

Summary of Quotations

Commodity:

A17-96616
PRINTED SNAP
SETS

Category:

Agency:

F.O.B.:

Delivery Requirements:

Date:

02/03/17

Requisition No.:

Bid Opening:

or

Closing Date

Purchase Period:

NAMES OF VENDORS

King Printing
Solutions

National Forms
and Systems Group

International
Security Products

Quoyeser Inc.

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ___

Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
2 PART CARBONLESS FORMS, ITEMS 1-14											
1	3-1/2" x 8-1/2", Top edge glued; 2 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow.10000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	33.86	\$ -	36.49	\$ -	48.36	\$ -	35.43	\$ -
2	3-1/2" x 8-1/2", Top edge glued; 2 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow.25000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	22.92	\$ -	24.74	\$ -	36.10	\$ -	24.96	\$ -
3	3-1/2" x 8-1/2", Top edge glued; 2 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow.50000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	19.31	\$ -	19.86	\$ -	33.56	\$ -	20.70	\$ -
4	8-1/2" x 7" plus stub; 2 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	222.90	\$ -	192.85	\$ -	211.84	\$ -	166.52	\$ -
5	8-1/2" x 7" plus stub; 2 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	89.16	\$ -	93.29	\$ -	115.43	\$ -	83.06	\$ -
6	8-1/2" x 7" plus stub; 2 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow.5000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	57.93	\$ -	66.37	\$ -	84.10	\$ -	55.95	\$ -
7	8-1/2" x 11" plus stub; 2 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	241.75	\$ -	180.88	\$ -	222.38	\$ -	181.71	\$ -
8	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 2 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	241.75	\$ -	198.45	\$ -	224.32	\$ -	135.87	\$ -

ORIGINAL

Commodity:

A17-96616
PRINTED SNAP
SETS

Category:

Agency:

F.O.B:

Delivery Requirements:

Date:

02/03/17

Requisition No:

Bid Opening:

or

Closing Date

Purchase Period:

Sealed Bid ☐ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐

King Printing Solutions	National Forms And System Group	International Security Products	Quoyeser Inc.
----------------------------	---------------------------------------	------------------------------------	---------------

9	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 2 part carbonless Sequence - white, yellow.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	96.70	\$ -	111.77	\$ -	127.21	\$ -	104.25	\$ -
10	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 2 part carbonless Sequence - white, yellow.5000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	64.77	\$ -	74.71	\$ -	98.08	\$ -	76.31	\$ -
11	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 2 part carbonless Sequence - white, pink.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	241.75	\$ -	214.45	\$ -	224.32	\$ -	153.32	\$ -
12	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 2 part carbonless Sequence - white, pink.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	96.70	\$ -	109.72	\$ -	127.21	\$ -	109.70	\$ -
13	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 2 part carbonless, Sequence green on green.25000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	42.39	\$ -	41.68	\$ -	73.75	\$ -	46.86	\$ -
14	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 2 part carbonless, Sequence green on green.50000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	39.31	\$ -	38.08	\$ -	69.38	\$ -	42.72	\$ -

3 PART CARBONLESS FORMS, ITEMS 15-38

15	Sequence white, yellow, buff in 100 lb. tag.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	369.60	\$ -	299.43	\$ -	295.38	\$ -	244.19	\$ -
16	Sequence white, yellow, buff in 100 lb. tag.1500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	246.40 147.84	\$ -	224.31	\$ -	229.51	\$ -	190.07	\$ -
17	8-1/2" x 5-1/2", Top edge glued, 3 part carbon carbonless Sequence white, yellow, pink.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	287.43	\$ -	226.85	\$ -	243.87	\$ -	125.85	\$ -
18	8-1/2" x 5-1/2", Top edge glued, 3 part carbon carbonless Sequence white, yellow, pink.1500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	191.62 114.98	\$ -	174.63	\$ -	191.73	\$ -	113.68	\$ -
19	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 3 part carbon carbonless Sequence white, yellow, pink.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	317.40	\$ -	225.64	\$ -	265.07	\$ -	196.53	\$ -

ORIGINAL

Commodity:

A17-96616
PRINTED SNAP
SETS

Category:

Agency:

F.O.B.:

Delivery Requirements:

Date:

02/03/17

Requisition No.:

Bid Opening:

or

Closing Date

Purchase Period:

King Printing Solutions	National Forms and Systems Group	International Security Products	Quayser Inc.
----------------------------	--	---------------------------------------	--------------

Sealed Bid Price Inquiry Definite Quantities

20	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 3 part carbon carbonlessSequence white, yellow, pink.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	126.96	\$	-	140.09	\$	-	162.58	\$	-	155.67	\$	-
21	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 3 part carbon carbonlessSequence white, yellow, pink.5000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	89.29	\$	-	110.88	\$	-	128.05	\$	-	117.56	\$	-
22	8-1/2" x 11", plus stub; 3 part carbonlessSequence white, pink, yellow.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	317.40	\$	-	246.14	\$	-	261.71	\$	-	231.53	\$	-
23	8-1/2" x 11", plus stub; 3 part carbonlessSequence white, pink, yellow.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	126.96	\$	-	139.72	\$	-	159.53	\$	-	149.84	\$	-
24	8-1/2" x 11", plus stub; 3 part carbonlessSequence white, yellow, pink.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	317.40	\$	-	236.14	\$	-	261.71	\$	-	231.53	\$	-
25	8-1/2" x 11", plus stub; 3 part carbonlessSequence white, yellow, pink.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	126.96	\$	-	139.72	\$	-	159.53	\$	-	126.44	\$	-
26	8-1/2" x 11", plus stub; 3 part carbonlessSequence white, yellow, pink.5000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	89.29	\$	-	109.60	\$	-	125.02	\$	-	99.84	\$	-
27	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 3 part carbon carbonlessSequence - white, pink, yellow. 1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	317.40	\$	-	240.64	\$	-	265.07	\$	-	244.74	\$	-
28	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 3 part carbon carbonlessSequence - white, pink, yellow. 2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	126.96	\$	-	140.09	\$	-	162.58	\$	-	155.67	\$	-
29	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 3 part carbon carbonlessSequence - white, pink, yellow. 5000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	89.29	\$	-	106.24	\$	-	128.05	\$	-	117.56	\$	-
30	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 3 part carbon carbonlessSequence - white, pink, yellow. 10000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	70.53	\$	-	88.31	\$	-	104.24	\$	-	85.29	\$	-

ORIGINAL

Commodity:

A17-96616
PRINTED SNAP
SETS

Category:

Agency:

F.O.B.:

Delivery Requirements:

Date:

02/03/17

Requisition No.:

Bid Opening:

or

Closing Date

Purchase Period:

King Printing
Solutions

National Forms
and Systems
Group

International
Security
Products

Quoxeser
Incorporated

Sealed Bid _____ Price Inquiry _____ Definite Quantities _____

31	8-1/2" x 14", Top edge glued, 3 part carbonlessSequence white, yellow, pink.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	350.24	\$	-	301.53	\$	-	283.46	\$	-	218.60	\$	-
32	8-1/2" x 14", Top edge glued, 3 part carbonlessSequence white, yellow, pink.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	140.10	\$	-	161.29	\$	-	179.33	\$	-	174.60	\$	-
33	8-1/2" x 14", Top edge glued, 3 part carbonlessSequence white, yellow, pink.5000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	101.22	\$	-	118.54	\$	-	144.65	\$	-	134.14	\$	-
34	8-1/2" x 14", Top edge glued, 3 part carbonlessSequence white, yellow, pink.10000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	81.87	\$	-	101.17	\$	-	120.68	\$	-	101.33	\$	-
35	11" x 8-1/2", Top edge glued, 3 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow, pink.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	336.42	\$	-	228.76	\$	-	274.12	\$	-	196.53	\$	-
36	11" x 8-1/2", Top edge glued, 3 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow, pink.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	134.57	\$	-	137.15	\$	-	174.22	\$	-	158.97	\$	-
37	11" x 8-1/2", Top edge glued, 3 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow, pink.5000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	96.00	\$	-	102.29	\$	-	129.00	\$	-	123.21	\$	-
38	11" x 8-1/2", Top edge glued, 3 part carbonlessSequence - white, yellow, pink.10000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	76.87	\$	-	85.36	\$	-	113.04	\$	-	90.33	\$	-
4 PART CARBONLESS FORMS, ITEMS 39-48															
39	8-1/2" x 11" plus stub, 4 part carbonless Sequence white, yellow, pink, gold.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	393.74	\$	-	275.93	\$	-	307.02	\$	-	280.30	\$	-
40	8-1/2" x 11" plus stub, 4 part carbonless Sequence white, yellow, pink, gold.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	157.50	\$	-	173.41	\$	-	193.52	\$	-	156.50	\$	-
41	8-1/2" x 11" plus stub, 4 part carbonless Sequence white, yellow, pink, gold.5000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	114.09	\$	-	133.57	\$	-	148.55	\$	-	128.22	\$	-
42	8-1/2" x 11" plus stub, 4 part carbonless Sequence white, yellow, pink, gold.10000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	92.72	\$	-	104.66	\$	-	128.65	\$	-	97.89	\$	-

ORIGINAL

Commodity:

A17-96616
PRINTED SNAP
SETS

Category:

Agency:

F.O.B.:

Delivery Requirements:

Date:

02/03/17

Requisition No.:

Bid Opening:

or

Closing Date

Purchase Period:

King Printing Solutions	National Forms and Systems Group	International Security Products	Guoyeser, Inc.
----------------------------	--	------------------------------------	----------------

Sealed Bid _____ Price Inquiry _____ Definite Quantities _____

43	8-1/2" x 11" plus stub, 4 part carbonless Sequence white, yellow, pink, gold.25000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	80.29	\$	-	83.49	\$	-	118.34	\$	-	85.44	\$	-
44	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 4 part carbonless Sequence white, yellow, pink, gold.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	393.74 157.50	\$	-	375.53	\$	-	311.65	\$	-	244.84	\$	-
45	8-1/2" X 11-5/8", plus stub, 4 part carbonless w/desensitized area on parts 3 and 4 under stars, .1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	633.63	\$	-	506.89	\$	-	757.96	\$	-	431.36	\$	-
46	8-1/2" X 11-5/8", plus stub, 4 part carbonless w/desensitized area on parts 3 and 4 under stars, .2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	253.46	\$	-	257.40	\$	-	398.78	\$	-	238.15	\$	-
47	8-1/2" X 11-5/8", plus stub, 4 part carbonless w/desensitized area on parts 3 and 4 under stars, .5000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	162.81	\$	-	168.55	\$	-	268.90	\$	-	170.91	\$	-
48	8-1/2" X 11-5/8", plus stub, 4 part carbonless w/desensitized area on parts 3 and 4 under stars, .10000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	117.94	\$	-	128.13	\$	-	207.78	\$	-	112.46	\$	-
5 PART CARBONLESS FORMS, ITEM 49 & 50															
49	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 5 part carbonless Sequence white, green, yellow, pink, gold.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	479.85	\$	-	360.78	\$	-	380.80	\$	-	370.90	\$	-
50	8-1/2" x 11", Top edge glued, 5 part carbonless Sequence white, green, yellow, pink, gold.2500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	191.95	\$	-	207.85	\$	-	258.92	\$	-	188.38	\$	-
6 PART CARBONLESS FORMS, ITEMS 51 & 52															
51	8-1/2" x 11" plus stub; 6 part carbonless Sequence white, blue, green, yellow, pink, gold. 1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	562.81 225.12	\$	-	357.94	\$	-	395.87	\$	-	408.14	\$	-
52	8-1/2" x 11" plus stub; 6 part carbonless Sequence white, blue, green, yellow, pink, gold.1000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	562.81	\$	-	390.28	\$	-	395.87	\$	-	408.14	\$	-
CARBONLESS BOOKS BOUND & STAPLED ITEMS 53 - 77															
53	7" x 7-1/2" plus left binding stub, 2 part, 1,000 (20 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	287.94 115.18	\$	-	290.17	\$	-	287.56	\$	-	273.87	\$	-
54	8-1/2" x 8-1/2" plus top binding stub, 2 part, 1,000 (20 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	317.72	\$	-	243.03	\$	-	300.30	\$	-	222.33	\$	-
55	8-1/2" x 8-1/2" plus top binding stub, 2 part, .2,500 (50 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	127.10	\$	-	128.92	\$	-	164.71	\$	-	133.51	\$	-

ORIGINAL

Commodity:

A17-96616
PRINTED SNAP
SETS

Category:

Agency:

F.O.B.:

Delivery Requirements:

Date:

02/03/17

Requisition No.:

Bid Opening:

or

Closing Date

Purchase Period:

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ___

56	3-1/2" x 7" plus left binding stub, 3 part, 1,000 (20 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	387.53	\$	-	258.41	\$	-	293.78	\$	-	231.47	\$	-
57	3-1/2" x 7" plus left binding stub, 3 part, 2,500 (50 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	155.02	\$	-	118.74	\$	-	148.39	\$	-	113.33	\$	-
58	3-1/2" x 7" plus left binding stub, 3 part, 5,000 (100 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	77.50	\$	-	75.52	\$	-	102.26	\$	-	77.37	\$	-
59	7-3/8" x 7" plus top binding stub, 3 part, 1,000 (20 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	373.11	\$	-	293.48	\$	-	343.26	\$	-	278.52	\$	-
60	7-3/8" x 7" plus top binding stub, 3 part, 2,500 (50 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	149.24	\$	-	155.20	\$	-	195.86	\$	-	169.84	\$	-
61	7-3/8" x 7" plus top binding stub, 3 part, 5,000 (100 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	107.16	\$	-	107.77	\$	-	145.90	\$	-	178.72	\$	-
62	8-1/2" x 11" plus top binding stub, 4 part, 1,000 (20 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	440.43	\$	-	312.95	\$	-	384.61	\$	-	338.12	\$	-
63	8-1/2" x 11" plus top binding stub, 4 part, 2,500 (50 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	176.18	\$	-	185.32	\$	-	232.12	\$	-	204.15	\$	-
64	8-1/2" x 11" plus top binding stub, 4 part, 5,000 (100 books)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	129.39	\$	-	139.49	\$	-	174.15	\$	-	163.18	\$	-

ORIGINAL

Commodity:

A17-96616
PRINTED SNAP
SETS

Category:

Agency:

F.O.B.:

Delivery Requirements:

Date:

02/03/17

Requisition No:

Bid Opening:

or

Closing Date

Purchase Period:

King Printing Solutions	National Forms and Systems Group	International Security Products	Guoyeser Inc
----------------------------	--	---------------------------------------	-----------------

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ___

65	4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Parking Citation, 4 part carbonless . Priced Per M Sets 25/Books5,000 -200 Books	1	PRICE PER M SETS	772.74	\$ -	331.59	\$ -	no Bid	\$ -	no Bid	\$ -
66	4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Parking Citation, 4 part carbonless , Priced Per M Sets 25/Books12,500 -500 Books	1	PRICE PER M SETS	375.62	\$ -	176.43	\$ -	no Bid	\$ -	no Bid	\$ -
67	4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Parking Citation, 4 part carbonless Priced Per M Sets 25/Books25,000-1,000 Books	1	PRICE PER M SETS	242.87	\$ -	126.40	\$ -	no Bid	\$ -	no Bid	\$ -
68	4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Parking Citation, 4 part carbonless Priced Per M Sets 25/Books50,000-2,000 Books	1	PRICE PER M SETS	176.76	\$ -	102.13	\$ -	no Bid	\$ -	no Bid	\$ -
69	4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Traffic Citation, 5 parts, part 1-white CB, part 2- pink CFB, part 3- blue CFB, part 4 - white 105# CF tag, part 5 part . Priced Per M Sets 25/Books 25,000 - 1,000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	139.02	\$ -	128.83	\$ -	163.44	\$ -	118.68	\$ -
70	4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Traffic Citation, 5 parts, part 1-white CB, part 2- pink CFB, part 3- blue CFB, part 4 - white 105# CF tag, part 5 part Priced Per M Sets 25/Books 50,500-2,000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	119.53	\$ -	106.01	\$ -	146.40	\$ -	102.53	\$ -
71	4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Traffic Citation, 5 parts, part 1-white CB, part 2- pink CFB, part 3- blue CFB, part 4 - white 105# CF tag, part 5 part . Priced Per M Sets 25/Books 100,000-4000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	109.69	\$ -	95.21	\$ -	139.11	\$ -	92.37	\$ -
72	4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Traffic Citation, 5 parts, Priced Per M Sets 25/Books 200,000-8,000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	104.90	\$ -	88.21	\$ -	136.09	\$ -	88.42	\$ -
73	4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Summons form sets, 4 part book, Priced Per M Sets 25/Books5,000 200	1	PRICE PER M SETS	133.94	\$ -	113.43	\$ -	186.38	\$ -	160.19	\$ -

ORIGINAL

Commodity:
**A17-96616
PRINTED SNAP
SETS**

Date: 02/03/17
Requisition No:

Agency:
Bid Opening:
or
Closing Date

F.O.B:
Purchase Period:

Delivery Requirements:

Sealed Bid Price Inquiry Define Quantities

74 4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Summons form sets, 4 part book, Priced Per M Sets 25/Books12,500- 500	1	PRICE PER M SETS	93.58	\$	-	79.60	\$	-	136.18	\$	-	102.95	\$	-
75 4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Summons form sets, 4 part book, Priced Per M Sets 25/Books25,000-1,000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	79.74	\$	-	64.64	\$	-	172.81	\$	-	82.97	\$	-
76 4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Summons form sets, 4 part book, Priced Per M Sets 25/Books50,000- 2,000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	73.08	\$	-	56.18	\$	-	115.83	\$	-	75.89	\$	-
77 4-1/4" x 8-1/2", Summons form sets, 4 part book, Priced Per M Sets 25/Books100,000-4,000	1	PRICE PER M SETS	69.62	\$	-	53.95	\$	-	113.03	\$	-	70.71	\$	-

EXTRA CHARGES FOR SNAP SETS , Items 78 - 99 Prices are not to exceed the figures on pages 26-28, definitions are also included on these pages.

78 Composition price applies to form w/stub less than 8-1/2"	1	PRICE PER M SETS	40.00	\$	-	40.00	\$	-	40.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
79 Composition price applies to form w/stub greater than 8 1/2"	1	PRICE PER M SETS	55.00	\$	-	55.00	\$	-	55.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
80 Modifications-minor change	1	PRICE PER M SETS	10.00	\$	-	10.00	\$	-	10.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
81 Modifications-intermediate change on form with stub less than 8-1/2"	1	PRICE PER M SETS	20.00	\$	-	20.00	\$	-	20.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
82 Modifications intermediate change, stub 8-1/2" or greater	1	PRICE PER M SETS	30.00	\$	-	30.00	\$	-	30.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
83 Back printing	1	PRICE PER M SETS	35.00	\$	-	35.00	\$	-	35.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
84 Part-to-part plate change	1	PRICE PER M SETS	35.00	\$	-	35.00	\$	-	35.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
85 Additional color plate charge	1	PRICE PER M SETS	35.00	\$	-	35.00	\$	-	35.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
86 Colored ink charge. This flat charge applies when a color ink other than standard black is used.	1	PRICE PER M SETS	25.00	\$	-	25.00	\$	-	25.00	\$	-	-	\$	-

King Printing Solutions	National Forms and Systems Group	International Security Products	Guoyeser Inc
-------------------------	----------------------------------	---------------------------------	--------------

ORIGINAL

Commodity:

A17-96616
PRINTED SNAP
SETS

Category:

Agency:

F.O.B.:

Delivery Requirements:

Date:

02/03/17

Requisition No.:

Bid Opening:

or

Closing Date

Purchase Period:

King Printing
Solutions

National Forms
and Systems
Group

International
Security
Products

Quoyeser Inc

Sealed Bid ☐ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐

87	100# white tag.(To figure total pounds, multiply length x width x .2315 x number of parts in the form that are this type of paper x number of thousand sets.)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	1.35	\$	-	1.35	\$	-	1.35	\$	-	-	\$	-
88	105# CF Carbonless tag.(To figure total pounds, multiply length x width x .234 x number of parts in the form that are this type of paper x number of thousand sets.)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	2.05	\$	-	4.00	\$	-	4.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
89	Consecutive numbers charge, (per number position, per M)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	15.00	\$	-	15.00	\$	-	15.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
90	Consecutive numbering charge, (per reset, per M)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	10.00	\$	-	10.00	\$	-	10.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
91	No missing numbers charge, (per thousand sets, based on crash printed numbers)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	2.00	\$	-	2.00	\$	-	2.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
92	File hole punching on press, (charge for every 2 and 3 holes, per M)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	10.00	\$	-	10.00	\$	-	10.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
93	Parallel perforations, (charge per perf position, per M)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	10.00	\$	-	10.00	\$	-	10.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
94	Perpendicular perforation, (per position, per M)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	10.00	\$	-	20.00	\$	-	20.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
95	Forms bound into books	1	PRICE PER M SETS	.30	\$	-	.30	\$	-	.30	\$	-	-	\$	-
96	Poly shrink wrapping, (Other than standard factory option)	1	PRICE PER M SETS	.75	\$	-	.75	\$	-	.75	\$	-	-	\$	-
97	Boxing, other than factory option	1	PRICE PER M SETS	1.00	\$	-	1.00	\$	-	1.00	\$	-	-	\$	-
98	RUSH CHARGE, jobs to be completed within 5 to 8 working days and shall not exceed 10% of the total job cost.	1	PRICE PER M SETS	15.00	\$	-	10%	\$	-	No charge	\$	-	3	\$	-
99	Red Marginal Words.	1	PRICE PER M SETS	No charge	\$	-	15.00	\$	-	No charge	\$	-	-	\$	-
TOTAL AMOUNT					\$	-		\$	-		\$	-		\$	-
Vendors															
Advertise () Bid Bond () Ins ()															
Special Conditions					\$	-		\$	-		\$	-		\$	-
Buyer															
Date															
DELIVERY															

ORIGINAL