0	Summary of Quotations			VENDORS					
	Commodity:					T		T	
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR			,	)	D 904	/ .		
	Category:	Requi	sition No:	Ralan	ing	Tient	4	Coidey	3
	20072		-20072	Dogs	ina	a dea	, .	Coiding	2 -0-
	UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)		17-02762	2000		Con Der	M	mit	OPIO
	Agency:		Opening or ing Date:	Good	5	Clodea Compan			
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17			^			
	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities								
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE						
1	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Jacket #76220 – Size Regular: S, M. L, XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	60	Each					//7.50	
2	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Jacket #76220 – Size Regular: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	10	Each					117.50	
3	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Jacket #76220 – Size Long: S, M, L, XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	20	Each					117.50	
4	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Jacket #76220 – Size Long: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	10	Each				×	117.50	
5	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Pant #78240 – Unisex Regular: S, M, L, XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	70	Each					57.48	
6	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Pant #78240 – Unisex Regular: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	20	Each					57.48	
7	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Pant #78240 – Unisex Short: S, M, L or Equal Per Attached Specifications	10	Each			¥	,	57.48	
8	RAINWEAR Waterproof Hood #7150 or Equal Per Attached Specifications	100	Each	OR	GIN	AL		12.95	
9	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Coat #76120 – Unisex Regular: S, M, L, XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	40	Each					124.98	

40. L

## **Summary of Quotations VENDORS** Commodity: A17-20072 Teers and POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR Category: Requisition No: A17-20072 20072 File: 17-02762 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC) **Bid Opening** Agency: Closing Date: POLICE - SUPPLY 06/27/17 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities UNIT OF DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY MEASURE Item No. QUANTITY RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Jacket #76220 - Size 1 Regular: S, M. L, XL or Equal Per Attached 60 Each Specifications RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Jacket #76220 - Size Regular: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached 10 2 Each Specifications RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Jacket #76220 - Size 3 20 Each Long: S, M, L, XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Jacket #76220 - Size Long: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached 4 10 Each Specifications RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Pant #78240 - Unisex Regular: S, M, L, XL or Equal Per Attached 70 Each Specifications RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Pant #78240 - Unisex Regular: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached 6 20 Each Specifications RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Pant #78240 - Unisex 7 10 Each Short: S. M. L or Equal Per Attached Specifications RAINWEAR Waterproof Hood #7150 or Equal Per 8 100 Each Attached Specifications RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Coat #76120 - Unisex Regular: S, M, L, XL or Equal Per Attached 9 40 Each **Specifications** ORIGINAL

	Summary of Quotations					VEN	DORS		
	Commodity:								
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR								·
	Category:	Requi	sition No:	$\sim$		)	<b>\</b>		6
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	File: 1	-20072 7-02762	Balance	U)	Pierre	white white	Con for	
	Agency:		opening or ng Date:	1000	}	Cont		Jh.,	
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17	Coo					
	Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities								
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE						
10	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Coat #76120 – Unisex Regular: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	15	Each					124.98	
11	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Coat #76120 – Unisex Long: M, L, XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	15	Each					124.98	
12	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Coat #76120 – Unisex Long: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	5	Each					124.98	
13	TACTICAL SAFETY VEST #71500 – or Equal Per Attached Specifications Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL	100	Each					47.80	
14	MEN'S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #411R7851Z or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 14.5" – 18.5"	70	Each					43.80	
15	MEN'S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #411R7851Z or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 19.0" – 22.0"	30	Each			v		43.80	
16	MEN'S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #761R7851Z or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 14.5" – 18.5"	450	Each					42.25	
17	MEN'S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #761R7851Z or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 19.0" – 22.0"	50	Each		i i			42.25	
18	MEN'S TROUSERS TR070 – Baton Rouge PD or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 28-44	400	Each				AT .	39.29	
			OR	IGIN	AL				

	Summary of Quotations					VENI	DORS	
	Commodity:							
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR							
	Category:	Requi	sition No:					
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)		-20072 17-02762	,	.01			
	Agency:		Opening or ing Date:	10000	Salety			
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17	Inc				
	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities		UNIT OF		1			
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	MEASURE					
10	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Coat #76120 – Unisex Regular: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	15	Each					
11	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Coat #76120 – Unisex Long: M, L, XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	15	Each					
12	RAINWEAR Reversible Rain Coat #76120 – Unisex Long: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Equal Per Attached Specifications	5	Each					
13	TACTICAL SAFETY VEST #71500 – or Equal Per Attached Specifications Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL	100	Each					
14	MEN'S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #411R7851Z or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 14.5" – 18.5"	70	Each					
15	MEN'S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #411R7851Z or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 19.0" – 22.0"	30	Each					
16	MEN'S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #761R7851Z or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 14.5" – 18.5"	450	Each					
17	MEN'S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #761R7851Z or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 19.0" – 22.0"	50	Each		,			
18	MEN'S TROUSERS TR070 – Baton Rouge PD or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size: 28-44	400	Each				-	



	Summary of Quotations			VENDORS					
	Commodity:								
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR								100
	Category:	Requi	sition No:			)			14
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)		-20072 17-02762	Balance	<b>9</b> /	Pierra	out the	Or gar	ems
	Agency:		Opening or ing Date:	Balance Sports	9	Com	out The		
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17	6000					
	Sealed Bid_X_Price Inquiry Definite Quantities								
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE						
	MEN'S TROUSERS TR070 – Baton Rouge PD or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size 46-60	400	Each					39.79	
20	SOFTSHELL JACKET #54100 or Equal Per Attached Specifications Regular - Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL; Long Size – M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	400	Each					109.90	
21	SWEATER #74086 or Equal Per Attached Specifications Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	100	Each		a			10490	
22	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT Style #72054 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: S, M, L, XL	50	Each					45.98	
23	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT Style #72054 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	50	Each					50.98	
24	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT Style #72054 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: Tall – L, XL. 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	50	Each					50.98	
25	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71002 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: S, M, L, XL	50	Each				b	4890	
26	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71002 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	50	Each	OR	IGIN	AF	i	5390	
27	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71175, 71175T or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: S, M, L, XL	50	Each		TOIL	AL	ı	44.96	

	Summary of Quotations				VENDORS				
	Commodity:								
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR								
	Category:	Requi	sition No:						
	20072	A17	-20072						
	UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	File: 1	7-02762	100					
	Agency:		Opening or ing Date:	Teach	4				
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17	Th					
	Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities								
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE						
19	MEN'S TROUSERS TR070 – Baton Rouge PD or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class A) Size 46-60	400	Each						
20	SOFTSHELL JACKET #54100 or Equal Per Attached Specifications Regular - Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL; Long Size – M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	400	Each						
21	SWEATER #74086 or Equal Per Attached Specifications Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	100	Each						
22	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT Style #72054 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: S, M, L, XL	50	Each						
23	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT Style #72054 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	50	Each						
24	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT Style #72054 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: Tall – L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	50	Each						
25	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71002 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: S, M, L, XL	50	Each						
26	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71002 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	50	Each						
27	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71175, 71175T or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: S, M, L, XL	50	Each						
	•		OR	IGIN	AL				

	Summary of Quotations					VEN	DORS	-	
	Commodity:								
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR				)				
	Category:	Requi	sition No:	1-49		Dale.	2	\.	08
	20072		-20072	Balones Blocks	c.	Condo		( o, e	6
	UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	File: 1	17-02762	(Out it	3	OMA DO	my	60,0	Sol.
	•	Bld (	- [	1 15		uend	110	, U	0
	Agency:	Clos	or ing Date:	Coo			10	No	
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17						
	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities								
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE						
	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71175, 71175T or Equal								
28	Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL	50	Each					49.90	
	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71175, 71175T or Equal	50	Fach						
29	Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: Tall – L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL, 5XL	50	Each					59.90	
	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71001, 71001T or Equal								
30	Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: S, M, L, XL	50	Each					48.90	
	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71001, 71001T or Equal							·m Can	
31	Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	50	Each					48.90	
	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71001, 71001T or Equal			ATTIVITY OF THE PARTY OF THE PA					
32	Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: Tall –	50	Each					53.90	
33	L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL, 5XL PANTS Style #74280 or Equal Per Attached	50	Each					WACD	
33	Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL PANTS Style #74280 or Equal Per Attached	- 50	Lacii					42.90	
34	Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL	50	Each					47.90	
	OC SPRAY HOLDER, STANDARD, TOP FLAPSHORT							6.0	
35	(Black basket-weave with concealed snap) Safariland	125	Each		Carlotte Control of the Control of t			bo Big	
	#38-2-4HS or Equal Per Attached Specifications			AD	TOTA			١	
	HANDCUFF POUCH TOP FLAP, HIDDEN SNAPLONG	405			IGIN	AL		Lin	
36	(Black basket-weave with concealed snap) Safariland #190-4HS or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	-				po bid	
	mice and or Equal to manding oppositionio							1.0	

	Summary of Quotations					VEN	IDORS	
	Commodity:							
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR							
	Category:	Requi	sition No:					
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	File: 1	-20072 17-02762	Teolo	La Cety			
	Agency:		Opening or ing Date:	IN	0.			
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17					
	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities		UNIT OF			<u> </u>	1	
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	MEASURE					
28	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71175, 71175T or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL	50	Each					
29	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71175, 71175T or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: Tall – L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL, 5XL	50	Each					
30	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71001, 71001T or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: S, M, L, XL	50	Each					
31	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71001, 71001T or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	50	Each					
32	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT Style #71001, 71001T or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: Tall – L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL, 5XL	50	Each					
33	PANTS Style #74280 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL	50	Each					
34	PANTS Style #74280 or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 2XL, 3XL	50	Each					
35	OC SPRAY HOLDER, STANDARD, TOP FLAPSHORT (Black basket-weave with concealed snap) Safariland #38-2-4HS or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	19.12				
36	HANDCUFF POUCH TOP FLAP, HIDDEN SNAPLONG (Black basket-weave with concealed snap) Safariland #190-4HS or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	22.18				
					OR	IGIN	AL	

	Summary of Quotations					VEN	IDORS		
	Commodity: A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR								-
	Category:	Requi	sition No:			_			4
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	File:	-20072 17-02762	Oc. And	9)	Pierre	oned She	Brig 6	Sopms
	Agency:		Opening or ing Date:	Balance	b b	Court		Y	
	POLICE - SUPPLY  Sealed Bid_ X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities	06/	27/17	6000					
		CHANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE				T		
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY  SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt,	QUANTITY	MEAGURE						
37	black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-28-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					No Bid	
38	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-30-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					ro Bid	
39	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-32-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					No Big	
40	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-34-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					No Bid	
41	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-36-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					Missa	
42	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-38-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	OR	GIN	AL		No Bid	

.

Name and Address of the Owner, where			the second second second		A CONTRACTOR OF THE PARTY OF TH	all the contract of the contract of		
	Summary of Quotations					VEN	DORS	
	Commodity:							
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR							
	Category:	Requis	sition No:					
	20072	A17-	-20072					
	<b>UNIFORMS (COTTON &amp; SYNTHETIC)</b>	File: 1	7-02762					
	Agency:		Opening or ng Date:	Teech	ly,			
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17	1	re			
	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities							
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE					
	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt,							
27	black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle)	125	Each	50.1				
590.00	Safariland Model 87-28-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications			44-23				
	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt,							
-20	black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle)	125	Each	1111.12				
	Safariland Model 87-30-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications			44.23				
	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt,							
39	black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle)	125	Each	44.23				
	Safariland Model 87-32-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications			79.00				
	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt,							
40	black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle)	125	Each	44.23				
40	Safariland Model 87-34-8B or Equal Per Attached		Luon	44.02				
	Specifications SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt,							
41	black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle)	125	Each	1111.13				
-71	Safariland Model 87-36-8B or Equal Per Attached	123	Lacii	44-23				
	Specifications SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt,							
40	black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle)	405	Fact	.11 13				
42	Safariland Model 87-38-8B or Equal Per Attached	125	Each	44.23				
	Specifications						_	1



	Summary of Quotations					VEN	DORS		
	Commodity:								
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR						\		
	Category:	Requi	sition No:				1	, .	6
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)		-20072 17-02762			Prende	الر	Con Low	pms
	Agency:		Opening or ing Date:	pala		Compo		Anis	
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17	600 Les	000	1	N		
	Sealed Bid_X_Price Inquiry Definite Quantities								
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE						
43	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-40-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					ho Big	
44	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-42-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					nopid	
45	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-44-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					NO Bid	
46	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-46-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					W08:9	
47	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-48-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					pspid	
48	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-50-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	OR	[GIN.	AL		bid an	

				A CONTRACTOR OF THE PARTY OF TH		and the second second			
	Summary of Quotations					VENI	oors		
	Commodity:								
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR								
	Category:	Requis	sition No:						
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)		-20072 7-02762						
	Agency:		Opening or ng Date:	Tecco					
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17	Salet	d	3			
	Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities			The	)				
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE						
43	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-40-8B or Equal Per Attached	125	Each	44-83					
	Specifications SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-42-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	44.23					
45	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-44-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	44.23					
46	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-46-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	45.23					
	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-48-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	H6.23				-	
	SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25" (Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle) Safariland Model 87-50-8B or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	41-23					_



	Summary of Quotations					VEN	DORS		
	Commodity:								
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR		,	Balar	rie ting	Pierr	· e	Guida	115
	Category:	Requi	sition No:		1	d	1		9 -
	20072		-20072	Spor	tins	- Man	Legux	Unita	nms
	UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	File: 1	17-02762	Mari		COT	-100	6.7.	
	Agency:	Bld (	Opening or	0009	5	11	ne		
	Ageney.	Clos	ing Date:						
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17						
	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities								
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE						
49	DOUBLE HANDGUN MAGAZINE POUCH (Black basket- weave with concealed snap) Safariland Model 77-83- 4MHS or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					no Bid	
50	BELT KEEPER, HIDDEN SNAP (Black basket-weave) Safariland Model 62-4HS	125	Each					NO Bid	
51	COMPACT LIGHT HOLDER (Black basket-weave) Bianchi 7926-22097 or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					No Bid	
52	OPEN TOP HANDCUFF CASE (Black basket-weave) Bianchi 7934 or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each					NOBO	
53	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #8741 TENX BDU Short Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	700	Each					51.95	
54	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #8731 TENX BUD Long Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	700	Each					54.85	



Summary of Quotations				VENDORS						
Commodity:										
A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR										
	Category:	Requisition No:								
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)		A17-20072 File: 17-02762		Cofy					
Agency:		Bid Opening or Closing Date:		Teeco	Safatu					
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17	The						
	Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE							
49	DOUBLE HANDGUN MAGAZINE POUCH (Black basket- weave with concealed snap) Safariland Model 77-83- 4MHS or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	23.82						
50	BELT KEEPER, HIDDEN SNAP (Black basket-weave) Safariland Model 62-4HS	125	Each	13.18						
51	COMPACT LIGHT HOLDER (Black basket-weave) Bianchi 7926-22097 or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	9.07						
52	OPEN TOP HANDCUFF CASE (Black basket-weave) Bianchi 7934 or Equal Per Attached Specifications	125	Each	12.62						
53	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #8741 TENX BDU Short Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	700	Each							
54	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #8731 TENX BUD Long Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	700	Each		,					

ORIGINAL

Summary of Quotations					VENDORS							
	Commodity:			3								
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR			Balan	nce	Pi						
	Category:	Requis	sition No:	Span	Lina	1 lers	e	1				
	20072	A17	-20072	Sport	inc			1				
	UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	File: 1	7-02762	Carl		rand	Eaux	- Vic	ry's			
	•		Opening	Oud o	7	00		Im. C	7110101			
	Agency:		or ng Date:			Pierre Cravdeaux Co., Inc		UTIT	orms			
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17			,						
	Sealed Bid_X_Price Inquiry Definite Quantities											
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	.7								
<i>EE</i>	WOMEN'S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #8741W TENX BDU Short Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	700	Each					51.95				
56	WOMEN'S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #8731W TENX BUD Long Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	700	Each					5H.85				
57	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #8741 TENX BDU Short Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Size: 5XL	50	Each					51.95				
58	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #8731 TENX BUD Long Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 5XL		Each					54.85				
	0	RIC	JIN/	IL!								

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity:									
A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR									
	Category:	Requi	sition No:						
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	A17-20072 File: 17-02762							
	Agency:	Bid Opening or Closing Date:		Teech	) fy				
	POLICE - SUPPLY Scaled Rid. Y. Price Inquiry - Definite Quantities	06/27/17		The	)				
Hour V	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities		UNIT OF						
55	WOMEN'S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #8741W TENX BDU Short Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	700	Each						
56	WOMEN'S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #8731W TENX BUD Long Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: XS, S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL	700	Each						
57	SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #8741 TENX BDU Short Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Size: 5XL	50	Each						
58	LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #8731 TENX BUD Long Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 5XL	50	Each			7			
			(	RIG	NAL			,	

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS							
Commodity:							***************************************	T			
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR	1		B.		P.		d.	)		
	Category:	Requi	sition No:	19 Con	n Ce	1 (GLA	e	SUK	144'5		
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)		A17-20072 <sup>-</sup> File: 17-02762		Lina	Crave	eauX	Unif	orms		
	Agency:	Bid Opening or Closing Date:		Bid Opening or Closing Date:		Goods	5	Co., 1	200		lry's orms
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17								
	Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities				8						
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE								
59	WOMEN'S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #8741W TENX BDU Short Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Size: 5XL	50	Each					51.95			
60	WOMEN'S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #8731W TENX BUD Long Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 5XL	50	Each	,				54.85			
61	MEN'S TROUSERS #8836 TENX OPERATIONAL TROUSER, TUNNEL WASTEBAND, Navy (04) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Sizes: 28 – 54	750	Each					43.29			
62	WOMEN'S TROUSERS #8836W TENX OPERATIONAL TROUSER, TUNNEL WASTEBAND, Navy (04) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Sizes: 2 – 26	250	Each					H3.29			
63	MEN'S TROUSERS #8836 TENX OPERATIONAL TROUSER, TUNNEL WASTEBAND, Tan (45) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Sizes: 28 – 54	100	Each					43,29			



Summary of Quotations					VENDORS					
	Commodity:									
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR									
	Category:	Requis	sition No:							
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	A17-20072 File: 17-02762								
Agency:		Bid Opening or Closing Date:		(M)	Salety					
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/27/17		Tear	,					
	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities			10						
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE							
59	WOMEN'S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT #8741W TENX BDU Short Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Size: 5XL	50	Each							
60	WOMEN'S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT #8731W TENX BUD Long Sleeve Shirt, Dark Navy (04) with 2 shoulder patches and one badge patch on left chest (patches are to be supplied by the East Baton Rouge Parish Supply Division) or Equal Per Attached Specifications (Dept. Class B) Size: 5XL	50	Each							
61	MEN'S TROUSERS #8836 TENX OPERATIONAL TROUSER, TUNNEL WASTEBAND, Navy (04) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Sizes: 28 – 54	750	Each							
62	WOMEN'S TROUSERS #8836W TENX OPERATIONAL TROUSER, TUNNEL WASTEBAND, Navy (04) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Sizes: 2 – 26	250	Each							
63	MEN'S TROUSERS #8836 TENX OPERATIONAL TROUSER, TUNNEL WASTEBAND, Tan (45) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Sizes: 28 – 54	100	Each							



Summary of Quotations			VENDORS									
Commodity:							1					
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR						2					
	Category:	Requisition No:			1. 0	10	0 .9	/,	V	16		
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)		A17-20072 File: 17-02762		Balance		Henry 1		Cuide	emb		
	Agency:	Bid Opening or Closing Date:		Bid Opening or Closing Date:		4	SO P	6	Gon	and a	Juigo	γ.
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17	9	00			<b>M</b>				
	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities					·						
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE									
64	WOMEN'S TROUSERS #8836W TENX OPERATIONAL TROUSER, TUNNEL WASTEBAND, Tan (45) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Sizes: 2 – 26	400	Each						43-29			
65	VEST CARRIER #8780 B.DU ARMORSKIN Ballistic Vest Carrier (Color: Dark Navy 04) or Equal Per Attached Specifications	250	Each						84.90			
66	POLO SHIRT Micropique Sport-Wick Polo ST650 Baton Rouge City seal embroidered onto left breast or Equal Per Attached Specifications. Size: S, M, L, XL	320	Each	18.9	9		16.50		no Bid			
67	POLO SHIRT Micropique Sport-Wick Polo ST650 Baton Rouge City seal embroidered onto left breast or Equal Per Attached Specifications. Size: 2X, 3X, 4X, 5X, 6X	180	Each	12.0	39		9.50		ho Big			
		TOTAL	AMOUNT									
		CASH D	ISCOUNT									
		NET AMOUNT										
Buyer		DELIVERY			U	RGI	NAL					
DSS		QUOTE TOTAL				The state of the s	September 1					
		AW	/ARD									
NOTES:	See Bid Worksheet											

Summary of Quotations					VENDORS					
	Commodity:									
	A17-20072 POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR									
	Category:	Requis	sition No:							
	20072 UNIFORMS (COTTON & SYNTHETIC)	A17-20072 File: 17-02762								
	Agency:	Bid Opening or Closing Date:		Tello	ythe					
	POLICE - SUPPLY	06/	27/17							
	Sealed Bid_X_ Price Inquiry Definite Quantities									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE							
64	WOMEN'S TROUSERS #8836W TENX OPERATIONAL TROUSER, TUNNEL WASTEBAND, Tan (45) or Equal Per Attached Specifications. (Dept. Class B) Sizes: 2 – 26	400	Each							
65	VEST CARRIER #8780 B.DU ARMORSKIN Ballistic Vest Carrier (Color: Dark Navy 04) or Equal Per Attached Specifications	250 Each								
66	POLO SHIRT Micropique Sport-Wick Polo ST650 Baton Rouge City seal embroidered onto left breast or Equal Per Attached Specifications. Size: S, M, L, XL									
	POLO SHIRT Micropique Sport-Wick Polo ST650 Baton Rouge City seal embroidered onto left breast or Equal Per Attached Specifications. Size: 2X, 3X, 4X, 5X, 6X	180	Each							
		TOTAL	AMOUNT							
		CASH D	ISCOUNT							
		NET AMOUNT								
Buyer		DELIVERY								
DSS		QUOTE TOTAL								
	AWARD		/ARD							
NOTES: See Bid Worksheet		ORIGI		VAL						