

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				CT Distributors Inc.		Lawmens & shooters Supply Inc.		Teeco Safety	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
SECTION 1 (Items 0001 - 0005)									
0001	Emblem: Shoulder Patch, 3.5" X 4.5". Premier Emblem Item # APREM 1023-1 or Equal	7000	Each	.59	4,130.00	no bid		.66	4,620.00
0002	Emblem: Badge Patch, , (Breast Badge) 2.5"W x 3.5"H Premier Emblem Item #APRE 12546- 9 or Equal.	2000	Each	.48	960.00	no bid		.68	1,360.00
0003	Emblem: School Guard Badge Patch, 2.5"W x 3.5"H Premier Emblem Item #APREM 1024-1 or Equal	100	Each	1.52	152.00	no bid		.98	98.00
0004	Emblem: Chevron, Sergeant. The sergeant chevrons are to be 3 7/8" high and 3 1/8" wide, three gold embroidered bars on navy (dacron/cotton twill key #4) back-ground, with black trim. , 3 1/8" W x 3 7/8" H Premier Emblem Item #APRE 22407-06 or Equal	800	Each	1.10	880.00	no bid		.75	600.00

ORIGINAL

395

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				GT Distributors Inc		Lawmen's Shooters Supply Inc		Teeco Safety	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0005	Emblem: Chevron, Corporal. The corporal chevrons are to be 3 1/8" high and 3" wide, two gold embroidered bars on navy (dacron/cotton twill key #4) background, with black trim 3 1/8" W x 3 1/8" H Premier Emblem Item #APRE 22407-17 or Equal	1200	Each	1.08	1,296.00	no bid		59.	828.00
SECTION 2 (Items 0006 - 0033)									
0006	Badge, Officer, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Roman, Blue; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Blackington Style # B-1549 or Equal	100	Each	75.33	7,533.00	68.47	6,847.00	70.80	7,080.00
0007	Badge, Sergeant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Roman, Blue; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Blackington Style # B-1549R or Equal	20	Each	75.33	1,506.60	68.47	1,369.40	70.80	1,416.00

ORIGINAL

385

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				GT Distributors Inc		Lawmen's Shooters Supply Inc		Teeco Safety	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0008	Badge, Lieutenant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reverse; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch, 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W); Eagles head is applied as a panel; 2 STARS or Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; Blackington Style # B-1549-R or Equal	20	Each	75.33	1,506.60	68.47	1,369.40	7.80	1,416.00
0009	Badge, Captain, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reverse; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; 3 Stars or Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Reversed Blue Blackington Style # B-1549-R or Equal	20	Each	75.33	1,506.60	68.47	1,369.40	70.80	1,416.00

ORIGINAL

385

Summary of Quotations					VENDORS							
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT					GT Distributors Inc		Lawmen's Shooters Supply Inc		Teeco Safety			
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS											Requisition No: 17-03907	
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY											Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17	
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐												
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL			
0010	Badge, Communication, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Roman, Blue; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Blackington Style # B-1549R or Equal	8	Each	75.33	602.64	68.47	547.76	70.80	566.40			
0011	Cap Badge, Sergeant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660 or Equal	20	Each	61.64	1232.80	57.44	1148.80	57.95	1159.00			
0012	Cap Badge, Officer, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660 or Equal	60	Each	61.64	3698.40	57.44	3446.40	57.95	3477.00			
0013	Cap Badge, Lieutenant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reversed; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660-R or Equal	15	Each	61.64	924.60	57.44	861.60	57.95	859.25			

ORIGINAL

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				CT Distributors INC		Lawmen's Shooters Supply Inc		Teeco Safety	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0014	Cap Badge, Captain, Finish: HI-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reversed; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660-R or Equal	15	Each	61.64	924.60	57.44	861.60	57.95	859.25
0015	Insignia: Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 1, Blackington or Equal	30	Each	14.31	429.30	15.58 Pair	467.40	12.35	370.50
0016	Insignia: : Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 2, Blackington or Equal	30	Each	14.31	429.30	15.58 Pair	467.40	12.35	370.50
0017	Insignia: : Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 3, Blackington or Equal	30	Each	14.31	429.30	15.58	467.40	12.35	370.50
0018	Insignia: : Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 4, Blackington or Equal	30	Each	14.31	429.30	15.58	467.40	12.35	370.50

ORIGINAL

325

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				GT Distributors Inc		Lawmen's Shooters Supply Inc		Teeco Safety	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0019	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" P.D. Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington Style #A7336 or Equal	75	Each	13.55	1016.25	13.90	1042.50	11.70	877.50
0020	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" OFC. , Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	30	Each	19.85	595.50	20.05	601.50	17.15	514.50
0021	Insignia: Large Sgt. Chevrons, Finish: Smooth, Gol-Tone-CI (Military Sgt.) Dimensions: 15/16" (W) x 13/16" (H) Blackington Style J130 or Equal	30	Each	4.41	132.30	4.52	135.60	3.80	114.00
0022	Insignia: Small Lt. Bars, Smooth, Finish: Gol-Tone-CI Dimensions: 3/4" (W) x 1/4" (H) Blackington Style #J61G or Equal	30	Each	4.41	132.30	4.52	135.60	3.80	114.00
0023	Insignia: Large Lt. Bars, Finish: Smooth Gol-Tone-CI Dimensions: 1" (W) x 3/8" (H) Blackington Style #J62G or Equal	30	Each	4.41	132.30	4.52	135.60	3.80	114.00
0024	Insignia: Small Capt. Bars, Finish: Smooth Gol-Tone-CI Dimensions: 13/16" (W) x 3/4" (H) Blackington Style J63G. or Equal	30	Each	4.41	132.30	4.52	135.60	3.80	114.00

ORIGINAL

385

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				GT Distributors INC		Lawmen's Shooters Supply Inc		Teeco Safety	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0025	Insignia: Large Capt. Bars, Finish: Smooth, Gol-Tone- CI DImensions: 1 1/16" (W) x 1" (H) Blackington Style J64G. or Equal	30	Each	4.41	132.30	4.52 pair	135.60	3.80	114.00
0026	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" C I B Finish: HI-Glo Blackington or Equal	40	Each	19.85	794.00	20.05 pair	802.00	17.15	686.00
0027	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" K-9 Finish: HI-Glo Blackington A9224:or	15	Each	13.55	203.25	13.90 pair	208.50	11.70	175.50
0028	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" 700 Finish: HI-Glo Blackington or Equal	10	Each	19.85	198.50	20.05 pair	200.50	17.15	171.50
0029	Commendation Bars: Officer of the Year Finish: Yellow/White/Yellow/White/Yellow Width : 1 1/4" Height : 3/8"	20	Each	12.63	252.60	13.17	263.40	10.90	218.00
0030	Insignia Honor Guard – Finish: Gold with Enamel White and Royal Blue Width : 1 3/8" Height : 5/16"	30	Each	9.99	299.70	12.04	361.20	8.60	258.00
0031	Insignia: Cutout Wheel With Wings(royal Blue Enamel) & Arrow HI-Glo Blackington or Equal	40	Each	7.98	319.20	11.56	462.40	6.85	274.00
0032	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" M. I. Finish: HI-Glo Blackington or Equal	10	Each	16.50	165.00	20.01 pair	200.10	14.25	142.50

ORIGINAL

385

Summary of Quotations					VENDORS				
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT					G.T. Distributors INC Lawmen's & Shooters Supply Inc Teeco Safety				
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS									
Requisition No: 17-03907									
Bld Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17									
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0033	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" HQ Finish: HI-Glo Blackington or Equal	20	Each	16.50	330.00	20.01 pair	400.20	14.85	285.00
SECTION 3 (Items 0034 - 0037)									
0034	Medal of Valor - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet clamshell case in white gift box	20	Each	NO Bid		NO Bid		NO Bid	
0035	Medal of Merit - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet case with white gift box	20	Each	NO Bid		NO Bid		NO Bid	
0036	Purple Heart - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet case with white gift box	20	Each	NO Bid		NO Bid		NO Bid	
0037	Life Saving - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet case with white gift box	20	Each	NO Bid		NO Bid		NO Bid	
Vendor	TOTAL AMOUNT								
	CASH DISCOUNT								
Special Cond.	NET AMOUNT								
Buyer	DELIVERY								
DSS	QUOTE TOTAL								
	AWARD								

ORIGINAL

NOTES: See Bid Worksheet

385

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>C.W. Nielsen</i> <i>Manufacturing</i> <i>Corp.</i>		<i>The Emblem</i> <i>Authority</i>		<i>Artcraft</i> <i>Ad Specialities</i>	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
SECTION 1 (Items 0001 - 0005)									
0001	Emblem: Shoulder Patch, 3.5" X 4.5". Premier Emblem Item # APREM 1023-1 or Equal	7000	Each	<i>No Bid</i>		<i>.51</i>	<i>3,570.00</i>	<i>.97</i>	<i>6,792.00</i>
0002	Emblem: Badge Patch, , (Breast Badge) 2.5"W x 3.5"H Premier Emblem Item #APRE 12546- 9 or Equal.	2000	Each	<i>No Bid</i>		<i>.41</i>	<i>820.00</i>	<i>.97</i>	<i>1,940.00</i>
0003	Emblem: School Guard Badge Patch, 2.5"W x 3.5"H Premier Emblem Item #APREM 1024-1 or Equal	100	Each	<i>No Bid</i>		<i>.41</i>	<i>41.00</i>	<i>.97</i>	<i>97.00</i>
0004	Emblem: Chevron, Sergeant. The sergeant chevrons are to be 3 7/8" high and 3 1/8" wide, three gold embroidered bars on navy (dacron/cotton twill key #4) background, with black trim. , 3 1/8" W x 3 7/8" H Premier Emblem Item #APRE 22407-06 or Equal	800	Each	<i>No Bid</i>		<i>.52</i>	<i>416.00</i>	<i>.81</i>	<i>648.00</i>

425

ORIGINAL

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>C.W. Nielsen Manufacturing Corp.</i>		<i>The Emblem Authority</i>		<i>Artcraft Ad Specialties</i>	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY				Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17					
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0005	Emblem: Chevron, Corporal. The corporal chevrons are to be 3 1/8" high and 3" wide, two gold embroidered bars on navy (dacron/cotton twill key #4) background, with black trim 3 1/8" W x 3 1/8" H Premier Emblem Item #APRE 22407-17 or Equal	1200	Each	<i>No Bid</i>		<i>.37</i>	<i>444.00</i>	<i>.60</i>	<i>720.00</i>
SECTION 2 (Items 0006 - 0033)									
0006	Badge, Officer, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Roman, Blue; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Blackington Style # B-1549 or Equal	100	Each	<i>No Bid</i>					
0007	Badge, Sergeant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Roman, Blue; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Blackington Style # B-1549R or Equal	20	Each						

485

ORIGINAL

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>C.W. Nielsen</i> <i>Manufacturing</i> <i>Corp</i>		<i>The Emblem</i> <i>Authority</i>		<i>Artcraft</i> <i>Ad Specialties</i>	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0008	Badge, Lieutenant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reverse; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch, 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W); Eagles head is applied as a panel; 2 STARS or Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; Blackington Style # B-1549-R or Equal	20	Each						
0009	Badge, Captain, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reverse; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; 3 Stars or Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Reversed Blue Blackington Style # B-1549-R or Equal	20	Each						

425

ORIGINAL

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>C.W. Nielsen</i> <i>Manufacturing</i> <i>Corp.</i>		<i>The Emblem</i> <i>Authority</i>		<i>Artcraft</i> <i>Ad Specialties</i>	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY									
Sealed Bid <u>X</u> Price Inquiry <u> </u> Definite Quantities <u> </u>									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0010	Badge, Communication, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Roman, Blue; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Blackington Style # B-1549R or Equal	8	Each						
0011	Cap Badge, Sergeant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660 or Equal	20	Each						
0012	Cap Badge, Officer, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660 or Equal	60	Each						
0013	Cap Badge, Lieutenant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reversed; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660-R or Equal	15	Each						

425

ORIGINAL

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>C.W. Nielsen</i> <i>Manufacturing</i> <i>Corp</i>		<i>The Emblem</i> <i>Authority</i>		<i>Artcraft</i> <i>Ad Specialties</i>	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0014	Cap Badge, Captain, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reversed; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660-R or Equal	15	Each						
0015	Insignia: Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 1, Blackington or Equal	30	Each						
0016	Insignia: : Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 2, Blackington or Equal	30	Each						
0017	Insignia: : Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 3, Blackington or Equal	30	Each						
0018	Insignia: : Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 4, Blackington or Equal	30	Each						

485

ORIGINAL

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS						
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>C. W. Nielsen</i> <i>Manufacturing</i> <i>Corp.</i>		<i>The Emblem</i> <i>Authority</i>		<i>Artcraft</i> <i>Ad Specialties</i>		
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907								
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17								
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐										
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	
0019	Insignia: Cutout Letters ½" P.D. Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington Style #A7336 or Equal	75	Each							
0020	Insignia: Cutout Letters ½" OFC. , Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	30	Each							
0021	Insignia: Large Sgt. Chevrons, Finish: Smooth, Gol-Tone-CI (Military Sgt.) Dimensions: 15/16" (W) x 13/16" (H) Blackington Style J130 or Equal	30	Each							
0022	Insignia: Small Lt. Bars, Smooth, Finish: Gol-Tone-CI Dimensions: 3/4" (W) x 1/4" (H) Blackington Style #J61G or Equal	30	Each							
0023	Insignia: Large Lt. Bars, Finish: Smooth Gol-Tone-CI Dimensions: 1" (W) x 3/8" (H) Blackington Style #J62G or Equal	30	Each							
0024	Insignia: Small Capt. Bars, Finish: Smooth Gol-Tone-CI Dimensions: 13/16" (W) x 3/4" (H) Blackington Style J63G. or Equal	30	Each							

425

ORIGINAL

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS					
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>C.W. Nielsen</i> <i>Manufacturing</i> <i>Corp</i>		<i>The</i> <i>Emblem</i> <i>Authority</i>		<i>Aircraft</i> <i>Ad Specialties</i>	
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907							
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17							
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0025	Insignia: Large Capt. Bars, Finish: Smooth, Gol-Tone- CI Dimensions: 1 1/16" (W) x 1" (H) Blackington Style J64G. or Equal	30	Each						
0026	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" C I B Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	40	Each						
0027	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" K-9 Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington A9224:or	15	Each						
0028	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" 700 Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	10	Each						
0029	Commendation Bars: Officer of the Year Finish: Yellow/White/Yellow/White/Yellow Width : 1 3/4" Height : 3/8"	20	Each						
0030	Insignia Honor Guard – Finish: Gold with Enamel White and Royal Blue Width : 1 3/8" Height : 5/16"	30	Each						
0031	Insignia: Cutout Wheel With Wings(royal Blue Enamel) & Arrow Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	40	Each						
0032	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" M. I. Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	10	Each						

485

ORIGINAL

Summary of Quotations					VENDORS				
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT					C.W. Nielsen Manufacturing Corp. The Emblem Authority Aircraft Ad Specialties				
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS			Requisition No: 17-03907						
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY			Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17						
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐									
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0033	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" HQ Finish: HI-Glo Blackington or Equal	20	Each						
SECTION 3 (Items 0034 - 0037)									
0034	Medal of Valor - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet clamshell case in white gift box	20	Each	75.00	1,500.00				
0035	Medal of Merit - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet case with white gift box	20	Each	75.00	1,500.00				
0036	Purple Heart - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet case with white gift box	20	Each	70.00	1,400.00				
0037	Life Saving - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet case with white gift box	20	Each	70.00	1,400.00				
Vendor	TOTAL AMOUNT								
	CASH DISCOUNT								
Special Cond. Buyer	NET AMOUNT								
	DELIVERY								
DSS	QUOTE TOTAL								
	AWARD								
NOTES: See Bid Worksheet									

ORIGINAL

425

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS							
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>Rite Choicell Uniforms Inc.</i>		<i>Pint Emblems</i>					
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907									
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐											
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL		
SECTION 1 (Items 0001 - 0005)											
0001	Emblem: Shoulder Patch, 3.5" X 4.5". Premier Emblem Item # APREM 1023-1 or Equal	7000	Each	.64	4,600.00	.75	5,250.00				
0002	Emblem: Badge Patch, , (Breast Badge) 2.5"W x 3.5"H Premier Emblem Item #APRE 12546- 9 or Equal.	2000	Each	.49	980.00	.70	1,400.00				
0003	Emblem: School Guard Badge Patch, 2.5"W x 3.5"H Premier Emblem Item #APREM 1024-1 or Equal	100	Each	.83	83.00	1.55	1,550.00				
0004	Emblem: Chevron, Sergeant. The sergeant chevrons are to be 3 7/8" high and 3 1/8" wide, three gold embroidered bars on navy (dacron/cotton twill key #4) back-ground, with black trim. , 3 1/8" W x 3 7/8" H Premier Emblem Item #APRE 22407-06 or Equal	800	Each	.48	384.00	1.05	840.00				

5 of 5

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS							
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>Rite Choice Uniforms Inc.</i>		<i>Point Emblems</i>					
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907									
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐											
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0005	Emblem: Chevron, Corporal. The corporal chevrons are to be 3 1/8" high and 3" wide, two gold embroidered bars on navy (dacron/cotton twill key #4) background, with black trim 3 1/8" W x 3 1/8" H Premier Emblem Item #APRE 22407-17 or Equal	1200	Each	.39	468.00	.86	1,032.00				
SECTION 2 (Items 0006 - 0033)											
0006	Badge, Officer, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Roman, Blue; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Blackington Style # B-1549 or Equal	100	Each	No Bid							
0007	Badge, Sergeant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Roman, Blue; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Blackington Style # B-1549R or Equal	20	Each	No Bid							

595

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS							
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>Rite Choice</i> <i>Uniforms Inc.</i>		<i>Point</i> <i>Emblems</i>					
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907									
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐											
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0008	Badge, Lieutenant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reverse; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch, 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W); Eagles head is applied as a panel; 2 STARS or Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; Blackington Style # B-1549-R or Equal	20	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
0009	Badge, Captain, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reverse; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; 3 Stars or Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Reversed Blue Blackington Style # B-1549-R or Equal	20	Each	<i>no bid</i>							

595

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS							
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>Rite Choice Uniforms Inc.</i>		<i>Point Emblems</i>					
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907									
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐											
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0010	Badge, Communication, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Roman, Blue; Hard Enamel; Safety Catch; Eagles head is applied as a panel; Numbers To Be Provided At Time Of Order; 3 1/2 (H) x 2 1/2 (W) Blackington Style # B-1549R or Equal	8	Each	<i>No Bid</i>							
0011	Cap Badge, Sergeant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660 or Equal	20	Each	<i>No Bid</i>							
0012	Cap Badge, Officer, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660 or Equal	60	Each	<i>No Bid</i>							
0013	Cap Badge, Lieutenant, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reversed; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660-R or Equal	15	Each	<i>No Bid</i>							

595

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS							
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>Rite Choice Uniforms Inc.</i>		<i>Point Emblems</i>					
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907									
		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17									
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY											
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐											
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0014	Cap Badge, Captain, Finish: Hi-Glo; Strike Solid; Badge Text: Block, Blue Reversed; Hard Enamel; Screw Back; 2 1/2 (H) x 3 1/4 (W) Blackington Style # B-1660-R or Equal	15	Each	<i>No Bid</i>							
0015	Insignia: Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 1, Blackington or Equal	30	Each	<i>No Bid</i>							
0016	Insignia: : Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 2, Blackington or Equal	30	Each	<i>No Bid</i>							
0017	Insignia: : Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 3, Blackington or Equal	30	Each	<i>No Bid</i>							
0018	Insignia: : Finish: Gold; 1/2" Solid Polished Brass, 2 Prong, Clutch Back, 2 Per Set., Custom Cutout 4, Blackington or Equal	30	Each	<i>No Bid</i>							

595

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS							
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>Rite Choice Uniforms Inc.</i>		<i>Point Emblems</i>					
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907									
		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17									
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY											
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐											
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0019	Insignia: Cutout Letters ½" P.D. Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington Style #A7336 or Equal	75	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
0020	Insignia: Cutout Letters ½" OFC. , Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	30	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
0021	Insignia: Large Sgt. Chevrons, Finish: Smooth, Gol-Tone-CI (Military Sgt.) Dimensions: 15/16" (W) x 13/16" (H) Blackington Style J130 or Equal	30	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
0022	Insignia: Small Lt. Bars, Smooth, Finish: Gol-Tone-CI Dimensions: 3/4" (W) x 1/4" (H) Blackington Style #J61G or Equal	30	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
0023	Insignia: Large Lt. Bars, Finish: Smooth Gol-Tone-CI Dimensions: 1" (W) x 3/8" (H) Blackington Style #J62G or Equal	30	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
0024	Insignia: Small Capt. Bars, Finish: Smooth Gol-Tone-CI Dimensions: 13/16" (W) x 3/4" (H) Blackington Style J63G. or Equal	30	Each	<i>no bid</i>							

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS							
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>Rite Choice</i> <i>Uniforms Inc.</i>		<i>Point</i> <i>Emblems</i>					
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907									
		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17									
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY											
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐											
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0025	Insignia: Large Capt. Bars, Finish: Smooth, Gol-Tone- CI Dimensions: 1 1/16" (W) x 1" (H) Blackington Style J64G. or Equal	30	Each								
0026	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" C I B Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	40	Each								
0027	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" K-9 Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington A9224:or	15	Each								
0028	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" 700 Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	10	Each								
0029	Commendation Bars: Officer of the Year Finish: Yellow/White/Yellow/White/Yellow Width : 1 3/4" Height : 3/8"	20	Each								
0030	Insignia Honor Guard – Finish: Gold with Enamel White and Royal Blue Width : 1 3/8" Height : 5/16"	30	Each								
0031	Insignia: Cutout Wheel With Wings(royal Blue Enamel) & Arrow Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	40	Each								
0032	Insignia: Cutout Letters 1/2" M. I. Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	10	Each								

595

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS							
Commodity: BADGES, PATCHES, & MEDALS FOR POLICE DEPARTMENT				<i>Rite Choice Uniforms Inc</i>		<i>Point Emblems</i>					
Category: 8015 BADGES & EMBLEMS		Requisition No: 17-03907									
Agency: CENTRAL GARAGE - SUPPLY		Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/24/17									
Sealed Bid ☒ Price Inquiry ☐ Definite Quantities ☐											
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
0033	Insignia: Cutout Letters ½" HQ Finish: Hi-Glo Blackington or Equal	20	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
SECTION 3 (Items 0034 - 0037)											
0034	Medal of Valor - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet clamshell case in white gift box	20	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
0035	Medal of Merit - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet case with white gift box	20	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
0036	Purple Heart - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet case with white gift box	20	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
0037	Life Saving - Includes Ribbon Medal and Bar Pin In black velvet case with white gift box	20	Each	<i>no bid</i>							
Vendor				TOTAL AMOUNT							
				CASH DISCOUNT							
Special Cond.				NET AMOUNT							
Buyer				DELIVERY							
DSS				QUOTE TOTAL							
				AWARD							
NOTES: See Bid Worksheet											

595