Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity:

Date:

Category:

Requisition No;| A18-90976

Agency: l-)epartment of Development

Bid Opening:

6/28/2018 CB Morgan

or

Equipment & Services

F.0.B:

Closing Date

LLC

Delivery Requirements:

Purchase Period:

item
No.

Sealed Bid ____ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities____

Constructio
Management
Enterprises LLC

Ronano Ward
Construction LLC

Peak Enterprises Inc

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

QUANTITY

UNIT OF

MEASURE Unit Price Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Demolition services, raised pier
construction, single story or first floor of
multi-story construction

SQ. Ft. $ 425] % 4.25

15.00 | $ 15.00

No Bid

No Bid

Demolition services, raised pier
construction, second story and each
additional story.

SQ. Ft. $ 4401 % 4.40

10.00

10.00

8.00]$ 8.00

No Bid

No Bid

Demolition reinforced concrete slab-on
grad construction, single story or first
floor of multi-story construction, including
demolition and removal of slab.

SQ. Ft. $ 625] % 6.25

10.00

10.00

25.00 | $ 25.00

No Bid

No Bid

Demvolition reinforced concrete slab-on
grade construction, second story and
each additional story.

SQ. Ft. $ 475($ 4.75

10.00

10.00

9.00]% 9.00

No Bid

No Bid

Demolition, reinforced concrete slab-on
grade, including demolition and removal
of slab.

SQ. Ft. $ 6.25]$ 6.25

10.00

10.00

10.00] $ 10.00

No Bid

No Bid

Removal, hauling and disposal of existing
debris (debris not generated by
demolition services), excluding tires

Cu Yd $ 4850 | $ 48.50

18.00

18.00

150.00 | $ 150.00

No Bid

No Bid

Removal, hauling and disposal of
asbestos containing flooring materials.

SQ. Ft. $ 7001 $ 7.00

6.00

6.00

40.00 | $ 40.00

No Bid

No Bid

Removal, hauling and disposal of
asbestos siding, sheathing and insulation
materials.

SQ. Ft. $ 3.45]§ 3.45

2.00

2.00

40.00| $ 40.00

No Bid

No Bid




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity:

Date:

Category:

Requisition No:| A18-0976

Agency: Department of Development

Bid Opening:

6/28/2018

or

F.0.B:

Closing Date

Delivery I-Requirements:

Purchase Period:

—

ltem
No.

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___

CB Morgan

LLC

Equipment & Services

Constructio
Management
Enterprises LLC

Ronano Ward
Construction LLC

Peak Enterprises Inc

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

QUANTITY

UNIT OF
MEASURE

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price Amount

Unit Price Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Removal, hauling and disposal of
asbestos ceiling and wall texture

SQ. Ft.

450]$

4.50

1.00] $ 1.00

$

4000} $ 40.00

No Bid

No Bid

10

Machine-placed granular material
backfill (sugar sand) , for backfill and
grading of property, swimming pools,
excavation, etc., upon completion of
machine-placed granular material
demolition.

Cu YD

19.00 | $

19.00

12.00] $ 12.00

$

25000} $ 250.00

No Bid

No Bid

1

Hand-placed granular material backfill
(sugar sand) for backfill and grading of
property, swimming pools, excavation,
etc., upon completion of hand-placed
granular material demolition.

CUYD

2400] $

24.00

30.00 | $ 30.00

$

350.00 | $ 350.00

No Bid

No Bid

12

Removal, hauling and disposal of septic
tank, including inlet line and leach field
lines.

SQ. Ft.

1,100.00 | § 1,

100.00

500.00 | $ 500.00

$

10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

13

Capping of existing sewer house
connection.

SQ. Ft.

300.00 | $

300.00

300.00 | $ 300.00

$

2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00

No Bid

No Bid

14

Removal, hauling and disposal of
asbestos containing roofing materials

SQ. Ft.

4251 8%

4.25

2001 $ 2.00

$

60.00 | $ 60.00

No Bid

No Bid




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS [ | |

Commodity: Date:

Category: Requisition No:| A18-90976

Agency: Department of Development Bid Opening: | 6/28/2018 CB Morgan Constructio Ronano Ward

or Equipment & Services Management Peak Enterprises Inc

Construction LLC

F.0.B: Closing Date LLC Enterprises LLC

Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period:

Sealed Bid___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___

tom DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY UNIT OF
No. QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

With regard to occupied main structures,
15 the disconnection of gas service to an
accessory structure

1 SQ. Ft. $ 25000 ] $ 250.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | § 2,500.00 | $§ 2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

Removal, hauling and disposal of
wooden fence , chain link fence, and
16 |ormamental iron fence , including gates,
fence posts and foundations

1 LF $ 450 | $ 450]8 200]$ 2001]$ 2000 | $ 20.00 No Bid No Bid

Furnish all necessary plywoad,
hardware, tools, labor and incidentals to
secure abandoned property, in

17 |accordance with the requirements of
Attachment C “Securing a Building
Declared Dangerous”.

1 SQ. Ft. $ 625|% 6.25]| $ 250| $ 250 | $ 40.00 | $ 40.00 No Bid No Bid

Furnish all necessary chains, padlocks,

keys, hardware, tools, labor and

18 incidentals to secure open gates by
means of padlock with swimming pools.

1 Each $ 65.00 ] § 65.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 No Bid No Bid

Furnish all equipment, pumps, hoses,
tools, labor and incidentals to draining
19 |swimming pools

1 Each $ 350.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 200.00| $ 2,500.00] $ 2,500.00 No Bid No Bid

Fumish all equipment, tools, labor and
incidentals to perforate in-ground
20 |swimming pools, prior to backfilling; with

4 inch diameter hole. 1 Each |$ 72500]$ 72500]% 20000{$ 20000|$ 600000|$ 600000] NoBid No Bid




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS |
Commodity: Date:
Category: Reguisition No:| A18-90976
Agency: Department of Development Bid Opening: | 6/28/2018 CB Morgan Constructio Ronano Ward
or Equipment & Services Management Peak Enterprises Inc
Construction LLC
F.O.B: Closing Date LLC Enterprises LLC
Delivery Requirements: burchase Period:
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___
ltem DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY UNIT OF
No. QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Removal, hauling and disposal of an
21 |above-ground pool, after draining
1 Each $ 900.00 | $ 900.00| $ 3,00000|$ 3,00000|8% 2500.00|8% 2500.00 No Bid No Bid
RACM demolition (The demolition of an
entire structure as regulated asbestos
containing material due to it being
22 |regulated under IAC 33:111 . 5151 but it
is structurally unsound and cannot be
abated).
1 Each No Bid No Bid $ 28,00000| $ 28,000.00| $ 38.00| $ 38.00 No Bid No Bid
Repair/Replace fence and/or gates that
are missing and/or disrepair for the
purpose of securing swimming pools with
four foot chain link by means of
23 |screws/mechanical fasteners and which
materials shall meet currently adopted
codes
1 LF $ 16.00 | $ 16.00 | § 25.00 | $ 2500 $ 95.00 | $ 95.00 No Bid No Bid
Hand Removal of building
24
1 SQ. Ft. $ 1000 | $ 10.00 ] $ 50.00 | $ 5000 | $ 3000 $ 30.00 No Bid No Bid




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity:

Date:

Category:

Requisition No:| A18-90976

Agency: Department of Development

Bid Opening:

6/28/2018

or

F.O.B:

Closing Date

Delivery Requirements:

Purchase Period:

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities____

CB Morgan
Equipment & Services
LLC

Constructio
Management
Enterprises LLC

Ronano Ward
Construction LLC

Peak Enterprises Inc

Item
No.

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

QUANTITY

UNIT OF
MEASURE

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

25

Non-regulated RACM demolition (The
demolition of a structure as nanregulated
asbestos containing material) due to it not
being regulated but it is structurally
unsound and cannot be abated.
Contractor shall submit receipt

of proper disposal of said material to a
site approved for RACM debris.

SQ. Ft.

No Bid

No Bid

$ 15.00 | $ 15.00

$ 28.00

$ 28.00

No Bid

No Bid

26

For emergency demolition

The required work shall be performed
within forty-eight (48) hours from the
issuance of the work order from the
Department of Development,
Neighborhood Revitalization Division and
all associated demolition debris removed
with sixt (60) hours from the issuance of
the work order from the Department of
Development, Neighbor hood
Revitalization Division Development,
Permits & Ispections.

Pricing for the emergenc demolition shall
be in the form of a price per job in
addition to the work performed.

Job

$

1,000.00

$

1,000.00

$ 1,000.00|$ 1,000.00

$ 15,000.00

$ 15,000.00

No Bid

No Bid




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity:

Date:

Category:

Requisition No:| A18-90976

Agency: Department ofTDevelopment

Bid Opening:

6/28/2018

or

F.0.B:

Closing Date

Delivery Requirements:

Purchase Period:

—

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___

CB Morgan

Equipment & Services

LLC

Constructio
Management
Enterprises LLC

Ronano Ward
Construction LLC

Peak Enterprises Inc

ltem
No.

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

QUANTITY

UNIT OF
MEASURE

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

27

For emergency coring, draining and
|backfilling of a pool.

The required work shall be performed
within thirty-six (36) hours from the
issuance of the work order from the
Department of development,
Neighborhood Revitalization Division.

Pricing for the emergency coring, draining
and backfilling of a pool shall be in the
form of a price per job in addition to the
work performed.

Job

$

1,200.00 | $

1,200.00

$ 200.00 | $

200.00

$ 5,000.00

$ 5,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

28

For Emergecy Secure.

The required work shall be completed
within twenty-four (24) hours from the
issuance oif the work order from the
Department of Development,
Neighborhood Revitalization Division.

Pricing for the secure shall be in the form
of a price per job in addition to the work
performed.

Job

$

700.00 | $

700.00

$ 200.00 | $

200.00

$ 5,000.00

$ 5,000.00

No Bid

No Bid




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity:

Date:

Category:

Requisition No:| A18-80976

Agency: Department of Development

Bid Opening:

6/28/2018

or

F.0.B:

Closing Date

Delivery Requirements:

Purchase Period:

—

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry

Definite Quantities____

CB Morgan
Equipment & Services

LLC

Constructio
Management
Enterprises LLC

Ronano Ward
Construction LLC

Peak Enterprises Inc

ltem

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

QUANTITY

UNIT OF
MEASURE

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

29

For Expedited Demolition.

The required work shall be completed
within forty-eight (48) hours from the
issuance of the work order from the
Department of Development,
Neighborhood Revitalization Division and
all associated demolition debris
removedc within sixty (60) hours from the
issuance of the work order from the
Department of Development,
Neighborhood Revitalization Division.

Pricing for the expedited demolition shall
be in the form of a price per job in
addition to the work performed.

Job

$

1,500.00 | $

1,500.00

$ 500.00 | $ 500.00

$ 10,000.00

$ 10,000.00

No Bid

No Bid




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity:

Date:

Category:

Reguisition No:| A18-80976

Agency: Department of Development

Bid Opening:

6/28/2018

or

e~

F.0.B:

Closing Date

Delivery Requirements:

Purchase Period:

Sealed Bid __ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___

Equipment & Services

CB Morgan

LLC

Constructio
Management
Enterprises LLC

Ronano Ward
Construction LLC

Peak Enterprises Inc

ltem
No.

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

QUANTITY

UNIT OF
MEASURE

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

30

For Expedited coring draining and
backfilling of a pool.

The required work shall be completed
within thirty-six (36) hours from the
issuance of the work order from the
Department of Development,
Neighborhood Revitalization Division, and
any associated debris removed within
forty-eight (48) hours from the insurance
of the work order from the Department of
Development, Neighborhood
Revitalization Division.

Pricing for the expedited coring, draining
and backfilling of a pool shall be in the
rorm of aprice per job in addition the
work, performed.

Job

$

1,200.00 | $

1,200.00

$

200.00] $ 200.00

$ 5,000.00

$ 5,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

3

For Expedited Secure.

The required work shall be ompleted
within twenty-four (24) hours from the
issuance of the work order from the
Department of Development,
Neighborhood Revitalization Division.

Pricing for the secure shall be in the form
of a price per job in addition to the work
perfomed.

job

$

800.00 | $

800.00

$

200.00] $ 200.00

$ 5,000.00

$ 5,000.00

No Bid

No Bid




