A B C D | G | H | J K L M N
1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 <5
. o o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: X
gory 9 q O $§ §
5 N s &
\
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 ,8(/0 § § Q(,O
7 or \g ¥ < g
. o §5 &
8 F.0.B: Closing Date 09 Y < é/z-
9 Z KON R
\J SO g
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
> Fo &
11 X N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN N
ltem UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
14 RECTANGLE #1
12”7 X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
15 1 450 EACH | $ 507 $ 2,28150| $ 396 $ 1,782.00| $ 5.19 2,335.50 $ -
12" X 36”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
16 2 750 EACH | $ 1014 $ 7,605.00 | $ 815 $ 6,11250| $ 10.38 7,785.00 $ -
12" X 24”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
17 3 200 EACH | $ 6.76 | $ 1,352.00 | $ 5411 % 1,082.00]| $ 6.92 1,384.00 $ -
24" X 30"
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
18 4 1000 EACH | $ 16.90 | $ 16,900.00 | $ 13.09 | $ 13,090.00 | $ 17.30 17,300.00 $ -
24" X 36”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
19 5 100 EACH | $ 20.28 ( $ 2,028.00 | $ 15951 % 1,595.00( $ 20.76 2,076.00 $ -
24" X 48”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
20 6 500 EACH | $ 27.04 | $ 13,520.00( $ 21.12 | $ 10,560.00 | $ 27.68 13,840.00 $ -
24" X 54"
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
21 7 50 EACH | $ 3042 | $ 1,521.00 $ 2295 $ 1,14750( $ 31.14 1,557.00 $ -




A B C D | G | H | J K L M N
1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 3
. L o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: X
gory 9 q O $§ OQ~
5 S S &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 § § lg)
7 or J N < Q}O)
: o F q
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O)O Y < 43'
9 2 EON S
\} N G
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
> JF& N
11 o N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
liem UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
24” X 60”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
22 8 50 EACH $ 33.80| $ 1,690.00 | $ 2646 $ 1,323.00]| $ 34.60 1,730.00 $ -
30” X 36”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
23 9 50 EACH $ 2535 $ 1,267.50 | $ 20141 $ 1,007.00| $ 25.95 1,297.50 $ -
18" X 6"
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
24 10 100 EACH $ 254 $ 254.00 | $ 213 $ 213.00( $ 2.60 260.00 $ -
127 X 6"
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
25 11 100 EACH $ 169 $ 169.00 | $ 1441 $ 14400 | $ 1.80 180.00 $ -
48” X 96”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
26 12 10 EACH $ 108.16| % 1,081.60 $ 103.83|$ 1,03830|% 110.70 1,107.00 $ -
27 RECTANGLE #2
24” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
28 13 500 EACH $ 1014 | $ 5,070.00 | $ 793|$% 3965.00( % 10.38 5,190.00 $ -
48” X 24”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
29 14 200 EACH $ 27.04 | $ 5,408.00 | $ 2111 $ 4,22200| $ 27.68 5,536.00 $ -




A B C D | G | H | J K L M N
1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 <
. o o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: X
gory g q O $§ dz~
5 S S &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 § § lg)
7 or J N < Q}O)
: o F q
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O)O Y < &
9 ) RS &
SR S
X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
> JF& N
11 o N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
ltem UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
48" X 30”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
30 15 100 EACH | $ 3380 | $ 3,380.00 | $ 3281|$ 3,281.00| $ 34.60 3,460.00 $ -
60" X 30”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
31 16 200 EACH | $ 42251 $ 8,450.00 | $ 40.06 | $ 8,012.00| $ 43.25 8,650.00 $ -
32 RECTANGLE #3, FLAT
24" X 9"
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
33 17 200(EACH $ 507 $ 1,014.00 | $ 505| % 1,010.00| $ 5.19 1,038.00 $ -
30" X 9”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
34 18 200(EACH $ 634 % 1,268.00 | $ 6.17| $ 1,23400]| $ 6.49 1,298.00 $ -
36" X 9”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
35 19 300|EACH $ 761 % 2,283.00 | $ 760|$ 2,280.00]| % 7.79 2,337.00 $ -
42" X 9"
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
36 20 200(EACH $ 886 % 1,772.00 | $ 9.00| $ 1,800.00| $ 9.08 1,816.00 $ -




A B C D | G | H | J K L M N

1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS

2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o

3 3

. L o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: X
gory g q o S S
5 $ F
> N &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 N § lg)
7 or \g T < 9
o § &
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O &
© o &
9 ZJ S é\
X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
> JF& N
11 o N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
liem UNIT OF

13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
48” X 9”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

37 21 200|EACH $ 1014 | $ 2,028.00 | $ 9.96 1,992.00| $ 10.38 2,076.00 $ -
54” X 9”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

38 22 200|EACH $ 1139 $ 2,278.00 | $ 11.52 2,304.00 | $ 11.68 2,336.00 $ -
60" X 9
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

39 23 200|EACH $ 1268 | $ 2,536.00 | $ 12.57 2,514.00 | $ 12.98 2,596.00 $ -
24” X 12”7
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

40 24 100|EACH $ 6.76 | $ 676.00 | $ 6.68 668.00 | $ 6.92 692.00 $ -
30” X 12”7
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

41 25 100|EACH $ 8451 $ 845.00 | $ 8.15 815.00 | $ 8.65 865.00 $ -
42”7 X 127
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

42 26 100|EACH $ 1183 $ 1,183.00| $ 11.74 1,174.00 | $ 12.88 1,288.00 $ -
487X 127
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

43 27 200|EACH $ 1352 | $ 2,704.00 | $ 13.21 2,642.00 | $ 13.84 2,768.00 $ -




A B C D | G | H | J K L M N

1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS

2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o

3 <

. o o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: X
gory g q O > D dz~
5 $ F
N N &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 N § lg)
7 or \g T < 9
o § &
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O &
© o &
9 ZJ S é\
X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
> JF& N
11 o N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
ltem UNIT OF

13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
60" X 127
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

44 28 50{EACH $ 16.90 | $ 845.00 | $ 16.46 823.00 | $ 17.30 865.00 $ -
66" X 127
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

45 29 50{EACH $ 1858 $ 929.00 | $ 18.25 91250 | $ 19.03 951.50 $ -
72" X 127
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

46 30 50{EACH $ 20.28 ( $ 1,014.00 | $ 19.17 958.50 | $ 20.76 1,038.00 $ -
78" X 12”7
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

47 31 50{EACH $ 2197 $ 1,098.50 | $ 20.93 1,046.50 | $ 22.49 1,124.50 $ -
84" X 127
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

48 32 50{EACH $ 2366 | $ 1,183.00 | $ 22.68 1,134.00( $ 24.22 1,211.00 $ -
7 36X 12”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

49 33 50{EACH $ 1014 $ 507.00 | $ 10.06 503.00 | $ 10.38 519.00 $ -
42”7 X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL

50 34 50{EACH $ 17.75( $ 887.50 | $ 16.76 838.00 | $ 18.17 908.50 $ -




A B C D | G | H | J K L M N
1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 3
. L o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: X
gory g q o S S
5 $ F
> N &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 N § lg)
7 or \g T < 9
o § &
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O &
© o &
9 ZJ S é\
X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
> JF& N
11 o N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
liem UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
48” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
51 35 200|EACH $ 20.28 | $ 4,056.00 | $ 19.77 3,954.00 | $ 20.76 4,152.00 $ -
54” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
52 36 100|EACH $ 2282 % 2,282.00 | $ 22.43 2,243.00 | $ 23.36 2,336.00 $ -
60” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
53 37 200|EACH $ 2535 $ 5,070.00 | $ 24.86 497200 $ 25.95 5,190.00 $ -
66” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
54 38 200|EACH $ 2789 | $ 5,578.00 | $ 27.37 5,474.00 | $ 28.55 5,710.00 $ -
72”7 X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
55 39 200|EACH $ 3042 | $ 6,084.00 | $ 29.96 5,992.00 | $ 31.14 6,228.00 $ -
84” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
56 40 200|EACH $ 3549 | $ 7,098.00 | $ 35.06 7,012.00 | $ 36.33 7,266.00 $ -
96” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
57 41 200|EACH $ 40.56 | $ 8,112.00 | $ 39.93 7,986.00 | $ 41.52 8,304.00 $ -




A B C D | G | H | J K L M N
1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 S
. L (o)
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: N
gory g q O $§ dz~
5 N s &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 § § lg)
7 or \g T < @
&) QI &
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O)O 9 < 43'
9 2 Sy S
X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
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11 X S S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
Item UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
102” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
58 42 200|EACH $ 43101 $ 8,620.00 | $ 42771 $ 8554.00| $ 44.12 8,824.00 $ -
108” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
59 43 200|EACH $ 45631 $ 9,126.00 | $ 4693 $ 9,386.00| $ 46.71 9,342.00 $ -
114” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
60 44 200|EACH $ 48171 $ 9,634.00| $ 47491 $ 9,498.00| $ 49.31 9,862.00 $ -
120” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
61 45 200|EACH $ 50.70| $ 10,140.00| $ 51.90| $ 10,380.00| $ 51.90 10,380.00 $ -
62 STREET NAME BLANKS, FLAT .100
24” X 6”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
63| 46 1|EACH $ 435( $ 435 $ 345( % 345( % 3.98 3.98 $ -
30" X 67
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
64| 47 1|EACH $ 544 $ 544 | $ 418 | $ 418 (% 4.98 4.98 $ -
36" X 67
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
65| 48 1|EACH $ 653 $ 653 $ 514 $ 514 $ 5.97 5.97 $ -




A B C D | G | H | J K L M N
1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 S
. L (o)
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: N
gory g g o >SS s
5 $ F
S N &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 N § lg)
7 or \g T < @
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8 F.0.B: Closing Date O Q &
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X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
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11 o N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
ltem UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
42" X 6”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
66| 49 1|EACH $ 761 $ 761($ 6.03 6.03 | $ 6.97 6.97 $ -
48” X 6”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
67| 50 1|EACH $ 8.70 | $ 8.70 | $ 6.70 6.70 [ $ 7.96 7.96 $ -
54” X 6”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
68| 51 1|EACH $ 979 $ 979 $ 7.70 770 $ 8.96 8.96 $ -
60" X 67
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
69| 52 1|EACH $ 1088($ 10.88 | $ 8.17 8.17($ 9.95 9.95 $ -
70 SQUARE
18” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
71 53 300|EACH $ 979 $ 2,937.00| $ 5.94 1,782.00| $ 7.79 2,337.00 $ -
24" X 24”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
72 54 300|EACH $ 1740 | $ 5,220.00| $ 10.47 3,141.00| $ 13.84 4,152.00 $ -
30” X 30”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
73 55 300|EACH $ 2719 1| $ 8,157.00| $ 16.35 4,905.00| $ 21.63 6,489.00 $ -
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1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 3
. L o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: X
gory g q o S S
5 $ F
> N &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 N § lg)
7 or \g T < 9
o § &
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O &
© o &
9 ZJ S é\
X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
> JL N
11 o N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
liem UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
36” X 36”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
74 56 200|EACH $ 39.15( $ 7,830.00 | $ 24.06 4,812.00 $ 31.14 6,228.00 $ -
48” X 48”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
75 57 10|EACH $ 69.60 | $ 696.00 | $ 52.43 52430 | $ 55.36 553.60 $ -
76 DIAMOND
18” X 18”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
77 58 100|EACH $ 9.79 | $ 979.00 | $ 6.18 618.00 | $ 7.79 779.00 $ -
24” X 24”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
78 59 50{EACH $ 1740 | $ 870.00| $ 10.65 53250 | $ 13.84 692.00 $ -
30” X 30”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
79 60 200|EACH $ 2719 $ 5,438.00 | $ 16.44 3,288.00 | $ 21.63 4,326.00 $ -
36” X 36”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
80 61 1|EACH $ 39.15( $ 39.15( $ 29.79 29.79| $ 31.14 31.14 $ -
48” X 48”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
81 62 1|EACH $ 69.60 | $ 69.60 | $ 52.43 52431 $ 55.36 55.36 $ -
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1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 3
. L o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: X
gory 9 q O $§ OQ~
5 S S &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 N § lg)
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12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
liem UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
82 OCTAGON
30” X 30”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
83 63 1000|EACH $ 27191 $ 27,190.00| $ 14.56 14,560.00 | $ 19.90 19,900.00 $ -
24” X 24”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
84 64 50{EACH $ 1740 | $ 870.00| $ 9.39 469.50 | $ 13.40 670.00 $ -
36” X 36”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
85 65 300|EACH $ 39.15| $ 11,745.00| $ 26.53 7,959.00 | $ 29.98 8,994.00 $ -
86 TRIANGLE
30” X 30” X 30”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
87 66 200{EACH $ 1631 | $ 3,262.00 | $ 8.85 1,770.00 | $ 11.60 2,320.00 $ -
36” X 36” X 36”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
88 67 100{EACH $ 3045 $ 3,045.00 | $ 13.48 1,348.00 | $ 15.57 1,557.00 $ -
89 CIRCLE
36” DIAMETER
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
90 68 50{EACH $ 39.15( $ 195750 | $ 21.88 1,094.00| $ 31.14 1,557.00 $ -
91 PENTAGON
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2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 <
. o o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: N
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13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
36" X 36”
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

92 69 100(EACH $ 39.15| $ 3,915.00 | $ 2521 $ 2,521.00( $ 3050 | $ 3,050.00 $ -
93 INTERSTATE SHIELD

24" X 24"

STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
94 70 10|EACH $ 25.01( $ 250.10 | $ 9.93( % 99.30 | $ 1420 | $ 142.00 $

30" X 24"

STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
95 71 10|EACH $ 26.10 | $ 261.00 | $ 1310 $ 131.00 | $ 17.70 | $ 177.00 $

UNIVERSAL STREET SIGN BRACKET, 12” SIGN HOLDER FOR FLAT OR EXRUDED JUMBO SIGNS, HE
CAST ALUMINUM FOR 2 3/8" ROUND POST COMPLETE WITH SET SCREWS

96

POST BRAKET (SUBMIT SAMPLE, IF

REQUESTED)

STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
97 72 1500|EACH $ 9.25| $ 13,875.00| $ 854 | $ 12,810.00| $ 8.16 | $ 12,240.00 $ -

CROSS BRACKET (SUBMIT

SAMPLE, IF REQUESTED)

STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
98 73 1500|EACH $ 9.25| $ 13,875.00| $ 854 | $ 12,810.00| $ 8.78| $ 13,170.00 $ -
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1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 N
. o o
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: N
gory g q o Y% § dz~
5 N S &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 § § lg)
7 or J N < Q}O)
: o F q
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O)O Y < &
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SN S
X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
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11 o N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
ltem UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
99 METRO "L", CANTILEVER
14 1/2 “ LONG ARM FOR FLAT AND
EXTRUDED BLADES, VS-IC OR
EQUAL
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
100| 74 150|EACH $ 795 $ 1,192.50 | $ 580 $ 870.00 | $ 565 $ 847.50 -
24" X 8.25'H X 2" LONG ARM FOR
FLAT AND EXTRUDED BLADES, VS-
IC OR EQUAL
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
101 75 150|EACH $ 1395| $ 2,092.50 | $ 1322 $ 1,983.00( $ 10.80 | $ 1,620.00 -
36" EXTRA LONG ARM, VS-B36 OR
EQUAL (SUBMIT SAMPLE, IF
REQUESTED)
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
102| 76 500|EACH NO BID #VALUE! $ 4544 $ 22,720.00| $ 5750 | $  28,750.00 -
BRANDING MATERIAL, STRAPS,
3/4” X 0.030” X 100’ STAINLESS
STEEL, TYPE C206 BAND — IT
BRAND OR EQUAL (SUMBIT
SAMPLE, IF REQUESTED)
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
103| 77 75|EACH $ 15524 $ 11,643.00| $ 6436 | $ 4,827.00( $ 80.60 | $ 6,045.00 -
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1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 <
. " (0}
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: N
gory ¢} q O $§ dz~
5 N s &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 § § lg)
7 or J N < Q}O)
: o F q
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O)O Y < 43'
9 2 Sy S
X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
N JL N
11 o N S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
Item UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
LAP SLICE (FHWA APPROVED), U-
CHANNEL BREAKAWAY SYSTEM,
EQUAL TO VULCAN RIB-BAK U-
CHANNEL POST AND LAB SLICE
COMPLETE ASSEMBLE (SUBMIT
SAMPLE, IF REQUESTED)
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
104| 78 300|EACH $ 6.80 | $ 2,040.00 | $ 6.15|$ 1,845.00( $ 11.95|$  3,585.00 -
105 U-CHANNEL SIGN POST
SEVEN (7) FOOT
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
106 79 400|EACH NO BID #VALUE! $ 1428 $ 5,712.00( $ 1313 $ 5,252.00 -
TEN (10) FOOT
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
107 80 1500|EACH NO BID #VALUE! $ 20.40 | $ 30,600.00 | $ 1875 $ 28,125.00 -
TWELVE (12) FOOT
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
108| 81 300|EACH NO BID #VALUE! $ 2449 $ 7,347.00( $ 2250 | $ 6,750.00 -
FOURTEEN (14) FOOT#
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
109 82 1|EACH NO BID #VALUE! $ 3063 | $ 3063 | $ 26.25| $ 26.25 -
STREE NAME POST, 2 3/8” X 10’
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
110] 83 600|EACH NO BID #VALUE! $ 21.35| $ 12,810.00( $ 26.13|$ 15,678.00 -

111

CLAMPS, BRACKETS, STRAPS, ETC.
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112

84

UNIVERSAL CHANNEL CLAMPS
(See drawing and must order in boxes
of 100)

STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

1000

EACH NO BID #VALUE!

$ 10.11

$

10,110.00

$ 4.20

4,200.00

113

85

24" CANTILEVER BRACKET,
STANLESS STEEL, ANTI-
ROTATIONAL (See drawing)
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

40

EACH NO BID #VALUE!

NO BID

#VALUE!

$ 25.94

1,037.60

114

86

36" CANTILEVER BRACKET,
STAINLESS STEEL, ANTI-
ROTATIONAL (See drawing)
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

150

EACH NO BID #VALUE!

NO BID

#VALUE!

$ 34.42

5,163.00

115

87

42" CANTILEVER BRACKET,
STAINLESS STEEL, ANTI-
ROTATIONAL (See drawing)
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

150

EACH NO BID #VALUE!

NO BID

#VALUE!

$ 38.30

5,745.00

116

88

TEN (10) FOOT SIGN SUPPORT
CHANNEL, ALUMINUM, EXTRUDED
AND LARGE CORNER (See drawing)
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

265

EACH NO BID #VALUE!

$ 67.09

$

17,778.85

$ 33.56

8,893.40

117

89

BUCKEL, 3/4 “ (100 PER BOX) (See
drawing)
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID

27

EACH $ 12149( $

3,280.23

$ 0.51

$

13.77

$ 25.40

685.80




A B C D | G | H | J K L M N
1 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
2 Commodity: 80109 Date: o
3 <
4 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal Requisition No: o $§ 59
5 S S &
6 Agency: Charles R Kelly Community C|Bid Opening: 11/28/18 /3(/0 § § lg)
7 or \g T < 9
. S &5 &
8 F.0.B: Closing Date O)O Y < &
9 Z RS &
SR S
X S @
10 Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q§ < N &
> JL N
11 X S S &
12 Sealed Bid _X__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ ©) AN} N
ltem UNIT OF
13 No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
“U” POST ADAPTER (See drawing and|
must order in boxes of 100)
STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID
118 90 200|EACH $ 395| $ 790.00 | $ 1132 $ 2,2264.00| $ 565|$  1,130.00 -
119(Vendors TOTAL AMOUNT #VALUE! #VALUE! $ 345,291.42 -
120|Advertise ( ) Bid Bond ( ) Ins (jcasH biscount
121{Special Conditions [ver avount #VALUE! #VALUE! $ 345,291.42 -
122 Buy(\ Date "DELIVERY




O P
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13 Unit Price Amount
14
15 $ -
16 $ -
17 $ -
18 $ -
19 $ -
20 $ -
21 $ -




O P
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13 Unit Price Amount
22 $ -
23 $ -
24 $ -
25 $ -
26 $ -
27
28 $ -
29 $ -




O P
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13 Unit Price Amount
30 $ -
31 $ -
32
33 $ -
34 $ -
35 $ -
36 $ -




O P
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13 Unit Price Amount
37 $ -
38 $ -
39 $ -
40 $ -
41 $ -
42 $ -
43 $ -




O P
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13 Unit Price Amount
44 $ -
45 $ -
46 $ -
47 $ -
48 $ -
49 $ -
50 $ -




O P
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13 Unit Price Amount
51 $ -
52 $ -
53 $ -
54 $ -
55 $ -
56 $ -
57 $ -




O P
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13 Unit Price Amount
58 $ -
59 $ -
60 $ -
61 $ -
62
63 $ -
64 $ -
65 $ -




O P
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13 Unit Price Amount
66 $ -
67 $ -
68 $ -
69 $ -
70
71 $ -
72 $ -
73 $ -




O P
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13 Unit Price Amount
74 $ -
75 $ -
76
77 $ -
78 $ -
79 $ -
80 $ -
81 $ -
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83

84

85

86

87

88

89

90

91




1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13 Unit Price Amount

92 $ -

93

94 $ -

95 $ -
FAVY DUTY

96

97 $ -

98 $ -
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103
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105

106

107

108

109

110

111
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114

115

116

117
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119
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122




