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BLACK & WHITE DIGITAL COPYING SERVICES
Copies to include reductions & enlargements 25% - 400% in 1%
1 increments 1 Pe’qu‘:“e $0.0¢ 50.04 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
o0
Bond
BLACK & WHITE DIGITAL COPYING SERVICES
Copies to include reductions & enlargements 25% - 400% in 1%
2 increments 1 Pe‘f“‘:""e $0.12 $0.12 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
00
Vellum
BLACK & WHITE DIGITAL COPYING SERVICES
Copies to include reductions & enlargements 25% - 400% in 1%
3 increments 1 ""FS"“(“’"‘ $0.15 $0.15 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
00!
Mylar, double matte
BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
4 8112 x 11" 1 Each $0.029 50.028 50.00 $0.00 50.00 50,00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00
o x
BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
3 8-1/2" x 14" 1 Each 50.04 50.04 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00
BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
6 PP 1 Each $0.05 50,05 $0.00 50,00 50.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00
X
BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
L 17" x 36~ ! Each $0.20 50.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00
BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
8 20% % 36° 1 Each 50.24 $0.24 $0.00 50.00 50,00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 50,00 50.00
BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
9 22 x 34" 1 Each $0.24 $0.24 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
|BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
L 22% x 36~ 1 Each 5024 50.24 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0,00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 50.00
BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
L 24" x 36" 1 Each 50.2¢ 50.24 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00




| I I I | I I | I
Commodity: 20372, 96214, 96627, & 96676 Date: 5/29/2019
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BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
12 6" x 52" 1 Each $0.50 $0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
i 0.00 0.00 0.00
13 Bum black and white image to disc 1 Per Meg $2.00 §2.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0¢ $ S
BLACK & WHITE COPIES, STANDARD, ON 20 # PAPER
Per Square
4 A 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
! Scanning for black & white copies ! Foot 3004 S0.04 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 50.00 H
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 28 # PAPER
15 B2 1 Each $0.14 5014 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00
1-1,000
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 28 # PAPER
16 &127x 11 1 Each 50,13 50.13 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50,00 50.00 50.00
1,001 & up
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 28 # PAPER
17 BNZx e 1 Each 50.17 5017 50,00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50,00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00
1-1,000
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 28 # PAPER
B-1/2" x 147
18 1 Each §0.15 $0.15 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
1,001 & up
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 24 # PAPER
19 N 1 Each §0.19 $0.19 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
1-1,000
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 24 # PAPER
Mox 17"
20 L 1 Each $0.17 $0.17 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00
1,001 & up
COLCR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 24 # PAPER
21 4y 36 1 Each 5048 5048 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50,00 $0.00 s0.00 $0.00
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COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 24 # PAPER
2 oy a6 1 Each $0.48 3048 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 24 # PAPER
L Prespy 1 Esch $048 $0.48 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 24 # PAPER
24 22" x 36" 1 Each $048 $048 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 24 # PAPER
L - 1 Each $0.75 $0.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD., ON 24 # PAPER
Per Square 00 .00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
26 Scanning for color copios 1 Fout $0.50 $0.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0 $0
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 24 # PAPER
! X X .00 0.00 $0.00
27 | amcolor image to disc 1 Per Meg $2.00 $2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0. H
COLOR COPIES, STANDARD, ON 24 # PAPER
2 | R Disc 1 Each $2.00 $2.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BINDING
GBC SPIRAL 812" x 11°
29 1 Each $0.75 $0.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Up to 100 sheots
BINDING
GBC SPIRAL 812" x 11°
30 1 Each $0.75 $0.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
101 - 250 shects
BINDING
GBC SPIRAL 8-172"x 11"
3 1 Each $0.75 $0.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
251 - 500 sheets
POST BINDING 8-1/2°x 11°
32 o004 sheots 1 Each $1.00 $1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
POST BINDING 8172 x 11°
" X X .00 X X
33 1) or 3 Holo Punch s PRpy— 1 Each $1.00 $1.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0,00 $0.00 $0. $0.00 $0.00
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POST BINDING 8-172x 11" 65 _—
$0.00 $0.00 :
1.00 1.00 0.00 50,00 $0.00 $0.00 50,00 $0.00 50,00 $0.00
3 ez Fold Prints 117 x 17" ! Encn % 3 ¥
STRIP BINDING FOR LARGE DOCUMENTS 24" x 36° -
35 1 Each 50.10 $0.10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.
Up to 100 sheets
STRIP BINDING FOR LARGE DOCUMENTS 24" x 36" w000 <000 -
0 H L
; A 50.00 50,00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.01
% | e 1 Each 50.10 50.10
POST BINDING FOR LARGE DOCUMENTS p—
37 |RxE” 1 Each s0.10 $0.10 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 :
176 and up
STAPLING FOR BINDING 0.00
28 B2 x 11" 1 Per Book 50,02 $0.02 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50,00 50,
STAPLING FOR BINDING o
qp WMt 1 Per Book 5002 $0.02 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 s
PRESENTATION SUPPLIES
40 1 Per Sy 52.50 5250 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 30.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00
Dry mounting Foot i 2
PRESENTATION SUPPLIES $0.00
Per Square 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 {
1 250 : $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 i
o Lamination (Both Sides) Foot 3 250
PRESENTATION SUPPLIES
2 1 Fec Squne $250 5250 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00
Foam Core Board Foot ’
BLUEPRINTING SUPPLIES FOR BLU-RAY 350
0.00 0.00 0.00
43 Paper, blue, fast speed, sheet size 24" x 367, 16 Package $54.00 $864.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 s0.00 $0. $ $
250 sheets per pkg.
PLOTTER SUPPLIES
FOR HP. DESIGN JET 755
“ 2 Roll $18.75 $37.50 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 5000 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 50,00 $0.00 50,00
High Gloss Photographic Paper 36" x 100' per roll.
PLOTTER SUPPLIES
FOR H,P. DESIGN JET 755
45 45 Roll $18.75 $843.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Inkjet Bond, 24Ib., 24" x 50 yds. per roll
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PLOTTER SUPPLIES
FOR H.P. DESIGN JET 755
46 25 Roll $24.00 $600.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Inkjet Bond, 241b., 36" x 50 yds. per roll
PLOTTER SUPPLIES
FOR H.P. DESIGN JET 755
47 2 Roll $1875 $37.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00
Coated Bond, color, 24 Ib., 24" x 50 yds. per roll
PLOTTER SUPPLIES
FOR H.P. DESIGN JET 755
48 2 Roll $24.00 $48.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Coated Bond, color, 24 Ib,, 36" x 50 yds. per roll
PLOTTER SUPPLIES
FOR H P. DESIGN JET 755
49 20 Each $95.00 $1,900.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 s0.00 $0.00 §0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00
Inkjet 4 mil. DLB Matte Film, 24" x 125 fi. erasable
PLOTTER SUPPLIES
FOR H.P. DESIGN JET 755
50 2 Each $125.00 $250.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Inkjet 4 mil. DLB Matte Film, 36" x 125 ft. erasable
INK CARTRIDGE WITH PRINTHEAD FOR HP755CM PRINTER,
42ML
51 5 Each $4500 $225.00 §0.00 §0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Yellow, HP51644Y
INK CARTRIDGE WITH PRINTHEAD FCR HP755CM PRINTER,
42ML
52 5 Each $45.00 $225.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Cyan, HP51644C
INK CARTRIDGE WITH PRINTHEAD FOR HP755CM PRINTER,
42ML
53 5 Each $45.00 $225.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 §0.00 §0.00
Magenta, HP51644M
INK CARTRIDGE WITH PRINTHEAD FOR HP755CM PRINTER,
42ML
54 5 Each $45.00 $225.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Black, HP51645
INK CARTRIDGE FOR HP1055CM PRINTER, 350ML
i 0.0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00
5 lyellow, C4848A 8 Each $183.00 $1,464.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00
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INK CARTRIDGE FOR HP1055CM PRINTER, 350ML
36 ] Each $183.00 $1,464.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Cyan, C4B846A "
INK CARTRIDGE FOR HP1055CM PRINTER, 350ML
0.00 50.00 $0.00
0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 §
5 [Magenta, C4847A 8 Each $183.00 $1,464.00 $0.0
INK CARTRIDGE FOR HP1055CM PRINTER, 350ML
00 $0.00 $0.00
i | $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.
58 Black, HP CA8T1A 12 Each $183.00 $2,196.00 $0.00 $0.00
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR HP1055CM COLOR
PRINTER
59 3 Each §210.00 $630.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Yellow, C4823A
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR HP1055CM CCLOR
PRINTER
60 3 Each §210.00 $620.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Cyan, C4821A
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR HP1055CM COLOR
PRINTER
61 3 Each §210.00 $620.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Magenta, C4822A
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR HP1055CM COLOR
PRINTER
62 3 Each $210.00 $630.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Black, C4820A
HP1055 VALUE PACK, INCLUDES 350ML INK CARTRIDGE,
PRINTHEAD AND CLEANER
3 5 Each NO-BID 50.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50,00 50.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00
Yellow, C4893A
HP1055 VALUE PACK, INCLUDES 350ML INK CARTRIDGE,
PRINTHEAD AND CLEANER
64 6 Each NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Cyan, C4891A
HP1055 VALUE PACK, INCLUDES 350ML INK CARTRIDGE,
PRINTHEAD AND CLEANER
65 ] Each NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Magenta, C4892A
HP1055 VALUE PACK, INCLUDES 350ML INK CARTRIDGE,
PRINTHEAD AND CLEANER
66 6 Each NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Black, C4830A
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INK CARTRIDGE FOR HPB00PS, 63ML
0.00 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00
67 Yellow, C4313A 6 Each $47.00 $282.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $ $
INK CARTRIDGE FOR HPB0OPS, 69ML
68 6 Each $47.00 $282.00 50.00 50,00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00
Cyan, C4911A
INK CARTRIDGE FOR HPBOOPS, 6IML
] 0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
69 Magenta, 43124 6 Each $47.00 $282.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 H
INK CARTRIDGE FOR HPBOOPS, 6ML
0.00 0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00
70 Black, C4844A 6 Each $47.00 $282.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 H s
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR HP80OPS
. .01 0.00 50.00 50.00 50,00 $0.00 50,00 $0.00
e Yellow, C4B13A 6 Each $44.00 $264.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 K
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR HP80OPS
7 g 0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00
2 Cyan, C4811A 6 Each $44.00 $264.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 H
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR HP80OPS
I 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 50.00 $0.00
Magenta, CAB12A 6 Each $44.00 $264.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 H
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR HP80OPS
i .00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00
L Black, C4810A 6 Each $44.00 $264.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.0
SUPPLIES FOR OCE 9600/TDS 600
L] X I ! 0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00
Tonar, contents: 2454 gram bottles, 49600, color: black 5 Each $182.00 $910.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 s
SUPPLIES FOR OCE 8600/TDS 600
76 .00 0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 50,00
paper, Bond, 24 width x 500" length, 3" core. 5 Each $17.00 $85.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50 s
SUPPLIES FOR OCE 9600/TDS 600
n . i 0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00
Paipar, Bind, 36 width x 500" length, 3" core. 5 Each $25.00 $125.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 8
SUPPLIES FOR OCE 9600/TDS 600
i 00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 50,00
78 |Paper, Matte Film, 4 mil.dib, 24" width x 500" longth, 3* core. s Bach 3105.00 350000 30.00 300 st S0 30
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Commodity: 20372, 96214, 96627, & 96676 Date: 5/29/2019
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Requisition No: — :
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A19-0502 BLUE PRINT SERVICES AND SUPPLIES RI% IN dh i ﬁ g. 4
4
Bid Opening:| 52812019 ~ XN il i
(<]
or B 4 4
o m—
& —
F.O.B: Closing Date P *“"h-.___‘_____
gs "‘-\____\_‘
@9
&
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: § b
Qé‘
&£
Sealed Bid _X_ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities. T
TOPTITTT
T, LNOP i j Am Unit Pri Amount | Unit Price| Amount | Unit Price| Amount | Unit Price| Amount
ltem No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY ANNUAL USE| MEASURE UnitPrice |  Amount | UnitPrice| Amount | UnitPrice| Amount | UnitPrice| Amount | UnitPrice | Amount | UntPrice | Amount | UnitPrice| Amount | UnitPrice] Amount | Unit Price ount | Unit Price | Amount rice| L rice nt | U _Am
SUPPLIES FOR OCE 9600/TDS 600
0.00 0.00
79 Paper, Matte Film, 4 mil. dib, 36" width x 500" length, 3" 5 Each $145.00 $725.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.0 §
core.
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR OCE' TCS500
80 ] Each $225.00 $1,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $000 $0.00
Cyan, 25 ML .
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR OCE' TCS500
81 8 Each $225.00 $1,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Magenta, 25 ML
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR OCE’ TCS500
82 8 Each $225.00 $1,800.00 30.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Yellow, 25 ML
PRINTHEAD WITH CLEANER FOR OCE’ TCS500
83 8 Each §225.00 $1,800.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Black, 25 ML :
INK TANK FOR OCE’ TCS500
84 8 Each $180.00 §1,440.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00
Cyan, 400 ML
INK TANK FOR OCE' TCS500
85 8 Each $180.00 $1.440.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00
Magenta, 400 ML
INK TANK FOR OCE' TCS500
86 B Each $180.00 $1.440.00 $0.00 $0.00 §$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Yellow, 400 ML
INK TANK FOR OCE'’ TCS500
87 8 Each $180.00 $1,440.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 §0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Black, 400 ML
MAINTENANCE CASSETTE FOR OCE' TCS500
8 |Maintenance Cassette 2 Each $195.00 $390.00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 50,00 $0.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 s0.00
Meodel: 05522
MISCELLANECUS
. $0.00
. 0. 0.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
B9 Metro Key Map Book 25 Book $39.00 $975.00 $0.00 $
TOTAL FOR ANNUAL CONTRACT NO: A19-0502 $33,468.09 $0.00 $0,00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 30.




[ I [ I I I I I [ I T | I [
Commodity: 20372, 86214, 96627, & 96676 Date: 5/28/2019

|Requisition No: e
A19-0502 BLUE PRINT SERVICES AND SUPPLIES

—— ]
Bid Opening: 5129/2019 ﬂn
(]
or o ¥
¢ | ]
F.0.B: Closing Date W.ro ...llll.alfrlrll.
-
huo lllffl.l.l-lr
&
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period. .um,
o
&£
&
Sealed Bid _X_ Price Inquiry___Definite Quan!| <
T
EST. UNIT OF
ftem No DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY ANNUAL USE| MEASURE Unit Price | Amount UnitPrice | Amount | UnitPrice |  Amount | Unit Price | Amount | UnitPrice | Amount | UnitPrice | Amount | UnitPrice| Amount | Unit Price| Amount |Unit Price| Amount | UnitPrice | Amount | Unit Price| Amount | Unit Price| Amount | UnitPrice| Amount
Vendors TOTAL AMOUNT
Advertise { X ) Bi CASH DISCOUNT
Special Conditions. NET AMOUNT
|Buyer: DB Date x/x/2019 DELIVERY




