Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

VENDORS

ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS

A19-0166

FOR POLICE VEHICLES

Category: Requisition No:
A19-0166
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 19-00166

Teeco Safety

Dana Safety
Supply

Safety Solutions

Agency: Bid Opening Date:
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET O O
10/08/19 c j
MANAGEMENT —_
SECTION 1 MANUFACTURER: FENEX
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0001 OEM Feniex Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price
of $5,000.00 is excluded.
. ) Finiex MSRP
Price List Used and Date of Issue July MAP 2019 Sep. 26.2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 23.00% 67.00%
0002 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost Waive
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0003 |delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock S EEEEEELL SRR BN
Feniex equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.
SECTION 2 MANUFACTURER: HAVIS
Item
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0004 OEM Havis Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price
of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue| Website 2019 | Web Site 2019
Percentage Discount 29.00% 42.00%
0005 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost 32.00% 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0006 [delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock BEEEEEEEES EEE BB SO0

Havis equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.




Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

VENDORS

ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS

A19-0166

FOR POLICE VEHICLES

Category: Requisition No:
A19-0166
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 19-00166

Teeco Safety

Dana Safety
Supply

Safety Solutions

Agency: Bid Opening Date:
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET O O
10/08/19 c j
MANAGEMENT —_
SECTION 3 MANUFACTURER: JOTTO DESK
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0007 OEM Jotto Desk Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount
price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue| Website 2019 Jan 2019
Percentage Discount 20.00% 40.00%
0008 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost 33.00% 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0009 |delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock S EEEEEELL SRR BN
Jotto Desk equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.
SECTION 4 MANUFACTURER: LIND
Item
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0010 OEM Lind Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price of
$5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue Websiite 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 10.00%
0011 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0012 [delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock BEEEEEEEES EEE BB SO0

Lind equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.




Summary of Quotations VENDORS VENDORS
A19-0166
ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS > _B\
FOR POLICE VEHICLES + (O] %)
Category: Requisition No: HC_G 8 a o
- =
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 A19-0166 n ] % 5
19-00166 (@) c N 1)
Agency: Bid Opening Date: 8 © >
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET L0/08/19 o © 0o 29
MANAGEMENT i & -
SECTION 5 MANUFACTURER: MOTOROLA
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0013 OEM Motorola Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount
price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue Jan 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 16.00%
0014 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0015 |delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock S EEEEEELL SRR BN
Motorola equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.
SECTION 6 MANUFACTURER: PANORAMA
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0016 OEM Panorama Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount
price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue Jan 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 26.00%
0017 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0018 [delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock BEEEEEEEES EEE BB SO0

Panorama equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.




Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

VENDORS

ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS

A19-0166

FOR POLICE VEHICLES

Category: Requisition No:
A19-0166
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 19-00166

Teeco Safety

Dana Safety
Supply

Safety Solutions

Agency: Bid Opening Date:
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET O O
10/08/19 c j
MANAGEMENT —_
SECTION 7 MANUFACTURER: SETINA
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0019 OEM Setina Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price
of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue 4/26/2019 July 2019
Percentage Discount 19.00% 34.00%
0020 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost 35.00% 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0021 |delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock S EEEEEELL SRR BN
Setina equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.
SECTION 8 MANUFACTURER: TROY
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0022 OEM Troy Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price of
$5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue July 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 26.00%
0023 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0024 [delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock BEEEEEEEES EEE BB SO0

Troy equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.




Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

VENDORS

ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS

A19-0166

FOR POLICE VEHICLES

Category: Requisition No:
A19-0166
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 19-00166

Teeco Safety

Dana Safety
Supply

Safety Solutions

Agency: Bid Opening Date:
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET O O
10/08/19 c j
MANAGEMENT —_
SECTION 9 MANUFACTURER: WHELEN
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0025 OEM Whelen Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price
of $5,000.00 is excluded.
. . 6/28/19
Price List Used and Date of Issue
i i u PL19 1WD July 2019
Percentage Discount 46.00% 48.00%
0026 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost 32.00% 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0027 |delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock S EEEEEELL SRR BN
Whelen equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.
SECTION 10 MANUFACTURER: GAMBER JOHNSON
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0028 OEM Gamber Johnson Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net
discount price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue Website 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 43.00%
0029 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock
0030 *kkkkkkkkk K*kkkkkkkkk *kkkkkkkkk kkkkkkkkkk

Gamber Jonhnson equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the
invoice.




Summary of Quotations VENDORS VENDORS
A19-0166
ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS > _B\
FOR POLICE VEHICLES + (O] %)
Category: Requisition No: HC_G 8 a o
- =
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 A19-0166 n ] % 5
19-00166 (@) c N 1)
Agency: Bid Opening Date: 8 © >
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET L0/08/19 o © 0o 29
MANAGEMENT i & -
SECTION 11 MANUFACTURER: CRADLEPOINT
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0031 OEM Cradlepoint Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount
price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue Jan 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 10.00%
0032 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0033 |delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock S EEEEEELL SRR BN
Cradlepoint equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.
SECTION 12 MANUFACTURER: PROGARD
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0034 OEM Progard Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount
price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue 7/1/19 July 2019
Percentage Discount 18.00% 33.00%
0035 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost 30.00% 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0036 [delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock BEEEEEEEES EEE BB SO0

Progard equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.




Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

VENDORS

ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS

A19-0166

FOR POLICE VEHICLES

Category: Requisition No:
A19-0166
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 19-00166

Teeco Safety

Dana Safety
Supply

Safety Solutions

Agency: Bid Opening Date:
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET O O
10/08/19 c j
MANAGEMENT —_
SECTION 13 MANUFACTURER: PATRIOT
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0037 OEM Patriot Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price
of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue July 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 10.00%
0038 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0039 |delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock S EEEEEELL SRR BN
Patriot equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.
SECTION 14 MANUFACTURER: D & R ELECTRONICS
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0040 OEM D & R Electronics Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net
discount price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue July 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 20.00%
0041 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock D
0042 *kkkkkkkkk K*kkkkkkkkk *kkkkkkkkk kkkkkkkkkk

& R Electronics equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the
invoice.




Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

VENDORS

ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS

A19-0166

FOR POLICE VEHICLES

Category: Requisition No:
A19-0166
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 19-00166

Teeco Safety

Dana Safety
Supply

Safety Solutions

Agency: Bid Opening Date:
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET O O
10/08/19 c j
MANAGEMENT —_
SECTION 15 MANUFACTURER: FEDERAL SIGNAL
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0043 OEM Federal Signal Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net
discount price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue Jan 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 43.00%
0044 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0045 delivery of parts: F:O.B. Destmanon,. Prepa|q and aIIoweq on orders of any stock e e o e
Federal Signal equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the
invoice.
SECTION 16 MANUFACTURER: BROOKINGS INDUSTRIES
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0046 OEM Brookings Industries Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net
discount price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue Jan 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 35.00%
0047 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0048 delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock R e

Brookings Industries equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the

invoice.




Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

VENDORS

A19-0166

ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS

FOR POLICE VEHICLES

Category: Requisition No:
A19-0166
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 19-00166

Teeco Safety

Dana Safety
Supply

Safety Solutions

Agency: Bid Opening Date:
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET O O
10/08/19 c j
MANAGEMENT —_
SECTION 17 MANUFACTURER: OPS PUBLIC SAFETY
Item
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0049 OEM OPS Public Safety Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net
discount price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue July 2019
Percentage Discount No Bid 25.00%
0050 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost
or
Percentage of Cost No Bid 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock
005 l ) . . . . *kkkkkkkkk kkkkkkkkkk
OPS Public Safety equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the
invoice.
SECTION 18 MANUFACTURER: WESTIN
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0052 OEM Westin Standard Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price
of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue No Bid July 2019
Percentage Discount 36.00%
0050 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
/53 Restock
Cost No Bid $20.00
or
Percentage of Cost
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0054 [delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock BEEEEEEEES EEE BB SO0

Westin equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.




Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

VENDORS

ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS

A19-0166

FOR POLICE VEHICLES

Category: Requisition No:
A19-0166
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 19-00166

Teeco Safety

Dana Safety
Supply

Safety Solutions

Agency: Bid Opening Date:
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET O O
10/08/19 c j
MANAGEMENT —_
SECTION 19 MANUFACTURER: ACE K9 ELECTRONICS
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0055 OEM Ace K9 Electronics Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount
price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue No Bid Jan 2019
Percentage Discount 5.00%
0056 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost No Bid
or
Percentage of Cost 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0057 delivery of parts': F.O.B.. Destination, Prepa|d anc! allowed on.orders of any stock e R e e
Ace K9 Electronics equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the
invoice.
SECTION 20 MANUFACTURER: AMERICAN ALUMINUM
Item
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0058 OEM American Aluminum Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount
price of $5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue No Bid Jan 2019
Percentage Discount 30.00%
0059 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost No Bid
or
Percentage of Cost 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0060 delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock R e

American Aluminum equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the

invoice.




Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

VENDORS

A19-0166
ORIGINAL EQUIPMENT MANUFACTURER STANDARD REPLACEMENT PARTS

Code 3 equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.

>
> +—
FOR POLICE VEHICLES + (O] %)
Category: Requisition No: HC_G 8 o o
A19-0166 o 5
5516,17,36,37,57,67,74,78,79,89 n c > 5
19-00166 (@) c N 1)
Agency: Bid Opening Date: 8 © >
CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET L0/08/19 o © 0o 29
MANAGEMENT i & -
SECTION 21 MANUFACTURER: SOUND OFF
Item
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0061 OEM Sound Off Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price of
$5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue No Bid July 2019
Percentage Discount 55.00%
0062 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost No Bid
or
Percentage of Cost 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0063 [delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock S EEEEEELL SRR BN
Sound Off equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.
SECTION 22 MANUFACTURER: CODE 3
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0064 OEM Code 3 Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price of
$5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue No Bid July 2019
Percentage Discount 45.00%
0065 Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
Restock
Cost No Bid
or
Percentage of Cost 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0066 [delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock BEEEEEEEES EEE BB SO0
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CENTRAL GARAGE - FLEET 10/08/19 o © 0o 29
MANAGEMENT i & -
SECTION 23 MANUFACTURER: GO RHINO
Iltem
No. DESCRIPTION UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
0067 OEM Go Rhino Replacement Parts; any parts item with a net discount price of
$5,000.00 is excluded.
Price List Used and Date of Issue No Bid July 2019
Percentage Discount 21.00%
Restocking Charge - State the Restocking Charge OR the Percentage of Cost to
0068
Restock
Cost No Bid
or
Percentage of Cost 20.00%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for any freight charges for expedited
0069 |delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock S EEEEEELL SRR BN

Go Rhino equipment. Orders will be shipped prepaid and added to the invoice.

TOTAL AMOUNT

CASH DISCOUNT

NET AMOUNT

DELIVERY

QUOTE TOTAL

AWARD

NOTES:




