
NAMES OF VENDORS

Item 

No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

0001

HELMET (Model: Galvion Caiman  Ballistic 

Helmet 4-0530-5177 UPC: 638632218625 

BLACK – MEDIUM or Approved Equal

18 EACH $1,371.85 $24,693.30 $1,198.45 $21,572.10 $705.88 $12,705.84 $1,155.00 $20,790.00 $1,155.00 $20,790.00 NO BID NO BID

0002

HELMET (Model: Galvion Caiman  Ballistic 

Helmet 4-0530-5179 UPC: 638632218649 

BLACK – LARGE or Approved Equal) 

12 EACH $1,371.85 $16,462.20 $1,198.45 $14,381.40 $705.88 $8,470.56 $1,155.00 $13,860.00 $1,155.00 $13,860.00 NO BID NO BID

0003

HELMET (Model: Galvion Caiman  Ballistic 

Helmet 4-0530-5181 UPC: 638632218663 

BLACK - XLARGE

or Approved Equal)

5 EACH $1,371.85 $6,859.25 $1,198.45 $5,992.25 $705.88 $3,529.40 $1,155.00 $5,775.00 $1,155.00 $5,775.00 NO BID NO BID

0004

HELMET  (Model: Galvion Batlskin  Viper A3 

Helmet  4-0525-9973 - V-A3 MC 1H BLK MSS 

MEDIUM or Approved Equal 

1 EACH $404.55 $404.55 $545.45 $545.45 $705.88 $705.88 $335.00 $335.00 $335.00 $335.00 NO BID NO BID

0005

HELMET  (Model: Galvion Batlskin  Viper A3 

Helmet –4-0525-9974- V-A3 MC 1H BLK MSS – 

LARGE or Approved Equal) 

8 EACH $404.55 $3,236.40 $545.45 $4,363.60 $705.88 $5,647.04 $335.00 $2,680.00 $335.00 $2,680.00 NO BID NO BID

0006

HELMET  (Model: Galvion Batlskin  Viper A3 

Helmet  4-0525-9975- V-A3 MC 1H BLK MSS – 

XLARGE or Approved Equal

1 EACH $404.55 $404.55 $545.45 $545.45 $705.88 $705.88 $335.00 $335.00 $335.00 $335.00 NO BID NO BID

$52,060.25 $47,400.25 $31,764.60 $43,775.00 $43,775.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$52,060.25 $47,400.25 $31,764.60 $43,775.00 $43,775.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$52,060.25 $47,400.25 $31,764.60 $43,775.00 $43,775.00 $0.00

SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

Commodity: Date:

HELMETS 07/01/20

Category: Requisition No:

Bid Opening or

Closing Date:

Delivery

(X) Advertise   (  ) Bid Bond     (  ) Ins 
Total Amount

POLICE - SRT 08/05/20

Sealed Bid    X          Price Inquiry              Definite Quantities ___ 

Total Amount

Cash Discount
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POLICE PROTECTION EQUIPMENT

M4585

19-04585

Agency:

NOTES: 

Buyer: DSS TOTAL AWARD
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Net Amount


