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Municipal Annex Building . - 805 SL Louls St
Currently house approx. 23 employees
:I:Lu_l.;mogr::duln Monday ~ Friday Between B:00 7705 5q. FL Sq.FL 07517 500 - - o — e —
Base Price in accardance with allached
specifications.

Municipal Annex Building . - 805 SL Louls SL
0002 |Gurrently house approx. 23 employees 25688 5q. FL 5q.FL NO CHARGE 03000 12000 NO CUARGE NO CHARGE

Shampoo Carpet [once per year]

0001 00650

NO CIIARGE 0.5000 NO CHARGE| NO HID

Municipal Annex Bullding . -805 St. Louls St

0003 |Currently houss approx. 23 employess 5,137 5. FL Sa FL NO CUARGE 07500 Ha000 —

Strip / Wax Bare Floors (once per year)
fon Flougs Juntor High Schoal and Sewer Fee

. 1100 Laurel Street - Cursenlly house approx.47
employeas.

D004 | eaning Schedule: Monday - Friday 6a.m. ~3pm. | 2000 S&-FL SqFL Lokt oinn 33430 o130

Base Price in accordance wilh attached

NO CHARGE NO CILARGE) 08500 NO CHARGE NONID

0.0140 0.0700 NO Jn 00800 00750

01d Baton Rouge Junior High School and Sawer Fee
. 1100 Laurel Street - Gurrently house approx.47 .
0005 [ e v il 18,464 Sq. FL. sq.FL NO CHARGE s.2000 119000 NOCIARGE a0
Shampoo Carpel (once par year}
Old Balon Rouge Junlar High School and Sewar Fee
. 1100 Laure! Sireet - Gurrently hou; 4T ;
mpmu‘:‘ real - Currantly hause spprox. 5,536 Sq. FL Sq.Ft NO CHARGE 07500 285000 NO CIARGE, NOCILARGE, NO CHARGE
|Strip  Wax Bara Floors (once per year)
Inspection Division 300 North 10th Street Currently
house approx.76 employees.
Cleaning Schedule: Monday - Friday 7 a.m. - 12 9,145 Sq. FL sq.F1. 05030 03500 L0510 02100 0900 a.0%00 0.0847
noon Base Price in accordance with atlached
specifications.

NO CHARGE | NO CILARGE. NO pID

NO CHARGE NO D

Lo 00700 00770

=1

Inspection Division 300 North 10th Streel Gurrently

house approx.76 employees. ) )
b Cleaning Schedule: Monday — Friday 7 a.m. - 12 4270 80,11, Sg.FL NO CHARGE 0.2500 15.5000 NO CHARGE| NO CTARGE! NO CHARGE,
noon Sham; ¢ year

0.5000 NO CHARGE| NO mp

Inspeclion Division 300 North 10ih Streel Currently|
houte approx.76 employees. . !
Cleaning Schedule: Monday - Friday 7 a.m. - 12 487889, FL Sg.FL NOEmARCE 7500 33.1000 NO CIIARGE o580 NO CHARGE 8500
anon Sirin{ Wax Rare Finors innce nar vaan
Weed Cutting Operations. 343 Chippewa Streel -
Currently house approx. 8 smployees Cleaning
0010 |Schedule: Monday ~Friday B am. -8 a.m. 00 5q, FL Sq.FL 12500 LoTeo 10900
Base Price In accordance with altached
specificalione,

2 NO CIHIARGE | NO BID

L1seo NO BID 01500 Q1250 02000 6.1700

Weed Cutting Oparations. 343 Chippewa Street -
y house approx. 3 employees Cleaning

Schedule: Mmﬂ-ypfFlldlr [ :: sam 900 59 F1. Sq.FL NO CHARGE 0.7500 57,8000 NO CIIARGE NOBID NO CHARGE 08500 NO CHARGE
Strip / Wax Bare Floors {once per year)

NO RID

o014

Fleet Management 333 Chippewa Sireet Cleaning
Schedule; Monday - Friday § a.m. - § p.m.

%932 | Basa Price in accordance with attached TR Bd FL Sa.FL Loy 1.0000 02093 12800 X0 B

specifications.

03000 02500 o.1500

Flee! Managemen! 333 Chippewa Streel Gleaning
0013 |Schedule: Monday ~ Friday 8 a.m. -5 p.m. 160 5q. FL Sq.FL NO CIIARGE NOBID

Shampoo Carpel {once per year}

CUARGE 0.6000 1450000 NO CHARGE,| NO BID NO CHARGE| 0.5000

Fleot Management 333 Chippewa Street Claaning
0014 |Schedule: Monday — Friday & a.m. -8 pm. 5405q, Fi. Sq.FL NO CIARGE 07500 56,9000 NO CILARGE|

Strip/Wax Bare Floors (once per year)

NO BID NO CHARGE | 08500 KO CHARGE

Central Garage and Service Slation 333 Chippewa

Street Cleaning Schedule: Monday - Friday 8 a.m. -
3,540 Sq. F1, 5q.FL L7 0.3900 09565 0.4200 NO BID 0.0480 0.0954 0.0600

ice In accordance with attached
s pecifications.

Cenlral Garage and Service Station 333 Chippewa

Streel Cleaning Schedule: Monday - Friday B am. - i
3,940 Sq. FL. Sa. FL NO CHARGE 0.7500 33.1000 NO CHARGE NO WD NO CHARGE 0.8500 NOCHARGE NOBID

5p.m.
StripiWax Bare Floors (once per year)

North Landfill Weigh Station 16001 Samuel Road
Cleaning Schedule: Tues. & Thur. 10 a.m. - 12 noon

Base Price in accordance with attached SR Sq. L 03350 1.0000 18200 o300 Nomp
apecifications.

01750 03500 03000

Narth Landlill Welgh Station 16001 Samual Road
0018 |Cleaning Schedule: Tues. 8 Thur. 10am. - 12noon| 765 Sq. FL sa.FL NO CHARGE w3500 NO CHARGE Nomp NO CILARGE 08500

Strip/Wax Bare Fioors (once per year)

NO CHARGE NOomD

South Wasle Water Plant 2850 Garders Lane -

Currently house approx. 50 employees Cleaning .
973 1S chedule: Monday - Friday 8 a.m. - § pm, Base Spasy, Su.FL 1amo o0 02100 wis00
Price in with attached

0.5000 0.0690 01800 1840

South Wasle Walet Plani 2850 Gardere Lane -
0.8500 NO CHARGE NOBID

StripWax Bare Floors (once per year)

Curtently house appiox. 60 employees Cleaning a :
0020 Scheciula: Monday — Friday & am.— & pm. 5,448 Sq. FL. Sq.Fl. NO CHARGE,| BI000 (BR ‘ NO €HARGE| NO CHARGE| NO CHARGE)|
T

~
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ih Wasie Waler Plant ipecker - Currently

e 30 Cleaning
ppi

0021 |Monday, Wednesday & Friday 8a.m—5 p.m. Base 3.000 Sq. Ft. Sq.FL 13130 o.4700 13070 02100 01000 1300 00670

Price in with atlached

01500 0.1300

North Waste Water Plant 50 Woodpecker - Cutrenlly
house approx. 30 employees, Cleaning Schedule: e

0022 Mw,,r fv,dmd.';"; Sriday s -'?nm 2,000 8q. Ft. sq.FL NOCHARGE 7500 38,1000 NO CHARGE NO CIARGE NO CHARGE oason

StripMWax Bare Floars (once per year)

NO CHARGE | Nommn

Gentral Waste Waler Plant 2443 River Road -
(Currently house approx. 12 employees. Cleaning

0023 | chedule: Monday  Friday 8 a.m. - § p.m. Base 008 S B &4-Fl- Hm s 13550 01100 52100 0.1300 0.5000

Price In accordance with attached specifications.

03000 01300

Ceniral Waste Water Plant 2443 River Road -
rox, 12 employees. Cleani

e y"f ¥ikday g o g} 3,000 5q. Ft. Sq. FL NO CHARGE 03500 In1000 NOCIAKGE NO CHARGE NO CHARGE Rs08 NOCTIARGE,

StripWax Bare Floors (once pef year)

NOBRID

0024

Jewel J. Newman Community Center 2013 Central

[ERT] 0.0600 0.5000

10,800 Sq. Fe. Sq.FL 0.6950 01500 21860 0z100 00900 0.0400

ice In accordance wilh allached

Bas
specifications.

Jewel J. Newman Community Center 2013 Central

Road - Currenily house approx,12 . ’ .
0028 | leaning Schedule: Mondsy - Friday B a.m. - § p.m. %00 5q. Ft Sa.FL N@CHARGE 300 23000 NOCIHARGE NO CILARGE
Shampaa Carpet fance per year)

NO CHARGE| a.5000 NO CHARGE| NomiD

Jewal J. Newmnan Gommunity Ganter 2013 Central
oozz |Foad -Currenly housa approx.12 employees. ’

Cleaning sdlfd,IIJII: l‘on:;d - Frld;ym= am. -§pm. A0S 4Pk N EIARGE e NO.CIARGE NOCHARGE NOCIARGE L
Strip/Wax Bare Floors {once per year)

NOCHARGE NO BID

Regiatrar of Volers office 11010 Courzey Bivd.
Currently house approx.12 employees Cleaning

02 | hecle: Monday — Friday 8 a.m.— 5 am. Bass 1400 5q, Fu So.FL 35710 Lo osz40 02100 0.4000 03000

Price in accordance with allached specifications,

01790 0.2500 1000

Regisirar of Voters office 11010 Coursey Bivd.
Currently house approx.12 employees Cleank . !

0029 M:: s w;‘f - m."::’_spm ™ 1,400 Sq. FL Sq.FL NO CIARGE| 0.7500 56,9000 NO CHARGE NOCHARGE NO CILARGE 0.8500

Strip/Wax Bare Floors fonce per year)

NO CILARGE NO D

DES Fisld Pump Mainienance Unit 2443 River Road.
Cutrenily housa approx.12 emplayees. Cleaning

0030 | < chedule: Monday — Friday B am. -5 pm. Basa 372054, Fe 8q.FL Lo Ll Lok ex100 02000 0.1480 o.1010

Price i wilh attached

0.0300 01400

DES Field Pump Maintenance Unil 2443 River Road.
Currently house approx,12 employees. Cleaning §

0031 | hedule: Monday — Friday B a.m. - 6 p.m. 1720 8q.FL Sq.FL. NOCHARGE 07500 39.0000 NO CHARGE, NOCHARGE| NO CHARGE, a.8500

StripWax Bare Floors (once per year)

NO CHARGE, NO D

0032 |Emergency Cali Oul 1 HOUR 310000 1500000 10,0000 30,0000 35,0000 £5.0000 50.0000 200000 NO CHARGE|

0033 |Weekend Call Oul 1 HOUR 37.0000 3750000 10.0000 30,0000 30.0000 50000 50,0000 20.0000 NO CIARGE

Vendors NET AMOUNT

(X) Bid Bond [ ) Inz {X) Informal { } CASH DISCOUNT % 1%

Special Condilions : DELIVERY TOTAL AMOUNT

Buyer : MWhite Date 111672020 DELIVERY




