
Sealed Bid   X   Price Inquiry__  Definite Quantities___ 

Item No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

0001

SECTION 1 – Brand: Fechheimer Flying Cross or Approved 

Equal RAINWEAR (#78240 Reversible Rain Pant – Unisex 

Regular: S, M, L, XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

70 Each 57.48 NB 64.00 No Bid

0002

SECTION 1 – Brand: Fechheimer Flying Cross or Approved 

Equal RAINWEAR (#78240 Reversible Rain Pant – Unisex 

Regular: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

20 Each 57.48 NB 64.00 No Bid

0003

SECTION 1 – Brand: Fechheimer Flying Cross or Approved 

Equal RAINWEAR (#76120 Reversible Rain Coat– Unisex 

Regular: S, M, L, XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

40 Each 119.50 NB 145.00 No Bid

0004
RAINWEAR (#76120 Reversible Rain Coat – Unisex Regular: 

2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Approved Equal)  Per Specifications
15 Each 119.50 NB 175.00 No Bid

0005
RAINWEAR  #76120– Reversible Rain Coat Unisex Long: M, 

L, XL or Approved Equal)  Per Specifications
15 Each 119.50 NB 145.00 No Bid

0006
RAINWEAR (#76120 Reversible Rain Coat  Unisex Long: 2XL, 

3XL, 4XL or Approved Equal)  Per Specifications
5 Each 119.50 NB 160.00 No Bid

0007
TACTICAL SAFETY VEST (#71500 Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 

3XL, 4XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
100 Each 48.89 NB 42.00 No Bid

0008
MEN’S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT (#411R7851Z Dept. Class A 

Size: 14.5” – 18.5” or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
70 Each 45.48 NB 40.00 No Bid

0009
MEN’S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT (#411R7851Z  Dept. Class A 

Size: 19.0” – 22.0” or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
30 Each 52.89 NB 40.00 No Bid

0010
MEN’S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT (#761R7851Z Dept. Class A 

Size: 14.5” – 18.5” or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
450 Each 44.25 NB 38.00 No Bid

0011
MEN’S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT (#761R7851Z Dept. Class A 

Size: 19.0” – 22.0” or Approved Equal) Per Specifications  
50 Each 48.25 NB 38.00 No Bid

0012
MEN’S TROUSERS (TR070 – Baton Rouge PD Dept. Class A 

(Size: 28-44 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 
400 Each 41.29 NB 38.00 No Bid

0013
MEN’S TROUSERS (TR070 – Baton Rouge PD  Dept. Class A 

Size 46-60 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
150 Each 43.29 NB 38.00 No Bid

0014
SOFTSHELL JACKET (#54100 Regular - Size: S, M, L, XL, 

2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
70 Each 111.90 NB 100.00 No Bid

0015
SOFTSHELL JACKET (#54100 Long Size – M, L, XL, 2XL, 

3XL, 4XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
30 Each 111.90 NB 105.00 No Bid
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0016
SWEATER (#74086 Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications
100 Each 107.40 NB 85.00 No Bid

0017

OC SPRAY HOLDER, STANDARD, TOP FLAPSHORT  

(Safariland #38-2-4HS Black basket-weave with concealed 

snap) or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

125 Each 26.48 26.04 22.00 19.72

0018

HANDCUFF POUCH TOP FLAP, HIDDEN SNAPLONG  

(Safariland #190-4HS Black basket-weave with concealed 

snap)or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

35 Each 27.48 30.55 25.00 22.72

0019

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” 

(Safariland Model 87-28-8B  Dutybelt, black basket-weave 

laminate with brass buckle or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications 

35 Each 53.89 56.17 49.00 44.72

0020

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-30-8B Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle) or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

35 Each 53.89 56.17 49.00 44.72

0021

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-32-8B Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle or Approved Equal) Per Specifications  

35 Each 53.89 56.17 49.00 44.72

0022

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-34-8B Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

35 Each 53.89 56.17 49.00 44.72

0023

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-36-8B Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

35 Each 53.89 56.17 49.00 44.72

0024

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-38-8B  Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

35 Each 53.89 56.17 49.00 44.72

0025

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” Safariland Model 

87-40-8B or  black basket-weave laminate with brass buckle 

or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

35 Each 53.89 56.17 49.00 44.72

0026

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-42-8B  Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

35 Each 53.89 56.17 49.00 44.72

0027

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-44-8B Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle) or Approved Equal)  Per Specifications

20 Each 53.89 56.17 49.00 44.72
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0028

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-46-8B  Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle or Approved Equal)  Per Specifications

20 Each 59.89 57.79 49.00 44.72

0029

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-48-8B  Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle) or Approved Equal)  Per Specifications

15 Each 59.89 59.42 49.00 44.72

0030

SUEDE LINED BELT WITH BUCKLE, 2.25” (Safariland Model 

87-50-8B  Dutybelt, black basket-weave laminate with brass 

buckle  or Approved Equal)  Per Specifications

5 Each 59.89 61.03 49.00 44.72

0031

DOUBLE HANDGUN MAGAZINE POUCH (Safariland Model 

77-83-4MHS Black basket-weave with concealed snap)  or 

Approved Equal)  Per Specifications

25 Each 32.88 33.34 30.00 25.10

0032
BELT KEEPER, HIDDEN SNAP  (Safariland Model 62-4HS 

Black basket-weave) or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
125 Each 14.94 19.10 20.00 14.72

0033
COMPACT LIGHT HOLDER (Bianchi 7926-22097  Black 

basket-weave or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
125 Each 19.89 13.60 11.00 10.10

0034
OPEN TOP HANDCUFF CASE (Bianchi 7934 Black basket-

weave or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
125 Each 26.89 21.53 18.00 16.72

0035

JACKET (Super Shell Jacket With Fleece Liner – Blauer 9970-

60 – Size Regular/Tall: S, M, L –  or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications 

25 Each 479.49 NB 160.00 No Bid

0036

JACKET (Super Shell Jacket With Fleece Liner – Blauer 9970-

60 – Size Regular/Tall: XL, 2XL, 3XL –  or Approved Equal) 

Per Specifications

5 Each 479.49 NB 160.00 No Bid

0037

ALL WEATHER PANTS (Blauer Tac Shell Duty Over Pants – 

Blauer 9825Z - Color: Dark Navy 04 – Size Regular/Tall: S, M, 

L -  or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 

20 Each 220.49 NB 80.00 No Bid

0038

ALL WEATHER PANTS (Blauer Tac Shell Duty Over Pants – 

Blauer 9825Z - Color: Dark Navy 0) – Size Regular/Tall: XL, 

2XL, 3XL  –  or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 

10 Each 220.49 NB 80.00 No Bid

0039

ZIP-OFF BIKE PANTS (BLAUER ZIP-OFF BIKE PANTS - 

Blauer 8822Z – Color: Dark Navy 04) – Size Regular/Long: 28 - 

42 -   or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

40 Each 88.49 NB 64.00 No Bid



Summary of Quotations VENDORS

Sealed Bid   X   Price Inquiry__  Definite Quantities___ 

Item No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Agency:

Category:

A20-20072

POLICE - SUPPLY 12/02/20 G
a
ll
s
, 
L

L
C

T
o

m
 M

e
a
g

h
e
r,

 
In

c
. 
d

b
a
 

G
u

id
ry

's
 

U
n

if
o

rm
s

B
a
rn

e
y
's

 
In

c
. 

Commodity:

A20-20072

20072

 

Bid Opening

Requisition No:

T
E

E
C

O
 

S
a
fe

ty
 I
n

c
. 

0040

ZIP-OFF BIKE PANTS (BLAUER ZIP-OFF BIKE PANTS - 

Blauer 8822Z  – Color: Dark Navy 04) – Size Regular/Long: 44 

- 50 -  or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

12 Each 88.49 NB 64.00 No Bid

0041

PANTS 8666 BLAUER FLEX RS  COVERT TACTICAL PANTS 

WITH TUNNEL WAISTAND, COLOR: DARK NAVY [04] or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications

900 Each 54.99 NB 43.00 40.49

0042

SHIRT 8362 BLAUER FLEX RS ARMORSKIN  SHORT 

SLEEVE BASE SHIRT COLOR: DARK NAVY [04] or Approved 

Equal) Per Specifications

900 Each 51.89 NB 43.00 39.70

0043

SHORT SLEEVE POLO SHIRT (Ufx Ultra-Light Color Block 

Short Sleeve Polo Shirt - Elbeco Style K5213/K5214 – Size: 

XS, S, M, L, XL – or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

40 Each 68.48 NB 52.00 39.26

0044

SHORT SLEEVE POLO SHIRT (Ufx Ultra-Light Color Block 

Short Sleeve Polo Shirt - Elbeco Style K5213/K5214 – Size: 

2XL, 3XL, 4XL – or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 

12 Each 68.48 NB 52.00 39.26

0045

LOOSE FIT DOUBLE KNEE WORK PANTS (Dickies 85283 – 

Color:  Dark Navy DN) – Men’s Size: 28 – 42 –  or Approved 

Equal) Per Specifications

150 Each 25.89 24.26 38.00 No Bid

0046

LOOSE FIT DOUBLE KNEE WORK PANTS (Dickies 85283  – 

Color:  Dark Navy DN) – Men’s Size: 44 – 58 – or Approved 

Equal) Per Specifications

50 Each 28.89 28.06 38.00 No Bid

0047

SHORT SLEEVE WORK SHIRT (Dickies 1574 – Color: Dark 

Navy DN) – Men’s Size: SM, M, L, XL – or Approved Equal) 

Per Specifications

125 Each 20.89 19.49 18.00 No Bid

0048

SHORT SLEEVE WORK SHIRT (Dickies 1574 – Color: Dark 

Navy DN) – Men’s Size: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL, 5XL, 6XL – or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications 

75 Each 23.49 20.49 18.00 No Bid

0049

MEN’S JACKET – Size: Small (First Tactical Men’s Tactix 

System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

20 Each 273.50 356.45 250.00 290.48

0050

MEN’S JACKET – Size: Medium (First Tactical Men’s Tactix 

System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

20 Each 273.50 356.45 250.00 290.48
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0051

MEN’S JACKET – Size: Large (First Tactical Men’s Tactix 

System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

40 Each 273.50 356.45 250.00 290.48

0052

MEN’S JACKET – Size: XL (First Tactical Men’s Tactix 

System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

40 Each 273.50 356.45 250.00 290.48

0053

MEN’S JACKET – Size: 2XL (First Tactical Men’s Tactix 

System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

40 Each 273.50 356.45 250.00 290.48

0054

MEN’S JACKET – Size: 3XL (First Tactical Men’s Tactix 

System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

5 Each 273.50 363.39 250.00 290.48

0055

MEN’S JACKET – Size: 4XL (First Tactical Men’s Tactix 

System Jacket – 118502  or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

5 Each 273.50 363.39 250.00 290.48

0056
PANTS (First Tactical 11401 Men’s V2 Tactical Pant or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications
125 Each 41.94 49.41 34.00 40.49
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