SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity:
KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Category:

16545, 73, 20149,24020, 28, 44561
KITCHEN SUPPLIES

Agency:
DHDS - ADMINISTRATION
Sealed Bid _X

Date:
11/17/20

Requisition No:
M12751
20-12751
Bid Opening or
Closing Date:
1217120

Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities

Douglas Food Stores, Inc.
dba Douglas Equipment

Pasco Brokerage, Inc

Caire Hotel & Restaurant

Supply Inc

Lafayette Restaurant

Supply Inc.

Schneider Paper

Pueblo Hotel Supply

The Hollson Experience

LLC

Strategic Equipment LLC

Lodging Kit Company

Ducote's Restaurant Bar

and Equipment

Chef's Depot

ltem
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

QUANTITY

ONIT
OF
MEASURE

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE

g
Z

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

SPATULA (Model: Rubbermaid
0001 |F1913000000 or Approved Equal) Per

EACH

$3.82

$2.55

$1.95

$1.87

$14.04

No Bid

$3.26

$1.83

$17.00

$1.78

$1.38

specifications
WERSORING TUP

{Model: Oneida Hospitality Group

fo0z MEA-CUP or Approved Equal) per

SET

$5.75

$3.50

$2.25

$2.21

$12.28

$3.31

$5.71

2.18
1.82

No Bid

$2.25

$2.29

SoecHications

MEASURING CUP (Model: Cambro
0003 |100MCCW135 or Approved Equal) per
Specifications

10

EACH

$6.07

$7.40

$6.35

$6.53

$8.54

$6.41

$13.70

$7.09

$10.45

§6.78

$2.51

BAKERY DISPLAY MARKET TRAY
0004 |(Model: Cambro 1318MT110 or

Approved Equal) per Specifications

1,440

EACH

$9.53

$10.10

$10.05

$10.06

$10.84

$10.06

$21.50

$11.13

$16.00

$10.64

$9.65

CABINET / FOOD PAN CARRIER
0005 |{Model: Cambre UPC600110 or

Approved Equal per Specifications

EACH

$584.38

$517.00

$590.00

$628.88

$825.00

$1,371.14

$670.00

$682.27

$1,031.65

$652.61

$511.01

FOOD STORAGE CONTAINER (Model:
Cambro 2SFCW135 or Approved
Equal) per Specifications

0006

288

EACH

$3.79

$3.50

$3.67

$4.80

$3.60

$8.55

$3.98

§6.10

$3.81

$3.46

FOOD STORAGE CONTAINER {Model:
0007 |Cambro 4SFCW135 or Approved
Egual) per Specifications

288

EACH

$5.78

$6.15

$5.35

$5.60

$7.02

$13.05

$6.08

$9.30

$5.81

$5.29

FOOD STORAGE CONTAINER (Model:
0008 |Cambro 6SFCW135 or Approved

Equal) per Specifications

288

EACH

$7.49

$7.95

$7.00

$7.12

$9.14

$7.12

$16.90

$7.88

$12.10

$7.53

$6.77

FOOD STORAGE CONTAINER COVER
0009 |(Model: Cambro SFC2SCPP190 or
Approved Equal) per Specifications

EACH

$1.64

$1.75

$1.55

$1.59

$2.33

$1.56

$3.70

$1.72

$2.75

$1.65

$0.97

COMPARTMENT TRAY (Maodel: Carlisle
0010 |4398802 or Approved Equal) per
Specifications

1,440

EACH

$8.69

$7.20

$7.50

$6.77

$8.22

$3.56

$20.36

$7.05

$12.25

$10.08

$8.38

SALAD FORK (Model: Winco 004-06 or

o011 Approved Equal) per Specifications

1,880

PER DOZEN

$1.58

$1.80

$1.67

$1.75

$1.99

$1.74

$1.78

$3.25

$1.84

$1.84

COFFEE / TEASPOON (Model: Winco
0012 |0002-01 or Approved Equal) per

Specifications

1,880

PER DOZEN

$0.94

§1.10

$0.98

$1.04

$1.22

$6.79

$2.72

$1.05

$1.95

§1.09

$1.09

STANDARD ROUND BOWL DISHER
0013 I(Model: Volirath 47139 or Approved

Equal) per Specifications

120

EACH

$7.03

$8.50

$7.50

$7.62

$9.47

§7.82

$16.70

B.42
3.66

$13.50

$8.27

$5.13




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date: g ~ " N
KITCHEN SUPPLIES 11/17/20 £E E 3 = - @
) a g - c . =
Category: Requisition No: 8 E ] a £ = = g E §
16545, 73, 20149,24020, 28, 44561 M12751 a3 & 2 3 5 g a E E 5.
KITCHEN SUPPLIES 20-12751 o W & &© 5 2 @ o} 5 3 %5 i
v : -] o o8 ] o @ = o - o E o
Bid Opening or d %' = T 0 (] = £ 5 w £ 83 3
Agency: Closing Date: w3 o E £ 2E 5 = % 5 2 23 g
DHDS - ADMINISTRATION 1217120 3o 8 o R 2 2 2 z s 2 9 sy %
g n = o B s ] @
Sealed Bid _X Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities 23 & Sa E @ 2 & =] a S a5 S
ORIT T T
Item OF UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
—
STANDARD ROUND BOWL DISHER
0014 |{(Model: Vollrath 47140 or Approved 120 EACH 8.42
IEguaI] per Specifications $7.03 §8.50 $7.50 $7.82 $9.47 $7.82 $16.70 3.66 $13.50 $8.27 §5.13
STANDARD ROUND BOWL DISHER
0015 |(Model: Vollrath 47143 or Approved 120 EACH 8.42
Equal) per Specifications $7.03 $8.50 $7.50 §7.82 $9.47 §7.82 $16,70 3,66 $13.50 §8.27 $5.07
KNIFE SET (Model: Victronix Swiss
0016 |Army No. 7.4012-X11 or Approved 8 SET 130.23
Equal) per Specifications $121.77 $144.45 $135.00 $137.09 No Bid $92.43 $272.00 120.43 No Bid $130.63 $133,72
PARING KNIFE (Model: Dexter Russell
0017 |S104SC-3RWC or Appraved Equal) per 8 EACH 12,23
Sgeciﬁ:allons $29.20 $17.65 $13.00 $13.46 No Bid $2.62 $24.70 3.76 No Bid $12.23 $12.78
0018 OVEN MITT (Model: Winco.OMT-‘IT or 72 EACH 292
Approved Equal) per Specifications $2.59 52.95 $2.95 52.88 $3.97 $2.85 $7.52 9.20 $4.60 $3.02 $3.02
SLOTTED SERVING SPOON {Model:
0019 |Browne USA Foodservice 573181 or % EACH 10.96
Approved Equal) per Specifications §6.97 $9.50 $9.75 $9.85 No Bid $6.51 $23.10 2.56 No Bid $10.86 $11.36
SLOTTED SERVING SPOON (Model:
0020 [Browne USA Foodservice 573174 or 96 EACH 14.73
Approved Equal) per Specifications $12.05 $12.70 $13.00 $13.11 No Bid No Bid $31.04 15.00 Ne Bid $14.60 $15.26
SOLID SERVING SPOON (Model:
0021 |Browne USA Foodservice 4750 or 120 EACH 14.83
Approved Equal) per Sgeciﬁcalions $2.08 $2.20 $2.20 $2.26 No Bid $1.45 $1.96 14.18 No Bid $2.52 $0.82
SOLID SERVING SPOON (Model:
0022 |Browne USA Foodservice 4760 or 120 EACH 2.81
Approved Equal) per Specifications §2.30 $2.45 $2.50 $2.50 No Bid $1.59 $2.27 0.60 No Bid $2.78 50.89
SOLID SERVING SPOON (Model:
0023 |Browne USA Foodservice 4770 or 120 EACH 3.07
Approved Equal) per Specifications $2.51 $2.65 $2.70 $2.73 Ne Bid $2.34 $2.62 0.66 No Bid $3.04 $1.01
Total A
Cash Discount|
Net Amount,
Delivery
{X) Advertise ( )BidBond { )Ins Total Amount|
Buyer: DSS TOTAL AWARD
NOTES:




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
KITCHEN SUPPLIES 11/17/20

Category: Requisition No:
16545, 73, 20149,24020, 28, 44561 M12751
KITCHEN SUPPLIES 20-12751
Bid Opening or
Agency: Closing Date:
DHDS - ADMINISTRATION 12117120

Sealed Bid _X Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities

ant

Food Stores, Inc.
Paper

R

Supply Inc
y e
Supply Inc

dba Douglas Equipment
Pasco Brokerage, Inc
Caire Hotel & Restaurant
Pueblo Hotel Supply
The Hollson Experience
|LLC

Strategic Equipment LLC
Lodging Kit Company
Ducote's Restaurant Bar
and Equipment

Chef's Depot

D

1

ORIT \
Item OF UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT |
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL| PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
SPATULA {(Model: Rubbermaid

0001 |F1913000000 or Approved Equal) Per 25 EACH
specifications $3.82 $2.55 $1.95 $1.87 $14.04 No Bid §3.26 $1.83 $17.00 $1.78 $1.38

CUF
(Model: Oneida Hospitality Group
MEA-CUP or Approved Equal) per

0002 10 SET 2.18

$5.75 $3.50 §2.25 $2.21 $12.28 $3.31 $5.71 1.82 No Bid $2.25 $2.20

{

'a

|

!

!
MEASURING CUP (Model: Cambro E -
0003 |100MCCW135 or Approved Equal) per 10 EACH | A
Specifications $6.07 $7.40 $6,35 $6.53 $8.54 $6.41 $13.70 $7.09 $10.45 $6.78 $2.51 |
BAKERY DISPLAY MARKET TRAY {
0004 |(Model: Cambro 1318MT110 or 1,440 EACH ‘
Approved Equal) per Specifications $9.53 $10.10 $10.05 $10.06 $10.84 $10.08 $21.50 $11.13 $16.00 $10.64 $9.65 !
CABINET / FOOD PAN CARRIER {
0005 |{Model: Cambro UPCE00110 or 8 EACH
Approved Egual per SEeci‘ﬁcatlnns $584.38 $517.00 $590.00 $628.88 $825.00 $1,371.14 $670.00 $682.27 $1,031.65 $652.61 $511.01
FOOD STORAGE CONTAINER (Model:
Cambro 2SFCW135 or Approved 288 EACH
Equal) per Specifications. $3.79 $4.00 $3.50 $3.67 $4.80 $3.60 $8.55 $3.98 §6.10 $3.81 $3.46
FOOD STORAGE CONTAINER (Medel:
0007 |Cambro 4SFCW135 or Approved 288 EACH
Equal) per SEGCIﬁcaIions $5.78 $6.15 $5.35 $5.60 $7.02 $5.50 $13.05 $6.08 $9.30 $5.81 $5.29

0006

FOOD STORAGE CONTAINER (Model:
0008 |Cambro 6SFCW135 or Approved 268 EACH
Eqgual) per Specifications 57.49 $7.95 $7.00 $7.12 $9.14 §7.12 $16.90 $7.88 $12.10 $7.53 $6.77

|Foop sTorAGE cONTAINER cOVER
0009 j(Model: Cambro SFC2SCPP190 or 144 EACH

Approved Equal) per Specifications $1.64 $1.75 $1.55 $1.59 $2.33 $1.56 $3.70 $1.72 $2.75 $1.65 $0.97

COMPARTMENT TRAY (Model: Carlisle
0010 4398802 or Approved Equal) per 1,440 EACH
Specifications $8.69 $7.20 $7.50 $6.77 $8.22 $3.56 $20.36 $7.05 $12.25 $10.08 $8.38

SALAD FORK (Model: Winco 004-06 or 1,880 PER DOZEN

0011 Ergi
Approved Equal) per Specifications $1.58 $1.80 $1.67 $1.75 $1.99 $1.74 54.58 $1.78 $3.25 $1.84 51,84

COFFEE / TEASPOON (Model: Winco
0012 |0002-01 or Approved Equal) per 1,880 PER DOZEN
Specifications $0.94 $1.10 $0.98 $1.04 $1.22 $6,79 $2.72 $1.05 $1.95 $1.09 $1.09

STANDARD ROUND BOWL DISHER
0013 }(Model: Volirath 47139 or Approved 120 EACH 8.42
Equal) per Specifications $7.03 $8.50 §7.50 $7.82 $9.47 $7.82 $16.70 3.66 $13.50 $8.27 $5.13




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date: 4
KITCHEN SUPPLIES 1117120 EE E @ 3 &
— " E o 'g = g | . m
Category: Requisition No: e E = E £ z g £ H =
16545, 73, 20149,24020, 28, 44561 M12751 23 s g 5 5 & H E E £
KITCHEN SUPPLIES 20.12751 o g . 7 g @ o & 3 SE
Bid Opening or 38 2 ) 2 a B c & = 3 g 3
— S L5 ] B2 g 5 ] 2 u & ] oy
gency: Closing Date: w 3 & 9 £ a8c - ES 2 2 o -] o
DHDS - ADMINISTRATION 12117120 =4 ] 2 g2 3 2 2 g £ 28 &
o
Sealed Bid _X Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities - é 'é E g‘ g E UE:,' :: é ,% g % E § E 5
T o = =
Item OF UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT unNIT UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
STANDARD ROUND BOWL DISHER
0014 |(Modei: Volirath 47140 or Approved 120 EACH 8.42
Equal) per Specifications $7.03 $8.50 $7.50 $7.82 $9.47 $7.82 $16.70 3.66 $13.50 $8.27 $5.13
STANDARD ROUND BOWL DISHER
0015 |{Model: Vollrath 47143 or Approved 120 EACH 8.42
Equal) per Specifications $7.03 $8.50 $7.50 $7.82 $9.47 §7.82 §16.70 3.66 §13.50 $8.27 $5.07
KNIFE SET (Model: Victronix Swiss *
0016 |Army No. 7.4012-X11 or Approved 8 SET 130.23
Equal) per Specifications $121.77 $144.45 $135.00 $137.09 No Bid $92.43 $272.00 120.43 No Bid $130.63 $133.72
PARING KNIFE (Model: Dexter Russell
0017 |S104S5C-3RWC or Approved Equal) per 8 EACH 12,23
Specifications $29.20 $17.65 $13.00 $13.48 No Bid 52.62 $24.70 3.76 No Bid §12.23 $12.78
e I
P udl) per Speciications 52.59 $2.95 $2.95 $2.88 $3.97 $2.85 $7.52 9.20 $4.60 $3.02 $3.02
SLOTTED SERVING SPOON (Model:
0019 |Browne USA Foodservice 573181 or 96 EACH 10.96
Approved Equal) per Specifications $8,97 $9.50 $9.75 $9.85 No Bid $6.51 $23.10 2.56 No Bid $10.86 $11.36
SLOTTED SERVING SPOON (Model:
0020 |Browne USA Foodservice 573174 or 96 EACH 14.73
Approved Equal) per Specifications $12.05 $12.70 $13.00 $13.11 No Bid No Bid $31.04 15.00 No Bid $14,60 $15.26
SOLID SERVING SPOON (Model:
0021 |Browne USA Foodservice 4750 or 120 EACH 14.83
Approved Equal) per Specifications $2.08 $2.20 $2.20 $2,26 No Bid $1.45 §1.96 14.18 No Bid $2.52 $0.82
SOLID SERVING SPOON (Model:
0022 | Browne USA Foodservice 4760 or 120 EACH 2.81
Approved Equal) per Specifications $2.30 52.45 52.50 $2.50 No Bid $1.59 $2.27 0.60 No Bid $2.78 50.89
SOLID SERVING SPOON (Model:
0023 |Browne USA Foodservice 4770 or 120 EACH .07
Approved Equal) per Specifications $2.51 $2.65 $2.70 $2.73 No Bid $2.34 $2.62 0.66 No Bid $3.04 $1.01
Total Amount
Cash Discount
Net Amount
Delivery
(X) Advertise ( ) Bid Bond { ) Ins Total Amount
|Buyer: Dss TOTAL AWARD
NOTES:




