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LIFTERS LATENT FINGER PRINT HINGE TYPE 1 4" x 2" $3.50
0001 |Transparent backing. Sirchie No. 130LT or equal, 24 per box. 5 Box $6.90
LIFTERS LATENT FINGER PRINT HINGE TYPE 2" x 4" $3.45
0002 |Transparent backing. Sirchie No. 131LT or equal, 12 per box. 34 Box $5.75
LIFTERS LATENT FINGER PRINT HINGE TYPE 4" x 4" $3.45
0003 |Transparent backing. Sirchie No. 131LT4 or equal, 12 per box. 34 Box $6.90
0004 LIFTERS LIFTING TAPE, TRANSPARENT 2" x 360",Sirchie 10 Roll $4.50 $4.25
144L2 or equal
0005 LIFTERS LIFTING TAPE, TRANSPARENT 4" x 360", Sirchie 10 Roll $7.55 $9.95
144L4 or equal
f 8, ¥ /0 "
0006 LI.FTE.RS LIFTING TAPE, TRANSPARENT Diff Lift: 1 %" x 60", 10 Roll $3.95 $12.00
Sirchie 144LRJ or equal
0007 LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS Black, 7" x 7", 5 per pack, Sirchie 25 Pack $14.90 $13.95
GLT301B or equal
0008 LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS Black, 14" x 7", 5 per pack, Sirchie 25 Pack $12.80 $11.95
GLT401B or equal
0009 LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS White, 5" x 7", 5 per pack, Lynn 25 Pack [$12.80 $19.50
Peavey No. 05911 or equal
LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS White, 10" x 5", 5 per pack, Sirchie $11.95
0010 1) T401W or equal 2 Pack |¥10.90
S
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LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS Transparent, 5" x 7", 5 per pack, Lynn $20.00
0011 Peavey No. 05912 or equal 43 Pack $12.80
0012 LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS Transparent, 14" x 5%, 5 per pack, 25 Pack $10.90 $11.75
Lynn Peavey No. 05914 or equal
0013 :;JHP:['LIES Reversible Scale 300X150mm (Sirchie PPS600) or 60 Each [$9.05 $5.25
0014 ::il:?LIES Reversible Scales (2 per set) (Sirchie PPS6000) or 50 Set $13.00 $6.00
SUPPLIES Photo Measure and Identifier Numbers With 0-4cm $5.00
0015 |scale (Sirchie PPS201) PMFTO1 or equal 100 Each INO BID
SUPPLIES Photo ID Markers With 2cm Scale (blank) 200 each $4.00
0016 |(sirchie PIM700) or equal 100 Each  [NOBID
0017 SL-JPF:LIES Syringe Transport Tube 1 inch x 8 inch (12 per set) 20 Set $10.35 $15.25
(Sichie ECT2) or equal
0018 SUPPLIES Regular Porelon Postmortem Inking Tool, Sirchie 10 Each INOBID $10.75
No. PM283 or equal
0019 SUPPLIES Replacement Pad (for PM283 only)Sirchie No. 10 Each NO BID $5.50
PM283P or equal
SUPPLIES DFO Powder 1 gram $49.50
0020 |pEo (1,8-DIAZAFLUOREN-9-ONE)Sirchie No. LV500 or equal 2 Each  1$92.50
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0021 SUPPLIES Rhodamine 6G 25 gramSirchie No. LV505 or equal 2 Each $19.00 $8.75
0022 SUPPLIES Amido Black 25 gramSirchie No. LV501 or equal 2 Each [$23.00 $6.00
0023 SUPPLIES GooPrint Fingerprint Powder Lynn Peavey No. 2 Each |$35.00 $8.00
30033 or equal
0024 zclljlral:l’LlES Ardrox Dye Liquid 1 quartSirchie No. LVS700 or 2 Each $40.00 $14.50
SUPPLIES Special Formula Ninhydrin Spray Pump 8 ozSirchie $22.00
0026 SUPPLIES Hard-Core Blue Casting Material (8lbs)(Sirchie 5 Each [$12.00 $20.00
HCB3001) or equal
0027 SUPPLIES Silver Nitrate Crystal Ampoules Set of 6 Sirchie No. 2 Each NO BID $20.00
SN208 or equal
0028 SUPPLIES OMEGA-PRINT Fingerprint Developer 16 ozSirchie 2 Each $49.90 $30.00
No. CNA103 or equal
0029 SUPPLIES Gunshot Residue Kit (AA) Analysis Lynn Peavey 50 Kits $5.95 $50.00
No. 05779 or equal
0030 BACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE White, 4" x 5", Lynn 2 Each |$3.70 $4.35
Peavey No. 05842 or equal
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0031 BACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE Black, 4" x 5", Lynn 2 Each [$6.90 $8.00
Peavey No. 05844 or equal
s i/ n
0032 BACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE White, 8 %2 " x 11", Lynn 2 Each |$33.25 NO BID
Peavey No. 05582 or equal
17/ n "
0033 BACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE Black ,7 2" x 16", 2 Each |$71.15 NO BID
Lynn Peavey No. 06673 or equal
BACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE Record Cards, lifted $22.00
0034 |print backing, sketch, gloss white back, 3" x 5", 500 per pack, 50 Pack [$3.55
Sirchie No. LPW1005 or equal
BACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE Backing sheet, rigid $6.75
0035 |plastic, transparent vinyl, 4" x 4", 20 per pack, Sirchie No. 50 Pack |NOBID
LB206 or equal
0036 i:.l::ul_allES Hard-Core Blue Solution (64 fl oz)(Sirchie HCB3002) 5 Each NO BID $5.00
SUPPLIES Disposable Rounded Blade Scalpel (#10 $7.25
20 E 4
0037 |, |ade)(Sirchie KCP13810) o equal ach [stA0
0038 SqRuUa?HES CAMEL HAIR 1 %" Bristles, Sirchie No. 118L or 20 Each NO BID $1.90
0039 BRUSHES CAMEL HAIR 2" Bristles, Sirchie No. 117L or equal 20 Each NO BID $2.50
0040 BRUSHES CAMEL HAIR Super Soft, 2" Bristles, Sirchie No. 20 Each NO BID $12.00 , “"“***—~—--_‘,
120LS or equal 'AYIN
0041 FI_BEI_?GLASS Fingerprint Brush; 2 %" Bristles, 4 74" Handle, 100 Each NO BID $4.20 g
Sirchie No. 122L or equal
0042 EII-ES;:':{SR DUSTERS Fingerprint Brush, 7", Sirchie No. 123LR 30 Each $7.55 $5.15
0043 zf:;’:jR DUSTERS Fingerprint Brush 6", Sirchie No. 123LW 30 Each |$7.55 $5.50
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0044 FEATHER DUSTERS Fingerprint Brush, 8", "Jumbo" Sirchie 30 Each $10.45 $7.75
No. 123LBW or equal
0045 LATENT FIIT.IGER PRINT POWDER 2 OUNCE CONTAINER Ash 1o Each |s4.70 $2.50
Gray, Sirchie No. 102L or equal
LATENT FINGER PRINT POWDER 2 OUNCE CONTAINER $2.50
0046 |\\hite, Sirchie No. 103L or equal 10 Bagh ¥4:01
LATENT FINGER PRINT POWDER 2 OUNCE CONTAINER $2.50
0047 jack, Sirchie No. 101L or equal 10 Each 34.01
LATENT FINGER PRINT POWDER $2.65
0048 |2 OUNCE CONTAINER, Sirchie No. M119L or equal 10 Each  [$5.50
LATENT FINGERPRINT POWDER 16 OUNCE JAR Gray, $14.45
0049 Sirchie No. BPM117L or equal 3 Eagh 3700
LATENT FINGERPRINT POWDER 16 OUNCE JAR Silver/ $14.25
.50
0430 Sirchie No. BPMSBMS9 or equal 3 Each 4383
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LATENT FINGERPRINT POWDERI 16 OUNCE JAR Black, $16.25
0051 | sirctils N BPMA49L orequsl 3 Eamh |[3abi0
MAGNETIC POWDER AND WANDS or equal Powder, $14.25
0052 |gjver/Black, 16 ounce, Sirchie No. BPMSBMS or equal 5 Each  NOBID
0053 MAG.NET!C P?W[.)ER AND WANDS Wand, Regular Magnetic 10 Each |$14.25 $8.50
Applicator, Sirchie No. 12SL or equal
MAGNETIC POWDER AND WANDS Permanent Magnetic $8.50
0054 Wands, Sirchie No. 125L or equal 20 Each |NOBID
0055 MAG.NETIC POWDER AND WANDS Wand, Bubble Base 10 Each $14.25 NO BID
Applicator Lynn Peavey No. 05554 or equal
0056 M_AGI?IETIC PRINT POWDER 3-OUNCE CONTAINER Gray, 5 Each NO BID $2.50
Sirchie No. M117L or equal
0057 M_AGITIETIC PRINT POWDER 3-OUNCE CONTAINER White, 5 Each NO BID $2.50
Sirchie No. M116L or equal
0058 M_AGI':IETIC PRINT POWDER 3-OUNCE CONTAINER Black, 5 Each NO BID $2.50 ~
Sirchie No. M114L or equal |
MAGNETIC PRINT POWDER 3-OUNCE CONTAINER Red, $2.50 B F - '"’“‘--—--...M_L
0059 sirchie No. M118L or equal 3 Each INOBID \ Rfﬂﬁ T ol
FLUORESCENT POWDERS — 2 OUNCES Redescent, Sirchie $3.25 [ e /
0060 No. LL701 or equal 19 Eagh.  [48.00 \|\
0061 FLUORESCENT POWDERS - 2 OUNCES Greenescent, Sirchie 10 Each $8.00 $3.25 “‘\-w___/
No. LL703 or equal
0062 FLUORESCENT POWDERS — 2 OUNCES Yellowescent, Sirchie 10 Each $8.00 $3.25
No. LL705 or equal
CYANOACRYLATE FUMING Cyno Wand Fingerprint Kit, $85.00
0063 Sirchie No. CW100 or equal 10 Each NO BID
0064 CYANOACRYLATE FUMING Butane Fuel, 1.3 ounces, Sirchie 10 Each NO BID $2.50
No. SCW103 or equal
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0065 CYANOACRYLATE FUMING Cartridge, Standard. Sirchie No. 10 Each NO BID $27.50
CW200 or equal
0066 CYANOACRYLATE FUMING Cartridge, Mega. Sirchie No. 10 Each NO BID $36.00
CW?300 or equal
DISPOSABLE CARTRIDGE FOR CYNO WAND Standard, 10 per $29.50
0067 pack. Sirchie No. CW200 or equal 2 Pack NO BID
DISPOSABLE CARTRIDGE FOR CYNO WAND Mega Cartridge, $36.00
0068 10 per pack. Sirchie No. CW300 or equal z Fack NErElR
DISPOSABLE CARTRIDGE FOR CYNO WAND Hulk Cartridge. $7.75
0069 |irchie No. CW4001 or equal 2 Each [NOBID
CHEMICAL REAGENTS - SMALL PARTICLE Dark: 500 ML $14.00
0070 bottle. Sirchie No SPR100 or equal S Each  920.25
T
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CHEMICAL REAGENTS — SMALL PARTICLE White: 500 ML $7.00
0071 |hottle. Sirchie No. SPR2001 or equal 3 Each  $20.25
TESTING SUPPLIES Cotton Swabs, Sterile, 2 per package, $8.85
a0z 100 packages per box, Lynn Peavey No. 02037 or equal 30 Box 38,75
TESTING SUPPLIES Swab Boxes, 50 per package or equal $14.25
0073 || ynn Peavey No. 01313 or equal 50 Pack  $9.35
TESTING SUPPLIES Photo ID Card, 4" x 6" 100 per pack $5.20
6 a
ik Sirchie No. PIC002 or equal Pack 334.00
TESTING SUPPLIES Photo ID Cards, 8 2" x 11", 100 per pack $5.00
0075 |sirchie No. PIC001 or equal G Pack  |+58.00
TESTING SUPPLIES A-Frame Photo Markers, yellow letters, A- $29.50
0076 (7 5" Sirchie No. PEA26V or equal 2 Set  343.00
TESTING SUPPLIES Photo Evidence Scale, 6" vinyl ruler with $4.85
0077 |both inches and millimeters. Sirchie No. PPS401 or equal 3 Pack |$9.75
TESTING SUPPLIES Photo Evidence Scale, Adhesive Back, 2", $2.85
0078 |5mm with both inches and millimeters. Sirchie No. PPS501 or 5 Pack |[$7.75
equal 50 per pack
TESTING SUPPLIES Photography Identifier, Number Booklet, $5.00
0079 25 sheets per book. Sirchie No. PNBS100 or equal 10 Each NO BID
TESTING SUPPLIES Photography Identifier, Arrows Booklet $5.40
0080 |5;chie No. PAB100 or equal L Each |NOBID
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0081 TESTING SUPPLIES Gel Lifters: %", white, 12 per box. Sirchie 250 Bok $7.45 $10.89
128LW or equal
] . 3/n . -
0082 TESTING SUPPLIES Gel Lifters: %", black, 12 per box. Sirchie 250 Box $5.10 $10.80
128LB or equal
0083 :‘I‘ESJ;ING SUPPLIES lodine Fuming Kit: Sirchie FUM250 or 10 Each NO BID $59.50
0084 TESTING SUPPLIES Wetwop: Black, 250ml per jar. Sirchie 3 Jar NO BID $8.00
ASP50D or equal
0085 TESTING SUPPLIES Wetwop: White, 250ml per jar. Sirchie 3 Each |NOBID $7.75
ASP50L or equal
TESTING SUPPLIES A-Frame Photo Markers: Yellow numbers $17.25
0086 |4 15 5" sirchie PEN15V or equal & Set  1$25.50
TESTING SUPPLIES A-Frame Photo Markers: Yellow numbers $38.75
0087 |46.50, 5". Sirchie PEN1650V or equal 3 Set $57.50
TESTING SUPPLIES A-Frame Photo Markers: Yellow numbers $54.00
0088 |51.99, 5", Sirchie PEN5199V or equal 3 Set  [$74.75
REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT Casting Silicone: $30.00
0089 Transparent, 4 per Lynn Peavey No. 40054 or equal 2 Pack $123.00
REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT Casting Silicone: $30.00
2 Pack .00
90s0 Brown, 4 per pack Lynn Peavey No. 40053 or equal ac e
REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT Casting Silicone: $30.00
0091 White, 4 per pack Lynn Peavey No. 40093 or equal 2 Pack 13123.00
REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT Mixing Tips: 40 per $43.00
0092 | ack. Sirchie PVS200N or equal 4 Pack_ [#e000
REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT Spreading Tips: 40 $36.00
0093 | er pack. _Sirchie PVS200NT or equal $ Pack  [etim
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REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT “PURITAN” or equal $14.00
0094 |Sterile Cotton Tipped Applicators 3" 2 per package 100 1 Box $10.25
pkgs/box or equal Sirchie KCP208C or equal
REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT “KENDALL” or equal $8.85
0095 (Single Tipped Applicators 6” 2 per package - 100 pkgs/box 1 Box NO BID
Sirchie KCP160C or equal
0096 |REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT 3” swab cartons 100 3 Package |NO BID $38.00
per package or equal Sirchie KCP307C or equal
0097 REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT 6” swab cartons 100 1 Package [$8.75 $12.50
per package or equal Lynn Peavey No. 02037 or equal ’
REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT “ADDIPAK"” or equal $22.00 $15.85
0098 |3mL Sterile water Sirchie KCP247C or equal 1 Pack
CASH DISCOUNT
NET AMOUNT
Buyer DELIVERY
SS QUOTE TOTAL
AWARD
NOTES: See Bid Worksheet




