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Item UNIT OF UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY |MEASURE| PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
0001 |Governmental Building 222 St.Louis Street Motion Control 3016959 52 Each NO BID $69.23 NO BID ¥104.00
0002 |Governmental Building 222 St. Louis Street Motion Control 3016960 52 Each NO BID $69.23 NO BID 104,00
0003 |Governmental Building 222 St. Louis Street Motion Control 3016961 52 Each NO BID $69.23 NO BB $104.00
0004 |Governmental Building 222 St. Louis Street Motion Control 3016962 52 Each NO BID $69.23 NG:BID $104.00
0005 |Governmental Building 222 St. Louis Street Motion Control 3016963 52 Each NO BID $69.23 NO BID $104.00
0006 |Governmental Building 222 St. Louis Street Motion Control 3016964 52 Each NO BID $69.23 NO'BID $104.00
0007 |Governmental Building 222 St. Louis Street Montgomery CT-32402 52 Each NO BID $69.23 NO BID $104.00
0008 |Governmental Building 222 St. Louis Street Montgomery CT-32403 52 Each NO BID $69.23 NO BID $104.00
0009 |Governmental Building 222 St. Louis Street Energy 93059 52 Each NO BID $10.38 NO BID $24.00
0010 |Governmental Building Parking Garage Esco 75403 12 Each NO BID $120.00 NO BID $240.00
0011 |Bogan Museum 427 Laurel Street Montgomery CO-34881 24 Each $135.00 $70.00 NO BID $120.00
0012 |LASC Building 1100 S. River Road Montgomery CP-34733 12 Each $125.00 $120.00 NO BID $240.00
0013 |LASC Building 1100 S. River Road Dover EM-9554 12 Each $125.00 $120.00 NO BID $240.00
0014 |City Courthouse 233 St. Louis Street Montgomery CP65343 24 Each NO BID $87.50 NO BID $120.00
0015 |City Courthouse 233 St. Louis Street Montgomery CP65342 24 Each NO BID $140.00 NO BID $220.00
0016 |City Courthouse 233 St. Louis Street Montgomery CP65541 24 Each NO BID $140.00 NO BID $220.00
0017 |City Courthouse 233 St. Louis Street Montgomery CP65344 24 Each NO BID $81.50 NO BID $120.00
0018 |City Courthouse 233 St. Louis Street Malot 21286 24 Each NO BID $20.00 NO BID $52.00
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0019 |City Courthouse 233 St. Louis Street Malot 21285 24 Each NO BID $20.00 NO BID $52.00
0020 |[ATM/OHSEP Building 3773 Harding Blvd. Lobby Dover EK9715 12 Each $135.00 ¥120.00 NOBIR ¥240.00
0021 21K‘I;n;:)é-|SEP Building 3773 Harding Blvd Rear South End Dover 12 Each $135.00 $120.00 NO BID $240.00
0022 ATM/OHSEP Building 3773 Harding Blvd  Rear North End 12 Each $135.00 $120.00 NO BID $240.00
Dover EK9717
0023 |ATM/OHSEP Building 3773 Harding Blvd Building Maintenance 24 Each $135.00 $70.00 NOBID %60.00
0024 |ATM/OHSEP Building 3773 Harding Blvd Building Maintenance 24 Each $135.00 »7E:00 NO'BID #50.00
0025 |ATM/OHSEP Building 3773 Harding Blvd Archives 24 Each $135.00 $70.00 NO BID $60.00
0026 |Human Resources 1755 Florida Blvd. Westinghouse 29058 12 Each NO BID $210.00 NO BID $440.00
0027 |Old Baton Rouge Junior High 1100 Laurel Schindler F4551 12 Each $135.00 $130.00 NO BID $240.00
0028 1P§_I(|](;G;(I)-I5eadquarters 9000 Airline Highway H3 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $270.00 NO BID $440.00
0029 1P::Itl;:;c-:;(I)-Iseadquarters 9000 Airline Highway H3 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $270.00 NO BID $440.00
0030 I:so_lil;;:gl_readquarters 9000 Airline Highway H3 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $270.00 NO BID $440.00
0031 Public Safety Complex 9048 Airline Highway H3 Montgomery/ 12 Each NO BID $110.00 NO BID $240.00
Kone 16-143319
0032 :L{l]télzlc;fafety Complex 9050Airline Highway H2 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $110.00 NO BID $240.00
0033 GPL(I)I;I; :jafety Complex 9050Airline Highway H2 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $110.00 NO BID $240.00




Summary of Quotations

VENDORS

Commodity: Q& & G
c’.
A21-0400 <O \\650 N S
Maintenance of Elevators, Escalators, & Dumbwaiters 4"' Xy \3.« é’\ () «oq"
O \Z Ny SR
Category: <Y oV oS Tox & N\
. N\ N & A <
File No. 9 O 9 Q 2 PN
91013 2100400 | & P < N 3
ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE & REPAIR - o G &S > |
——— (PRIGINAL
Agency: Bid Opening
Department of Buildings & Grounds 05/21/21

Sealed Bid_X __ Price Inquiry__ Definite Quantities____
Item UNIT OF UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY |MEASURE| PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
0034 ;’:}i;l;:afety Complex 9050Airline Highway H2 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $225.00 NO BID $240.00
0035 Z}:]I;I;Efafety Complex 9050Airline Highway H2 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $225.00 NO BID $240.00
0036 ?;hl;gcgoszafety Complex 9050Airline Highway H2 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $130.00 NO BID $240.00
0037 gp_l:)gg‘-:] ?Safety Complex 9050Airline Highway H2Z Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $120.00 NO BID $240.00
0038 Public Safety Complex 9050Airline Highway H1 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $270.00 NO BID $440.00

11-A117242-1
0039 Public Safety Complex 9050Airline Highway H1 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $270.00 NO BID $440.00

12-A117242-2
0040 ?fllggc;fzafety Complex 9050Airline Highway H1 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $230.00 NO BID $440.00
0041 Public Safety Complex 9050Airline Highway H1 Montgomery/ 12 Each NO BID $230.00 NO BID $440.00

Kone 2-100133

Public Safety Complex 9050Airline Highway H1 Montgomery/ $230.00 NO BID $440.00
0942 | kone 3-80-19553-051 & | Reen | ROBD
0043 Public Safety Complex 9050Airline Highway H1 Montgomery/ Kone 12 Each NO BID $230.00 NO BID $440.00

4-80-19553-051
0044 |EBR Parish Health Unit 353 North 12th. Street Motion Control 3047785 12 Each $125.00 $120.00 NO BID $240.00
0045 |M L King Comm. Center 4142 Gus Young Ave. Esco C1771643 12 Each NO BID $120.00 NO BID $240.00
0046 |Parking Facility East 345 St. Louis Street Dover V5947 24 Each $275.00 $125.00 NO BID $220.00
0047 |Parking Facility West 444 St. Louis Street Dover V6045 24 Each $275.00 $125.00 NO BID $220.00
0048 |EMS Headquarters 3801 Harding Blvd Schindler P-MX62400 12 Each $135.00 $140.00 NO BID $240.00
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Metropolitan Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr. Terminal-Main F/R $39.23 NO BID $60.00
0049 Schindler HY-64898-1 52 Each $195.00
Metropolitan Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr. Terminal-Main $39.23 NO BID $60.00
0050 Schindler HY-45543-1 52 Each $195.00
0051 I:;ﬁt;:;;;(l;_t:n Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr. Terminal Schindler 52 Each $900.00 $161.54 NO BID $165.00
0052 I\En;f;t:pz)gg:t;n Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr. Terminal Schindler 52 Each $900.00 $161.54 NO BID $165.00
0053 Metropolitan Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr. Terminal Schindler 52 Each $195.00 $39.23 NO BID $60.00
HY-45544-1
Metropolitan Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr. Terminal Freight $39.23 NO BID $60.00
0054 {5 chindler HY-64899-2 52 | Each | $195.00
Metropolitan Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr. Terminal — $23.10 NO BID $60.00
0055 | 2 estaurant P-Flo 94942201-B 52 | Each | $95.00
0056 ‘I;llse;t::golltan Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr URS Building Otis 52 Each $195.00 $39.23 NO BID $60.00
0057 Metropolltar_1 Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr Airport Parking 52 Each $195.00 $39.23 NO BID $60.00
Garage Schindler S2357447
Metropolitan Airport 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr Airport Parking $39.23 NO BID $60.00
0058 | zarage Schindler 52307637 22 | Esb | #8800
59 Metr?polltan Alrport_ 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr Airport Rental Car 52 Each $195.00 $46.15 NO BID $60.00
Parking Garage Schindler
0060 Metrf)polltan Alrport_ 9430 Jackie Cochran Dr Airport Rental Car 52 Each $195.00 $39.23 NO BID $60.00
Parking Garage Schindler
Independence Library 7711 Goodwood Blvd. Concierge (3) NE $250.00 $427.00 NO BID
0061 | ont Entrance Kone 20336177 12 | FEach | §315.00
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Independence Library 7711 Goodwood Blvd. Monumental Stairs $250.00 $427.00 NO BID
0982 |yiddie Building (1) Kone 20336175 12 | Each | s313.00
Independence Library 7711 Goodwoced Blvd. Monumental Stairs $250.00 $427.00 NO BID
0083 |middle Building (2) Kone 20336176 12 | Eech | S31800
Independence Library 7711 Goodwood Blvd Staff Hall (4) SW $250.00 $427.00 NO BID
0084 Staff Entrance. Kone 20336178 12 Edch 81580
River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828181 General NO BID NO BID NO BID
0065 Maintenance Otis TU544483 - 63828181 1 Each 3300.00
0066 River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828181 Category 1 Each NO NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Testing Otis TU544483 - 63828181 Al CHARGE
0067 River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828181 Category 1 Each NO NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Testing Otis TU544483 - 63828181 CHARGE
0068 River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828181 Fire Key 12 Each NO NO BID NO BID NO BID
Testing Otis TU544483 - 63828181 CHARGE
River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828182 General NO BID NO BID NO BID
0069 |1 1aintenance Otis TUS44483 - 63828182 1 Each | $300.00
0070 River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828182 Category 1 Each NO NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Testing Otis TU544483 - 63828182 i CHARGE
0071 River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828182 Category 1 Each NO NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Testing Otis TU544483 - 63828182 CHARGE
0072 River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828182 Fire Key 12 Each NO NO BID NO BID NO BID
Testing_] Otis TU544483 - 63828182 CHARGE
River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828183 General NO BID NO BID NO BID
0073 Maintenance Otis TU544483 - 63828183 1 Each $300.00
007 4' River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828183 Category 1 Each NO NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 Testing Otis TU544483 - 63828183 4N | CHARGE
0075 River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828183 Category 1 Each NO NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 Testing Otis TU544483 - 63828183 CHARE
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0076 River Center Library 250 North Boulevard, TU544483 - 63828183 Fire Key 1 Each NO NO BID NO BID NO BID
Testing Otis TU544483 - 63828183 2N | CHARGE
STRAIGHT-TIME LABOR RATE FOR WORK NOT INCLUDED IN
0077 | S ONTRACT Mechanic 1 Each | $200.00 $185.25 $197.00 $170.00
STRAIGHT-TIME LABOR RATE FOR WORK NOT INCLUDED IN
0078 | ONTRACT Helper 1 Each | $160.00 $185.25 $197.00 $150.00
p— non:E:aI:an LABOR RATE FOR WORK NOT INCLUDED IN CONTRACT . Each | %300.00 <339.10 SA97:00 ——
e 3;/'?5;11% LABOR RATE FOR WORK NOT INCLUDED IN CONTRACT ; Each | G240.00 535810 P 520500
TOTAL AMOUNT
CASH DISCOUNT
NET AMOUNT
DELIVERY
AWARD

NOTES:




