
Summary of Quotations VENDORS

Sealed Bid   X   Price Inquiry__  Definite Quantities___ 

Item No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

10-01

Microflex Diamond Grip™ powder-free exam gloves, or 

equivalent. Natural latex, non-sterile, ambidextrous, 

textured fingertips, beaded cuff, disposable.  Length: 

9.6in,Tensile Strength (before aging): >27Mpa, Tensile 

Strength (after aging): >23Mpa, Elongation at break 

(before aging), >750%, Elongation at break (after aging): 

>600%, Palm Thickness: 6.3mil, Average palm width: 

3.26in

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

200 BOX $16.95 $15.00 $5.01 $9.50 No Bid $9.50

10-02

Microflex Diamond Grip™ powder-free exam gloves, or 

equivalent. Natural latex, non-sterile, ambidextrous, 

textured fingertips, beaded cuff, disposable.  Length: 

9.6in,Tensile Strength (before aging): >27Mpa, Tensile 

Strength (after aging): >23Mpa, Elongation at break 

(before aging), >750%, Elongation at break (after aging): 

>600%, Palm Thickness: 6.3mil, Average palm width: 

3.74in

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

MEDIUM – Product Code # MF-300-M

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

800 BOX $16.95 $15.00 $5.01 $9.50 No Bid $9.50

10-03

Microflex Diamond Grip™ powder-free exam gloves, or 

equivalent. Natural latex, non-sterile, ambidextrous, 

textured fingertips, beaded cuff, disposable.  Length: 

9.6in,Tensile Strength (before aging): >27Mpa, Tensile 

Strength (after aging): >23Mpa, Elongation at break 

(before aging), >750%, Elongation at break (after aging): 

>600%, Palm Thickness: 6.3mil, Average palm width: 

4.21in

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

1500 BOX $16.95 $15.00 $5.01 $9.50 No Bid $9.50

10-04

Microflex Diamond Grip™ powder-free exam gloves, or 

equivalent. Natural latex, non-sterile, ambidextrous, 

textured fingertips, beaded cuff, disposable.  Length: 

9.6in,Tensile Strength (before aging): >27Mpa, Tensile 

Strength (after aging): >23Mpa, Elongation at break 

(before aging), >750%, Elongation at break (after aging): 

>600%, Palm Thickness: 6.3mil, Average palm width: 

4.60in 

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

X-LARGE – Product Code # MF-300-XL

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

1200 BOX $16.95 $15.00 $5.01 $9.50 No Bid $9.50
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Summary of Quotations VENDORS

Sealed Bid   X   Price Inquiry__  Definite Quantities___ 

Item No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
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Agency:

Category:
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Requisition No:
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File: 21-00633
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10-05

Microflex Midknight® gloves or equivalent. Black, nitrile, 

non-sterile, ambidextrous, fully textured, beaded cuff, 

disposable, non-latex. Length: 9.6”, Tensile Strength 

(before aging): 27Mpa, Tensile strength (after aging) 

14mpa, Elongation at break (before aging) >500, 

Elongation at break (after aging) >400, Palm Thickness 

single wall: 4.7mil, Average palm width: 3.38in

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

SMALL – Product Code # MK-296-S

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

800 BOX $16.95 $15.90 $10.76 $9.50 No Bid $14.75 $15.00

10-06

Microflex Midknight® gloves or equivalent. Black, nitrile, 

non-sterile, ambidextrous, fully textured, beaded cuff, 

disposable, non-latex. Length: 9.6”, Tensile Strength 

(before aging): 27Mpa, Tensile strength (after aging) 

14mpa, Elongation at break (before aging) >500, 

Elongation at break (after aging) >400, Palm Thickness 

single wall: 4.7mil, Average palm width: 3.77in

 

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

MEDIUM – Product Code # MK-296-M

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

300 BOX $16.95 $15.90 $10.76 $9.50 No Bid $14.75 $15.00

10-07

Microflex Midknight® gloves or equivalent. Black, nitrile, 

non-sterile, ambidextrous, fully textured, beaded cuff, 

disposable, non-latex. Length: 9.6”, Tensile Strength 

(before aging): 27Mpa, Tensile strength (after aging) 

14mpa, Elongation at break (before aging) >500, 

Elongation at break (after aging) >400, Palm Thickness 

single wall: 4.7mil, Average palm width: 4.21in

 

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

LARGE – Product Code # MK-296-L

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

3000 BOX $16.95 $15.90 $10.76 $9.50 No Bid $14.75 $15.00
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MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

T
e
le

fl
e
x
, 
L

L
C

M
in

i 
W

in
g

 U
S

A

B
o

u
n
d

 T
re

e
 M

e
d

ic
a
l 
, 

L
L
C

L
if
e
-A

s
s
is

t,
 I
n

c
. 

T
a
y
lo

r 
H

e
a
lt

h
c
a
re

 
P

ro
d

u
c
ts

, 
In

c
. 

M
e
d

li
n

e
 I
n
d

u
s
tr

ie
s
, 

In
c
.

N
o

rf
le

e
t 
D

is
tr

ib
u

to
rs

 
L
L
C

M
e
d

ic
a
l 

S
p

e
c
ia

lt
ie

s

Commodity:

A21-0633

EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES
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10-08

Microflex Midknight® gloves or equivalent. Black, nitrile, 

non-sterile, ambidextrous, fully textured, beaded cuff, 

disposable, non-latex. Length: 9.6”, Tensile Strength 

(before aging): 27Mpa, Tensile strength (after aging) 

14mpa, Elongation at break (before aging) >500, 

Elongation at break (after aging) >400, Palm Thickness 

single wall: 4.7mil, Average palm width: 4.52in

 

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

X-LARGE – Product Code # MK-296-XL

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

2500 BOX

16.95 $15.90 $10.76

$9.50 No Bid $14.75 $15.00

10-09

Microflex Midknight® gloves or equivalent. Black, nitrile, 

non-sterile, ambidextrous, fully textured, beaded cuff, 

disposable, non-latex. Length: 9.6”, Tensile Strength 

(before aging): 27Mpa, Tensile strength (after aging) 

14mpa, Elongation at break (before aging) >500, 

Elongation at break (after aging) >400, Palm Thickness 

single wall: 4.7mil, Average palm width: 4.64in

 

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

XX-LARGE – Product Code # MK-296-XXL

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

200 BOX

$16.95 $15.90 $10.76

No Bid No Bid ______

10-10

Microflex Ultrasense® EC or equivalent. Powder free, 

Blue, nitrile, non-sterile, ambidextrous, extended 

beaded cuff, non-latex, non-stick surface, textured 

fingers, Cuff length: 11.4in”, Cuff Thickness: 2.8mil, 

Tensile Strength (before aging):33Mpa, Tensile Strength 

(after aging): 32Mpa, Elongation (before aging): 500%, 

Elongation (after aging): 400%, Palm Thickness: 3.5mil, 

Finger Thickness: 4.7mil

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

SMALL – Product Code # USE-880-S

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$26.05 $22.50 $10.76

$9.50 No Bid $13.50 $18.00
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10-11

Microflex Ultrasense® EC or equivalent. Powder free, 

Blue, nitrile, non-sterile, ambidextrous, extended 

beaded cuff, non-latex, non-stick surface, textured 

fingers, Cuff length: 11.4in”, Cuff Thickness: 2.8mil, 

Tensile Strength (before aging):33Mpa, Tensile Strength 

(after aging): 32Mpa, Elongation (before aging): 500%, 

Elongation (after aging): 400%, Palm Thickness: 3.5mil, 

Finger Thickness: 4.7mil

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

MEDIUM – Product Code # USE-880-M

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$26.05 $22.50 $10.76

$9.50 No Bid $13.50 $18.00

10-12

Microflex Ultrasense® EC or equivalent. Powder free, 

Blue, nitrile, non-sterile, ambidextrous, extended 

beaded cuff, non-latex, non-stick surface, textured 

fingers, Cuff length: 11.4in”, Cuff Thickness: 2.8mil, 

Tensile Strength (before aging):33Mpa, Tensile Strength 

(after aging): 32Mpa, Elongation (before aging): 500%, 

Elongation (after aging): 400%, Palm Thickness: 3.5mil, 

Finger Thickness: 4.7mil

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

LARGE – Product Code # USE-880-L

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$26.05 $22.50 $10.76

$9.50 No Bid $13.50 $18.00

10-13

Microflex Ultrasense® EC or equivalent. Powder free, 

Blue, nitrile, non-sterile, ambidextrous, extended 

beaded cuff, non-latex, non-stick surface, textured 

fingers, Cuff length: 11.4in”, Cuff Thickness: 2.8mil, 

Tensile Strength (before aging):33Mpa, Tensile Strength 

(after aging): 32Mpa, Elongation (before aging): 500%, 

Elongation (after aging): 400%, Palm Thickness: 3.5mil, 

Finger Thickness: 4.7mil

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

X-LARGE – Product Code # USE-880-XL

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$26.05 $22.50 $10.76

$9.50 No Bid $13.75 $18.00
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10-14

Microflex Ultrasense® EC or equivalent. Powder free, 

Blue, nitrile, non-sterile, ambidextrous, extended 

beaded cuff, non-latex, non-stick surface, textured 

fingers, Cuff length: 11.4in”, Cuff Thickness: 2.8mil, 

Tensile Strength (before aging):33Mpa, Tensile Strength 

(after aging): 32Mpa, Elongation (before aging): 500%, 

Elongation (after aging): 400%, Palm Thickness: 3.5mil, 

Finger Thickness: 4.7mil

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

XX-LARGE – Product Code # USE-880-XXL

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$26.05 $22.50 $10.76

No Bid No Bid ____

10-15

Microflex Ultrasense® EC or equivalent. Powder free, 

Blue, nitrile, non-sterile, ambidextrous, extended 

beaded cuff, non-latex, non-stick surface, textured 

fingers, Cuff length: 11.4in”, Cuff Thickness: 2.8mil, 

Tensile Strength (before aging):33Mpa, Tensile Strength 

(after aging): 32Mpa, Elongation (before aging): 500%, 

Elongation (after aging): 400%, Palm Thickness: 3.5mil, 

Finger Thickness: 4.7mil

100 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

XXX-LARGE – Product Code # USE-880-XXXL

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$18.55 $22.50 $10.76

No Bid No Bid ___

10-16

Microflex Safegrip® or equivalent. Latex, non-sterile, 

ambidextrous, beaded extended cuff, powder-free, 

textured fingers. Length: 295mm, Tensile Strength 

(before aging): >34Mpa, Tensile strength (after aging): 

>28Mpa, Elongation at break (before aging): >750%, 

Elongation at break (after aging): >600%, Palm 

Thickness single wall: 11mil, Finger Thickness: 17.3-

17.7mils, Average palm width: 95mm

50 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

SMALL – Product Code # SG-375-S

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$19.75 $17.25 $7.23

No Bid No Bid
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10-17

Microflex Safegrip® or equivalent. Latex, non-sterile, 

ambidextrous, beaded extended cuff, powder-free, 

textured fingers. Length: 295mm, Tensile Strength 

(before aging): >34Mpa, Tensile strength (after aging): 

>28Mpa, Elongation at break (before aging): >750%, 

Elongation at break (after aging): >600%, Palm 

Thickness single wall: 11mil, Finger Thickness: 17.3-

17.7mils, Average palm width: 106mm

50 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

MEDIUM  - Product Code # SG-375 M

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$19.75 $17.25 $7.23

No Bid No Bid

10-18

Microflex Safegrip® or equivalent. Latex, non-sterile, 

ambidextrous, beaded extended cuff, powder-free, 

textured fingers. Length: 295mm, Tensile Strength 

(before aging): >34Mpa, Tensile strength (after aging): 

>28Mpa, Elongation at break (before aging): >750%, 

Elongation at break (after aging): >600%, Palm 

Thickness single wall: 11mil, Finger Thickness: 17.3-

17.7mils, Average palm width: 115mm

50 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

LARGE – Product Code # SG-375-L

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$19.75 $17.25 $7.23 No Bid

No Bid

10-19

Microflex Safegrip® or equivalent. Latex, non-sterile, 

ambidextrous, beaded extended cuff, powder-free, 

textured fingers. Length: 295mm, Tensile Strength 

(before aging): >34Mpa, Tensile strength (after aging): 

>28Mpa, Elongation at break (before aging): >750%, 

Elongation at break (after aging): >600%, Palm 

Thickness single wall: 11mil, Finger Thickness: 17.3-

17.7mils

50 gloves per box, 10 boxes per case

X-LARGE – Product Code # SG-375-XL

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

50 BOX

$19.75 $17.25 $7.23 No Bid

No Bid

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY “10” GLOVES
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20-01

Fitted, White, heavy-duty sheet, 36”x90” SUPER-G™ 

Fitted Sheet for Stryker XPS stretcher.  Custom fit to 

unique XPS stretcher mattress design, fluid resistant, 

elastic fitted design, assist in aid of transfer of patient 

up to 450 pounds, protects mattress and patient from 

cross contamination

MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT, 

STRYKER POWER PRO XT STRETCHER WITH 

HARNESS RESTRAINT 

BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Products # 90-SUPER-G

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SAMPLE WITH BID 

40,000    EACH

$1.53 $2.80 $2.45 $4.19 No Bid No Bid 

20-02

Patient privacy flat sheet. 55gsm non-woven spun bond 

polypropylene.  Dimensions: 40” X 84”, dark blue. 

BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Products #90-BPS4084.  

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID 

20,000 EACH

$0.70 $1.15 $0.87 $1.44 No Bid No Bid 

20-03

Pillow, small, 30gsm non-woven shell: 100% polyester 

fiberfill; non-allergenic.  14” X 16”, white material, white 

fiberfill.

500 EACH

$1.99 $2.75 $2.15 $7.33 No Bid No Bid 

20-04
Pillow case, 30gsm, non-woven spun bond 

polypropylene.  17” X 25” white 
350 EACH

$0.21 $0.35 $0.22 $0.40 No Bid No Bid 

20-05

Blanket, Yellow, Disposable 60” X 90”, impervious to 

fluids, 1.5 mil poly (yellow side) with 40gsm PPE 

(polypropylene non-woven (white side).  

BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Product #90-YEB6090. 

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID 

5,000 EACH

$3.60 $4.00 $3.40 $7.85 No Bid No Bid 

20-06

Blanket, Navy Blue Polar Fleece, 2 sides brushed, one 

sided anti-pilling with 3 stitch edges 60” X 80”, 200gsm 

BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Product #60-NFB6080

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID 

2,000 EACH

$3.80 $5.75 $4.40 $7.41 No Bid No Bid 

30-01

Emergency Carry Caddy with Drawer, has pull out 

drawer containing 12 compartments, resilient & durable 

caddy made of high density polyethylene plastic, 

dimensions: 16 ½” W x 6 5/16” H x 10 ¼” D

MUST SEND SAMPLE OR SPEC SHEET WITH BID

15 EACH

$17.74 No bid No Bid 

30-02 Equipment case: Flambeau 2272 20 EACH $97.51 $88.55 No bid No Bid 

30-03 Equipment case:  Plano 747 20 EACH $107.00 No bid No Bid 

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY “20” LINENS
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30-04
Flambeau Medical Box 1702 with lift out tray.  16 ½”L X 

8 ¼”W X 7 ½” D
30 EACH

$24.91 No bid No Bid 

30-05

Resuscitator case D-Size portable oxygen case, orange 

with molded top carrying handle.  Replaceable latches 

continuous stainless steel hinges.

25 EACH

$115.00 No bid No Bid 

30-06

Double-sided plastic utility boxes with 15 stationary 

compartments. 

 6 5/8” W X 2 1/8” H X 4 ¼” D. Plano™
30 EACH

$10.00 No bid No Bid 

30-07 C-4 Multi-Casualty triage kit in hard plastic case 25 EACH $18.10 No bid No Bid 

40-01

Replacement 4-lead Trunk Cable-AAMI for Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8300-0803-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

50 EACH

$175.35 No Bid No Bid $117.75

40-02

Replacement Percordial 6 Lead Cable-AAMI for Zoll X-

Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8300-0804-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

50 EACH

$219.00 No Bid No Bid $138.00

40-03

ECG Plain White Paper – 80mm (Pack of 6 rolls) for Zoll 

X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-000901-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

6,000 ROLL

$5.05 No Bid No Bid $18.54

40-04

OneStep Pediatric CPR Electrodes, multifunction 

electrodes for anterior/posterior placement, for Zoll X-

Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8900-000219

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

100 PAIR

$171.46 No Bid No Bid $70.98

40-05

CPR Stat-Padz, HVP Multi-Function CPR Electrodes (8 

pairs/case for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8900-0400

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

700 PAIR

$137.32 No Bid No Bid $454.23

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY “30” MEDICAL & TRAUMA CASES/BAGS
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40-06

Multi-Tech USB Cellular Modem Kit, CDMA (Verison)-

Included Modem and 90 degree USB Cable for Zoll X-

Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-000472-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $691.39

40-07

Dual Lumen NIBP 5 foot hose for Propaq MD for Zoll X-

Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8300-0002-02

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

50 EACH

$116.75 No Bid No Bid $93.75

40-08

Blood Pressure Cuff, Infant, 2-Tube, Twist lock 

connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # REUSE-07-2MQ

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

10 EACH

$20.30 No Bid No Bid $39.38

40-09

Blood Pressure Cuff, Small Child, 2-Tube, Twist lock 

connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # REUSE-08-2MQ

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$20.30 No Bid No Bid $39.38

40-10

Blood Pressure Cuff, Child, 2-Tube, Twist lock 

connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # REUSE-09-2MQ

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$21.08 No Bid No Bid $39.38

40-11

Blood Pressure Cuff, Small Adult, 2-Tube, Twist lock 

connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # REUSE-10-2MQ

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

30 EACH

$21.66 No Bid No Bid $39.38
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40-12

Blood Pressure Cuff, Adult, 2-Tube, Twist lock 

connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # REUSE-11-2MQ

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

30 EACH

$23.49 No Bid No Bid $39.38

40-13

Blood Pressure Cuff, Lg Adult, 2-Tube, Twist lock 

connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # REUSE-12-2MQ

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

30 EACH

$25.60 No Bid No Bid $39.38

40-14

Blood Pressure Cuff, Thigh, 2-Tube, Twist lock 

connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # REUSE-13-2MQ

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

30 EACH

$39.35 No Bid No Bid $39.38

40-15

YSI Reusable Adult Skin Temperature Probe for Zoll X-

Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-0670

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$111.25 No Bid No Bid $93.75

40-16

YSI Reusable Adule Esophageal/Rectal Temperature 

Probe for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-0668

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$49.81 No Bid No Bid $96.56

40-17

Filterline Set Adult/Pediatric, Case of 25 for Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8300-0520-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

250 EACH

$5.75 No Bid No Bid $206.25
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40-18

Smart CapnoLine Plus O2 Adult (O2 tubing), Case of 25 

for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8300-0524-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

6,000 EACH

$7.20 No Bid No Bid $266.25

40-19

Smart CapnoLine Plus O2 Pediatric (O2 tubing), Case of 

25 for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8300-0525-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

200 EACH

$8.95 No Bid No Bid $296.25

40-20

X Series Power Extension Cable for Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-000903-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$113.18 No Bid No Bid $90.85

40-21

US Power Cord for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-0100

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$58.22 No Bid No Bid $48.67

40-22

Six hour rechargeable SurePower Smart battery for Zoll 

X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-0580-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$468.71 No Bid No Bid $389.81

40-23

SurePower 4 bay charging system (requires 8300-0250-

01 charge SurePower Battery) for Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8050-0030-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

10 EACH

$1,661.24 No Bid No Bid $1,845.31
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40-24

SurePower single bay charger for Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8200-000100-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

10 EACH

$930.22 No Bid No Bid $766.52

40-25

Replacement AC power adapter/charger, 120-240 VAC, 

50,60 400 HZ for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8300-0004

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

40 EACH

$421.63 No Bid No Bid $350.44

40-26

SurePower Charger Adapter for batteries for Zoll X-

Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8300-0250-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

40 EACH

$86.88 No Bid No Bid $239.28

40-27

SurePower 4 Bay charging system including 4 battery 

charging adapters for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8300-0500-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

10 EACH

$2,654.13 No Bid No Bid $2,095.13

40-28

USB Extension Cable for Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8707-000500-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

40 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.39

40-29

X-Series Carry case for Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8707-000502-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$488.43 No Bid No Bid $401.50
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EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES
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Requisition No:
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47537, 47561
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40-30

Shoulder Strap for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-0914

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.56

40-31

External Paddle Assembly Apex/Sternum w/controls & 

built in pediatric electrodes for Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-1010-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $307.50

40-32

CPR Connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 8000-0020

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

40-33

Carry Case, rear bag, for Zoll X-Series     

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 9680-000404-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

40-34

Multifunction Therapy Cable, for Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator, PPMD

Item # 8300-0783

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$289.88 No Bid No Bid $241.72

40-35

Test Port for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 1004-0149

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$46.80 No Bid No Bid $0.00
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EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Agency:
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Requisition No:
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40-36

Label for “30j Test Block” to adhere to test port for Zoll 

X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 9305-0325-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

40-37

Label for “This End Up” to adhere to test port for Zoll X-

Series Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 9305-0326-01

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

40-38

Tie Wraps to secure test port to Zoll X-Series 

Monitor/Defibrillator

Item # 0501-0020

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

40-39

OneStep cable

Item # 8300-000676

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $334.69

40-40

Top handle for Zoll X-Series Monitor

Item # 705519-02

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.48

40-41

Bottom handle for Zoll X-Series Monitor

Item # 705517-02

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.19

40-42

CPR-D Padz Connector for R Series Onestep Cable

Item # 8009-0020

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EKG MONITOR: ZOLL X-SERIES ADVANCED 

MONITOR/DEFIBRILLATOR

20 EACH

$367.70 No Bid No Bid $29.00
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EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Agency:

Category:
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Requisition No:
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File: 21-00633
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50-01

ARROW EZ-IO 15mm, 15ga Intraosseous  Needle, 3-

39kg, w/EZ-Connect Extension set, EZ-IO Wristband and 

NeedleVISE 1-Port Sharps Block,  box of 5

REF #: 9018-VC-005 

NSN #: 6515-01-537-9808

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: 

ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS 

SYSTEM

200 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $111.90 $0.00

50-02

ARROW EZ-IO 25mm, 15ga Intraosseous  Needle, 3kg & 

over, w/EZ-Connect Extension set, EZ-IO Wristband and 

NeedleVISE 1-Port Sharps Block, box of 5

REF #: 9001-VC-005

NSN #: 6515-01-537-9007

 

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: 

ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS 

SYSTEM

500 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $111.90 $0.00

50-03

ARROW EZ-IO 45mm, 15ga Intraosseous Needle, 40kg & 

over, w/EZ-Connect Extension set, EZ-IO Wristband and 

NeedleVISE 1-Port Sharps Block, box of 5

REF #: 9079-VC-005

NSN #: 6515-01-577-0312

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: 

ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS 

SYSTEM

400 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $111.90 $0.00

50-04

ARROW EZ-IO Stabilizer, box of 5

REF #: 9066

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: 

ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS 

SYSTEM

1,000 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $0.00

50-05

ARROW EZ-IO Vascular Access Power Driver

REF #: 9058

NSN #: 6515-01-590-8589

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: 

ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS 

SYSTEM

10 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00 $0.00

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY “40” ZOLL MONITOR, ACCESSORIES & EQUIPMENT
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Commodity:
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EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Agency:

Category:
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or
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Requisition No:
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50-06

ARROW EZ-IO Power Driver Hard-Sided Carrying Case

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: 

ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS 

SYSTEM

10 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.95 $0.00

60-01

ResQPod ITD 16, impedance threshold device (ITD) that 

is a replacement component for ResQCPR System.  

Attached to the airway during CPR, the ITD enhances 

negative pressure to increase perfusion.

Item # 12-0822-000

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

600 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $92.50

60-02

1 Liter Dark Blue Test Lung for Zoll ZVent

Item # 820-0132-00

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

10 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

60-03

6 Foot Long Oxygen Hose for Zoll ZVent

Item # 825-0002-00

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

10 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

60-04

Ambulance Wall Mount for Zoll ZVent

Item # 703-0003-00

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.10

60-05

CPAP Harness + Mask for Zoll ZVent

#5 Regular Adult

Item # 712-0002-00

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

600 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY “50” EZ-IO NEEDLES & ACCESSORIES
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EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Agency:

Category:
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or
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Requisition No:
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60-06

CPAP Harness + Mask for Zoll ZVent

#6 Large Adult

Item # 712-0003-00

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

600 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

60-07

Disposable Adult 731 Circuit, 6 foot for Zoll ZVent

Item # 820-0106-15

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

2,000 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

60-08

Disposable Infant/Pediatric 731 Circuit, 6 foot 

for Zoll ZVent

Item # 820-0107-20

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

300 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

60-09

Power Cord for Zoll ZVent

Item # 708-0042-00

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

60-10

Power Supply for Zoll ZVent

Item # 024-0012-00

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

60-11

Vehicle Charger for Zoll ZVent

Item # 704-0EMV-06

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

60-12

Carry Case (white) Eagle II for Zoll ZVent

Item # 703-0731-27

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: ZOLL ZVENT PORTABLE 

VENTILATOR

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY “60” ZOLL ZVENT
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EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Agency:
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or
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Requisition No:
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70-01

Disposable Suction Cup (12 pack) for Lucas 3 CPR 

device

Item # 11576-000047

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

600 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $446.25 $0.00

70-02

Carry Case, hard shell for Lucas 3 CPR device

Item # 11576-000094

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

20 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $402.05 $0.00

70-03

Grip Tape for Slim Back Plate (3 pack) for Lucas 3 CPR 

device

Item # 11576-000090

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

30 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $62.05 $0.00

70-04

Lucas 3 Back Plate for Lucas 3 CPR device

Item # 11576-000088

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

10 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $353.60 $0.00

70-05

Patient Wrist Straps (3 pack) for Lucas 3 CPR device

Item # 11576-000051

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

30 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $242.25 $0.00

70-06

Stabilization Strap, neck strap (4 pack) for Lucas 3 CPR 

device

Item # 21576-000075

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

30 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $264.35 $0.00
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70-07

Desk-Top Battery Charger for Lucas 3 CPR device

Item # 11576-000090

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

5 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,049.75 $0.00

70-08

External Power Supply for Lucas 3 CPR device

Item # 11576-000071

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

10 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $332.35 $0.00

70-09

Lucas 3 Battery, dark grey, rechargeable LiPo for Lucas 

3 CPR device

Item # 11576-000080

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

15 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $641.75 $0.00

70-10

Lucas 12V-24V DC Car Cable for Lucas 3 CPR device

Item # 11576-000048

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST 

COMPRESSION SYSTEM

30 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.50 $0.00

80-01

NIOSH/CBRN Approved Emergency Escape Respirator 

in sealed container, one size fits all. P-100 Particulate 

filter (99.97% filter efficiency level) effective against all 

particulate aerosols

Drager-Defend Air Part # R 54 838

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH 

BID

150 EACH

$0.20 No Bid No Bid $0.00

80-02

Stretcher mattress for Stryker Power Pro XT w/ knee 

gatch & XPS side rails

BRAND: STRYKER

PART #: 6500-003-130

NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH 

CURRENT EQUIPMENT: STRYKER POWER PRO XT

20 EACH

$452.12 No Bid No Bid $418.17 $0.00

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY “70” STRYKER LUCAS 3 CHEST COMPRESSION SYSTEM
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80-03

Nail polish remover pads, contains ACETONE

BRAND:  

MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH BID

1,000 EACH

$0.04 No Bid No Bid $0.00

80-04

Strap: 1 piece 15’ strap with metal buckle, neon yellow

BRAND: QuadMed, Inc.

Reorder # EST-136510-NY

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND FUNCTIONAL 

SAMPLE WITH BID

250 EACH

No Bid No Bid $0.00

80-05

Chamco Original Ambulance Torso Slide Board, 18”x30” 

Lightweight, flexible. Easy to place under the patient 

while on gravel or asphalt. Easily transfers patient from 

your stretcher to hospital stretcher

 BRAND: Chamco or equivalent

Item #: 4004T

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND FUNCTIONAL 

SAMPLE WITH BID

50 EACH

$148.55 No Bid No Bid $0.00

80-06

Res-Q-Vac Hand pump ONLY for both adult and child. 

BRAND: Repro-Med or equivalent

MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT, 

REPRO-MED RES-Q-VAC EMERGENCY SUCTION

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND FUNCTIONAL 

SAMPLE WITH BID 

20 EACH

$50.76 No Bid No Bid $0.00

80-07

Replacement cartridges for Res-Q-Vac, adult size.  

BRAND: Repro-Med or equivalent 

MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT, 

REPRO-MED RES-Q-VAC EMERGENCY SUCTION

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND FUNCTIONAL 

SAMPLE WITH BID 

20 EACH

$15.24 No Bid No Bid $0.00
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80-08

Replacement cartridges for Res-Q-Vac, child size. 

BRAND: Repro-Med or equivalent 

MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT, 

REPRO-MED RES-Q-VAC EMERGENCY SUCTION

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND FUNCTIONAL 

SAMPLE WITH BID 

15 EACH

$13.95 No Bid No Bid $0.00

80-09

NEOTECH Little Sucker ™ multipurpose suction device.  

Single patient use.  Standard Size. 

BRAND: Neotech # N205 or equivalent

IF NOT BID AS SPECIFIED, MUST SEND FUNCTIONAL 

SAMPLE WITH BID 

50 EACH

$2.23 No Bid No Bid $0.00

80-10

ETCo2 cannula w/detachable adapter for endotracheal 

tube, micro-stream key style connection to cardiac 

monitor

MUST SEND SAMPLE WITH BID

50,000 EACH

No Bid No Bid $6.25 $0.00

80-11
Mini-Maglite LED, uses 2 AA batteries, black in color 

includes holster
150 EACH

$19.86 No Bid No Bid $0.00

80-12
Electrode adapter Zoll system for use with Cardiac 

Science Powerheart AED G3 Pro
10 EACH

$11.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00

90-01 McGrath Mac EMS Video Laryngoscope 3.6V Battery 300 EACH
No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.70 $0.00

90-02

McGrath Mac EMS Video Laryngoscope Blade

Size: 1
200 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.40 $0.00

90-03

McGrath Mac EMS Video Laryngoscope Blade

Size: 2
200 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.40 $0.00

90-04

McGrath Mac EMS Video Laryngoscope Blade

Size: 3
200 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.40 $0.00

90-05

McGrath Mac EMS Video Laryngoscope Blade

Size: 4
400 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.40 $0.00

90-06

McGrath Mac EMS Video Laryngoscope Blade

Size: X3
500 EACH

No Bid No Bid No Bid $243.10 $0.00

 

 

  

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY “80” MISCELLANEOUS

TOTAL FOR CATEGORY “90” McGRATH MAC EMS VIDEO LARYNGOSCOPE

NET AMOUNT

DELIVERY

(X) Advertise   (  ) Bid Bond     (X) Ins QUOTE TOTAL

CASH DISCOUNT

TOTAL AMOUNT

NOTES: 

Buyer: BSM AWARD


