NAMES OF VENDORS

| | Summary of Quotations
Commodity. 98143 Date: 8/18/2021
Category: A21-98130 Requisition No: | &
Generator Rental for City of BR g?“
gency: Building and Grounds Bid Opening: 8/18/2021 ('\‘ o
or Qo [ "VV
F.0.B: [Ciosing Date ,;? $ P
IS 2 &
| $ 2 3
Delivery Requirements: IPurchase Pericd: (€] 490 é‘é
| g ) N
Sealed Bid ____ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities_ T < @
ESTIMATED] UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY] QUANTITY | MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount | Unit Price | Amount [ Unit Pricell Amount | Unit Price ] Amount
20 KW DIESEL POWERED
0001 GENERATOR 1 WK
$ 783.09 $ 650.00 $ 1,480.00
20 KW DIESEL POWERED
0002 GENERATOR ! MO
$ 1,408.09 $ 1,550.00 $ 2,166.67
30 KW DIESEL POWERED
0003 (GENERATOR ! WK
$ 783.09 No Bid $ 1,720.00
30 KW DIESEL POWERED
0004 FGENERATOR ! MO
3 1,408.09 No Bid $ 2566.67
0 KW DIESEL POWERED i WK
GENERATOR
$ 783.09 $ 950.00 $ 2,040.00
0 KW DIESEL POWERED 1 MO
GENERATOR
$ 1,408.09 $ 2,100.00 $ 3,100.00
50 KW DIESEL POWERED 1 WK
GENERATOR
$ 970.59 3 1,000.00 $ 2,340.00
50 KW DIESEL POWERED O
0008 §ENERATOR ! Mo I RIGIN AL
$ 1,970.59 $ 2,400.00 $ 3.450.00




.
| Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
fCommodity: 98143 Joate: I  snerz021

| "
Category: A21-98130 £
Generator Rental for City of BR éo*
gency: Building and Grounds 8/18/2021 (x‘ o
()
— 3 [} \7’
[r.oB: 3 & %"
) &
] & ¥ &
o & K4
Delivery Requirements: Q @ by
o & £
| $ £ &
m— & 2 S
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ \ 3 o] 2]
Item ESTIMATED| UNIT OF
No. JDESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANT[TY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount [ Unit Price] Amount Unit Price Amount
75 KW DIESEL POWERED
0009 §SENERATOR ! WK
$ 1,095.59 $ 1,250.00 $ 3,220.00
N
75 KW DIESEL POWERED
0010} - ENERATOR ! MO
$ 2,345.59 $ 3,400.00 $ 4,916.67
100 KW DIESEL POWERED
0011} ENERATOR ! WK
$ 1,216.91 I $ 1,250.00 $ 3,600.00
100 KW DIESEL POWERED
0012 | - ERATOR | 1 MO
$ 2,591.91 $ 3,400.00 $ 5,400.00
125 KW DIESEL POWERED
0013 |GENERATOR ! WK I
$ 1,875.00 $ 1,750.00 $ 3,760.00
125 KW DIESEL POWERED
0014 |GENERATOR 1 MO
$ 3,674.65 $ 4,700.00 $ 5,666.67
150 KW DIESEL POWERED
0015 GENERATOR I WK
$ 1,992.65 $ 1,750.00 $ 4,000.00
150 KW DIESEL POWERED
0016 s ENERATOR ! MO
I $ 3,742.65 $ 4,700.00 $ 6,666.67 l




Summary of Quotations | NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: 98143 JDate: 8/18/2021
|

[Category: A21-98130

[Generator Rental for City of BR

gency: Building and Grounds

9
N
$ o
@ ~
S o <
F.0.B: Closing Date | '3 £ o
| - 1 g & &
Delivery Requirements: [Purchase Period: <) ) S
| | o & )
" . - . - — O o 3
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ < L 2]
Item ESTIMATED] UNIT OF
No. §DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY|] QUANTITY | MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount | Unit Price Amount [ Unit Price] Amount ] Unit P rice | Amount
175 KW DIESEL POWERED
0017 GENERATOR ! WK
$ 2,117.65 $ 1,750.00 $ 4,320.00
175 KW DIESEL POWERED
0018 § ;FNERATOR ' MO
1 $ 4,117.65 $ 4,700.00 $ 6,600.00
200 KW DIESEL POWERED
0019 §SENERATOR ! WK
$ 2,477.94 $ 2,150.00 $ 4,320.00
200 KW DIESEL POWERED
0020 GENERATOR ! MO
I $ 4,727.94 $ 6,600.00 $ 6,600.00
50 KW DIESEL POWERED
0021 GENERATOR 1 WK
$ 2,775.74 $ 2,150.00 $ 5,400.00
250 KW DIESEL POWERED
0022 }GENERATOR ! MO
$ 5,150.74 $ 6,600.00 $ 8,100.00
300 KW DIESEL POWERED
0023 §GENERATOR ! WK
$ 3,431.25 $ 2,700.00 $ 7,001.20
300 KW DIESEL POWERED
0024 GENERATOR ! MO
$ 6,293.75 $ 7.500.00 $ 10,768.07

ORIGINAL
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| Summary of Quotations | . NAMES OF VENDORS
fcommedity: 98143 Joate: I sn1srz021
| | o

Category: A21-98130 |Requisition No: I N
Generator Rental for City of BR || g?"
Agency: Building and Grounds  [|Bid Opening: 8/18/2021} é‘ o
of % o <
fr.o.B: JClosing Date I mé\ f &
| | & & &
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: [$) & 8’
] 4 o S
& & §
- Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry____Definite Quantities____ A o T & —
ESTIMATED| UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY]] QUANTITY | MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount | Unit Price Amount [ Unit Price] Amount J Unit Price ] Amount
350 KW DIESEL POWERED 1 WK
GENERATOR
$ 3,797.79 No Bid $ 780240
350 KW DIESEL POWERED
0026 GENERATOR 1 MO
$ 6,922.79 I No Bid $ 12.102.80 §
400 KW DIESEL POWERED
0027 (GENERATOR ! WK
Is 451103 No Bid $ 7,803.60
400 KW DIESEL POWERED |
9028 } GENERATOR ! MO !
% $ 7.866.03 No Bid $ 12,104.20
450 KW DIESEL POWERED ) WK
GENERATOR |
$ 4,823.53 No Bid $ 7.804.80
450 KW DIESEL POWERED
0030 § GENERATOR ! MO
$ 8.823.53 No Bid $ 12,105.60
500 KW DIESEL POWERED
0031 §ENERATOR ! WK H I
3 6,242.65 $ 4,140.00 $ 7,806.00
500 KW DIESEL POWERED
0032 GENERATOR 1 MO
$ 10,492.65 $ 12,000.00 $ 12,107.00




I I Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
| JCommodity: 98143 JDate: | 8/18/2021 i
— = ¢
Category: A21-98130 Requisition No: || $
Generator Rental for City of BR é?"
gency: Building and Grounds 8/18/2021 c\‘
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[ciosingDate | $ £ o
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Delivery Requirements: IPurchase Period. %) Qg eb
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Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T < 1)
Item ESTIMATED ] UNIT OF
No. JDESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY[] QUANTITY | MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount | Unit Price § Amount [ Unit Pricel Amount | Unit Price ] Amount
600 KW DIESEL POWERED
0033 §GENERATOR ! WK
$ 9,371.32 No Bid $ 13,200.00
600 KW DIESEL POWERED
0034 }GENERATOR ! MO
$ 13,996.32 No Bid $ 20,200.00 I
700 KW DIESEL POWERED I
0035 | GENERATOR ! WK
$ 9,558.82 No Bid $ 15,600.00
700 KW DIESEL POWERED
0036 GENERATOR 1 MO
$ 14,558.82 No Bid $ 24,200.00
800 KW DIESEL POWERED
0037} GENERATOR ! WK
$ 15,808.82 3 7,600.00 $ 16,200.00
800 KW DIESEL POWERED
| %8 koeNERATOR : MO
$ 33,308.82 $ 22,000.00 $ 24,800.00 L I
1000 KW DIESEL POWERED
0039 §GENERATOR ! WK
3 18,235.29 $ 7,600.00 $ 16,800.00
1000 KW DIESEL POWERED
0040 GENERATOR ! I MO
$ 38,235.29 $ 22,000.00 $ 25,600.00




NAMES OF VENDORS

I I Summary of Quotations
L JCommodity: 98143 Igate: I snsiz021
| o
fCategory: A21-98130 [requisition No: || £
Generator Rental for City of BR ‘.’{,o‘
gency: Building and Grounds Bid Opening: 8/18/2021 c\‘ o
or & ~
S o ~
F.0.B: Closing Date || r3 X3 &
(] =~
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& & $
Delivery Requirements: - Purchase Period: Q ng Qb
: ' S & s
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ < L @
Item ESTIMATED| UNIT OF
No. JDESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY]] QUANTITY | MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount § Unit Price Amount [§ Unit Price] Amount ] Unit Price ] Amount
1250 KW DIESEL POWERED :
0041 GENERATOR ! WK
$ 20,198.53 No Bid $ 22,800.00
1250 KW DIESEL POWERED
0042 }GENERATOR ! MO
$ 42,948.53 No Bid $ 35,600.00
1500 KW DIESEL POWERED
0043 IGENERATOR ! WK
$ 20,750.00 $ 12,000.00 $ 22,800.00
1500 KW DIESEL POWERED
0044 JGENERATOR ! MO
$ 42,602.94 $ 35,000.00 $ 35,600.00
1750 KW DIESEL POWERED
0045 IGENERATOR | ! WK
$ 23,165.44 No Bid $ 32,240.00
1750 KW DIESEL POWERED
0046 IGENERATOR ! MO
$ 48,790.44 No Bid $ 51,333.33
2000 KW DIESEL POWERED
0047 |GENERATOR ! WK
$ 23,165.44 No Bid $ 32,240.00
000 KW DIESEL POWERED
L 0048 IéENERAT OR 1 MO
$ 48,790.44 No Bid $ 51,333.33




NAMES OF VENDORS

' | Summary of Quotations 1
| fCommodity: 98143 JDate: I snsr021
] ] .
Category: A21-98130 &£
| [Generator Rental for City of BR 6.9’
[ JAgency: Building and Grounds  JBid Opening: 8/18/2021 c'\‘ o
[
or ;0 o 5
Closing Date | S < o
& &
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& & &
Delivery Requirements: JPurchase Period: O & Qb
| & 3 ~
& & 5
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ 4 < ]
Item ESTIMATED ] UNIT OF
No. |DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount [ Unit Price§] Amount Unit Price Amount
MOBILIZATION AND .
$1600 Roundtrip for
0049 DEMOBILAION CHARGES I HR 20-100 KW $2400
Roundtrip for 175-
350 KW $3600 for
$150.00 500-1500 KW $  200.00
0050 IASSESSMENT, HOURLY H ) HR
$129.00 $ 83.00 $ 105.00
0051 CHNICIAN, HOURLY RATE 1 HR
k $ 89.00 $ 138.00 $  105.00
I 0052 IELECTRICIAN, HOURLY RATE 1 HR
$ 139.00 3 413.00 l $ 105.00 I
I 0053 |OPERATOR, HOURLY RATE 1 HR
$ 109.00 $ 275.00 3 105.00
REFUELING CHARGE, PRICE
0054 §bER GALLON-DIESEL ! GAL
$4.00 $ 12.00 $ 6.00
DETAINMENT CHARGES
0055 (AFTER 4 HOUR DELAY) | 1 HR '
$ 250.00 3 275.00 $ 105.00
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Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

| fCommodity: 98143 JDate: |

| |
Category: A21-98130
]
L
or

[Closing Date |
_

Delivery Requirements:

ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY] QUANTITY

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities_

8/18/2021
g
&
&
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§
O
4
$
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UNIT OF
MEASURE

Unit Price Amount

Unit Price] Amount

Unit Price

0 KW DIESEL POWERED
0057 f[GENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

1,768.38

1,300.00

$ 2,360.00

0 KW DIESEL POWERED
0058 JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

3,893.38

3,100.00

0059 JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

1,768.38

No Bid

$ 3,633.33

$ 2,840.00

30 KW DIESEL POWERED
0060 fIGENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

MO

3,893.38

No Bid

$ 4,433.33

GENERATOR-EMERGENCY

40 KW DIESEL POWERED
0061
USE

40 KW DIESEL POWERED
0062 [GENERATOR-EMERGENCY
SE

MO

1,768.38

1,800.00

3,893.38

4,200.00

50 KW DIESEL POWERED
0063 fGENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

30 KW DIESEL POWERED l

WK

2,080.88

2,000.00

3,480.00

5,500.00

$ 3,780.00




| Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Date:

8/18/2021]

ICommodity: 98143

fCategory: A21-98130

Jrequisition No: |

IGenerator Rental for City of BR

8/18/2021

gency: Building and Grounds

F.0.B:

Delivery Requirements: |Purchase Period;

Item
No.

0064

0065

0066

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___

ESTIMATED] UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY] QUANTITY | MEASURE

50 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

MO

$ 4,830.88

o

N
X4
&
&
LN
O
ES

Unit Price Amount

Unit Price

$ 4,800.00

Amount | Unit Price § Amount

$ 5,850.00

Unit Price] Amount ] Unit Price

Amount

75 KW DIESEL POWERED ﬂ
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

WK

$ 2,500.00

$ 5,540.00

75 KW DIESEL POWERED
(GENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

MO

$ 2,080.88 r

$ 4,830.88

$ 6,800.00

0067

100 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

$ 2,481.62

! $ 2,500.00

$ 8,783.33

$ 6,000.00

1060 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

MO

$ 5,856.62

$ 6,800.00

$ 9,400.00

h 0069

N
125 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

WK

$ 3,625.00

0070

k07 1

GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

MO

$ 7,875.00

$ 3,500.00

$ 6,320.00

$ 9,400.00

$ 9,933.33

150 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

125 KW DIESEL POWERED l

$ 4,113.97

$ 3,500.00

$ 6,800.00




| Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Jcommodity: 98143 JDate: | 81812021

Category: A21-98130
Generator Rental for City of BR
gency: Building and Grounds

Requisition No:

Bid Opening: 8/18/2021

or

|r.o.B: fClosing Date |

Ipelivery Requirements: JPurchase Period:

Item
No.

0072

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___

ESTIMATED ] UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY[] QUANTITY | MEASURE

150 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

MO

o
o
&
&
&

£

o
T

Unit Price

$ 8,988.97

Amount

Unit Price Amount | Unit Price § Amount

3 9,400.00 $ 10,733.33

Unit Price] Amount

Unit Price

Amount

0073

0074

175 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

$ 4,676.47

$ 3,500.00 $ 7.440.00

175 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY H 1 MO

USE

$ 10,676.47

$ 9,400.00 $ 11,800.00

1 0075

0076

200 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 i

WK
USE

$ 5,866.91

$ 4,300.00 $ 7,440.00

00 KW DIESEL POWERED
(GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

MO

$ 13,841.91

$ 13,200.00 $ 11,800.00

0077

0078

250 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

WK

$ 7,007.35

$ 4,300.00 $ 9,000.00

250 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

MO

$ 16,2567.35

3 13,200.00 3 14,100.00

0079

300 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

WK

$ 8,125.00

$ 9,801.20

$ 5,400.00
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| Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
lCommodity: 98143 Jpate: I 8/18/2021

[ [Category: A21-08130 Requisition No: | &
| [Generator Rental for City of BR éﬂ"
~

| JAgency: Building and Grounds

Bid Opening:

8/18/2021

Closing Date

Delivery Requirements:

Purchase Period:

————

D

300 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

R

id__ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___

ESTIMATED] UNIT OF

ESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY] QUANTITY | MEASURE

18,375.00

15,000.00

$ 15,601.40

&
2] o
& §
Q &
& Y
c
1¢] )
o <&
[4) <]
£ &
< T
Unit Price Unit Price Amount | UnitPrice | Amount I Unit Pricel Amount [ Unit Price § Amount

350 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

10,040.44

$ 11,402.40

50 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

0082

$ 23,415.44 H

No Bid

$ 18,102.80

00 KW DIESEL POWERED
0083 JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

$ 11,547.79

No Bid

$ 13,803.60

400 KW DIESEL POWERED
0084 gGENERATOR-EMERGENCY
SE

MO

26,172.79

No Bid

I $ 22,104.20

450 KW DIESEL POWERED
0085 gGENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

450 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

12,985.29

30,485.29

No Bid

No Bid

I $ 13,804.80

$ 22,105.60

500 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY
USE

$ 16,176.47

[

8,280.00

I $ 13,806.00
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| | Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
] Jcommodity: 98143 IDate: I 81872021
— | .
Category: A21-98130 Requisition No: | £
Generator Rental for City of BR &@‘
Agency: Building and Grounds  [[Bid Opening: 8/18/2021 & I o
Q
] ~
<3 ~
JFoB: ICiosing Date S £ o
4 ) &
| | ’3 g &
Delivery Requirements: fPurchase Period: QO nge ebé
| s o N
_ _ ‘ 0 °
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T < ]
Item ESTIMATED| UNIT OF
No. JDESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY] QUANTITY | MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount | Unit Price Amount § Unit Price] Amount § Unit Price | Amount
500 KW DIESEL POWERED
0088 [GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 MO
USE $  36,176.47 $ 24,000.00 $ 22,107.00
600 KW DIESEL POWERED
0089 JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 WK
USE $  23,088.24 No Bid $ 21,600.00 I |
500 KW DIESEL POWERED
0090 JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 MO
USE $  48,088.24 No Bid $ 34,200.00
700 KW DIESEL POWERED I
0091 [GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 WK !
USE | I I $ 2371324 No Bid $ 25,200.00
700 KW DIESEL POWERED |
0092 JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 MO |
USE $  49.963.24 No Bid $ 40,200.00
800 KW DIESEL POWERED |
0093 JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 WK
USE $ 2371324 No Bid $ 25,800.00
800 KW DIESEL POWERED | I
0094 [GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 MO
USE $ 4996324 No Bid $ 40,900.00
1000 KW DIESEL POWERED
0095 [GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 WK
USE $  25477.94 $ 15,200.00 $ 28,800.00
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I | Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
kcommedity: 98143 Date: I 8872021 |
| "
Category: A21-98130 Requisition No: | &
Generator Rental for City of BR g‘?"
gency:. Building and Grounds Bid Opening: 8/18/2021 c\‘ o
or & ) vi
. S | o ~
[r.oB: fclosing Date l o $ 9"
L o @
| | & ¥ &
— Q s’ QQ
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: (<) an eb
& 2 N
. - - & ) S
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T <3 )
Item ESTIMATED] UNIT OF
No. JDESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY] QUANTITY | MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount | Unit Price Amount [ Unit Price] Amount | Unit Price ] Amount
1000 KW DIESEL POWERED
0096 |GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 MO
USE $  51,727.94 $ 44,000.00 $ 45,600.00
1250 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 WK
USE I $  26,485.29 No Bid $ 40,800.00 I
1250 KW DIESEL POWERED |
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY | MO
USE $  51,727.94 No Bid $ 65,600.00
1500 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 WK
USE $  31,375.00 $ 24.ooo.oo| $ 59,656.80
1500 KW DIESEL POWERED i
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 MO
USE $  64,654.41 $ 70,000.00 $ 97,028.00
1750 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 WK |
USE $  32,091.91 No Bid $ 50,656.80
1750 KW DIESEL POWERED
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 MO
USE $ 6521691 No Bid I $ 97,028.00
2000 KW DIESEL POWERED
0103 [GENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1 WK
USE s __3200191] No Bid I $ 59,656.80 i




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: 98143 Joate: | 8/18/2021

| o
Category: A21-98130 Requisition No: £
Generator Rental for City of BR ég)‘
Agency: Building and Grounds Bid Opening: 8/18/2021 é‘ o

or & o S
F.0.B: [cClosing Date QQ.\ & o
Q g &

| § & &
Delivery Requirements: [Purchase Period: O Qg;e §

| S © >

& & §

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ A s L 9

Item ESTIMATED] UNIT OF
No. |DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY] QUANTITY § MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount | UnitPrice | Amount J Unit Price] Amount

2000 KW DIESEL POWERED
0104 JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY 1
USE

MO

$ 65,216.91

No Bid

$ 97,028.00

Unit Price

Amount

LINES 105-128 ARE FOR STANDBY PRICING RATES TO RESERVE GENERATORS, FOR PRE-PLANNING PURPOSES IN THE EVENT OF AN EMERGENCY, FOR A FOUR (4) MONTH PERIOD THAT
(WILL BEGIN AUGUST 1| OF CONTRACT CALENDAR YEAR AND WILL END NOVEMBER 30 OF CONTRACT CALENDAR YEAR. THERE IS NO GUARANTEE THAT THE LINES WILL BE USED, AS
IT WILL BE THE DISCRETION OF THE USING AGENCY TO DECIDE THEIR INTENT OF UTILIZING THE FOLLOWING LINES; IF ALLOWED WITHIN THEIR ANNUAL BUDGET

I Item ESTIMATED] UNIT OF I
No. JDESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY] QUANTITY j§ MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount § Unit Price Amount [ Unit Pricef] Amount ] Unit Price ] Amount
20 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
105§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
I’NOVEMBER )
. $ 944.85 $ 1,550.00 $ 134167 I
30 KW DIESEL GENERATOR - I
106§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO I
NOVEMBER )
I $ 944.85 No Bid $ 1,666.67
40 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
107§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
-NOVEMBER )
$ 944.85 3 2,100.00 $ 2,100.00
50 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
108§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
NOVEMBER)
$ 1,007.35 $ 2,400.00 $ 2,175.00




| Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS

fCommodity: 98143 [pate: |  sr18r2021
] | .
Category: A21-98130 Requisition No: | £
Generator Rental for City of BR g‘?"
gency: Building and Grounds Bid Opening: 8/18/2021 c\‘ o
or @w ~
S o' ~
froe: [Closing Date || & Ny o
i ) &
| | £ & 5
|Delivery Requirements: IPurchase Pericd: O Qg? g
l I Oo < N
- & & §
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ hd & ]
Item ESTIMATED] UNIT OF
No. }DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY} QUANTITY § MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount ]| Unit Price Amount [ Unit Price] Amount ] Unit Price ] Amount
75 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
109STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
-NOVEMBER )
$ 1,319.85 $ 3,400.00 $ 3,366.67
100 KW DIESEL GENERATOR H
110§- STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
—-NOVEMBER ) ‘
$ 1,944.85 $ 3,400.00 $ 3,550.00 I [ ]
125 KW DIESEL GENERATOR h I

114}- STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
NOVEMBER )

|

$ 6,600.00 $ 4,525.00 I

$ 3,077.21

250 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
115F- STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
—~NOVEMBER )

3 3,327.21

111} STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO |
_NOVEMBER ) I
$ 1,944.85 $ 4,700.00 $ 3,766.67
150 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
112}- STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
NOVEMBER )
$ 2,069.85 $ 4,700.00 $ 4,091.67
175 KW DIESEL GENERATOR | |
113}- STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
[ NOVEMBER ) I |
$ 2,764.71 $ 4,700.00 $ 4,525.00

200 KW DIESEL GENERATOR |

$ 6,600.00 % $ 5,325.00 I




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
Commcdity: 98143 'Date: | snsre021 I

o
| Jcategory: A21-98130 isiti : £
”\
@
8/18/2021 c'\é'
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JDelivery Requirements: IPurchase Period: Q an eb
' |
Sealed B:cl Price Inquiry__Definite Quantities___ < I s )
UNIT OF ,
MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Unit Price Amount [ Unit Price] Amount | Unit Price

300 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
STANDBY RATE (AUGUST

7,491.97

4,389.71 7,500.00

4,702.21 I i 8,575.60

STANDBY RATE (AUGUST

00 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
118
NOVEMBER )

3 5,952.21 No Bid $ 8,575.80

50 KW DIESEL GENERATOR h I
119} STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
NOVEMBER )

$  7.139.7 No Bid $ 8,576.20 I

500 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
120}- STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
NOVEMBER ) H

$ 8,389.71 $ 12,000.00 $ 8,576.50
LOO KW DIESEL GENERATOR I | I I I

STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
NOVEMBER )

$ 9,639.71 No Bid $ 13,800.00

-NOVEMBER )

$ 10,889.71 $ 17,150.00

700 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
1228~ STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO I
No Bid




| | Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
| fCommodity: 98143 Date: | 882021
S— o
Requisition No: £
Q\
&
&
& N
S o ~
[Ciosing Date & $ o
) &
3 3 S
Delivery Requirements:. Purchase Period: L$) Qg: eb
$ © I N
& & S
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ Ao I < @
Item ESTIMATED] UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY[] QUANTITY ] MEASURE Unit Price Unit Price Amount Unit Price] Amount | Unit Price § Amount
800 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
123F- STANDBY RATE (AUGUST
-NOVEMBER ) .
$ 12,172.79 No Bid $ 17.300.00
1000 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
1248 STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO l
-NOVEMBER ) i
$ 15,047.79 $ 22,000.00 $ 17,450.00
T
1250 KW DIESEL GENERATOR L I I
125 STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO I
NOVEMBER )
3 18,437.50 No Bid $ 25,575.00
1500 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
1268- STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO I
NOVEMBER )
$ 21.562.50. $ 35,000.00 $ 25,575.00
1750 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
127§- STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
NOVEMBER ) $ 23,441.18 No Bid $ 38,358.33
2000 KW DIESEL GENERATOR
1288~ STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO
NOVEMBER )
$ 27,308.82 No Bid $ 38,358.33




In the event of a declared emergency,

Ty —
| Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
Icommodity: 98143 Ioate: P ensr2021

| o
Category: A21-98130 [Requisition No: | $
Generator Rental for City of BR éo"
agency: Building and Grounds Bid Opening: 8/18/2021 c\‘ o
o
d ~
o ~
' 05\ £ q?..
33 ¥ &
£ d 3
& & 4
Q—
g o §
& & 5
A4 T )

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price} Amount
we reserved the right to establish reasonable rerouting and detainment rates using the lowest rerouting bidder and detainment rates of the responsive bidders as a

Unit Price

Amount

benchmark. Additional delivery charges if applicable: Please specify below your applicable delivery related charges as may apply to this contract. Failure to supply applicable charges below will indicate
endor is supplying the service/commodity at no additional charge ($0.00) to the City Parish, If your delivery is unreasonable delayed in loading or unloading at delivery destination, beyond four (4) hours,

specify the separate hourly delivery detainment charge assessed

Item ESTIMATED ] UNIT OF
No. |DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY] QUANTITY ] MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount | UnitPrice | Amount [ Unit Price] Amount | Unit Price ] Amount
129 Delivery detainment charge, per 1 HR
hour, beyond a four(4) hour delay
| 250.00 $ 275.00 $ 250.00
|
130QDelivery rerouting charge 1 FLAT FEE
300.00 550.00 $ 250.00
131Delivery rerouting charge 1 MILE
2.00 $ 550.00 3 5.00
TOTAL AMOUNT
JCASH AMOUNT
JNET AMOUNT |
[DELIVERY | |
Jawarb ] | ] ] |
NOTES:




