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Commodity: 98836 Date:
9/17/2021 =
Category:Lawn & Landscaping Maintenance|{Requisition No: ar g
A21-0927 § Qc?-
EMS & BUILDING MAINTENANCE Bid Opening: T o o § ;..0
or \,V..::’ Q‘!*_ {,\? (§J
F.0.B: Destination Closing Date & & .;\O ¥ S
9/17/2021 by K $ 2 g
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: Q?Q’O Find S & &
&3 2 &2 N
: S T \g & ) ©
Sealed Bid _x_ Price Inquiry_X__Definite Quantities___ O v A © 3
ESTIMATED it Price Amount
I:\f:‘ DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY O;:J&:\:'L:'r‘:;? n;JEhj:;l?;E Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Prics
b glljciilgi\;’:;man s Hospital/ Police Headquarters & s | = - 465 Bl . 550,63 N 5 580.00
GROUP FOUR
0021[Alcohol and Drug Abuse Building 43 EACH | s 165.00 NO BID S 60.00 NA $ 30000
0022/ Human Resources Building 43 EACH | & 110.00 NO BID 3 45.00 NA $ 125.00
0023 EBR Health Unit 43 EACH | s 220.00 NO BID 3 80.00 NA $  300.00 r == ‘
- ‘ - ; T
0024 g::zo}?:;?':fa;ﬁs'nﬁ:ﬁfﬁ;ﬁi’fﬁ i:u';g?h 43 EACH | s 330.00 NO BID 3$ 160.00 NA $  380.00 : g.ﬁg{ %géi X g_::‘.!%%\m IS W
0025 Le0 5. Butler Community Center 23 EACH |5 165.00 NO BID 5 50.00 NA § 125,00 4 :
0026 YWWomen's Community Rehabilitation Center 43 EACH | s 165.00 NO BID $ 50.00 NA $ 150.00 —
0027 BR Police Dept. 2nd District a3 EACH | s 55.00 NO BID s 45.00 NA $ _ 100.00 - ==
0028|LSU AgCenter/Recycling Office 43 EACH | s 165.00 NO BID $ 70.00 NA $  200.00
ROUP FIV]
00(239 Wunderlaid Head Start Center 43 EACH | s 210.00 NO BID S 100.00 NA S 22500
0030/ Progress Road Head Start Building 43 EACH | s 270.00 NO BID $ 165.00 NA S 300.00
0031|Charlie Thomas Memorial Head Start Center a3 EACH | s 190.00 NO BID s 100.00 NA $ 24500
0032/ Freeman Mathews Head Start Center 43 EACH | 5 230.00 NO BID $ 100.00 NA § 15000
0033|LaBelle Aire Head Start Center a3 EACH | s 150.00 NO BID s 110.00 NA $ 1I70.00
0034|New Horizon Head Start Center 43 EACH | 8 190.00 NO BID 3 110.00 NA $  350.00
GROUP SIX
0035/ Public Building Group & ROW 43 EACH | s 490,00 NO BID $  300.00 NA 2 1 zig.zg
003g|Baton Rouge River Center Complex 43 EACH | s 290.00 NO BID s 300.00 NA 375,
GROUP SEVEN
0037|City Parish Building & Lots 43 EACH | s 330.00 $ 75.00 $ 135,00 NA $  400.00
0038 Animal Control Center 43 EACH | s 250.00 $  130.00 S 190,00 NA $ 1.300.00
GROUP EIGHT
003940 Lawn Services per year 40 EACH | s 475.00 NO BID 5 180.00 NA $ 1,800.00
004020 Landscaping Service per year 20 EACH | s 250.00 NO BID $ 90.00 NA $ _1,500.00
Vendors TOTAL AMOUNT
Advertise ( ) Bid Bond ( ) Ins ( ) CASH DISCOUNT
Special Conditions NET AMOUNT $ - § :
Buy{ Arvin Jones Date 09/08/2021 |DELIVERY |




