Summary of Quatations NAMES OF VENDORS NAMES OF VENDORS

PROJECT: A21-0405 - JANITORIAL SERVICES FOR
VARIOUS PUBLIC SAFETY FACILITIES

5
Date: 91412021 & ‘{? el
Commodity: 91039 S{;I [ &
Category: JANITORIAL SERVICES File No: & Ly _é." &
File 21-00405 2 {.3' & 3
Agency: BR PD, BR Fire, BR Juvinile Services Bid Opening: é‘ é‘S' 2 § é{f .3\';
ADDENDUM 1 & 2 or 911412021 & £ 6:’ & L S
F.0.B: Destination Closing Date £ § 4‘5? Q;" ‘SJ § ;“-‘
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: é‘a" _;',‘,‘ ¥ d_k &7 a7
One Time & & é' T Qg _f"l Q-?
Sealed Bid __X_ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ é? q’f § @ L0 Q
ltem UNIT OF Per Month Per Year Cost or § Per Month Per Year Cost or S Per Month Per Year Cost or iz Per Month Per Year Cost or . Per Month Per Year Cost or
Unit P
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Cost Per Odouriios Unit Price Cost S Unit Price Cost i Unit Price Cost Per Oceurance nit Price Cost Per Occurance
Base Price
0001 |[Janitorial Services at 1st District Police Precinct 8,800 SQFT $0.0730 $0.0946 $0.3200 $0.071352 $0.2300
4545 Plank Rd
Janitorial Services at 1st District Police Precinct
0002|4545 Plank Rd 2,100 SQFT NC CHARGE $0.1100 NO CHARGE 50,33824 N/C

Shampoo Carpet (by request)
Janitorial Services at 1st District Police Precinct
00034545 Plank Rd 6,700 SQFT NO CHARGE $0.2900 NO CHARGE $0.233523888 NG

Strip/Wax Bare Floors (by request)

Base Price

0004 |Janitorial Services at 2nd District Police Precinct 2,304 SQFT 50.2300 $0.1996 51.2500 $0.1916362847 e
2265 Highland Rd
Janitorial Services at 2nd District Police Precinct

0005|2265 Highland Rd 324 SQFT NO CHARGE $0.2000 NO CHARGE $0.4358850617 NIC

Shampoo Carpet {by request)

2nd District Police Precinct
0006|2265 Highland Rd 1,980 SQFT NO CHARGE 50.2900 NO CHARGE $0,243126260 NIC
Strip/Wax Bare Floors (by request)

Base Price

0007 |Janitorial Services at 4th District Police Precinct 3,200 SQFT $0.1320 $0.1596 50.9000 $0.160021875
8227 Scenic Hwy
Janitorial Services at 4th District Police Precinct

0008|8227 Scenic Hwy 3,011 SQFT | NOCHARGE 50.1100 NO CHARGE 501861541016

Shampoo Carpet (by request)

Janitorial Services at 4th District Police Precinct
0009|8227 Scenic Hwy 189 SQFT NO CHARGE §0.2900 NO CHARGE $4,346,560,847,000000000
Strip/Wax Bare Floors (by request)

Base Price
0010 |Janitorial Services at Gus Young Police Precinct 1,200 SQFT $0.2590 $0.3832 $2.4000
4778 Gus Young Avenue

$0.0684583333 NC

Janitorial Services at Gus Young Police Precinct
00114778 Gus Young Avenue 1,200 SQFT NO CHARGE $0,1100 NO CHARGE $0.2530166667 NC

Strip/Wax Bare Floors (by request)

Base Price
0012}Janitorial Services at Police Traffic Division 7261 2,336 SQFT 50.1840 $0.1969 $1.2300 $0.1347089041 Ne
Florida Blvd.
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0013

Base Price
Janitorial Services at Police Intelligence Division
223 Fernwoad Dr., SuitesB& C

1,900

SQFT

$0.0660

§0.1200

$0.2200

$0.1058157895

NiC

0014

Janitorial Services at Police Intelligence Division
223 Fernwood Dr., Suites B& C
Strip/Wax Bare Floors (by request)

1,900

SQFT

NGO CHARGE

$0.2900

NO CHARGE

$0.1693736842

NC

0015

Base Price

Janitorial Services at Fire Department
Headquarters

8011 Merle Gustafson Drive

16,815

SQFT

$0.0630

$0.1013

$0.1700

$0.0564567351

NIC

0018

Janitorial Services at Fire Department
Headquarters

8011 Merle Gustafson Drive
Shampoo Carpet (by request)

13,452

SQFT

NO CHARGE

$0.0500

NO CHARGE

50.0643123689

NIC

0017

Janitorial Services at Fire Department
Headquarters
8011 Merle Gustafson Drive

3,363

SQFT

NO CHARGE

$0.2270

NO CHARGE

$0.1114808207

NIC

0018

Sirin/Wax Bare Floors (by reguest)
Janitorial Services at Fire Department
Headquarters

8011 Merle Gustafson Drive

Day Attendant - Monday through Friday, 6:00 am -
3:00 pm

MONTH

$1,300.0000

$2,596.5400

$720.0000

§$483.2700000000

$2,600.0000

0o1e

Base Price

Janitorial Services at Fire Department Maintenance
Outbuilding

8011 Merle Gustafson Drive

480

SQFT

$0.1800

50.1100

NO CHARGE

$0.2810208333

NIC

0020

Janitorial Services at Fire Department Maintenance
Qutbuilding
8011 Merle Gustafson Drive

| Strip/Wax Bare Floors (by request)

480

SQFT

NO CHARGE

$0.2270

NO CHARGE

50.3445000000

NIC

0021

Base Price

Janitorial Services at Fire Department Mechanic
Shop Outbuilding

8011 Merle Gustafson Drive

480

SQFT

$0.1800

$0.1100

NO CHARGE

$0.2093958333

NIC

0022

Janitorial Services at Fire Department Mechanic
Shop Outbuilding
8011 Merle Gustafson Drive

Strip/Wax Bare Floors {by request)

480

SQFT

NO CHARGE

50.2270

NO CHARGE

$0.1599583333

NiC

0023

Base Price
Janitorial Services to be performed at Fire

Department Supply Outbuilding
8011 Merle Gustafson Drive.

202

SQFT

$0.1700

$0.1700

NO CHARGE

$0.19039860396

NiC

0024

Janitorial Services to be performed at Fire
Department Supply Outbuilding

8011 Merle Gustafson Drive.

Strip/Wax bare Floors (upon request)

202

SQFT

NO CHARGE

$0.2270

NO CHARGE

$0.2535148515

NC
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0025

Base Price

Janitorial Services to be performed at Juvenile
Services Including Juvenile Annex, West Wing,
Detention Center (except youth sleeping
wings/units), Modular Building & Training Trailer
at,

32,439 SQFT

NO BID

$0.0944

$0.1700

$0.03538056040

NIC

0026

Janitorial Services to be performed at Juvenile
Services (including Juvenile Annex, West Wing,
Detention Control Center, Modular Building &
Training Trailer

8333 Veterans Blvd.

Shampoo Carpet (upon request)

10,287 SQFT

NO BID

§0.1100

NO CHARGE

$0.057072000

NiC

0027

Janitorial Services at Juvenile Services (including
Juvenile Annex, West Wing, Detention Control
Center, Modular Building & Training Trailer

8333 Veterans Bivd.

Strip/Wax bare Floors (upon request)

22,152 SQFT

NO BID

$0.2900

NO CHARGE

$0.0331654027

N/C

o028

Tudi

Janitorial Services at Juvenile Services (i
Juvenile Annex, West Wing, Detention Control
Center, Modular Building & Training Trailer

8333 Veterans Blvd.

Day Attendant - Monday through Friday, 7:00 am -
11:00 am

1 MONTH

NO BID

$1,298.2700

§360.0000

5765.480000000

§5,000.0000

0029

Base Price

|Janitorial Services at Juvenile Court Section

8333 Veterans Bivd,

14,000 SQFT

NO BID

$0.1200

§0.3100

50.1069185714

NIC

0030

Janitorial Services at Juvenile Court Section
8333 Veterans Bivd.
Shampoo Carpet (upon request)

11,675 SQFT

NO BID

$0.1100

NO CHARGE

50.073%477516

NIC

0031

Janitorial Services at Juvenile Court Section
8333 Veterans Bivd.
Strip/Wax bare Floors (upon request)

3,225 SQFT

NO BID

$0.2800

NO CHARGE

§0.2999162791

NIC

0032

Janitorial Services at Juvenile Court Section
8333 Veterans Blvd.

Day Attendant - Monday through Friday, 8:30 am -
3:00 pm

1 MONTH

NO BID

$1,947.4000

$720,0000

§1,127.870000000

NIC

0033

Base Price
Janitorial Services at SRT/K9 Building
3737 Brig. General Davis Avenue

2,770 SQFT

$0.0730

$0.1200

$0.2600

$0.2872779783

0034

Janitorial Services at SRT/K9 Building
3737 Brig. General Davis Avenue
Strip/Wax bare Floors (upon request)

2,770 SQFT

NO CHARGE

$0.2900

NO CHARGE

$0.1975559567

ORIGINAL
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0035 |Janitorial Services at Police Air Support 1,210 SQFT $0.0900 50.2000 $0.3000 $0,1699586777
9710 C.E. Woolman St
Janitorial Services at Police Air Support
00369710 C.E. Woolman St 1,210 SQFT NO CHARGE $0.2000 NO CHARGE $0.2949317355
Strip/Wax bare Floors (upon request)
Base Price
Janitorial Services to be performed at Police
0037 Department Evidence Division 5,519 SQFT $0.0290 $0.1200 $0.2100 50,1628863925
2905 Evangeline Street
Base Price
Janitorial Services to be performed at Police _
0038| pepartment Crime Division 5,000 SQFT 50.0310 $0.1200 $0.2300 $0.160692000
2905 Evangeline Street
Base Price
Janitorial Services to be performed at Police
0032 | annex Building. 5,800 SQFT 50.0280 50,1200 50.1240 50.1725637931
100 West Thomas Road
Base Price
Janitorial Services to be performed at 5TH District
0040 Police Precinct 1,000 SQFT $0.1100 $0.1200 52.8800 50.602160000
201 3rd Street
Base Price
|Vanitorial Services to be performed at the
0041 | yarcotics Processing Room 1,000 SQFT $0.1100 50.1200 $0.5780 $0.602180000
4443 Plank Road
\Vendors NET AMOUNT
Advertise (X) Bid Bond ( ) Ins { ) Informal ( ) CASH DISCOUNT
ISpecial Conditions : DELIVERY TOTAL AMOUNT
Buyer MWhite Date 08/09/21 DELIVERY




