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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | PRICE |TOTAL| PRICE |TOTAL| PRICE |TOTAL| PRICE |TOTAL| PRICE |TOTAL|PRICE|TOTAL
0001 GIANT PI_P'E BIUILDERS {Model: FF597 or Approved Equal 68 EACH NO BID NO BID $74.39 $91.00
per Specifications)
gppz [IP-SIEED BINOCULARS = SET OF 6 {Model: FS344.or 68 EACH | $15.00 $50.76 NO BID $46.49 $57.00
Approved Equal per Specifications)
0003 LAKESHORE BIG BL_]BBLES (Model EE604 or Approved 68 EACH NO BID NO BID $37.19 $45.50
Equal per Specifications)
|
0004 KEEP IT SAFE.. '!'RA_FFIC SIGNS (Model JJ374 or Approved 12 EACH $120.00 $76.46 NO BID $83.69 $102.50
Equal per Specifications)
HEAVY-DUTY HOPSCOTCH PUZZLE MATS (Model: VR206
0005 or Approved Equal per Specifications) 68 EACH $57.00 $31.41 NO BID $27.89 $34.00
ggoe: |AETV I CSCARVES (Model: TT881 orApproved Equal per 136 EACH | $9.00 $33.11 $4.32 $15.80 $19.25
Specifications)
oo | ¥ - TUHGHTRUCKS (tiodel: TREZ0X oripproved Equa) 68 EACH |NOBID $89.13 NO BID $83.24 $102.00
per Specifications)
il l .
0008 LET'S GET MOVING! ACT!\{ITY. MATS (Model: GG735 or 68 EACH NO BID NO BID $46.49 $57.00
Approved Equal per Specifications)
0oog |EASY BUILD BRICKS STARTER SET (Model: #BRS73 or 24 EACH [$132.00 $125.76 NO BID $147.87 $181.00
Approved Equal per Specifications)
LARGE HOP ALONG BALL (22") (Model: RA669 or
0010 Approved Equal per-Siecifications) 48 EACH $7.45 $33.96 $11.98 $27.89 $34.00
MEDIUM HOP ALONG BALL (18") Model: RA668 or
0011 Approved Equal per Specifications) 48 EACH $6.50 $33.96 NO BID $23.24 $28.50
0012 |SHIPPING 1 EACH $0.00 $0.00 $4,940.00
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