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0001 |Boulevard Group One Annual Total 1 EACH N/A $245,100.00 $73,017.44 $89,236.46 NB $72,541.00
0002 |Boulevard Group Two Annual Total 1 EACH N/A $249,400.00 $0.00 $60,498.10 NB $53,836.00
0003 |Boulevard Group Three Annual Total 1 EACH | $60,540.00 $150,500.00 $0.00 $39,529.00 NB $34,701.00
0004 |Boulevard Group Four Annual Total 1 EACH N/A No Bid $0.00 $32,376.96 NB $14,806.00
0005 |Boulevard Group Five Annual Total 1 EACH N/A No Bid $143,321.58 $368,963.68 NB $134,676.00
0006 |Boulevard Group Six Annual Total 1 EACH N/A No Bid $0.00 $321,226.70 NB $127,022.00
0007 |Boulevard Group Seven Annual Total 1 EACH N/A No Bid $0.00 $251,161.80 NB $90,816.00
0008 |Boulevard Group Eight Annual Total 1 EACH | $140,755.00 No Bid $0.00 $163,359.93 NB $97,524.00
0009 |Boulevard Group Nine Annual Total 1 EACH N/A No Bid $333,499.98 $641,238.92 NB $500,500.00
0010 [Boulevard Group Ten Annual Total 1 EACH N/A No Bid $133,000.12 $277,491.14 NB $152,900.00
0011 |Boulevard Group Eleven A Annual Total 1 EACH $50,928.00 No Bid $0.00 $25,209.28 $10,509.20 $10,793.00
0012 |Boulevard Group Eleven B Annual Total 1 EACH N/A $112,920.00 $324,000.00 $170,946.31 NB $153,000.00
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