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Men’s Uniform Pants (Model: 5.11 Flex-Tac Stryke 74369 or
0001 Approved Equal) Per Specifications 2,500 Each $69.00 $61.55 $48.60 $54.50 $45.50
Women's Uniform Pants (Model: 5.11 Flex-Tac #64386 or
0002 Approved Equal) Per Specifications 300 Each $69.00 $61.55 $48.60 $54.50 $45.50
Men’s Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049 — Size: XS —
0003 3¥0. or Approved Equal)Per Speciffeations 1,300 Each $44.50 $48.60 $39.60 $45.50 $32.50
Men’s Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049T Size: L - 5XL
0GH Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 800 Each $50.75 $51.55 $40.60 $45.50 $35.75
Women's Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #61165 Size: S -
0005 XL or Approved Equal) Per'Secifications 350 Each $44.50 $46.53 $39.60 $45.50 $32.50
IMen’s Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1149 or
0006 Approved Equal) Per Specifications 800 Each $48.50 $49.00 $54.50 $54.75 $40.00
Women’'s Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1190
neeT Size: S-2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 100 Each $48.50 $49.00 $54.50 $54.75 $40.00
Men's Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1249 or
0008 Approved Egual) Per Specifications 400 Each $44.50 $47.00 $49.50 $52.75 $38.00
Women's Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1292
0003 Size: S — 2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 100 Each $44.50 $47.00 $49.50 $52.75 $38.00
godo; [oICr Sleeve Duty Shirt (Wodei: 511 #71354 Sizes; L.~ bxl. 800 Each | No Bid No Bid $53.75 No Bid $53.00
Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
Short Sleeve Duty Shirt (Model: 5.11 #71354 Size: XS - 3XL, .
0011 Regular or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 2,200 Each $67.00 $63.66 $50.50 No Bid $50.00
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ESTIMAT4ED
ANNUAL UNIT OF
Item No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
0001 IMen’s Uniform Pants (Mod.e.[: 5.:11 Flex-Tac Stryke 74369 or 2,500 Each $48.61 No Bid $55.70
Approved Equal) Per Specifications
0002 Women’s Uniform Pants (I\{It_aclel_: 5.11 Flex-Tac #64386 or 300 Each $48.61 No Bid $55.70
Approved Equal) Per Specifications
Men's Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049 — Size: XS - g
1002 3XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 1,500 Each $45,64 Na Bld $34.54
Men’s Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049T Size: L - 5XL .
0004 Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 800 Each $45.64 No Bid 354.34
Women's Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #61165 Size: S - ;
0005 XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 350 Edeh $45.64 Nagld 354,34
Men’s Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1149 or
e Approved Equal) Per Specifications 800 Each $45.08 $69.13 $59.07
Women’s Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1190
907 Size: S-2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 00 Each $45.08 $59.13 53,07
Men's Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1249 or
Qoos Approved Equal) Per Specifications 498 Each $42.52 $56.13 53,09
Women'’s Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1292
0009 Size: S — 2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 100 Bach $42.52 $56.13 $55.69
Short Sleeve Duty Shirt (Model: 5.11 #71354 Sizes: L — 5XL >
oty Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 800 Eaeh %60.08 No Bid eI
0011 Short Sleeve Duty Shirt (Model: 5.11 #_7_135?1 Size: XS - 3XL, 2,200 Each $56.25 No Bid $61.22
Regular or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
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