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0005 LIFTERS LIFTING TAPE, TRANSPARENT 4" x 360", Sirchie 10 Roll $8.95 $10.17 $11.62
144L4 or equal
H - VAL "
0006 LI.FTE.RS LIFTING TAPE, TRANSPARENT Diff Lift: 1 2" x 60", 10 Roll $13.28 $14.28 $15.50
Sirchie 144LRJ or equal
0009 LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS White, 5" x 7", 5 per pack, Lynn 25 Pack  $22.00 NO Bid $29.42
Peavey No. 05911 or equal
LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS White, 10" x 5", 5 per pack, Sirchie $15.20 $17.34
0010 GLT401W or equal 25 Pack [$13.95
LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS Transparent, 5" x 7", 5 per pack, Lynn INO Bid $30.27
8011 IPeavey No. 05912 or equal = REER P
0012 LIFTERS GEL LIFTERS Transparent, 14" x 5", 5 per pack, 25 Pack [$9.95 NO Bid $12.52
Lynn Peavey No. 05914 or equal
- - " No. . =¥
0023 SUPPLIES GooPrint Fingerprint Powder Lynn Peavey No 2 Each |$15.69 $17.69 No Bid
30033 or equal
SUPPLIES Hard-Core Blue Casting Material (8Ibs)(Sirchie $29.30 $34.56
0026 lHcB3001) or equal 5 Each [$15.00
0029 SUPPLIES Gunshot Residue Kit (AA) Analysis Lynn Peavey 50 Kits $9.50 $14.45 $16.01
No. 05779 or equal
0030 IBACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE White, 4" x 5", Lynn 2 Package [No Bid No Bid $10.08
Peavey No. 05842 or equal
0031 IBACK!NG CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE Black, 4" x 5", Lynn 2 Package [No Bid INo Bid $10.87
Peavey No. 05844 or equal
H EVAD [T o _
0032 IBACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE White, 8 2" x 11", Lynn 2 Package [No Bid INo Bid No Bid
Peavey No. 05582 or equal
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BACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE Black ,7 2" x 16", . No Bid No Bid
0033 Lynn Peavey No. 06673 or equal 2 Package No Bid
BACKING CARDS 100 PER PACKAGE Record Cards, lifted $40.47 $45.91
0034 |print backing, sketch, gloss white back, 3" x 5", 500 per pack, 50 Package [[$24.50
Sirchie No. LPW1005 or equal
SUPPLIES Disposable Rounded Blade Scalpel (#10 $16.79 $21.53
0037 11 |ade)(Sirchie KCP13810) or equal g Each  [$9.50
MAGNETIC POWDER AND WANDS Wand, Bubble Base $15.45 $22.16
0055 Applicator Lynn Peavey No. 05554 or equal e Eaeh [S7.00
TESTING SUPPLIES Cotton Swabs, Sterile, 2 per package, 100 $12.19 $13.10
0042 packages per box, Lynn Peavey No. 02037 or equal S0 Pagkege 138,50
TESTING SUPPLIES Swab Boxes, 50 per package or equal $20.03 $31.23
0073 | ynn Peavey No. 01313 or equal 50 Package $23.00
TESTING SUPPLIES Gel Lifters: 3", white, 12 per box. Sirchie $14.21 $16.39
0081 128LW or equal 250 o pieag
i Py k . Sirchi . 2
0082 TESTING SUPPLIES Gel Lifters: %", black, 12 per box. Sirchie 250 Box $12.50 $14.21 $16.39
128LB or equal
REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT Mixing Tips: 40 per $14.86 $45.91
0092 § . ck. Sirchie PVS200N or equal 3 Pack w598
REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT “PURITAN” or equal $14.89 $15.75
0094 [Sterile Cotton Tipped Applicators 3” 2 per package 100 1 Box $15.00
pkgs/box or equal Sirchie KCP208C or equal
0097 REPLACEMENT SUPPLIES FOR SIL KIT 6” swab cartons 100 1 Pack $8.50 $1,219.00 $13.10
per package or equal Lynn Peavey No. 02037 or equal acrage )
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