SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

Commodity: Date:
A22-0310 07/11/22 2
PIPES & CULVERTS (REINFORCED CONCRETE) E‘-'g
Category; FITG No: (.?
21028 22-0310 =
CULVERTS, CONCRETE, CORRUGATED METAL, ETC. é-_"_é’
Bid Opening or 7]
Agency: Closing Date: g
DPW WAREHOUSE 07/25/22 8
Sealed Bid _X Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities c? i
ltem UNIT OF UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE PRICE | TOTAL PRICE | TOTAL
o ———e
ASTM C-76 CLASS lll Concrete Pipe with AASHTO M-198, TYPE A, “O” Ring Rubber Gaskets
(RCP — Reinforced Concrete Pipe) Or Approved Equal
0001 |SN# 6583430295 — 12” RCP 200 FOOT NO BID NO BID $21.000
0002 |SN# 6583432304 — 15” RCP 64 FOOT NO BID BLANK $21.000
0003 |SN# 6583434306 — 18” RCP 72 FOOT NO BID BLANK $28.800
0004 |SN# 6583436309 — 24” RCP 144 FOOT NO BID BLANK $44.100
0005 |SN#6583440313 — 30” RCP 16 FOOT NO BID BLANK $63.600
0006 |SN# 6583441313 — 36” RCP 16 FOOT NO BID BLANK $82.500
0007 |SN# 6583441314 — 42" RCP 16 FOOT NO BID BLANK $102.900
0008 |SN# 6583441316 — 60” RCP 16 FOOT NO BID BLANK $194.400
AASHTO M-36, 20 ft. Lengths of Corrugated Polymer Coated (AASHTO M-245, Grade 10/10) Galvanized Steel
Pipe, with Bands, Nuts and Bolts for Louisiana DOTD Type 3 Joint
(PCCSP — Polymer Coated Corrugated Steel Pipe) Or Approved Equal
16 Gauge, 2-2/3” x12” Corrugation

0009 |SN# 6581873302 — 12” PCCSP 20 FOOT $27.610 $25.840 NO BID
0010 |SN# 6581873304 — 15” PCCSP 20 FOOT $33.130 $31.550 NO BID
0011 |SN# 6581873306 — 18” PCCSP 20 FOOT $41.420 $38.740 NO BID
0012 |SN# 6581873309 — 24” PCCSP 20 FOOT $52.470 $48.410 NO BID

14 Gauge, 2-2/13" x1/2” Corrugation
0013 |SN# 6581873311 — 30” PCCSP 20 FOOT $82.850 $76.450 NO BID
0014 |SN# 6581873313 — 36” PCCSP 20 FOOT $99.410 $92.680 NO BID




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

Commodity: Date:
A22-0310 07/11/22 3 &
PIPES & CULVERTS (REINFORCED CONCRETE) § &
Category: File No: (? 0?
21028 22-0310 & 5
CULVERTS, CONCRETE, CORRUGATED METAL, ETC. ;&g’ __:‘i-‘ _5'""
Bid Opening or 7] S
Agency: Closing Date: g K
DPW WAREHOUSE 07/25/22 8 o
Sealed Bid _X Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities 8 c?
ltem UNIT OF UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY| MEASURE PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL TOTAL
AASHTO M-36, 20 ft. Lengths of Corrugated Polymer Coated (AASHTO M-245, Grade 10/10) Galvanized Steel
Pipe, with Bands, Nuts and Bolts for Louisiana DOTD Type 3 Joint
(PCCSP — Polymer Coated Corrugated Steel Pipe) Or Approved Equal
12 Gauge, 3” x 1” Corrugation
0015 |SN# 6581873314 — 42” PCCSP 20 FOOT $173.140 $162.550 NO BID
0016 |SN# 6581873315 — 60” PCCSP 20 FOOT $292.160 $279.220 NO BID
0017 |SN# 6581873317 — 72” PCCSP 20 FOOT $364.530 $337.460 NO BID
AASHTO M-36. 20 ft. Lengths of Corrugated Asphalt Coated (AASHTO M-190,Type A) Galvanized Steel Pipe,
with Bands, Nuts and Bolts for Louisiana DOTD Type 3 Joint
( ACCSP — Asphalt Coated Corrugated Steel Pipe) Or Approved Equal
16 Gauge, 2-2/3” x 12" Corrugation
0018 |SN# 6581856295 — 12” ACCSP 800 FOOT $24.840 $23.450 NO BID
0019 |SN# 6581858304 — 15” ACCSP 800 FOOT $30.910 $28.550 NO BID
0020 |SN# 6581860306 — 18” ACCSP 800 FOOT $39.090 $36.030 NO BID
14 Gauge, 2-213" x1/2” Corrug_;ation
0021 |SN# 6581862309 — 24” ACCSP 700 FOOT $59.980 $55.140 NO BID
0022 |SN# 6581864312 — 30” ACCSP 300 FOOT $75.440 $71.110 NO BID
12 Gauge, 2 — 2/3” x 1/2” Corrugation
0023 |SN# 6581866313 — 36” ACCSP 200 FOOT $116.590 $112.640 NO BID
0024 |SN# 6581868314 — 42” ACCSP 140 FOOT $147.440 $142.130 NO BID
0025 |SN# 6581870315 — 48” ACCSP 40 FOOT $169.740 $154.770 NO BID
12 Gaug_;e, 3R Corrugation
0026 |SN# 6581868320 — 54” ACCSP 20 FOOT $218.880 $202.330 NO BID
0027 |SN# 6581869360 — 60” ACCSP 20 FOOT $251.090 $228.480 NO BID




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
A22-0310 07/11/22 2 S
PIPES & CULVERTS (REINFORCED CONCRETE) g &
Category: File No: (.? fg
21028 22-0310 S b
CULVERTS, CONCRETE, CORRUGATED METAL, ETC. ::?'__é’ _g’ __155"
Bid Opening or %) S
Agency: Closing Date: g 3
DPW WAREHOUSE 07/25/22 3 2
Sealed Bid _X Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities c? (.?
Item UNIT OF UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY| MEASURE PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
AASHTO M-36, 20ft Lengths of Corrugated Asphalt Coated (AASHTO M-190, Type A) Galvanized Steel Pipe
Arch, with Bands, Nuts and Bolts for Louisiana DOTD Type 3 Joint
(ACCSPA — Asphalt Coated Corrugated Steel Pipe Arched) Or Approved Equal
14 Gauge, 2 — 2/3” x 1/2” Corrugation
0028 |SN# 6581875028 — 28" x 20" ACCSPA 20 FOOT $66.070 $60.880 NO BID
0029 |SN# 6581875035 — 35” x 24” ACCSPA 40 FOOT $83.070 $77.150 NO BID
12 Gauge, 3R Corrugation
0030 |SN# 6581875042 — 42” x 29” ACCSPA 20 FOOT $129.040 $123.450 NO BID
0031 |SN# 6581875046 — 46” x 36” ACCSPA 20 FOOT $163.360 $154.110 NO BID
0032 |SN# 6581875053 — 53” x 41” ACCSPA 20 FOOT $187.920 $172.580 NO BID
0033 |SN# 6581875060 — 60” x 46” ACCSPA 20 FOOT $242.090 $223.110 NO BID
10 Gauge, 3” x 1” Corrugation
0034 |SN# 6581875065 — 60” x 51” ACCSPA 20 | FOOT $348.890 $332.140 NO BID
16 Gauge, 2 2/3” x 12” Corrugation NO BID
0035 |SN# 6581875017 — 17” x 13" ACCSPA 20 FOOT $33.950 $32.030 NO BID
0036 |SN# 6581875021 — 21” x 15” ACCSPA 20 FOOT $42.910 $40.000 NO BID




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

Commodity: Date:
A22-0310 07M1/22 2 b
PIPES & CULVERTS (REINFORCED CONCRETE) éz" & 2.
Category: File No: C? fg lfrs‘l ‘
21028 22-0310 e : g AT
CULVERTS, CONCRETE, CORRUGATED METAL, ETC. §s g N /17
Bid Opening or ] S n‘.? fa
Agency: Closing Date: g 3 g N
DPW WAREHOUSE 07/25/22 3 ] '5,3’
Sealed Bid _X Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities S S Cg,
Item UNIT OF UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY| MEASURE PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
ASTM F-794, Series 46, Ribbed PVC Plastic Pipe (Min. Cell Class 12454C); or ASTM F-949 Profile Wall PVC
Plastic Pipe ( Min. Cell Class 12454C); with Rubber Gaskets
( PVCP — Polyvinyl Chloride Pipe)
0037 |SN# 6586070295 — 12” PVCP 900 FOOT $9.600 $9.000 NO BID
0038 |SN# 6586070313 — 36” PVCP 39 FOOT $79.090 $70.000 NO BID
0039 |SN# 6586070303 — 15” PVCP 1,400 FOOT $15.250 $14.330 NO BID
0040 |SN# 6586070306 — 18” PVCP 700 FOOT $21.640 $20.000 NO BID
0041 |SN# 6586070309 — 24” PVCP 507 FOOT $38.750 $36.030 NO BID
0042 |SN# 6586070312 — 30” PVCP 39 FOOT $55.530 $51.220 NO BID

Total Amount

Cash Discount

Net Amount

Delivery

Total Amount

AWARD

NOTES:




