Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

A22-1124 MOSQUITO CONTROL INSECTICIDES

Date:

Commodity:

9/7/2022

167540, 67545

Requisition No: |

Category: |

N/A

Insecticides, Chemicals

IBid Opening:

9/7/2022

Agency. MARC

or

Mosquito Abaitment

Closing Date

91712022

ADDENDUM

Delivery Requirements:

Purchase Period:]

YES

Sealed Bid Price Inquiry __ Definite Quantities
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Item
No.

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

QUANTITY

UNIT OF MEASURE

Unit Price

Per Year Cost

Unit Price

Per Year Cost

Unit Price

Per Year Cost

Unit Price

Per Year Cost

Unit Price

Per Year Cost

Unit Price

Per Year Cost

0001

Naled, Liquid Insecticide

Per bid specifications reguirements

DIBRCM CONCENTRATE or approved equal.
Minimum order 4 each 30 gal drums

Specify

Product Bid

60

Gallon

No Bid

268.14/GL

No Bid

No Bid

0002

Methoprene Granules, Larvicide
IALTOSID P35 or approved equal.
Per bid specification requirements.
Specify Product Bid

320

Pound

18.72/LB

18.72

0003

BTI Liquid Larvicide

Per bid specification requirements
AQUABAC XT or

VECTOBAC 12AS or approved equal.
ISpecify Product Bid

300

Gallon

42.00

]

35.74/GL
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No Bid

0004

BTI Granules Larvicide

Per bid specification requirements
AQUABAC 200G or

VECTOBAC G or approved equal.
Specify

Product Bid

1,600

Pound

2.00

1.78/LB

$1.65

No Bid

0005

Larvicidal Qil, Reduced Petroleum Distillale

Clarke COCOBEAR or approved equal. Max. of 10%
mineral cil. Per bid specification requirements Specify
Product Bid

165

Gallon

No Bid

No Bid

25.57

0006

Spinosad Tablet Larvicide

Clarke NATULAR XRT or approved equal,
Per bid specification requirements
Specify Product Bid

1,100

Tablet

No Bid

No Bid

4.18

equa
0007 3

SummiPralfethrianBO Insecticide Mix
Clarke DUET DUAL ACTION ADULTICIDE or approved

Per bid specification requirements

Specify
Product Bid

550

Gallon

No Bid

No BID

159.53
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0008

=T - —
Sumithrin/Prallethrin/PBO
Aerial Insecticide Mix
Liquid DUET HD MOSQUITO ADULTICIDING
INSECTICIDE or approved equal.
Per bid specification requirements
Specify
Product Bid

1,100 Gallon

No Bid

No BID

195.51

0009

Methoprene Pellets

ALTOSID PELLETS or approved equal. Per bid
specification requirements.

Specify Product Bid

500 Pound

26.57/LB

|

-28.80/LB iy

26.57

0010

Permethrin/PBO Insecticide Mix PERMANONE 31-66,
BIOMIST 31+66, KONTROL 31-67 or Approved Equal
Per bid specification requirements

Specify Product Bid

300 Gallon

145.63

190.00/GL

$110.00

150.50

0011

Deltamethrin Aerial Adulticide Imperium Mosquito
Adulticiding Insecticide or Approved Equal

Per bid specification requirements

Specify

Product Bid

300 Gallon

No Bid

$224.00

No Bid

Vendors

NET AMOUNT

Advertise (X) Bid Bond ( ) Ins (X) Informal { )

CASH DISCOUNT|

ISpecial Conditions : DELIVERY

TOTAL AMOUNT

Buyer :

MWhite Date 09/07/2022

DELIVERY




