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27" THERMAL ROLL LAMINATOR
0001 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #33397 or Approved Equal per 8 EACH $3,198.71 NO BID $2,429.95
Specifications)
LAMINATING FILM 3 MIL
0002 J(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #37661 or Approved Equal per 32 EACH no bid NO BID $130.86
Specifications)
LAMINATOR TABLE
0003 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #90639 or Approved Equal per 8 EACH no bid NO BID $288.96
Specifications)
ELLISON PRESTIGO PRO MACHINE FOR DIE CUTS
0004 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #11701 or Approved Equal per 7 EACH no bid NO BID $454.99
Specifications)
4" BLOCK ALPHABET CAPITAL LETTERS - SET OF 26
0005 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #13213 or Approved Equal per 7 SET no bid NO BID $390.99
Specifications)
4" BLOCK ALPHABET LOWERCASE LETTERS - SET OF 26
0006 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #13214 or Approved Equal per 7 SET no bid NO BID $390.99
Specifications)
SURECUT DIE 30 - SLOT STORAGE RACK
0007 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #15878 or Approved Equal per 7 EACH no bid NO BID $49.29
Specifications)
STEM CONCEPTS POSTER SET-SET OF 12
0008 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #89773 or Approved Equal per 68 SET no bid $30.68 $16.96
Specifications)
WHITE SENTENCE STRIPS-100 PACK
0009 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #86078 or Approved Equal per 136 PACK $5.18 $6.50 $5.91
Specifications)
COLOR SENTENCE STRIPS-100 PACK
0010 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #80258 or Approved Equal per 68 PACK $8.49 $7.43 $6.76
Specifications)
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PEOPLE SHAPED CRAFT STICKS 36 PACK
0011 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #30285 or Approved Equal per 68 PACK no bid $15.80 $10.16
Specifications)
HEALTHY HABITS POSTERS-SET OF 12
0012 |(Model: KAPLAN ITEM #90521 or Approved Equal per 68 SET no bid $30.68 $16.96
Specifications)
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