SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing \
34016 & Monitoring of Fire OR [ —
Alarm & Smoke IGINAL
Detectors 8 \ 1]
Agency: Bid Opening or & & —— =
gency: Closing Date: = - >
- ) ) I3 k7]
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 £ £ ' 3
Q [] -l
F.0.B: k] w e, =
' [ @ ) 3 g
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: 5 - 2 g
I 2 Q2 o
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry __ Definite Quantities ___ = = = 5
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price [Amount| Unit Price | Amount
001A $3,200.00 No bid $11,604.00
001B No bid No bid




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS
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$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
0010 [ e i e e S e o o=y S NGt $29.00 No bid $90.00
Annual testing and cleaning of Silent
Knight model SK-2224 multiple Fire
002A |Alarm system located at Jewel J. 1 Yearly | $9,200.00 No bid $912.00
Newman Community Center, 2013
Central Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Silent Knight model SK-2224 multiple
002B (Fire Alarm system located at Jewel J. 12 Monthly No Bid No bid $364.00
Newman Community Center, 2013
Central Road, Baton Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
Detectors 8 S
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$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Silent Knight
model SK-2224 multiple Fire Alarm
002C |system located at Jewel J. Newman 12 Monthly | $29.00 No bid $90.00
Community Center, 2013 Central Road,
Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Silent
Knight Model IFP-1000 Fire Alarm
003A [system located at Zachary Branch 1 Yearly $318.00 No bid $2,676.00
Library, 1900 Church Street, Hwy 64,
Zachary, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Silent Knight Model IFP-1000 Fire
003B |Alarm system located at Zachary 12 Monthly $75.00 No bid $372.00
Branch Library, 1900 Church Street,
Hwy 64, Zachary, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price{ Amount
Monthly monitoring of Silent Knight
Model IFP-1000 Fire Alarm system
003C |located at Zachary Branch Library, 12 Monthly | $29.00 No bid $90.00
1900 Church Street, Hwy 64, Zachary, -
La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Silent
Knight Model 5204 multiple Fire Alarm
004A |System located at Juvenile Services, 1 Yearly $440.00 No bid $1,080.00
8333 Veterans Memorial Blvd., Baton
Rouge, La
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Silent Knight Model 5204 multiple Fire
004B |Alarm Systems located at Juvenile 12 Monthly | $200.00 No bid $368.00
Services, 8333 Veterans Memorial
Blvd., Baton Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS ' NAMES OF VENDORS.
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11109122
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Silent Knight
Model 5204 multiple Fire Alarm
004C |Systems located at Juvenile Services, 12 Monthly | $29.00 No bid $90.00
8333 Veterans Memorial Blvd., Baton
Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of S3 Series
Honeywell Fire Alarm system located at
005A |Greenwell Springs Library, 11300 1 Yearly $325.00 No bid $3,936.00
Greenwell Springs Road, Baton Rouge,
La
Monthly maintenance and testing of S3
Series Honeywell Fire Alarm system
005B |located at Greenwell Springs Library, 12 Monthly | $100.00 No bid $416.00
11300 Greenwell Springs Road, Baton
Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of S3 Series
Honeywell Fire Alarm system located at
005C |Greenwell Springs Library, 11300 12 Monthly $29.00 No bid $90.00
Greenwell Springs Road, Baton Rouge,
La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Edwards
model EST2, FB I, model XL4,
006A |multiple Fire Alarm system located at 1 Yearly | $1,260.00 No bid $3,276.00
Baker Library, 3501 Groom Road,
Baker, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Edwards model EST2, FB 11, model
006B | XL4, multiple Fire Alarm system 12 Monthly | $400.00 No bid $408.00
located at Baker Library, 3501 Groom
Road, Baker, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/109/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Edwards model
EST2, FB II, model XL4, multiple Fire .
’ i i 29.00 No bid 90.00
006C Alarm system located at Baker Library, 12 Monthly s on $
3501 Groom Road, Baker, La.
Annual Testing and cleaning of
Edwards Model EST2 multiple Fire
007A |Alarm system located at Pride- 1 Yearly $750.00 No bid $936.00
Chaneyville Branch Library, 11360
Pride Port Hudson Road, Pride, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Edwards Model EST2 multiple Fire
007B |Alarm system located at Pride- 12 Monthly | $425.00 No bid $374.00
Chaneyville Branch Library, 11360
Pride Port Hudson Road, Pride, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Edwards Model
EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system
007C |located at Pride-Chaneyville Branch 12 Monthly | $29.00 No bid $90.00
Library, 11360 Pride Port Hudson
Road, Pride, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Edwards
model EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system .
008A located at Scotlandville Library, 7373 ! Yearly | $660.00 No bid $3:432.00
Scenic Highway, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Edwards model EST2 multiple Fire
008B |Alarm system located at Scotlandville 12 Monthly | $350.00 No bid $387.00
Library, 7373 Scenic Highway, Baton
Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Edwards model
EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system .
008C located at Scotlandville Library, 7373 12 Monthly $29.00 No bid $90.00
Scenic Highway, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning Siemens
Fire Finder XLS System Fire Alarm
400.00 No bi X
009A system located at River Center Library ! Yearly ¥ o bid $2486.00
at, 250 North Blvd, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing
Siemens Fire Finder XLS System Fire
009B |Alarm system located at River Center 12 Monthly | $150.00 No bid $456.00
Library at, 250 North Blvd, Baton
Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11109122
Controls
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Siemens Fire
Finder XLS System Fire Alarm system !
009C located at River Center Library at, 250 12 Monthly $29.00 No bid $90.00
North Blvd, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Edwards
System Tech., Model LSS1 multiple
010A |Fire Alarm system located at Women’s 1 Yearly $720.00 $912.00
Correctional and Rehab Center, 855 St.
Ferdinand Street, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Edwards System Tech., Model LSS1
multiple Fire Alarm system located at .
320. K
010B Women’s Correctional and Rehab 12 Monthly | $320.00 No bid $339.00
Center, 855 St. Ferdinand Street, Baton
Rouge, La.
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Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Edwards System
Tech., Model LSS1 multiple Fire Alarm
010C [system located at Women’s Correctional 12 Monthly $29.00 No bid $90.00
and Rehab Center, 855 St. Ferdinand
Street, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Edwards
model EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system .
011A located at ATM-EOC Building, 3773 1 Yearly $425.00 No bid $1,584.00
Harding Blvd., Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Edwards model EST2 multiple Fire
011B |Alarm system located at ATM-EOC 12 Monthly | $320.00 No bid $424.00
Building, 3773 Harding Blvd., Baton
Rouge, La.
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Commodity: Date:
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Edwards model
EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system .
011C located at ATM-EOC Building, 3773 12 Monthly | $29.00 No bid $90.00
Harding Blvd., Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Fire
Alarms and Smoke Detectors for the
following locations: Parking Garage,
,440. . ,210.
012A Mechanical Building, Various 1 Yearly $1,440.00 $850.00 $1,210.00
Locations, 222 St. Louis Street, Baton
Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Fire
Alarms and Smoke Detectors for the
following locations: Parking Garage,
012B Mechanical Building, Various 12 Monthly $380.00 $300.00 $384.00
Locations, 222 St. Louis Street, Baton
Rouge, La.
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price [ Amount
Monthly monitoring of Fire Alarms and
Smoke Detectors for the following
012C |locations: Parking Garage, Mechanical 12 Monthly $29.00 $50.00
Building, Various Locations, 222 St.
Louis Street, Baton Rouge, La.
013A $600.00 No Bid $636.00
0138 [ No Bid No bid
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Controls
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A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
Detectors N g
. Bid Opening or S S £
Agency: Closing Date: £ = é
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 2 2 9 E
(] [7] | °
F.O.B: ° ? o £
: . — ) o i g
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: e i 3- qE,
! 2 2 0
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ____ = 2 i %
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of
Honeywell 7100 System located at .
014A DHH/ OCP Building 8453 Veteran’s 1 Yearly No Bid $400.00 $1,080.00
Memorial Blvd., Baton Rouge, La
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Honeywell 7100 System located at ]
014B DHH/ OCP Building 8453 Veteran’s 12 Monthly No Bid $200.00 $376.00
Memorial Blvd., Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Honeywell 7100
System located at DHH/ OCP Building .
o14C 8453 Veteran’s Memorial Blvd., Baton 12 Monthly | No Bid $50.00 $90.00
Rouge, La.
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Controls
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of
Honeywell S3 System located at Baton
015A |Rouge Metro Airport Multiplex 1 Yearly No Bid $600.00 $3,132.00
Building, 4400 Airpark Blvd, Baton
Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Honeywell S3 System located at Baton
015B [Rouge Metro Airport Multiplex 12 Monthly | No Bid $200.00 $173.00
Building, 4400 Airpark Blvd, Baton
Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Honeywell S3
System located at Baton Rouge Metro
015C No Bid 50. .
Airport Multiplex Building, 4400 12| Monthly | No $50.00 $90.00
Airpark Blvd, Baton Rouge, La.
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Simplex
model NFGPA 72 Remote Station Fire
016A |Alarm system located at Eden Park 1 Yearly $800.00 No Bid $2,664.00
Branch Library, 5131 Greenwell
Springs Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Simplex model NFGPA 72 Remote
Station Fire Alarm system located at
016B 500.00 No B .
Eden Park Branch Library, 5131 12 Monthly | $ o Bid $368.00
Greenwell Springs Road, Baton Rouge,
La.
Monthly monitoring of Simplex model
NFGPA 72 Remote Station Fire Alarm
016C |system located at Eden Park Branch 12 Monthly | $29.00 No Bid $90.00
Library, 5131 Greenwell Springs Road,
Baton Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
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Controls
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Notifier
NFS-640 Fire Alarm system located at .
017A Delmont Gardens Branch Library, 3351 1 Yearly $300.00 No Bid $3,432.00
Lorraine Street, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Notifier NFS-640 Fire Alarm system
017B |located at Delmont Gardens Branch 12 Monthly | $150.00 No Bid $389.00
Library, 3351 Lorraine Street, Baton
Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Notifier NFS-
640 Fire Alarm system located at -
1 29.00 No B .
or7e Delmont Gardens Branch Library, 3351 12 Monthly $ o Bid $90.00
Lorraine Street, Baton Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
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Controls
Category: Requisition No:
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Notifier
NFS-320 with Fire Voice 25/50 Fire
018A |Alarm system located at Bluebonnet 1 Yearly | $1,400.00 No Bid $3,432.00
Library, 9200 Bluebonnet Blvd., Baton
Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Notifier NFS-320 with Fire Voice 25/50
018B |Fire Alarm system located at 12 Monthly | $500.00 No Bid $384.00
Bluebonnet Library, 9200 Bluebonnet
Blvd., Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Notifier NFS-
320 with Fire Voice 25/50 Fire Alarm
018C |system located at Bluebonnet Library, 12 Monthly | $29.00 No Bid $90.00
9200 Bluebonnet Blvd., Baton Rouge,
La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Notifier
NFW 2-100 with Fire Voice 25/50Fire
019A |Alarm system located at Central Branch 1 Yearly $200.00 No Bid $2,652.00
Library, 11260 Joor Road, Baton
Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Notifier NFW 2-100 with Fire Voice
019B |25/50Fire Alarm system located at 12 Monthly | $250.00 No Bid $384.00
Central Branch Library, 11260 Joor
Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Notifier NFW 2-
100 with Fire Voice 25/50Fire Alarm
019C |system located at Central Branch 12 Monthly | $29.00 No Bid $90.00
Library, 11260 Joor Road, Baton
Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
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Agency: Closing Date: £ £ g
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 £ £ 9 )
[7] Q = T
F.0.B: ® ? o £
I . . — ) @ 2 2
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of NFS-320
Honeywell Fire Alarm system located at
200. .
020A Jones Creek Library, 6222 Jones Creek 1 Yearly $200.00 No Bid $2,412.00
Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
NFS-320 Honeywell Fire Voice
020B |25/50Fire Alarm system located at 12 Monthly | $250.00 No Bid $595.00
Jones Creek Library, 6222 Jones Creek
Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of NFS-320
Honeywell Fire Alarm system located at .
29. B .
020C Jones Creek Library, 6222 Jones Creek 12 Monthly | $29.00 No Bid $90.00
Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of system at
021A |Old Baton Rouge Jr. High Notifier 1 Yearly $600.00 No Bid $1,080.00
Model No. NFW2-100




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
Detectors o S
. Bid Opening or S S £
Agency: Closing Date: £ £ g‘-
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 £ £ 9 g
Q [ = T
F.0.B: ® ® o £
[ ) ) 3 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: e o 3- g
2 2 o
Sealed Bid __  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ___ s 2 e -:,2,
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly maintenance and testing of
021B |system at Old Baton Rouge Jr. High 12 Monthly | $250.00 No Bid $369.00
Notifier Model No. NFW2-100
Monitoring of system at Old Baton
021C |Rouge Jr. High Notifier Model No. 12 Monthly | $29.00 No Bid $90.00
NFW2-100
Annual testing and cleaning of Microm
model FX2017A Fire Alarm system
22A ,400. i ,508.
0 located at Carver Branch Library, 720 ! Yearly | $1,400.00 No Bid $2,608.00
Terrace Street, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Microm model FX2017A Fire Alarm
022B (system located at Carver Branch 12 Monthly | $200.00 No Bid $339.00
Library, 720 Terrace Street, Baton
Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
= cIjDetectors Q 8
. id Opening or S S =
Agency: Closing Date: £ £ é
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 g g 9 g
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: e o g_ é
2 2 o
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ___ =< b & %
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Microm model
FX2017A Fire Alarm system located at
22C 29. N .
0 Carver Branch Library, 720 Terrace 12 Monthly | $29.00 © Bid $90.00
Street, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Face
Shield multiple Fire Alarm System
023A |located at Juvenile Court and Detention, 1 Yearly $400.00 No Bid $3,732.00
8333 Veterans Memorial Blvd., Baton
Rouge, La
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Face Shield multiple Fire Alarm System
023B |located at Juvenile Court and Detention, 12 Monthly | $200.00 No Bid $385.00
8333 Veterans Memorial Blvd., Baton
Rouge, La




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date: -
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11109122
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
B.:gtectfars Q g
. id Opening or S S =
Agency: Closing Date: £ £ Z
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 g 2 S _%
] |
F.0.B: ® 1 o £
. — ) & 8 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: e e g_ g
1 2 2 o
Sealed Bid __  Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ___ P s P %
; $ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF :
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Face Shield
multiple Fire Alarm System located at
023C |Juvenile Court and Detention, 8333 12 Monthly $29.00 No Bid $90.00
Veterans Memorial Blvd., Baton ,
Rouge, La
Annual testing and cleaning Johnson
Controls Fire Alarm Fire Alarm system
024A |located at Main Library at 1 Yearly | $8,000.00 No Bid $5,712.00
Independence Park, 7711 Goodwood,
Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing
Johnson Controls Fire Alarm Fire
024B |Alarm system located at Main Library at 12 Monthly | No bid No Bid $367.00
Independence Park, 7711 Goodwood,
RBaton Ronee 12




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
- A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
B.cl’)gtectgrs ) 8
. id Opening or 3 3 =
Agency: Closing Date: £ £ é
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 £ g 9Q g
[} [ | ko]
F.0.B: » ® o =
' . - L ) @ 2 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: o it 2 g
1 2 2 o
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ____ =z b e ﬁ
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Johnson
Controls Fire Alarm Fire Alarm system
024C [located at Main Library at 12 Monthly | $29.00 No Bid $90.00
Independence Park, 7711 Goodwood,
Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning Firelite Fire
Alarm Fire Alarm system located at .
025A Fairwood Branch Library, 12910 Old 1 Yearly $300.00 No Bid $2,976.00
Hammond Hwy Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing
Firelite Fire Alarm Fire Alarm system
025B |located at Fairwood Branch Library, 12 Monthly | $150.00 No Bid $395.00
12910 Old Hammond Hwy Baton
Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring Firelite Fire Alarm
Fire Alarm system located at Fairwood
2 29.00 No Bid R
025¢ Branch Library, 12910 Old Hammond 12 Monthly $ ° $90.00
Hwy Baton Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11109122
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
B.:gtectprs o g
. id Opening or S 3 £
Agency: Closing Date: = = g
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 2 2 9 é’
F.O.B; ] % pr £
— ! @ @ [ 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: e i 2 é
2 2 o
Sealed Bid __  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ___ =< < e %
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Bosch/
Radionic Model D-8112 fire alarm
026A |system at East Baton Rouge Inspection 1 Yearly $650.00 No Bid $912.00
Division 300 North 10th Street, Baton
Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Bosch/Radionic Model D-8112 fire
026B |alarm system at East Baton Rouge 12 Monthly | $150.00 No Bid $358.00
Inspection Division. 300 North 10th
Street, Baton Rouge, La
Monthly monitoring of Bosch/Radionic
Model D-8112 fire alarm system at East
2 . i .
026¢ Baton Rouge Inspection Division 300 12 Monthly | $29.00 No Bid $90.00
North 10th Street, Baton Rouge, La
Annual testing and cleaning of
Bosch/Radionic Model D-7212 fire
027A |alarm system at Outreach/Recycled 1 Yearly $650.00 No Bid $912.00
Reads Building 3434 North Blvd, Baton
Rouge, La




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
Detectors Q S
. Bid Opening or P & £
Rengy: Closing Date: = £ E'-
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 g £ 9 4
g g = 2
F.O.B: 7 7 - -
: ' a & g 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: e i 3 qE,
L Q2 2 )
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ___ b4 = i %
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price [ Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Bosch/Radionic Model D-7212 fire
027B |alarm system at Outreach/Recycled 12 Monthly | $150.00 No Bid $517.00
Reads Building 3434 North Blvd, Baton
Rouge, La
Monthly monitoring of Bosch/Radionic
Model D-7212 fire alarm system at .
027C o iC 29.00 No Bid 90.00
Outreach/Recycled Reads Building = Montbly $ o 1
3434 North Blvd, Baton Rouge, La
028A $1,560.00 No Bid $8,940.00




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
Deotectors q 8
. Bid Opening or S S =
Agency: Closing Date: = £ é«
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 2 £ 9 g
3 ko) O S
F.O.B: 17 7] o =
' ' @ @ 8 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: =] o
i ki ki g E
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ____ = = = %
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount Unit Price [ Amount| Unit Price | Amount
028B No Bid No Bid
029A $150.00 No Bid $816.00
029B No Bid No Bid
Annual testing and cleaning of
030A [Firequest 200 System at 9141 J. D. Hair 1 Yearly No Bid $1,300.00 $708.00
Sr. Avenue, Baton Rouge, La




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
Detectors ) 8
. Bid Opening or S a8 =
Agency: Closing Date: = = é
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 2 g 9 _§
o] o a
F.0.B: ® ® o =
[ . — @ 7y 3 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: 5 - 2 g
I 2 2 @
Sealed Bid __  Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ____ b = T %
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly maintenance and testing of
030B |[Firequest 200 System at 9141 J. D. Hair 12 Monthly No Bid $600.00 $361.00
Sr. Avenue, Baton Rouge, La
031A $100.00 No Bid $792.00
031B No Bid No Bid
032A $100.00 No Bid $1,428.00




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
Detectors Q ';;’
. Bid Opening or S S =
Fgeaney: Closing Date: £ = >
S ) @ 3 1]
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 £ £ b 3
[ [] -l
F.0.B: 1 ® o <
' ' @ ) 2 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: - e 3 g
1 2 2 )
Sealed Bid __  Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ___ 3 = = %
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
,,,,,,,,, No Bid No Bid
$29.00 $29.00 No Bid $90.00
Hourly labor rate/charges for repairs not
covered by maintenance agreement as
33 |applicable for the various locations During $158.00 $158.00 $125.00 $169.00
normal working hours 8:00a.m.-5:00p.m.
Monday thru Friday




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11109122
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
B.:gtectf)rs ) 2
. id Opening or S S =
Agency: Closing Date: £ £ g
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 g g 9Q g
8 8 - -
F.O.B: 3 o 8 -
1 1
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: 2 g qg’_ é
1 2 2 o
Sealed Bid __  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities =< I e %
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Hourly labor rate/charges for repairs not
covered by maintenance agreement as
34 |applicable for the various locations After 1 Hourly $237 $237.00 $175.00 $253.50
normal working hours or on Saturday (not to
exceed1-1/2 time the normal rate).
Hourly labor rate/charges for repairs not
covered by maintenance agreement as
35 |applicable for the various locations. During 1 Hourly $316.00 $316.00 $175.00 $338.00
Holidays or Sunday (not to exceed 2 times
the normal labor rate).
Original Equipment Manufacturer’s o 0% No o o
36 Standard replacement parts. _ % Bid 20% 20%
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used
for any freight charges for expedited PRI el i
37 delivery of parts: F.O.B. Destination, IR sl fos No Bid
Prepaid and allowed on orders of any stock ok i
OEM Orders will be shipped prepaid and
added to the invoice




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and 11/09/22
Controls
Category: Requisition No:
A22-0811
Maintenance Testing
34016 & Monitoring of Fire
Alarm & Smoke
Detectors Q i1
. Bid Opening or 1] S £
Agency: Closing Date: £ £ é
DPW-Building & Grounds 11/09/22 g £ 9 g
8 s - 2
F.0.B: » 7 o =
' ] o & 8 g
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: i i 2 g
! 2 2 o
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ___ < =z o %
$ 1,050.00
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
TOTAL AWARD
CASH DISCOUNT
NET AMOUNT
DELIVERY
AWARD

NOTES: See Bid Worksheet




