SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS VENDORS VENDORS
Commodity: o
A22-0401 Furnishing and Cleaning ]
of Linens, Floor Mats and Janitorial Supplies és _:
Category: Requisition No: é: é’ §'
98377, 85092, 95470, 95403, and 95405 A22-0401 S » %
Cleaning Services %1 S S
Bid Opening or ~ 3 @ S
. y i ) g O @
Agency: Closing Date: o g o 2
DPW - Building and Grounds 12.12.22 Iy & ,.‘;' 5
Sealed Bid_X___ Price Inquiry____ Definite Quantities 3 S & K
ESTIMATED
WEEKLY UNIT
Item USE OF UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY MEASURE | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
LINENS
Towels, kitchen, white,
0001 |approximate size 17” x 20” 119 EACH $0.06 $0.22 $1.00 NO BID
0002 |Aprons, bib, white, kitchen cook’s 15 EACH $0.16 $0.40 $1.50 NO BID
Towels, bath, 100% cotton
0003 |Approximate size 20” x 44” 140 EACH $0.42 $0.75 $1.75 NO BID
DUST MOP & FRAME SIZE
0004 |24”Weekly 24 EACH $0.36 $1.50 $33.00 NO BID
0005 |24” Bi-Weekly 24 EACH $0.63 $2.25 $33.00 NO BID
0006 |36” Weekly 6 EACH $0.54 $2.00 $42.00 NO BID
0007 |36” Bi - Weekly 6 EACH $0.94 $3.00 $42.00 NO BID
MATS
Black 3’ x 5’ — ——*;;'2{
% al1l'%
0008 |Weekly 44 EACH $1.23 $3.00 $2.00 NO BID (‘) %kﬁm i_
Black 3 x 5" : =
0009 |Bi-Weekly 44 EACH $1.85 $4.50 $2.00 NO BID
Black 3’ x 4’
0010 |Weekly 2 EACH BLANK $3.00 $2.00 NO BID
Black 3’ x 4’
0011 |Bi-Weekly 2 EACH BLANK $4.50 $2.00 NO BID




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS VENDORS VENDORS
Commodity: -
A22-0401 Furnishing and Cleaning ]
of Linens, Floor Mats and Janitorial Supplies é" R
Category: Requisition No: 5 5}’ é_"
98377, 85092, 95470, 95403, and 95405 A22-0401 s & @
Cleaning Services %1 = S
Bid Opening or ~ 3 2 S
. ; ; ) g o 7]
Agency: Closing Date: @ 3 8 _g-
DPW - Building and Grounds 12.12.22 g & g =
Sealed Bid _X Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities S g O <
ESTIMATED
WEEKLY UNIT
Item USE OF UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY MEASURE | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
Black 4’ x 6’
0012 |Weekly 143 EACH $1.98 $4.00 $2.00 NO BID
Black 4’ x 6’
0013 |Bi-Weekly 143 EACH $2.98 $6.00 $2.00 NO BID
Red 3’ x 5’
0014 |Weekly 12 EACH $1.23 $3.00 $2.00 NO BID
Red 3’ x 5’
0015 |Bi-Weekly 12 EACH $1.85 $4.50 $2.00 NO BID
Black 2-1/2’ x 3’
0016 |Weekly 22 EACH BLANK $2.50 $2.00 NO BID
Black 2-1/2’ x 3’
0017 |Bi-Weekly 22 EACH BLANK $3.75 $2.00 NO BID
Black 3’ x 10’
0018 |Weekly 9 EACH $2.48 $5.00 $3.00 NO BID
Black 3’ x 10’
0019 |Bi-Weekly 9 EACH $3.74 $7.50 $3.00 NO BID
Safety Message 3’ x 5’
0020 |Weekly 23 EACH $1.38 $4.50 $2.00 NO BID
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Safety Message 3’ x 5’
0021 |Bi-Weekly 23 EACH $2.41 $6.75 $2.00 NO BID
3x5 Wet Area Anti Fatigue Rubber Comfort Flow
0022 |Mats With Drain Holes 22 EACH | $1.85 $4.50 $2.00 NO BID
Weekly
B3x5 Wet Arena Anti Fatigue Rubber Comfort
Flow Mats With Drain Holes
0023 Bi-Weekly 22 EACH $3.23 $6.75 $2.00 NO BID
MISCELLANEOUS
Shop Towels, Red 18” x 18”
0024 |Weekly 196 EACH $0.06 $0.16 $1.00 NO BID
Shop Towels, Red 18” x 18”
0025 |Bi-Weekly 196 EACH $0.10 $0.24 $1.00 NO BID
Fender Covers
0026 |Weekly 9 EACH $0.55 $2.00 $2.00 $20.52
Fender Covers
0027 |Bi-Weekly 9 EACH $0.96 $3.00 $2.00 $20.52
Industrial Shop Aprons, Blue Denim
0028 |Weekly 6 EACH $0.32 $2.50 $2.25 $4.90
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Industrial Shop Aprons, Blue Denim
0029 |Bi-Weekly 6 EACH $0.56 $3.75 $2.25 $4.90
Foam Soap & Dispensers
0030 [Weekly 6 EACH $10.65 $3.50 $20.00 $22.60
Foam Soap & Dispensers
0031 |Bi-Weekly 6 EACH BLANK $7.00 $20.00 $22.60
Total Amount
Cash Discount
Net Amount
Delivery
Total Amount
AWARD

NOTES: = p——




