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Naled, Liquid Insecticide DIBROM
0001 {CONCENTRATE or approved equal per bid 60 Gallon
specifications N/A NO BID $268.14 NO BID
Methoprene Granules ALTOSID P35 or
0002 japproved equal per bid specifications 320 Pound
$19.47 19.4700 $29.69 $19.47
BTI Liquid Larvicide AQUABAC XT or
0003 |[VECTOBAC 12AS or approved equal per 300 Galion
bid specifications $36.88 NO BID $38.24 NO BID
BTI Granules AQUABAC 200G or
0004 |VECTOBAC G or approved equal per bid 1,600 Pound
specifications $1.72 1.6500 $1.74 NO BID
Larvicidal Oil, Reduced Petroleum Distillate
0005 |Clarke COCOBEAR or approved equal per 165 Gallon
bid specifications N/A NO BID $19.49 $36.70
Spinosad Tablet Larvicide
0006 {Clarke NATULAR XRT or approved equal 1,100 Tablet
per bid specifications $1.62 11715 NO BID $4.48
SumithrianrallethrianBO Insecticide Mix
Clarke DUET DUAL ACTION ADULTICIDE or
0007 fapproved equal per bid specifications 550 Gallon
N/A NO BID NO BID $169.63
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DUAL ACTION AERIAL
SUMITHRIN/PRALLETHRIN/PBO
0008 |INSECTICIDE MIX Liquid DUET HD 1,100 Gallon
MOSQUITO Adulticiding Insecticide or
approved equal per bid specifications $60.00 NO BID NO BID $199.97
Methoprene Pellets
ALTOSID PELLETS or approved equal. per
0009 ;4 specifications 500 | Pound
$27.63 27.6300 blank $27.63
Permethrin/PBO Insecticide Mix
PERMANONE 31-66, BIOMIST 31+66,
00101, ONTROL 31-67 or approved equal per bid | 300 | Gatlon
specifications $118.57 118.0000 $175.00 $107.00
Deltamethrin Aerial Adulticide IMPERIUM
MOSQUITO ADULTICIDING INSECTICIDE or
L approved equal per bid specifications ) Sallon
N/A 249.0000 blank NO BID
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