
Sealed Bid   X   Price Inquiry__  Definite Quantities___ 

Item No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

ESTIMAT4ED

ANNUAL

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

0001
Men’s Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049 – Size: XS – 

3XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
1,300 Each $66.91 $61.99 $47.00 $48.60 $47.00

0002
Men’s Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049T Size: L - 5XL 

Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
800 Each $66.91 blank $51.50 $51.55 $50.00

0003
Women’s Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #61165 Size: S - 

XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
350 Each $43.39 $61.99 $47.00 $46.53 $47.00

0004
Men’s Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1149 or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications
800 Each $80.01 $61.00 NO BID $49.00 $54.00

0005
Women’s Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1190 

Size: S-2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
100 Each $80.01 $61.00 NO BID $49.00 $54.00

0006
Men’s Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1249 or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications
400 Each $76.24 $58.00 NO BID $48.00 $51.00

0007
Women’s Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1292 

Size: S – 2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
100 Each $76.24 $58.00 NO BID $48.00 $51.00

0008
Short Sleeve Duty Shirt (Model: 5.11 #71354 Sizes: L – 5XL 

Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
800 Each $95.83 $54.99 NO BID blank $62.50
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Summary of Quotations

Sealed Bid   X   Price Inquiry__  Definite Quantities___ 

Item No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

ESTIMAT4ED

ANNUAL

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

0001
Men’s Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049 – Size: XS – 

3XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
1,300 Each

0002
Men’s Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049T Size: L - 5XL 

Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
800 Each

0003
Women’s Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #61165 Size: S - 

XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
350 Each

0004
Men’s Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1149 or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications
800 Each

0005
Women’s Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1190 

Size: S-2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
100 Each

0006
Men’s Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1249 or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications
400 Each

0007
Women’s Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1292 

Size: S – 2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
100 Each

0008
Short Sleeve Duty Shirt (Model: 5.11 #71354 Sizes: L – 5XL 

Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications
800 Each
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