

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS										
Commodity:				Seaside Companies LLC	Standard Textile Co., Inc.	Prison Enterprises	Practical Tactical Clothing and Gear	Rite Choice Uniforms, Inc.						
A23-20088 FIRE DEPARTMENT UNIFORMS														
Category:		File No.												
20072 FIRE GEAR		23-20088												
Agency:		Bid Opening												
FIRE - ADMINISTRATION		04/24/23												
Sealed Bid <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Price Inquiry <input type="checkbox"/> Definite Quantities <input type="checkbox"/>														
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
0001	Men's Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049 – Size: XS – 3XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	1,300	Each	\$66.91		\$61.99		\$47.00		\$48.60		\$47.00		
0002	Men's Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049T Size: L - 5XL Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	800	Each	\$66.91		blank		\$51.50		\$51.55		\$50.00		
0003	Women's Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #61165 Size: S - XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	350	Each	\$43.39		\$61.99		\$47.00		\$46.53		\$47.00		
0004	Men's Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1149 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	800	Each	\$80.01		\$61.00		NO BID		\$49.00		\$54.00		
0005	Women's Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1190 Size: S-2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	100	Each	\$80.01		\$61.00		NO BID		\$49.00		\$54.00		
0006	Men's Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1249 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	400	Each	\$76.24		\$58.00		NO BID		\$48.00		\$51.00		
0007	Women's Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1292 Size: S – 2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	100	Each	\$76.24		\$58.00		NO BID		\$48.00		\$51.00		
0008	Short Sleeve Duty Shirt (Model: 5.11 #71354 Sizes: L – 5XL Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	800	Each	\$95.83		\$54.99		NO BID		blank		\$62.50		
		TOTAL AMOUNT												
		CASH DISCOUNT												
		NET AMOUNT												
Buyer		DELIVERY												
DSS		QUOTE TOTAL												
		AWARD												

NOTES:

Summary of Quotations				VENDORS			
Commodity:				<i>Barney's Police Supplies</i>	<i>Galls, LLC</i>		
A23-20088 FIRE DEPARTMENT UNIFORMS							
Category:		File No.					
20072 FIRE GEAR		23-20088					
Agency:		Bid Opening					
FIRE - ADMINISTRATION		04/24/23					
Sealed Bid <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Price Inquiry <input type="checkbox"/> Definite Quantities <input type="checkbox"/>							
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	ESTIMATED ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
0001	Men's Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049 - Size: XS - 3XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	1,300	Each	NB		\$37.99	
0002	Men's Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #71049T Size: L - 5XL Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	800	Each	NB		\$41.50	
0003	Women's Performance Polos (Model: 5.11 #61165 Size: S - XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	350	Each	NB		\$36.00	
0004	Men's Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1149 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	800	Each	\$82.39		\$49.00	
0005	Women's Long Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1190 Size: S-2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	100	Each	\$56.25		\$49.00	
0006	Men's Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1249 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	400	Each	\$77.69		\$41.25	
0007	Women's Short Sleeve Shirt (Model: Horace Small HS1292 Size: S - 2XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	100	Each	\$53.13		\$46.00	
0008	Short Sleeve Duty Shirt (Model: 5.11 #71354 Sizes: L - 5XL Tall or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	800	Each	NB		\$76.00	
		TOTAL AMOUNT					
		CASH DISCOUNT					
		NET AMOUNT					
Buyer		DELIVERY					
DSS		QUOTE TOTAL					
		AWARD					
NOTES:							