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Gravel, washed, 5/8'" to 1-1/2" $65.0000 NO BID
0001 [mixture. C/P No. 7507739905 800 Cubic YardNO BID
Delivered
Gravel, washed, 5/8" to 1-1/2" $55.0000 $30.0000
0002 [mixture. C/P No. 7507739905 Pick- 800 Cubic YardjNO BID
Up
NO BID NO BID
Fine Aggregate, Table 103-1, Grade F .
0003 kb No. 7507731950 Delivered 100 JCubic YardjNO BID
NO BID NO BID
Fine Aggregate, Table 103-1, Grade F .
0004 C/P No. 7507731950 Pick-Up 100 Cubic YardNO BID
Fill Sand (Mississippi River Pumped $19.5000 NO BID
Sand with less than 10% sieve, .
poos meaning no trash or debris) C/P No. 9% P YardhoBID
7507775905 Delivered
Fill Sand (Mississippi River Pumped $9.5000 $60.0000
Sand with less than 10% sieve, .
Ao meaning no trash or debris) C/P No. 4000 Jble Yandie BID
7507775905 Pick-Up
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NO BID NO BID
ooo7 |Red Clay C/P No. 7503520905 500  JCubic Yard|NO BID
Delivered
) e NO BID NO BID
0008 E;d Clay C/P No. 7503520905 Pick 500 Cubic YardINo BID
0009 RlVFr-Sllt C/P No. 7908056905 1500 cubic YardINo BID NO BID NO BID
Delivered
N . NO BID NO BID
0010 ﬁ:er silt C/P No. 7908056905 Pick 1500 cubic YardINo BID
0011 JConcrete Sand Delivered 800 Cubic YardNO BID $44.5000 NO BID
0012 [Concrete Sand Pick-Up 800 Cubic Yard|NO BID $34.5000 NO BID
0013 Ma.son Sand C/P No. 7507779905 100 Cubic YardINo BID $54.5000 NO BID
Delivered
0014 Mason Sand C/P No. 7507779905 100 cubic YardINo BID $44.5000 NO BID
Pick-Up
Mixture of Pea Gravel 65% with Fill NO BID NO BID
0015 [}Sand 35% C/P No. 7507733905 4000 Cubic YardjNO BID
Delivered
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Mixture of Pea Gravel 65% with Fill
0016 [Sand 35% C/P No. 7507733905 Pick 4000 Cubic Yard|NO BID
Up
0017 |[Topsoil Delivered 500 Cubic YardNO BID |NO BID NO BID
0018 [Topsoil Pick-Up 500  |cubic Yard|NO BID hOBID NO BID
0019 LIMESTONE_ #610 — Base Material: 2500 Ton $45.60 $51.0000 NO BID
32 tons-Delivered
0020 LIMESTONE #610 — Base Material: 2500 Ton $45.60 $51.0000 NO BID
16 tons — Delivered
0021 L!MESTONE #610 — Base Material: 2500 Ton $37.60 $41.0000 NO BID
Pick-Up
0022 LIM.ESTONE 67,3/4": 32 tons — 200 Ton $48.60 NO BID NO BID
Delivered
0023 LIM_ESTONE 67,3/4": 16 Tons- 200 Ton $48.60 NO BID NO BID
Delivered
0024 [LIMESTONE 67,3/4": Pick Up 200 |ton $39.60 B0 NO BID
". 52.0000
0025 LIM'ESTONE #57,1": 32 tons 2000 Ton $48.60 $ NO BID
Delivered
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", 52.0000
0026 LIM.ESTONE #57,1": 16 tons 2000 Ton $48.60 $ NO BID
Delivered
0027 JLIMESTONE #57, 1": Pick-up 2000 [Ton $39.60 $42.0000 NO BID
0028 #4, 'Clean Railroad Rock 2": 32 tons 280 Ton $48.60 $54.0000 NO BID
Delivered
#4, Clean Railroad Rock 2": 16 tons $54.0000 NO BID
0029 Delivered 280 Ton $48.60
0030 [#4, Clean Railroad Rock 2": Pick-up 280  |Ton $39.60 $44.0000 NO BID
0031 Rock, 1-1/2" X 3": 32 tons Delivered 420 Ton $48.60 $4.0000 NO BID
0032 |Rock, 1-1/2" X 3": 16 tons Delivered 420 [Ton $48.60 »54.0000 NO BID
0033 |Rock, 1-1/2" X 3":Pick-up 420 [ton $39.60 $44.0000 NO BID
0034 [Road Base 2-1/2": 32 tons Delivered 280 Ton NO BID NO'BID NO BID
0035 [Road Base 2-1/2": 16 tons Delivered 280  |Ton NO BID NOBID NO BID
0036 |-'MESTONE Rip-Rap, 8" X 2": 32 . - $65.0000 NO BID
tons Delivered
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ip- & . 65.0000
0037 LIMEST(?NE Rip-Rap, 8" X 2": 16 280 Ton $57.00 $
tons Delivered
0038 tlpMESTONE Rip-Rap, 8" X 2": Pick- 280 Ton $48.00 $55.0000 NO BID
80.00
0039 |Rip-Rap, Man Size: 32 tons Delivered| 280  |Ton NO BID i i
0040 JRip-Rap, Man Size: 16 tons Delivered 280 Ton NO BID BAANNG el
0041 [Rip-Rap, Man Size: Pick-up 280 Ton NO BID $65.0000 NO BID
TOTAL AMOUNT
CASH DISCOUNT
NET AMOUNT
Buyer DELIVERY
SS QUOTE TOTAL
AWARD

NOTES: See Bid Worksheet




