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CATEGORY “40"” ZOLL MONITOR, ACCESSORIES, &
EQUIPMENT — ITEMS 40-01 — 40-41

Replacement 4-lead Trunk Cable-AAMI for Zoll X-Series
40-01 |Monitor/Defibrillator 50 Each $169.00 $117.75 $398.25
Item # §300-0803-01
Replacement Percordial 6 Lead Cable-AAMI for Zoll X-Series
40-02 |Monitor/Defibrillator 50 Each $196.00 $138.00 $379.29
Item # 8300-0804-01
ECG Plain White Paper — 80mm (Pack of 6 rolls) for Zoll X-
40-03 |Series Monitor/Defibrillator 6,000 Roll no bid
Item # 8000-000901-01
OneStep Pediatric CPR Electrodes, multifunction electrodes
for anterior/posterior placement, for Zoll X-Series
Monitor/Defibrillator
ltem # 8900-000219
CPR Stat-Padz, HVP Multi-Function CPR Electrodes (8
40-05 |pairs/case for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator) 700 Pair $79.37
Item # 8900-0400
Dual Lumen NIBP 5 foot hose for Propaq MD for Zoll X-Series
40-06 |Monitor/Defibrillator 50 Each $135.00 $93.75 $140.63
Item # 8300-0002-02
Blood Pressure Cuff, Infant, 2-Tube, Twist lock connector for
40-07 |Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 10 Each $22.50 $39.38 $63.18
ltem # REUSE-07-2MQ
Blood Pressure Cuff, Small Child, 2-Tube, Twist lock
40-08 |connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each $20.50 $39.38 $63.18
Iltem # REUSE-08-2MQ

18.54 (BOX OF 6) 3.09

(PER ROLL) 3800

40-04 100 Pair $101.00 $70.98 $100.80

454.16 (8 PAIR PER

CASE) 56.77 (PER PAIR) $85.50
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Blood Pressure Cuff, Child, 2-Tube, Twist lock connector for
40-09 |Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each $22.50 $39.38 $63.18

Item # REUSE-09-2MQ

Blood Pressure Cuff, Small Adult, 2-Tube, Twist lock
40-10 Jconnector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 30 Each $23.50 $39.38 $63.18
ltem # REUSE-10-2MQ

Blood Pressure Cuff, Adult, 2-Tube, Twist lock connector for
40-11 jZoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 30 Each $24.05 $39.38 $47.25
Item # REUSE-11-2MQ

Blood Pressure Cuff, Lg Adult, 2-Tube, Twist lock connector
40-12 |[for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 30 Each $27.45 $39.38 $63.18
Item # REUSE-12-2MQ

Blood Pressure Cuff, Thigh, 2-Tube, Twist lock connector for
40-13 |Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 30 Each $42.00 $39.38 $44.99
Item # REUSE-13-2MQ

YSI Reusable Adult Skin Temperature Probe for Zoll X-Series
40-14 |Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each $132.50
Item # 8000-0670

YSI Reusable Adult Esophageal/Rectal Temperature Probe for
40-15 |Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each $142.50 $96.56 $112.50
Item # 8000-0668

Filterline Set Adult/Pediatric, Case of 25 for Zoll X-Series

ITEM NO LONGER

AVAILABLE $112.50

206.25 (PER BOX OF 25)

40-16 |Monitor/Defibrillator 250 Each $7.25 $273.49
Item # 8300-0520-01 8,25 (EACH)
Smart CapnoLine Plus 02 Adult (O2 tubing), Case of 25 for

40-17 |Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 6,000 Each $9.25 266.25 (PER BOX OF 25) $431.33

10.65 (EACH)

ltem # 8300-0524-01
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Smart CapnoLine Plus 02 Pediatric (02 tubing), Case of 25 for
40-18 |Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 200 Each $11.05 #36.25 {PER BOX.OF 25} $391.50

Item # 8300-0525-01 11.85 (EACH)

X Series Power Extension Cable for Zoll X-Series
40-19 |Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each $128.50 $90.85 $160.08
Item # 8000-000903-01

40-20 Il.tleSmP;v;ngg:%(f)or Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each $69.00 $48.67 $69.30
Six hour rechargeable SurePower Smart battery for Zoll X-
40-21 |Series Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each $618.99 $389.81 $501.18
Item # 8000-0580-01

SurePower 4 bay charging system (requires 8300-0250-01
charge SurePower Battery) for Zoll X-Series
Monitor/Defibrillator

I1tem # 8050-0030-01

SurePower single bay charger for Zoll X-Series

40-23 |Monitor/Defibrillator 10 Each $1,085.00 $766.52 $1,088.10
Item # 8200-000100-01

Replacement AC power adapter/charger, 120-240 VAC, 50,60
40-24 1400 HZ for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 40 Each $505.00 $350.44 $504.23
Item # 8300-0004

SurePower Charger Adapter for batteries for Zoll X-Series
40-25 |Monitor/Defibrillator 40 Each $94.50 $239.28 $278.78
ltem # 8300-0250-01

SurePower 4 Bay charging system including 4 battery
40-26 |charging adapters for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 10 Each no bid $2,095.13 $2,440.94
Item # 8300-0500-01

USB Extension Cable for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator

40-27 ltem # 8707-000500-01 40 Each no bid $28.39 $42.53

40-22 10 Each no bid $1,845.31 $2,618.00
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X-Series Carry case for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator
40-28 ltem # 8707-000502-01 20 Each $565.00 $401.50 $648.00
Shoulder Strap for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator .
40-29 ltem # 8000-0914 20 Each no bid $27.56 $42.53
External Paddle Assembly Apex/Sternum w/controls & built in
40-30 |pediatric electrodes for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each no bid ITE‘TVPZ?L;EE:ER $679.50
Item # 8000-1010-01
CPR Connector for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator .
40-31 ltem # 8000-0020 20 Each no bid $247.47 $283.50
Carry Case, rear bag, for Zoll X-Series  Monitor/Defibrillator
40-32 ltem # 9680-000404-01 20 Each $455.00 $25.00 $30.38
Multifunction Therapy Cable, for Zoll X-Series
40-33 |Monitor/Defibriliator, PPMD 20 Each $345.00 $241.72 $343.80
Item # 8300-0783
Test Port for Zoll X-Series Monitor/Defibrillator . ITEM NO LONGER
40-34 Item # 1004-0149 20 Each no bid AVAILABLE $168.38
Label for “30j Test Block” to adhere to test port for Zoll X-
40-35 |Series Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each no bid ITE::V':\?L;OBESER $9.00
ltem # 9305-0325-01
Label for “This End Up” to adhere to test port for Zoll X-Series
40-36 |Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each no bid ITERAVP:?L:(;EEER $12.86
Item # 9305-0326-01
Tie Wraps to secure test port to Zoll X-Series
40-37 |Monitor/Defibrillator 20 Each no bid ITEL“VP:\?L:(;ESER $3.15
ltem # 0501-0020
OneStep cable ;
40-38 Item # 8300-000676 20 Each no bid $334.69 $681.67
Top handle for Zoll X-Series Monitor ; ITEM NO LONGER
40-39 {ytem # 705519-02 20 EHEl. | Do b AVAILABLE 38242
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Bottom handle for Zoll X-Series Monitor . ITEM NO LONGER
40-40 |\em # 705517-02 20 Eaeh no b AVAILABLE ybas
CPR-D Padz Connector for R Series Onestep Cable .
40-41 ltem # 8008-0020 20 Each no bid $295.00 $423.90
CATEGORY “60” ZOLL ZVENT- ITEMS 60-01 — 60-12
ResQPod ITD 16, impedance threshold device (ITD) that is a
replacement component for ResQCPR System. Attached to the
60-01 Jairway during CPR, the ITD enhances negative pressure to 600 Each no bid $131.13 $139.73
increase perfusion.
Item # 12-0822-000
1 Liter Dark Blue Test Lung for Zoll ZVent
60-02 Item # 820-0132-00 10 Each $135.00 $136.66 $200.48
6 Foot Long Oxygen Hose for Zoll ZVent ,
60-03 Item # 825-0002-00 10 Each no bid $42.50 $51.03
Ambulance Wall Mount for Zoll ZVent \
60-04 Item # 703-0003-00 20 Each no bid $33.60 $87.48
CPAP Harness + Mask for Zoll ZVent
60-05 |#5 Regular Adult 600 Each no bid $23.03 $32.81
ltem # 712-0002-00
CPAP Harness + Mask for Zoll ZVent
60-06 }#6 Large Adult 600 Each no bid $23.03 $32.81
Item # 712-0003-00
Disposable Adult 731 Circuit, 6 foot for Zoll ZVent
Iltem # 820-0106-15 . 184.78 (PER CASE OF
60-07 2,000 Each no bid 15) 12.32 (PER EACH) $16.23
Disposable Infant/Pediatric 731 Circuit, 6 foot for Zoll ZVent . 279.34 9 (PER CASE OF
80-08 1o m # 820-0107-20 300 Eash no bid 20) 13.97 (PER EACH) $21.00
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Power Cord for Zoll ZVent .
60-09 ltem # 708-0042-00 20 Each no bid $9.00 $13.37
Power Supply for Zoll ZVent .
60-10 ltemn # 024-0012-00 20 Each no bid $111.30 $179.96
Vehicle Charger for Zoll ZVent .
60-11 ltern # 704-0EMV-06 20 Each no bid $40.74 $26.99
Carry Case (white) Eagle Il for Zoll ZVent .
60-12 ltem # 703-0731-27 20 Each no bid $316.00 $479.93
TOTAL AMOUNT
CASH DISCOUNT
NET AMOUNT
Buyer DELIVERY
mid QUOTE TOTAL
AWARD
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