SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
34016 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors 2
) Bid Opening or =
Ageney: Closing Date: (jJ 4
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 . ..3 2
F.O.B: g & 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: ?, . QE,
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ____ & P %
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY J MEASURE §l Unit Price | Amount § Unit Price | Amount J Unit Price | Amount § Unit Price JAmount§ Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Bosch/Radionic
Model D-100240 Fire Alarm and Smoke Detector
System located in the City of Baton Rouge
001A 5,000.00 4,500.00
Governmental Building, 222 St. Louis Street, l Yealy IS ”
Baton Rouge La. Work to be performed after
normal working hours.
Monthly maintenance and repair of
Bosch-/Radionic Model D-100240 Fire Alarm
and Smoke Detector System located in the City of] .
001B - 12 Monthl No Bid NB
Baton Rouge Governmental Building, 222 St. oty o
Louis Street, Baton Rouge La. Work to be == =
performed after normal working hours. @Ri@ NAL
- - _‘_._‘_SE——
Monthly monitoring of Bosch/Radionic Model D-
100240 Fire Alarm and Smoke Detector System
located in the City of Baton Rouge Governmental .
001C . ; 12 Monthl No Bid 29.00
Building, 222 St. Louis Street, Baton Rouge La. oty o= ¥
Trouble reports are to be reported at 8:00 am
after the date of occurrence.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
=401k Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors
Agency: Bid Opening or

Closing Date:

DPW-Building & Grounds/Library

08/31/23

F.O.B:

Delivery Requirements:

fPurchase Period:

Sealed Bid ____

Price Inquiry ___

Definite Quantities ____

Fire Quest, LLC

Allied Systems, Inc.

Siemens AG

Item
No.

002 |

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

Annual testing and cleaning of Silent Knight
model SK-2224 multiple Fire Alarm system
located at Jewel J. Newman Community Center,
2013 Central Road, Baton Rouge, La.

UNIT OF

QTY § MEASURE

1 Yearly

Unit Price

$4,000.00

Amount

Unit Price

$300.00

Amount

Unit Price | Amount

Unit Price

Amount

Unit Price

Amount

002B

Monthly maintenance and testing of Silent Knight
model SK-2224 multiple Fire Alarm system
located at Jewel J. Newman Community Center,
2013 Central Road, Baton Rouge, La.

12 Monthly

No Bid

$85.00

002C

Monthly monitoring of Silent Knight model SK-
2224 multiple Fire Alarm system located at Jewel
J. Newman Community Center, 2013 Central
Road, Baton Rouge, La.

12 Monthly

$150.00

$29.00

G)
s

003A

Annual testing and cleaning of Silent Knight
Model IFP-1000 Fire Alarm system located at
Zachary Branch Library, 1900 Church Street,
Hwy 64, Zachary, La.

| Yearly

$600.00

$300.00




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
34016 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors g
. Bid Opening or =
Hgenayt Closing Date: (ﬂ) 2
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 5 -3 2
F.O.B: o & 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: ‘z b g
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ____ ,f b %
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY § MEASURE |l Unit Price ] Amount § Unit Price ] Amount § Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price §Amount} Unit Price | Amount
Monthly maintenance and testing of Silent Knight
Model IFP-1000 Fire Alarm system located at
003B ) 300.00 75.00
Zachary Branch Library, 1900 Church Street, 2 Bonthly.§: 5 .
Hwy 64, Zachary, La.
Monthly monitoring of Silent Knight Model IFP-
1000 Fire Alarm system located at Zachary
003C 50.00 29.00
Branch Library, 1900 Church Street, Hwy 64, 12 Mounthly ¥ ¥
Zachary, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Silent Knight
Model 5204 multiple Fire Alarm System located
004A . i
at Juvenile Services, 8333 Veterans Memorial l vearly 0.0 #A10:00
Blvd., Baton Rouge, La
Monthly maintenance and testing of Silent Knight 3
Model 5204 multiple Fire Alarm Systems located (3 f'
004B i g L
at Juvenile Services, 8333 Veterans Memorial 2 Mothly . 3400.00 S20000 41 JRE i ,NAL
Blvd., Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Silent Knight Model 5204
multiple Fire Alarm Systems located at Juvenile
004C B .
Services, 8333 Veterans Memorial Blvd., Baton iz hentlily e $29.00
Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
34016 Testing

Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors

o
— [ =
. Bid Opening or =
Agency: Closing Date: Lj) 2
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 = g 2
F.O.B: g iy 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: % T g
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ____ i P %
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY § MEASURE || Unit Price | Amount § Unit Price ] Amount || Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price JAmount§ Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Edwards Systems
Tech. Model 1RC-3 multiple Fire Alarm system
300.00 325.00
0= located at Greenwell Springs Library, 11300 . Yealy ¢ ¥
Greenwell Springs Road, Baton Rouge, La
Monthly maintenance and testing of Edwards
Systems Tech. Model 1RC-3 multiple Fire Alarm
005B fsystem located at Greenwell Springs Library, 12 Monthly | $200.00 $100.00
11300 Greenwell Springs Road, Baton Rouge,
La.
Monthly monitoring of Edwards Systems Tech.
Model 1RC-3 multiple Fire Alarm system located QDI In
00 . . 30.00 29.00 3 =
>C at Greenwell Springs Library, 11300 Greenwell 12 Monthly ¥ ¥ UE“‘& “U} g ?\Q@L
Springs Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Edwards model
EST2, FB II, model XL4, multiple Fire Alarm
006A ’ ? e 1,500.00 1,550.00
system located at Baker Library, 3501 Groom ! Yearly 1% ?
Road, Baker, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
SIS Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors cé
. Bid Opening or =
AGENGy: Closing Date: Lj’ g
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 2 % 2
F.O.B: g iy 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: (Z T g
Sealed Bid __  Price Inquiry __  Definite Quantities ___ o = 3
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY [ MEASURE } Unit Price | Amount J| Unit Price | Amount § Unit Price | Amount § Unit Price JAmount} Unit Price | Amount
Monthly maintenance and testing of Edwards
[model EST2, FB 11, model XL4, multiple Fire .
’ ’ ’ 12 M No Bid 500.00
0068 Alarm system located at Baker Library, 3501 aniiily o ®
Groom Road, Baker, La.
Monthly monitoring of Edwards model EST2, FB
11, model XL4, multiple Fire Alarm system .
No Bid 29.00
006C located at Baker Library, 3501 Groom Road, 12 Mornitily o= d
Baker, La.
Annual Testing and cleaning of Edwards Model
EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system located at Pride
750.00 1,000.00
007A Chaneyville Branch Library, 11360 Pride Port : Yearly s d
Hudson Road, Pride, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Edwards
Model EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system located
600.00 560.00
el at Pride-Chaneyville Branch Library, 11360 Pride 12 Montuly |- 9 b
Port Hudson Road, Pride, La.
Monthly monitoring of Edwards Model EST2
multiple Fire Alarm system located at Pride- "
No Bid 29.00
e Chaneyville Branch Library, 11360 Pride Port k2 Mornthy = ¥
Hudson Road, Pride, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
31016 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors %)
= =
. Bid Opening or =
Agency: Closing Date: tj’ 4
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 . g 2
F.O.B: g iy @
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: ?) b5 g
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ____ LE I %
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY | MEASURE || Unit Price | Amount §| Unit Price § Amount § Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price fAmount}l Unit Price ] Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Edwards model
EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system located at
4,000.00 750.00
008A Scotlandville Library, 7373 Scenic Highway, l Veadly I .
Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Edwards
model EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system located
B . : 12 Monthl 700.00 410.00
0% at Scotlandville Library, 7373 Scenic Highway, onthly | ¥ :
Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Edwards model EST2
multiple Fire Alarm system located at -
No Bid 29.00
098¢ Scotlandville Library, 7373 Scenic Highway, 12 Monthly o= .
Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning Siemens Fire Finder
XLS System Fire Alarm system located at River
A 5,000.00 400.00 2,451.00
009 Center Library at, 250 North Blvd, Baton Rouge, 1 Yearly |i* » ¥
La.
Monthly maintenance and testing Siemens Fire
Finder XLS System Fire Alarm system located at .
No Bid 150.00
(e River Center Library at, 250 North Blvd, Baton 2 Meathly o ®
Rouge, La




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Cateci;ory: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
shals Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors g
. Bid Opening or =
Agency: Closing Date: g z
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 = % 2
F.O.B: g & @
Delivery Requirements: jPurchase Period: g 5 g
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ___ ,f = ﬁ
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY MEASURE { Unit Price | Amount J| Unit Price ] Amount § Unit Price | Amount § Unit Price | Amount| Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Siemens Fire Finder XLS
009C |System Fire Alarm system located at River Centerj 12 Monthly | No Bid $29.00
Library at, 250 North Blvd, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Edwards System
Tech., Model LSS1 multiple Fire Alarm system
010A flocated at Women’s Correctional and Rehab 1 Yearly $500.00 $900.00
Center, 855 St. Ferdinand Street, Baton Rouge,
La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Edwards
System Tech., Model LSS1 multiple Fire Alarm
010B jsystem located at Women’s Correctional and 12 Monthly {| $400.00 $450.00 .
Rehab Center, 855 St. Ferdinand Street, Baton i
Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Edwards System Tech.,
Model LSS1 multiple Fire Alarm system located
50.00 29.
(ilae at Women’s Correctional and Rehab Center, 855 12 Monthly | $ S
St. Ferdinand Street, Baton Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
34016 Testing

Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors

%)
=
. Bid Opening or =
g Closing Date: g g
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 o -.3 (<9
F.O.B: o » 2
Delivery Requirements: JPurchase Period: g < g
Sealed Bid __ Price Inquiry __  Definite Quantities ___ = = o
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY |} MEASURE || Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price | Amount § Unit Price fAmount} Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Edwards model
EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system located at
2,000.00 550.00
OlLAY, IM-EOC Building, 3773 Harding Bivd., Baton |+ | Y* ¥ :
Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Edwards
model EST2 multiple Fire Alarm system located .
No Bid 450.00
oriB Wat ATM-EOC Building, 3773 Harding Blvd., 12 | Monthly | Nefi ¥
Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Edwards model EST2 = Iad ﬂ L
011C jmultiple Fire Alarm system located at ATM-EOC 12 Monthly | No Bid $29.00 J {iN E‘Fﬂ 5
Building, 3773 Harding Blvd., Baton Rouge, La. _—
Annual testing and cleaning of Fire Alarms and
Smoke Detectors for the following locations:
012A : : ot ; 1 Yearl 900.00 $1,440.00
Parking Garage, Mechanical Building, Various sary ¥
Locations, 222 St. Louis Street, Baton Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
34016 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors J
= =
. Bid Opening or =
Agency: Closing Date: g 2
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 5 % 2
F.O.B: ¢ & @
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: cg 3 £
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry __  Definite Quantities ___ = — -
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY MEASURE |l Unit Price | Amount §l Unit Price ] Amount J Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price jAmount} Unit Price
Monthly maintenance and testing of Fire Alarms
and Smoke Detectors for the following locations:
012B . : L . hl 325.00 380.00
Parking Garage, Mechanical Building, Various 12 Monihly Y3 ¥
Locations, 222 St. Louis Street, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Fire Alarms and Smoke
012C Detectors for the following locations: Parking 12 Monthl $50.00 $29.00
Garage, Mechanical Building, Various Locations, y ’ ’
222 St. Louis Street, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Simplex model
NFGPA 72 Remote Station Fire Alarm system
013A i Y 800.00 600.00
located at Eden Park Branch Library, 5131 : carly s »
Greenwell Springs Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Simplex
model NFGPA 72 Remote Station Fire Alarm
013B . | No Bid NB
system located at Eden Park Branch Library, 12 Monthly o
5131 Greenwell Springs Road, Baton Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
34018 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors o
—— =
. Bid Opening or =
Agency: Closing Date: g e
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 = % S,:)
F.O.B: g & 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: ?, . g
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ____ & P %
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY MEASURE § Unit Price | Amount §| Unit Price ] Amount [ Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price fAmount} Unit Price | Amount
Monthly monitoring of Simplex model NFGPA
72 Remote Station Fire Alarm system located at .
013C No Bid 78.
Eden Park Branch Library, 5131 Greenwell = Mentiily o HEAI0
Springs Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Notifier NFS-640
Fire Alarm system located at Delmont Gardens
500.00 1,200.00
LA Branch Library, 3351 Lorraine Street, Baton I Weatly » .
Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Notifier NFS-
640 Fire Alarm system located at Delmont
14 200.00 300.00
ol Gardens Branch Library, 3351 Lorraine Street, 12 Montily | ¥
Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Notifier NFS-640 Fire
014C Alarm s};/stem locatid at Delmont Gardens 12 Mol $50.00 $78.00 | Ez E Es : ?”S;NL
Branch Library, 3351 Lorraine Street, Baton y ’ )
Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Notifier NFS-320
with Fire Voice 25/50 Fire Alarm system located
015A ; 1,200.00 2,400.00
2 at Bluebonnet Library, 9200 Bluebonnet Blvd., : Yealy. |9 v
Baton Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: “Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
4018 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors g
. Bid Opening or =
Ageney: Closing Date: Lj’ 2
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 o % 2
F.O0.B: @ iy 4
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: g T “E’
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ____  Definite Quantities ____ ,_E <=,: %
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY MEASURE § Unit Price | Amount } Unit Price ] Amount J| Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price fAmount}] Unit Price §] Amount
Monthly maintenance and testing of Notifier NFS-
320 with Fire Voice 25/50 Fire Alarm system
500.00 600.00
flEh located at Bluebonnet Library, 9200 Bluebonnet 2 Mptithly | ¥ y
Blvd., Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Notifier NFS-320 with
Fire Voice 25/50 Fire Alarm system located at
50.00 78.00
015€C Bluebonnet Library, 9200 Bluebonnet Blvd., = Monthly $ 5
Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Notifier NFW 2-
100 with Fire Voice 25/50Fire Alarm system
1,500.00 600.00
vilas located at Central Branch Library, 11260 Joor ! Yearly |} 9% s
Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Notifier ety \
NFW 2-100 with Fire Voice 25/50Fire Alarm 8 [
016B ; 12 Monthl $300.00 $250.00 - e
system located at Central Branch Library, 11260 onthly E= |
Joor Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Notifier NFW 2-100 with
Fire Voice 25/50Fire Alarm system located at
50.00 78.00
(6t Central Branch Library, 11260 Joor Road, Baton 12 hlanthiy 2 .
Rouge, La.




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date.
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
34016 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors 2
. Bid Opening or =
Agency: Closing Date: (ﬂ) E:
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 ° % 2
F.O.B: ¢ & 9
Delivery Requirements: JPurchase Period: g g g
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry ___  Definite Quantities ___ i 3 >
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY | MEASURE || Unit Price | Amount J| Unit Price ] Amount § Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price JAmount}l Unit Price § Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Notifier NFW 2-
100 with Fire Voice 25/50Fire Alarm system
017A 2,000.00 800.00
located at Jones Creek Library, 6222 Jones Creek : Yemly I* ¥
Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Notifier
NFW 2-100 with Fire Voice 25/50Fire Alarm
017B 300.00 500.00
system located at Jones Creek Library, 6222 12 Monthly |l 3
Jones Creek Road, Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Notifier NFW 2-100 with
Fire Voice 25/50Fire Alarm system located at
017C 50.00 78.00
Jones Creek Library, 6222 Jones Creek Road, 12 Manthly $ $
Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of system at Old
018A §Baton Rouge Jr. High Notifier Model No. NFW2- 1 Yearly $750.00 $600.00
100
Monthly maintenance and testing of system at Old|
018B §Baton Rouge Jr. High Notifier Model No. NFW2-1 12 Monthly | $300.00 $300.00
100
Monitoring of system at Old Baton Rouge Jr.
018C ) ) 2 50.00 78.00
High Notifier Model No. NFW2-100 12| Monthly | & s




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Cat%ory: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
24016 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors It
: : £
— Bncli Olpenlljng c?r o I
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 . % 2
F.O0.B: g & 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: ?, o °E’
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ____ e b '3-;
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY MEASURE § Unit Price Unit Price ] Amount § Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price fAmountf Unit Price | Amount
Annual testing and cleaning of Microm model
FX2017A Fire Alarm system located at Carver
019A 2,000.00 1,400.00
Branch Library, 720 Terrace Street, Baton Rouge, ! Yearly | 3
La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of Microm
model FX2017A Fire Alarm system located at
019B 500.00 300.00
Carver Branch Library, 720 Terrace Street, Baton 2 Monthly | % s
Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring of Microm model FX2017A
019C fFire Alarm system located at Carver Branch 12 Monthly | $50.00 $78.00
Library, 720 Terrace Street, Baton Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Face Shield
multiple Fire Alarm System located at Juvenile
020A ; . Y 3,000.00 600.00
Court and Detention, 8333 Veterans Memorial ) Rarly ¥ ¥
Blvd., Baton Rouge, La
Monthly maintenance and testing of Face Shield
multiple Fire Alarm System located at Juvenile
020B § . 2 M 500.00 300.00
Court and Detention, 8333 Veterans Memorial ! il S ¥
Blvd., Baton Rouge, La




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
dA018 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors
Agency: Bid Opening or

Closing Date:

DPW-Building & Grounds/Library

08/31/23

F.OB:

Delivery Requirements:

Purchase Period:

Sealed Bid _

Price Inquiry ____

Definite Quantities ____

IFire Quest, LLC

Allied Systems, Inc.

Siemens AG

Item
No.

020C

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

Monthly monitoring of Face Shield multiple Fire
Alarm System located at Juvenile Court and
Detention, 8333 Veterans Memorial Blvd.,
Baton Rouge, La

UNIT OF
MEASURE

12 Monthly

Unit Price | Amount

$50.00

Unit Price

$29.00

Amount

Amount

Amount

Unit Price Unit Price jAmountj Unit Price

021A

Annual testing and cleaning Johnson Controls
Fire Alarm Fire Alarm system located at Main
Library at Independence Park, 7711 Goodwood,
Baton Rouge, La.

1 Yearly

$9,000.00

$3,600.00

021B

Monthly maintenance and testing Johnson
Controls Fire Alarm Fire Alarm system located at
Main Library at Independence Park, 7711
Goodwood, Baton Rouge, La.

12 Monthly

No Bid

NB

021C

Monthly monitoring of Johnson Controls Fire
Alarm Fire Alarm system located at Main Library
at Independence Park, 7711 Goodwood, Baton
Rouge, La.

12 Monthly

No bid

$78.00

022A

Annual testing and cleaning Firelite Fire Alarm
Fire Alarm system located at Fairwood Branch
Library, 12910 Old Hammond Hwy Baton
Rouge, La.

1 Yearly

$400.00

$300.00




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
SHth Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors 1)
=
. Bid Opening or =
Agency: Closing Date: (:Il) 4
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 8 % 2
F.0.B: e iy @
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: ?) % g
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ____ LE I %
Item UNIT OF
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QTY MEASURE || Unit Price | Amount § Unit Price ] Amount J| Unit Price | Amount | Unit Price f Amount} Unit Price | Amount
Monthly maintenance and testing Firelite Fire
Alarm Fire Alarm system located at Fairwood
022B 300.00 150.00
Branch Library, 12910 Old Hammond Hwy 12 )Montlly § = #
Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly monitoring Firelite Fire Alarm Fire
Alarm system located at Fairwood Branch
022C 50.00 29.00
Library, 12910 Old Hammond Hwy Baton 12 Moty 3 S
Rouge, La.
Annual testing and cleaning of Bosch/ Radionic
Model D-8112 fire alarm system at East Baton
023A R N 1 Y 2,000.00 650.00
Rouge Inspection Division 300 North 10th Street, carly 1% 3
Baton Rouge, La.
Monthly maintenance and testing of
Bosch/Radionic Model D-8112 fire alarm system .
023B No Bid 250.00
at East Baton Rouge Inspection Division. 300 2 Santiily o s
North 10th Street, Baton Rouge, La
Monthly monitoring of Bosch/Radionic Model D
8112 fire alarm system at East Baton Rouge .
023C . e 12 Mont No Bid 29.00
Inspection Division 300 North 10th Street, Baton Bl o ¥
Rouge, La




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
Testing
SA018 Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors
Agency: Bid Opening or

Closing Date:

DPW-Building & Grounds/Library

08/31/23

"F.OB:

Delivery Requirements:

Purchase Period:

Sealed Bid ____

Price Inquiry ___

Definite Quantities ____

Fire Quest, LLC

Allied Systems, Inc.

Siemens AG

Item
No.

024A

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

Annual testing and cleaning of Bosch/Radionic
Model D-7212 fire alarm system at
Outreach/Recycled Reads Building 3434 North
Blvd, Baton Rouge, La

UNIT OF

QTY | MEASURE

1 Yearly

Unit Price

No Bid

Unit Price | Amount

$650.00

Unit Price | Amount

Unit Price | Amount

Unit Price

Amount

024B

Monthly maintenance and testing of
Bosch/Radionic Model D-7212 fire alarm system
at Outreach/Recycled Reads Building 3434 North
Blvd, Baton Rouge, La

12 Monthly

No Bid

$200.00

024C

Monthly monitoring of Bosch/Radionic Model D-
7212 fire alarm system at Outreach/Recycled
Reads Building 3434 North Blvd, Baton Rouge,
La

12 Monthly

No Bid

$29.00

025A

Annual testing and cleaning of Simplex 4100ES
System located at East Baton Rouge Mosquito
Abatement Rodent Control 10550 Veterans
Memorial Boulevard, Baton Rouge, La.

1 Yearly

$2,000.00

$1,560.00

OR

Monthly maintenance and testing of Simplex
4100ES System located at East Baton Rouge
Mosquito Abatement Rodent Control 10550
Veterans Memorial Boulevard, Baton Rouge, La

12 Monthly

$2,000.00

NB




SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: Date:
Fire Alarm Systems, Power Sirens and Controls 08/31/23
Category: Requisition No:
A23-0811
Maintenance
34016 Testing

Monitoring of Fire
Alarms & Smoke
Detectors

J
<
: Bid Opening or =
Agency: Closing Date: % £
DPW-Building & Grounds/Library 08/31/23 o .3 9:
F.0.B: g ) 2
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: (z k> “E’
3 : z 2o = = = 2
Sealed Bid ___  Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities ____ ic < @

Item
No.

UNIT OF
MEASURE

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

Unit Price Unit Price | Amount || Unit Price Unit Price fAmount{{ Unit Price | Amount

Monthly monitoring of Simplex 4100ES System
located at East Baton Rouge Mosquito Abatement
Rodent Control 10550 Veterans Memorial
Boulevard, Baton Rouge, La

025C 12 Monthly $90.00 $78.00

Annual testing and cleaning of system at Public
Safety Facility (Old Women’s Hospital buildings)
fire alarm system Simplex Model No. PSC is a
4100.

Monthly maintenance testing and Monitoring of
system at Public Safety Facility (Old Women’s
Hospital buildings) fire alarm system Simplex
Model No. PSC is a 4100.

026A 1 Yearly [ $6,000.00 $3,200.00

026B 12 Monthly | No Bid NB

Monthly monitoring of system at Public Safety
026C fFacility (Old Women’s Hospital buildings) fire 12 Monthly | No Bid $78.00 B
alarm system Simplex Model No. PSC is a 4100.

Hourly labor rate/charges for repairs not covered
by maintenance agreement as applicable for the
various locations During normal working hours
8:00a.m.-5:00p.m. Monday thru Friday

27 1 Hourly $150.00 $158.00
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Hourly labor rate/charges for repairs not covered
by maintenance agreement as applicable for the

28 [fvarious locations After normal working hours or 1 Hourly $200.00 $237.00
on Saturday (not to exceed1-1/2 time the normal
rate).

Hourly labor rate/charges for repairs not covered

29 by maintenaqce agreer.nent as .applicable for the i Hourly $250.00 $316.00

various locations. During Holidays or Sunday
I(not to exceed 2 times the normal labor rate).

30 Original Equipment Manufacturer’s Standard % 0% .
replacement parts. — \— I ey |
Miscellaneous - This line item is to be used for reight Freight Freight | ﬁ\:,gé :

: - : FhEELE charges charges 0 “k‘"‘
any freight charges for expedited delivery of to BENEES _ay b
] - g bl to Be pre- to Be pre- e

31 [Jparts: F.O.B. Destination, Prepaid and allowed on{l , . ...x paid and paid and
orders. of any stock OEM .Ord.ers will be shipped — ] added to sddedio
prepaid and added to the invoice. [OMIVOICE Y |\ oice invoice
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INET AMOUNT
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AWARD
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