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Individual Standard Portable Toilets

Daily rentals
0001 [Manufacturer Offered: 400 EACH No Bid $78.00 $31,200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:

Individual Handicapped Portable Toilets Daily rentals
oopz |Manufacturer Offered: 50 EACH No Bid $114.00 $5,700.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:

Restroom Trailer with AC, 20’ x 8’

Daily rentals
0003 |Manufacturer Offered: 1 EACH No Bid $1,800 $1,800 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:
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0004 _I?:illL!tsPump-Outs for Individual Standard and Handicapped Portable 250 EACH No Bid $18.00 $4.500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
0005 |Daily Pump-Outs for Restroom Trailers 1 EACH No Bid $360.00 $360.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Hand-Wash Station (300+ Uses)
Daily Rental
0006 [Manufacturer Offered: 1 EACH No Bid $24.00 $24.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Model Offered:
TOTAL FOR GROUP 1: DAILY RENTALS (ltems 0001 — 0006 must
all be bid for consideration of award) 2000 $43,584.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
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Individual Standard Portable Toilets

Weekly rentals
0007 |Manufacturer Offered: 1 EACH $10 $10 $78.00 $78.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:

Individual Handicapped Portable Toilets Weekly rentals
ity [MamataetarenGianed 1 EACH $110 $110 $114.00 $114.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:

Restroom Trailer with AC, 20" x &'

Weekly rentals
0009 |Manufacturer Offered: 1 EACH $1,100 $1,100 $2,400 $2,400 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:
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0010 Twov.?lzlgy Pump-Outs for Individual Standard and Handicapped Portable 1 EACH $85 $85 $18.00 $18.00 $0.00 $0.00 %64
0011 |Weekly Pump-Outs for Restroom Trailers 1 EACH $250 $250 $360.00 $360.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Hand-Wash Station (300+ Uses)

Weekly Rental
0012 |Manufacturer Offered: 1 EACH $120 $120 $24.00 $24.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:

TOTAL FOR GROUP 2: WEEKLY RENTALS (ltems 0007 — 0012 must

all be bid for consideration of award) $1,675.00 $2,994.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
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Individual Standard Portable Toilets

Monthly rentals
0013 |Manufacturer Offered: 1 EACH $10 $10 $114.00 $114.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:

Individual Handicapped Portable Toilets Monthly rentals
0014 |Manufacturer Offered: 1 EACH $110 $110 $150.00 $150.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:

Restroom Trailer with AC, 20" x &’

Monthly rentals
0015 |[Manufacturer Offered: 1 EACH $3,900 $3,900 $3,000 $3,000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:

300 Gallon Portable Holding Tank
0016 [Monthly rental 1 EACH $20 $20 $420.00 $420.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
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0017 |Pump-Outs for 300 Gallon Portable Holding Tank 1 EACH $240 $240 $90.00 $90.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Hand-Wash Station (300+ Uses)

Monthly Rental
0018 |Manufacturer Offered: 1 EACH $120 $120 $114.00 $114.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Model Offered:

TOTAL FOR GROUP 3: MONTHLY RENTALS (ltems 0013 - 0018
must all be bid for consideration of award) A0 3380800 Boc $0.00 $0.00

Additional Pump-Outs for Individual Standard and Handicapped Portable

0019 |r5ilets on an as needed basis 1 EACH $65 $65 $18.00 $18.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
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0020 [Additional Pump-Outs for Restroom Trailers on an as needed basis 1 EACH $200 $200 $360.00 $360.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
0021 Additional P_ump-Outs for 300 Gallon Portable Holding Tanks on an as 1 EACH $185 $185 $90.00 $90.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
needed basis
TOTAL FOR OPTIONAL ITEMS T;)r gPPLY TO EITHER GROUPS 1, 2, $450.00 $468.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Vendors TOTAL AMOUNT $6,525.00 $50,934.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Advertise ( X ) Bid Bond ( ) Ins ( ) CASH DISCOUNT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Special Conditions NET AMOUNT $6,525.00 $50,934.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Buyer: Date x/xx/2020 DELIVERY $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
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