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GAS FRYER, BATTERY-(FRYMASTER MODEL No. SCFHD360G OR
0001 APPROVED EQUAL) 2 Each $36,260.00 $33,100.00 $33,122.00 NO BID $35,560.00
0002 CONTROLLER (MODEL No. CM3.5 OR APPROVED EQUAL) 6 Each $1,174.00 $1,100.00 $1,073.00 NO BID $1,150.00
SPREADER CABINET (MODEL No. 20 MC W, STAINLESS STEEL
DOOR AND SIDES FREE STANDING OR IN BATTERY "MUST SPECIFY
0003 |AT TIME OF ORDER*, WITH LEGS STANDARD OR APPROVED EQUAL) 2 Each $1,306.00 $1,200.00 $1,193.00 NO BID $1,280.00
FOOD WARMER & HOLDING STATION (MODEL No. FWH-1 CERAMIC
HEATING ELEMENT WITH WIRE GUARD, RADIANT HEAT, INCLUDES
0004 |HEAT LAMP, CORD & PLUG, 12 X 20 X 2- 1/2" STAINLESS STEEL 1 Each $1,024.00 $1,400.00 $1,934.00 NO BID $1,485.00
CAFETERIA-STYLE PAN & SCREEN *SPREADER CABINET REQUIRED*
, NSF, CULUS OR APPROVED EQUAL)
0005 |LABOR (DISCONNECT, REMOVE & EXISTING EQUIPMENT/INSTALL 1 Each $330.00 $500.00 $350.00 NO BID $2,500.00
NEW EQUIPMENT)
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