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Naled, Liquid Insecticide DIBROM 281.54 1-3
0001 |[CONCENTRATE or approved equal per bid 60 Gallon no bid n/a 30 gallon n/a
specifications drums
0002 |Methoprene Granules ALTOSID P35 or 320 Pound $20.05 $20.05 $30.60 $20.05
approved equal per bid specifications
BTI Liquid Larvicide AQUABAC XT or
0003 [VECTOBAC 12AS or approved equal per bid 300 Gallon no bid $37.98 $38.50 $36.00
specifications
0004 |BT! Granules AQUABAC 200G or VECTOBAC G | ) 44, Pound no bid $1.82 $1.68 $1.60
or approved equal per bid specifications
Larvicidal Oil, Reduced Petroleum Distillate
0005 [Clarke COCOBEAR or approved equal per bid 165 Gallon $44.00 n/a no bid n/a
specifications
Spinosad Tablet Larvicide
0006 |1arke NATULAR XRT or approved equal per 1,100 Tablet $4.73 n/a no bid n/a
bid specifications
Sumithrin/Prallethrin/PBO Insecticide Mix
0007 |Clarke DUET DUAL ACTION ADULTICIDE or 550 Gallon $180.66 n/a no bid n/a
approved equal per bid specifications
DUAL ACTION AERIAL
SUMITHRIN/PRALLETHRIN/PBO INSECTICIDE
0008 [MIX Liquid DUET HD MOSQUITO Adulticiding 1,100 Gallon $213.77 n/a no bid n/a
Insecticide or approved equal per bid
specifications
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Methoprene Pellets
0009 |ALTOSID PELLETS or approved equal. per bid 500 Pound $28.50 $28.50 no bid $28.50
specifications
Permethrin/PBO Insecticide Mix PERMANONE
o010 |[31-66 BIOMIST 31+66, KONTROL 31-67 or 300 Gallon $162.00 $136.83 $150.00 $133.00
approved equal per bid specifications
Deltamethrin Aerial Adulticide IMPERIUM
0011 [IMOSQUITO ADULTICIDING INSECTICIDE or 300 Gallon no bid n/a no bid $270.50
approved equal per bid specifications
TOTAL AMOUNT
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