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Gravel, washed, 5/8" to 1-1/2"
0001 fmixture. C/P No. 7507739905 800 Cubic Yard $41.00 $44.55 $68.40
Delivered
Fine Aggregate, Table 103-1, Grade F . . .
00 100 Cubic Yard 71.08 No Bid No Bid
%3 Ic/P No. 7507731950 Delivered uble Yard} 9 o= o=
Fine Aggregate, Table 103-1, Grade F . . . .
100 [Cubic Yard No Bid No B
0004 1c/p No. 7507731950 Pick-Up uble Yard)  NoBi gEld ma e
Fill Sand (Mississippi River Pumped
Sand with less than 10% sieve
0005 2 4000 Cubic Yard 21.00 14.2 No Bid
meaning no trash or debris) C/P No. uble Tar » e °F
7507775905 Delivered
Fill Sand (Mississippi River Pumped
Sand with less than 10% sieve
0006 ’ 4000 Cubic Yard 21.00 7.50 No Bi
o meaning no trash or debris) C/P No. whle Tar 3 ? o Bid
7507775905 Pick-Up
ooo7 [Red Clay C/P No. 7503520905 500 [Cubic Yard| $20.00 $15.25 No Bid
Delivered
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No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY | MEASURE | UNIT PRICE| TOTAL | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE] TOTAL
0008 5:‘1 e e 500  JCubic Yard| No Bid $7.50 No Bid
apog | rrersiECE e, 7008026905 1500  |Cubic Yard] $20.25 $15.25 No Bid
Delivered
0010 E’Ver'sm GIE N, 208056905 Ficke 1500  [cubic Yard] No Bid $7.50 No Bid
P
0011 |JConcrete Sand Delivered 800 Cubic Yard] $23.33 $17.15 $32.40
0012 |Concrete Sand Pick-Up 800 Cubic Yard] No Bid $6.90 $12.00
G0iE  [ron pand CIE Na. 3507700 100 |Cubic Yard| $28.33 $27.55 $38.70
Delivered
Qo |[o2oom dand C/F No. TSURT70K08 100  [cubic Yard| No Bid $12.30 18.30
Pick-Up
Mixture of Pea Gravel 65% with Fill
0015 [Sand 35% C/P No. 7507733905 4000 Cubic Yard $39.00 $41.30 No Bid
Delivered
Mixture of Pea Gravel 65% with Fill
10016 [Sand 35% C/P No. 7507733905 Pick 4000 Cubic Yard No Bid $27.30 No Bid
Up
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0017 |[Topsoil Delivered 500 Cubic Yard] $27.77 $15.75 No Bid
0018 ([Topsoil Pick-Up 500 Cubic Yard] No Bid $7.50 No Bid
j0034 |Road Base 2-1/2": 32 tons Delivered 280 Cubic Yard] No Bid $66.50 No Bid
{0035 JRoad Base 2-1/2": 16 tons Delivered 280 Cubic Yard] $69.44 $72.00 No Bid
0039 [Rip-Rap, Man Size: 32 tons Delivered 280 Cubic Yard] No Bid $85.30 No Bid
0040 |JRip-Rap, Man Size: 16 tons Delivered 280 Cubic Yard] No Bid $87.80 No Bid
0041 [Rip-Rap, Man Size: Pick-up 280 Cubic Yard] No Bid $72.80 No Bid
TOTAL AMOUNT
CASH DISCOUNT
NET AMOUNT
it DELIVERY
SS IQUOTE TOTAL
AWARD

NOTES: See Bid Worksheet




