SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS					VENDORS									
	Commodity:							Ų						
M1977														
	Drones								, S					
	Category:  03596  Unmanned Aerial Vehicles (UAV) Drones  Agency: Police  Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities		Requisition No: 1977  Bid Opening or Closing Date: 08/12/24		Adorama INC.		Unmanned Vehicle Technologies, LLC		Navigation Electronics, INC		Advexure LLC			
Sealed														
Item			UNIT OF	UNIT		UNIT		UNIT		UNIT				
No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	MEASURE	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL			
0001	Drone (Model: DJI Mavic 3 Thermal or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	\$5,748.00		\$4,749.05		\$5,498.00		\$4,749.05				
0002	2 Year Service Plan (Model: 2-Year DJI Care Enterprise Basic or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	free		\$711.55	8	\$250.00		\$711.55				
0003	Drone Kit (Model: DJI Mavic 3 Series Flymore Kit or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	\$539.00		\$519.00		\$525.00		\$493.05				
0004	Setup Service for Items 0001-0003 (Model: ProLine Preflight Service or Approved Equal per Specifications)	1	EACH	free		\$0.00		\$0.00		0 no charge				
11111111	Support Service for Items 0001-0003 (Model: ProLine Support or Approved Equal per Specifications)	1	EACH	free		\$0.00		\$0.00		0 no charge				
			otal Amount											
			sh Discount Net Amount											
					1									



SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS					VENDORS									
	Commodity:													
	M1977					l		l		1				
Drones					6	İ				ļ				
	Category:	Requisition No:		, j		l			**		Ø			
	03596		1977		Skytech Drones LLC		Wilcom, LLC		Fox Partners LLC		Cloud City Drones			
	Unmanned Aerial Vehicles (UAV) Drones  Agency:		Bid Opening or Closing Date:											
	Police		08/12/24											
Sealed	Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities			Ś		2		π <sub>o</sub>		72				
Item			UNIT OF	UNIT		UNIT								
No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	CHANTITY	MEASURE	25-15-15-15-16-16-16-16-16-16-16-16-16-16-16-16-16-	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL			
		QUANTITI	WILASURE	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL			
	Drone (Model: DJI Mavic 3 Thermal or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	\$5,288.16		\$6,303.40		\$5,748.00		\$6,086.65				
	2 Year Service Plan (Model: 2-Year DJI Care Enterprise Basic or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	no charge		\$390.00		no charge		no charge	-			
0003	Drone Kit (Model: DJI Mavic 3 Series Flymore Kit or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	\$597.08		\$765.70		\$659.00		no charge	-			
	Setup Service for Items 0001-0003 (Model: ProLine Preflight Service or Approved Equal per Specifications)	1	EACH	no charge		\$0.00		\$1,188.00		no charge				
11111112	Support Service for Items 0001-0003 (Model: ProLine Support or Approved Equal per Specifications)	1	EACH	no charge		\$0.00		no charge		no charge				
		To	otal Amount			\$0.00								
			sh Discount											
Net Amount														
Delivery														
Total Amount AWARD														
NOTE														
NOTES	o:													





SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS					V E N D O R S									
	Commodity:							()						
M1977								l 3						
Drones									g.					
	Category:		Requisition No:						ldji					
03596		1977				F 2	S S		Š.					
Unmanned Aerial Vehicles (UAV) Drones		<u> </u>		Q		ar.		Q <sub>2</sub>						
			Bid Opening or		° Cor		oe Infr		, Grou		777			
	Agency:		Closing Date:											
	Police	08/12/24		Penico Corp		Monroe Infrared Technology, INC		Global Group Holding LLC		Vetbz LLC				
Sealed	Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities													
			UNIT											
ltem			OF	UNIT		UNIT		UNIT		UNIT	be to the enterior			
No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	MEASURE	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL			
0001	Drone (Model: DJI Mavic 3 Thermal or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	no bid		\$4,428.00		\$5,498.00		\$5,269.00				
0002	2 Year Service Plan (Model: 2-Year DJI Care Enterprise Basic or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	no bid		\$689.00		\$499.00		no charge				
116161 <	Drone Kit (Model: DJI Mavic 3 Series Flymore Kit or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	no bid		\$599.00		\$659.00		\$290.00				
0004	Setup Service for Items 0001-0003 (Model: ProLine Preflight Service or Approved Equal per Specifications)	1	EACH	no bid		no charge		\$99.00		no charge	_			
0005	Support Service for Items 0001-0003 (Model: ProLine Support or Approved Equal per Specifications)	1	EACH	no bid		no charge		\$99.00		no charge				
		To	otal Amount											
		Cas	sh Discount											
NOTE	S:													



SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS	VENDORS									
Commodity:						)e				
M1977			1			niir				
Drones	ļ					Õ	l			
Category:	Requisition No:		l			Ĭ.				
03596	1977			Air Vision LLC		Skytech Drones LLC-online				
Unmanned Aerial Vehicles (UAV) Drones										
	Bid Opening or		7 "		Dr					
Agency:		Closing Date:		si <sub>o</sub>		ct.				
Police	08/1	2/24	ذ ا		7,5					
Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Definite Quantities			Ą		ž					
		UNIT								
Item		OF	UNIT		UNIT		UNIT		UNIT	
No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY		MEASURE	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL
0001 Drone (Model: DJI Mavic 3 Thermal or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	\$5,173.20		\$5,288.16					
0002 2 Year Service Plan (Model: 2-Year DJI Care Enterprise Basic or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	0 included		no charge					
0003 Drone Kit (Model: DJI Mavic 3 Series Flymore Kit or Approved Equal per Specifications)	12	EACH	\$549.99		\$597.08					
O004 Setup Service for Items 0001-0003 (Model: ProLine Preflight Service or Approved Equal per Specifications)	1	EACH	0 included		no charge					
0005 Support Service for Items 0001-0003 (Model: ProLine Support or Approved Equal per Specifications)	1	EACH	0 included		no charge					
	Ţ	otal Amount								
		sh Discount Net Amount								
					in the second					
NOTES:										

