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OLD STYLE Stripe + “PoLice + BATON ROUGE + 911" Per
0001 |2 IVER SIDE DECAL OR APPROVED EQUAL 0 | peear | Y000 HO BID N/A NO BID
OLD STYLE “911 + BATON ROUGE + PoLice” + Stripe Per
0002 |1, \SSENGER SIDE DECAL OR APPROVED EQUAL 0 | pecar | 000 HO Bl N/A NO-BID
NEW STYLE “911 + EMERGENCY” DRIVER SIDE Per
0003 |hEcAL OR APPROVED EQUAL 50 | pecar | %975 $7.81 $7.00 $35.00
NEW STYLE “911 + EMERGENCY” PASSENGER SIDE Per
0004 |,E AL OR APPROVED EQUAL | pegar | 019 $7.81 $7.00 $35.00
NEW STYLE “BATON ROUGE + POLICE” DRIVER SIDE Per
0005 | - ! OR APPROVED EQUAL 50 Deont | $7540 $46.02 $95.00 $103.00
NEW STYLE “BATON ROUGE + POLICE” Per
0006 |, ASSENGER SIDE DECAL OR APPROVED EQUAL | paea | #7540 $46,02 $25.00 $103.00
NEW STYLE PATCH DRIVER SIDE OR APPROVED Per
Ll iy 50 ooy | $448 $7.09 $4.50 $18.00
NEW STYLE PATCH PASSENGER SIDE OR Per
0008 |\ CoeOVED EQUAL 50 Decal | $448 $7.09 $4.50 $18.00
ACCREDITATION DRIVER SIDE DECAL OR APPROVED Per
0009 [Coiar 50 boont | 5225 $4.87 $1.75 $15.00
ACCREDITATION PASSENGER SIDE DECAL OR Per
0010 |rer ovED EBLAL 50 el | $225 $4.87 $1.75 $15.00
2.5" UNIT NUMBER DRIVER SIDE DECAL OR Per
0011 |22 BROVED EQUAL 50 Dot | $295 $5.91 $2.35 $25.00
2.5" UNIT NUMBER PASSENGER SIDE DECAL OR Per
0% {rocncdon EGUAL 50 Dount | §2:95 $5.91 $2.35 $25.00
“POLICE” (Red) DECAL FOR TRAILING EDGE DECAL Per
1l fbpecinll. o beiiing 50 el | $0:00 $6.44 $4.50 NO BID
DRIVER SIDE FRONT QUARTER DECAL OR Per
0014 | CBROVED EQUAL 50 Deugt | $0:00 NO BID N/A NO BID
PASSENGER SIDE FRONT QUARTER DECAL OR Per
5 | onmmurn QUL 50 el | $0-00 NO BID N/A NO BID
so16 |PRIVER SIDE REAR QUARTER DECAL OR APPROVED | Per 65D — i NO BID
EQUAL Decal
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PASSENGER SIDE REAR QUARTER DECAL OR Per
0017 APPROVED EQUAL 50 Decal $0.00 NO BID N/A NO BID
“POLICE” (Blue) DECAL FOR TRAILING EDGE DECAL
0018 OR APPROVED EQUAL $5.94 NO BID $4.50 $25.00
OLD STYLE MARKED UNIT — CHEVROLET IMPALA Per
0019 |pER SPECIFICATIONS OR APPROVED EQUAL 50 |vehicle| 90 NG NIA NREIR
OLD STYLE MARKED UNIT - DODGE CHARGER PER Per
Qa0 SPECIFICATIONS OR APPROVED EQUAL 30 Vehicle $8.00 N@BIR WA NOBID
OLD STYLE MARKED UNIT - SUV PER Per
0021 | S bECIFICATIONS OR APPROVED EQUAL 0 | gehiere | $940 NO BID Wi NSBID
NEW STYLE MARKED UNIT — OTHER VEHICLES OR Per
0022 APPROVED EQUAL 50 Vehicle $0.00 $149.84 $225.70 $417.00
NEW STYLE MARKED UNIT - CHEVROLET TAHOE OR Per
0023 APPROVED EQUAL 50 Vehicle $0.00 $149.84 $225.70 $417.00
NEW STYLE MARKED UNIT - DODGE CHARGER OR Per
0024 APPROVED EQUAL 50 Vehicle $0.00 $149.84 $225.70 $417.00
NEW STYLE MARKED UNIT — DODGE DURANGO OR Per
0025 APPROVED EQUAL 50 Vehicle $0.00 $149.84 $225.70 $417.00
NEW STYLE MARKED UNIT — FORD INTERCEPTOR Per
0026 OR APPROVED EQUAL 50 Vehicle $0.00 $149.84 $225.70 $417.00
TOTAL AMOUNT
CASH DISCOUNT
NET AMOUNT
Buyer DEL'VERY
DSS QUOTE TOTAL
AWARD

NOTES:




