Summary of Quotations				VENDORS						VENDORS			
Commodity: A24-0206 Chemicals for Corrosion and Odor Control Category: Requisition No:				ITER S, LLC		<i>(</i> c.		NO BID)		ON USA		% 0 % A	
0206 Chemicals for Corrosion and Odor		File: 24-0206		OPTIMAL WATER TECHNOLOGIES, LLC		MOMAR, INC.		PENCCO, INC. (NO BID)		UMVAR SOLUTION LLC (NO BID) USA		CHEMSTATION OF LOUISIANA	
Agency: DEPT OF ENV SVCS		Bid Opening 09/16/24											
	Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry Defi	nite Quanti	ties	1				ď		5			
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
0001	Sulfuric Acid (H2 SO4) 93%	3500	Gallon	\$7.20		NO BID						N/A	
0002	Sodium Hydroxide Solution (NaOH) 25% w/w	6000	Gallon	\$5.35		NO BID						\$4.75	
0003	ChemStation's Bug Growth Nutrient #8515 or equal	9000	Gallon			\$9.00						\$9.92	
		TOTAL A			\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		CASH DISCOUNT			0		0		0		0		0
Buyer	—	NET AMOUNT DELIVERY			\$0.00 0		\$0.00 0		\$0.00 0		\$0.00 0		\$0.00 0
EM		QUOTE TOTAL			\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00
		AWARD			+		\$0.00						,