Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
Commaodity: 98143 IDate: | 10/15/2024 é—’
& &
JCategory: A24-98130 fRequisition No: | , S-""’ & o;
fGenerator Rental for City of BR & <) 1 L ' Q"‘Q &
O TR L N
iAgency: Building and Grounds Bid Opening: 11/7/2024 c\" t;:}" JR‘G‘ NA is q?
@ N e ————— (=] &
or & 0 4 ( S w
= 2 L&
IF.0.B: Closing Date 3 R ' & ¢
T K o &
K @ & 8
& @ & N
fDelivery Requirements: lPurchase Period: I Q b‘-@ *9 ?JQ. &
3 3 S & 3
. : , - & & 3 3 o
Sealed Bid Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities L4 <) T ) <
TSN TR LTI
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. § DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
20 KW DIESEL POWERED
4 : 400.00
0001 GENERATOR I WK $ 800.00 $ 1,480.00 $ 700.00 $ 653.00 3
20 KW DIESEL POWERED
2 ; 806. 1,200.00
000 GENERATOR 1 MO 3 1,500.00 $ 2,166.67 $ 2,100.00 $ 1,806.00 $ 0
30 KW DIESEL POWERED
0003 'K ! 857.00 567.00
bGENERATOR 1 WK $ 800.00 3 1,720.00 $ 702.00 $ $
30 KW DIESEL POWERED
)04 : 1,700.00
000 GENERATOR 1 MO $ 1,500.00 $ 2,566.67 $ 2,106.00 $ 2,366.00 $
40 KW DIESEL POWERED
L A 7.00
0005 GENERATOR 1 WK $ 800.00 3 2,040.00 $ 918.00 3 918.00 $ 66
40 KW DIESEL POWERED
000 2,530.00 2,000.00
6 lGENERATOR 1 MO $ 1,500.00 $ 3,100.00 $ 2,754.00 $ i $
50 KW DIESEL POWERED :
0007 / ! 1,051.00 No Bid
{GENERATOR 1 WK $ 1,200.00 $  2,340.00 $ 1,112.00 $ o Bi
50 KW DIESEL POWERED i
B
0008 GENERATOR | MO $ 2,400.00 $  3,450.00 $ 3,336.00 $ 2,897.00 No Bid




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS

Jcommodity: 98143 Joate: | 101152024 &
$
fcategory: A24-98130 fRequisition No: | § & @‘:
fGenerator Rental for City of BR & <) @ R l G I NAL ?"S ,5_.?
(3
(Agency: Building and Grounds Bid Opening: 11/7/2024 c\" t‘?’ v {.‘Q‘ q‘}'\
[ L g
o 8 K e ( & g
IFoE: Closing Date IS R - S Sessd & &
g s & )
. . & 2 ¢ S
[Delivery Requirements: JPurchase Period: l Q t';‘" ag? §' Q/q,
O < @
S & $ § J
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T < b4 ) <
e ==

Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Unit Price Amount Unit Price Unit Price

75 KW DIESEL POWERED )
< g 1,499.00 No Bid
0009 1GENERATOR 1 WK $ 1,500.00 $ 3,220.00 $ 1,292.00 3

75 KW DIESEL POWERED i
RA : 4,111.00 No Bid
0010 GENERATOR 1 MO § 2950.00 $ 491667 $ 3,876.00 $ 1

100 KW DIESEL POWERED

/K : 1,591.00 $ 1,200.00
LT vy i WK $  1,750.00 $  3,600.00 $ 1,558.00 $
100 KW DIESEL POWERED
2 4 ; 674, 4,366.0 3,600.00
001 LGENERATOR 1 MO $ 3695.00 $  5400.00 $ 4,674.00 $  4,366.00 $

125 KW DIESEL POWERED ;
795.0 1,400.00
0013 Lries ioinn 1 WK $  2,150.00 $  3760.00 No Bid $ 1,795.00 $

125 KW DIESEL POWERED :
; 4,927.00 4,200.00
0014 GENERATOR 1 MO $  4,150.00 $ 5666.67 No Bid $ $

150 KW DIESEL POWERED
0015 " 4 i 1,720.00 1,877.00 $ 1,600.00
lcENERATOR 1 WK $  2,400.00 $ ,000.00 $ $

150 KW DIESEL POWERED
. 161.00 4,800.00
0016 GENERATOR 1 MO $ 475000 $ 6,066.67 $ 5,160.00 $§ 5161.0 $




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
spos . - ‘J‘
Commodity: 98143 [Date: | 10152024 o &
: ” : 1 N .
Category: A24-98130 [Requisition No: | & '@ Ri G l NAL : é:s' .—f
Generator Rental for City of BR & <) (i i b Y$ &
o {
Agency: Building and Grounds IBid Opening: 11/7/2024 c\" b“y " R s? é\
o & $ & 5
IF.oB: fclosing Date 3 R & ¢
@ < & &
8 @ & )
& @ 2 &
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: I O b{" *9 bQ‘ &
& IS s & d
; & & & o b
Sealed Bid ____ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T @ T ) <z
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
175 KW DIESEL POWERED .
/K ,320. 2,072.00 $ 1,836.00 No Bid
0017 IGENERATOR 1 WK $ 2,600.00 $ 4,320.00 $
175 KW DIESEL POWERED -
i 6,216.00 5,049.00 No Bid
0018 GENERATOR 1 MO $ 4,950.00 $ 6,600.00 $ $
200 KW DIESEL POWERED i
/K : ,106. 1,887.00 No Bid
0019 GENERATOR 1 WK $ 2,750.00 $  4,320.00 $ 2,106.00 $
200 KW DIESEL POWERED .
002 ; 6,600.00 6,318.00 $ 5,192.00 No Bid
0 bGENERATOR 1 MO $  5500.00 $ $
250 KW DIESEL POWERED .
2 < ; A No Bid 2,417.00 $ 2,000.00
0021 | GENERATOR : WK $  3,000.00 $  5400.00 o Bi 5
250 KW DIESEL POWERED ;
2 . ,100. 6,650.00 $ 6,000.00
002 GENERATOR 1 MO $ 6,000.00 $ 8,100.00 No Bid $
300 KW DIESEL POWERED
2 < A 7,001.20 2,818.00 $ 2,530.00 $ 2,500.00
0023 LGENERATOR 1 WK $ 3,500.00 $ 00 $
300 KW DIESEL POWERED
2 - : 8,454.00 $ 6,946.00 $ 7,500.00
0024 } G ENERATOR 1 MO $ 6,950.00 $ 10,768.07 $




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: 98143 JDate: | 1or15/2024 &
A
e rp—— cii\’ &
Category: A24-981 IrRequisiti ' 4 e " & ~
egory 8130 Requisition No l e ~ -‘EG | NAL & o
Generator Rental for City of BR c,” O | g:‘-l s y Te {.?
9 P
Agency: Building and Grounds IBid Opening: 11/7/2024 S S}" S . £ &
o & K & g
jF.0.B: Closing Date 5\ R & 3
T ol o &
Q @ & )
& ¥ g g
Delivery Requirements: fPurchase Period: I (8] g‘” .3 t?. &
S IS & & «
£ & & & i
[Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities T (<) T ) <
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
350 KW DIESEL POWERED . .
002 /K b 7,802.40 No Bid $ 2642.00 No Bid
5 lGENERATOR 1 WK $  4,000.00 $ o Bi
350 KW DIESEL POWERED : :
2 j 102, B 7,252.00 No Bid
0026 GENERATOR 1 MO $ 7.950.00 $ 12,102.80 No Bid $
400 KW DIESEL POWERED : .
; . No Bid 3,866.00 No Bid
0027 | GENERATOR 1 WK $  4.750.00 $ 7.803.60 o Bi $
400 KW DIESEL POWERED ; .
2 : . N 10,628.00 No Bid
0028 lGENERATOR | MO $ 9,500.00 $ 12,104.20 o Bid $
450 KW DIESEL POWERED ; :
s N 3,866.00 No Bid
0029 VGENERATOR 1 WK $ 5,000.00 $ 7,804.80 o Bid $
450 KW DIESEL POWERED ; 2
4 No Bid 10,628.00 No Bid
0030 GENERATOR 1 MO $ 10,000.00 $ 12,105.60 o Bi $
500 KW DIESEL POWERED
; ,560. 3,947.00 3,267.00
0031 LGENERATOR 1 WK $  6,000.00 $ 7,806.00 $ 4,560.00 $ $
500 KW DIESEL POWERED
20 . 107, 13,680.00 10,863.00 $ 9,800.00
003 IGENERATOR 1 MO $ 11,000.00 $ 12,107.00 $ 13,680 $




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: 98143 IDate: | 10/15/2024 é’
Category: A24-98130 fRequisition No: | & e <& >
-~ i) E 3 (%. . []) &
Generator Rental for City of BR & (¢} SARTAS] , NAH: ?@ ,5?
L % ;
IAgency: Building and Grounds §Bid Opening: 11/7/2024 é‘ g:;l T § é“
jF.0.B: IClosing Date 5\ R & @0
o - v
2] ) & )
oé\ & @ N
IDelivery Requirements: JPurchase Period: | (¢ b\"’ L 5 &
S 'S & @ >
& & & Iy o
fSealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T 1G] T ) B
=T YT R AT
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
600 KW DIESEL POWERED . . :
00 /K ; 13,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 GENERATOR 1 WK $  9,000.00 $ o Bi
600 KW DIESEL POWERED ) ) )
: No Bid No Bid No Bid
0034 GENERATOR 1 MO $ 16,000.00 $ 20,200.00 o Bi
700 KW DIESEL POWERED ) . .
5 < ; .600. No Bid No Bid No Bid
0035 GENERATOR 1 WK $ 10,500.00 $ 15,600.00 o Bi i
700 KW DIESEL POWERED : ; . )
3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
0036 LGENERATOR 1 MO $ 18,500.00 $ 24,200.00 o Bi o Bi
800 KW DIESEL POWERED ; ;
i No Bid 8,160.00 No Bid
0037 lGENERATOR 1 WK $ 12,500.00 $ 16,200.00 o Bi $
800 KW DIESEL POWERED : .
! No Bid 22,440.00 No Bid
0038 GENERATOR I MO $ 25,000.00 $ 24,900.00 o Bi $
1000 KW DIESEL POWERED ;
< : ,640.00 §,160.00 No Bid
0039 GENERATOR 1 WK $ 15,000.00 $ 16,800.00 $ 9,640 $
1000 KW DIESEL POWERED ;
; ; ! 28,920.00 22,440.00 No Bid
0040 lGENER.ATOR 1 MO $ 29,000.00 $ 25,600.00 $ 3




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

fCommodity: 98143 [oate: 10/15/2024 \Qc’
& ¢
fCategory: A24-98130 Requisition No: | g " S B 0‘:
Generator Rental for City of BR Q,"’ (¢] K 2 i & &
i e $ 5 JRIGINAL ¥ &
Agency: Building and Grounds IBid Opening: 11/7/2024 c\ S-I A% SN E‘? @
IF.0.B: IClosing Date é:\ K g SQ'
oy T
] ] & -8
§ $ 4 -
jDelivery Requirements: jPurchase Period: I (&) b‘?’ *? ;1' &
S & 5,5’ & g
& & & & %
Sealed Bid __ Price Inquiry__Definite Quantities__ T (<) T ) T
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY | QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Athioinit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1250 KW DIESEL POWERED :
\ 10,755.00 10,200.00 No Bid
0041 bGENERATOR 1 WK $ 18,000.00 $ 22,800.00 $ $
1250 KW DIESEL POWERED .
2 : ,600. ,265. 28,050.00 No Bid
004 GENERATOR 1 MO $ 34,950.00 $ 35,600.00 $ 32,265.00 $
1500 KW DIESEL POWERED i
. 12,300.00 No Bid
0043 GENERATOR 1 WK $ 21,000.00 $ 22,800.00 $ 11,511.00 3
1500 KW DIESEL POWERED :
0044 ; 35,600.00 34,533.00 $ 28,980.00 No Bid
IGENERATOR 1 MO $ 39,500.00 $ 5,60 $
1750 KW DIESEL POWERED s . )
Bid No Bid No Bid
0045 |GENF.RATOR 1 WK $ 24,000.00 $ 32,240.00 No Bi o Bi
1750 KW DIESEL POWERED ; . ;
No Bid No Bid
0046 GENERATOR 1 MO $ 44,000.00 $ 51,333.33 No Bid o Bi
2000 KW DIESEL POWERED .
{ 431. 12,990.00 No Bid
0047 GENERATOR 1 WK $ 28,000.00 $ 32,240.00 $12,431.00 $
2000 KW DIESEL POWERED .
: 37,293.00 29,998.00 No Bid
0048 IGENERATOR 1 MO $ 52,000.00 $ 51,333.33 3 $




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
Commodity: 98143 IDate: I 10115/2024) &
o o
: e o L &
Category: A24-98130 §Requisition No: I £ E ‘).' S109 . & &"
Generator Rental for City of BR & O i ): || j ‘{ aNAEi ?S ..,S-?
(4] -
iAgency: Building and Grounds [Bid Opening: 11/7/2024} (i‘ g h =g ES‘ tz?
L g $ & <
IF.0.B: Closing Date 5\‘ R & gm
@ 5 v
S ) & R
# $ ¢ §
§Delivery Reguirements: fPurchase Period: ] &) b\(? *9 bQ' Qj"
(s} @ @
& & S ¥ @
F = ) = o ) & [*)] < 2
§Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities___ T @ NE )
== T
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
MOBILIZATION AND )
200.00 156.00 No Bid $ 125.00
0049 ¥ EMOBILAION CHARGES : HR 269 ¥ ¥
0050 SITE ASSESSMENT, HOURLY I HR $169.00 $ 105.00 $  156.00 $ 160.00 $0.00
RATE
0051 JTECHNICIAN, HOURLY RATE 1 HR 3 150.00 3 105.00 $ 156.00 $ 160.00 $ 166.00
0052 BELECTRICIAN, HOURLY RATE 1 HR $ 180.00 3 105.00 $ 175.00 No Bid No Bid
0053 JOPERATOR, HOURLY RATE 1 HR $ 150.00 3 105.00 $ 156.00 No Bid No Bid
REFUELING CHARGE, PRICE Cost plus
’ ; 6.00 5.00 $ 9.50
0054 ¥pER GALLON-DIESEL ' R 22 ¥ $ 30%
DETAINMENT CHARGES .
55 ; No Bid 200/hr $  125.00
0055 I{AF'I'ER 4 HOUR DELAY) 1 HR $ 269.00 $ 105.00 o Bi
0056 JCABLE 1 FT $ 1.25 $ 7.50 $ 1.50 12.00/linear ft $ 0.40




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

fcommodity: 98143 IDate: | 10/15/2024 {,9
& &
fiCategory: A24-98130 fRequisition No: I § : —— g." ;:
IGenerator Rental for City of BR @ () AFIIAIRT A & & ol
& AAIRT A [ o
9 @]Z11C AY g N
Agency: Building and Grounds I8id Opening: 11/7/2024 & z;‘}’ )A {ﬂ‘(.?i E N '.-\\\;Lf S §
Z & $ & g
|F.oB: Closing Date 3 R ‘ g &
o X &
éél @ 2 )
o g @ &
IDelivery Requirements: Purchase Period: | (<) z;?.“ &£ bQ' &
S IS gf’ L &
& & & g o
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T (C) < b) T
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
20 KW DIESEL POWERED
< i 2,360.00 700.00 1,306.00 $ 800.00
L NGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 W . Lesldl # ' g ¥
20 KW DIESEL POWERED
1 1 ! 2,100.00 $ 3,610.00 $ 2,400.00
002 FGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! b =G ¥ GRS ®
30 KW DIESEL POWERED
5 . i : 702.00 $ 1,714.00 $ 1,133.00
0059 lGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 WK $ 1,850.00 $  2,840.00 $
30 KW DIESEL POWERED
; 4,433, 2,106.00 $ 4732.00 $ 3,400.00
Gosl GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ] MO $ 383000 s 5 ¢
40 KW DIESEL POWERED
4 ,480.00 918.00 1,836.00 $ 1,333.00
Qubl GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : Wi $ 1:850.00 ¥ 34800 # s
40 KW DIESEL POWERED
; ,500. 2,754.00 $ 5,060.00 $ 4,000.00
0062 lGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 MO $ 3,950.00 $ 5,500.00 $
50 KW DIESEL POWERED .
3 < B ,780. 1,112.00 $ 2,102.00 No Bid
0063 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 WK $ 2,350.00 $ 3,780.00 3
50 KW DIESEL POWERED z
: . 5,850.00 3,336.00 5,794.00 No Bid
0064 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! MO ¥ 485000 $ ¥ ¥




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS

flcommodity: 98143 lDate: | 10/15/2024 \é’
& &
JiCategory: A24-98130 fRequisition No: | §" - 5‘ r;‘:
lGenerator Rental for City of BR & 81" Fal PV ¥ & ol
— o & & URIGINA \J &
Agency: Building and Grounds IBid Opening: 11/712024 C\' b\/ il ' = &? @
& ‘
or @ & -EP ‘?
. 2 3 o &
fF.O.B: IClosing Date < R &
& & X &
Q @ & e
& & & &
Delivery Requirements: JPurchase Period: | O t;f" g bQ' &
<
& IS i & &
3] i > b4
: : = = = & & =] <
Sealed Bid ____ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T <) T 9 <z
L el ===
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

75 KW DIESEL POWERED .
i 1,292.00 2,998.00 No Bid
0065 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 WK $ 2,600.00 $  5,540.00 $ $

75 KW DIESEL POWERED i
M - ,783. 3,876.00 8,222.00 No Bid
0066 }GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE b © e s R s ’

100 KW DIESEL POWERED
0067 X 6,000.00 1,558.00 3,182.00 $ 2,400.00
lGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE I WK ¥ 280000 $ $ 3

100 KW DIESEL POWERED
0 ,400.00 4,674.00 $ 8,732.00 $ 7,200.00
068 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! MO L W el s

125 KW DIESEL POWERED :
] 3,590.00 $ 2,800.00
0069 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 WK $ 3,500.00 $ 6,320.00 No Bid $

125 KW DIESEL POWERED ;
0070 ; 9,933.33 No Bid $ 9,854.00 $ 8,400.00
IGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE I MO ¥ 720000 3 e Bl

150 KW DIESEL POWERED
| ; : 3,774.00 $ 3,200.00
0071 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 WK $  3,950.00 $ 6,800.00 $ 1,720.00 $

150 KW DIESEL POWERED
0072 : 10,733.33 5,160.00 $ 10,322.00 $ 9.600.00
GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : MO $ 92000 ¥ 10 $




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: 98143

Date: 1

10/15/2024}

-

=
§
By

— = "
V4 O <
Category: A24-98130 JRequisition No: | ) _.3" -’_@* : & (,::
Generator Rental for City of BR & <) @R I G I NAL - Y_S &
4 A
Agency: Building and Grounds IBid Opening: 11/7/2024 & g?" 3 &
IF.0.B: Closing Date § '03 & éz’
Le) 2 & 8
& @ ¢ S
§Delivery Requirements: §Purchase Period: I €] b{” q? t?: &
S 'S Q,‘? =2 &
&£ & S5 & d
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities____ ol <) < ) <
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
175 KW DIESEL POWERED :
i 7,440.00 2,072.00 $ 3,672.00 No Bid
0073 WGENERATOR—EMERGENCY USE ! WE. & A0 ’ ' ¥
175 KW DIESEL POWERED -
] 1 .0 6,216.00 $ 10,098.00 No Bid
G GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! MO + 00000 $ H.a0se0 b
200 KW DIESEL POWERED .
5 4 ; ,440. 2,106.00 $ 3,774.00 No Bid
0075 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 WK $ 6,250.00 $ 7.440.00 $
200 KW DIESEL POWERED i
0076 11,850.00 11,800.00 $ 6,318.00 $ 10,384.00 No Bid
IGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : MO y *
250 KW DIESEL POWERED ;
9,000.00 No Bid $ 4,834.00 $ 4,000.00
0077 IGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! WK % 585000 L oF
250 KW DIESEL POWERED .
; No Bid 13,300.00 $ 12,000.00
0078 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 MO $ 13,950.00 $ 14,100.00 o Bi $
300 KW DIESEL POWERED
/K ; .901.2 2,818.00 $ 5,060.00 $ 5,000.00
ROwR GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ] Wk ¥ B0 ¥ SR ¥
300 KW DIESEL POWERED
1 J 15,601.40 8,454.00 $ 13,892.00 $ 15,000.00
Yose GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE L MO $ 693000 ¥ i




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

fcommodity: 98143 Date: | 10/15/2024 \c.‘-"
, & &
Jcategory: A24-98130 Requisition No: | . § g & ‘;:
|
kGenerator Rental for City of BR gqf’ <) : V‘S .‘g?
., ~7/ = = 7
A . Buildi i ing: & ~ £y L < Iy
gency: Building and Grounds Bid Opening 11/7/2024 q,c\ P ,:3 i ggGI NA ob' coo
C g $ e S S
F.0.B: Closing Date ,§’ R @ SQ’
N T
] ) & L
r.'.>éN g ¢ S
IDelivery Requirements: NPurchase Period: l &) S’? 4.9 t?. &
& IS & &£ g
G v & L
= = . . 7= ) s (=3 ‘3 .b
Sealed Bid ____ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities hd <) X
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
350 KW DIESEL POWERED : :
00 L WK ,950. 11,402.40 No Bid $ 5284.00 No Bid
81 |GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : e s ¢
350 KW DIESEL POWERED ’ o
- 19,500.00 18,102.80 No Bid $ 14,504.00 No Bid
aps2 WGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ] MO s ! ¥
400 KW DIESEL POWERED . i
1 } ,803.60 No Bid $ 7,732.00 No Bid
Ol GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : WK $ 12,000.00 S
400 KW DIESEL POWERED ; i
0 : 22,104.20 No Eid $ 21,256.00 No Bid
Uad IGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! MO ¥ 23,950.00 $
450 KW DIESEL POWERED ; :
00 WK 13,950.00 13,804.80 No Bid $ 7,732.00 No Bid
83 TGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : ¥ $
450 KW DIESEL POWERED 2 3
: 22,105.60 No Bid $ 21,256.00 No Bid
0086 § GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : i ¥ R0 W e ==
500 KW DIESEL POWERED
/ 17,000.00 13,806.00 $ 4,560.00 $ 7,894.00 $ 6,533.00
g7 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ] WE $ ' $
500 KW DIESEL POWERED
00 ,000.00 22,107.00 13,680.00 $ 21,726.00 $ 19,600.00
a8 IGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! MO i $ ¥




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Icommodity: 08143 [Date: | 10/15/2024 \é’
> o
m— o 3 £ £
Category: A24-98130 IReguisition No: I £ & o
: PA — " & & @
IGenerator Rental for City of BR -oq, \(,_; AR A AL T é\o
iAgency: Building and Grounds IBid Opening: 11/7/2024 c\.‘ b\l y } ::’{ H L& l N :‘S qf‘
i (,f’ f B 5. 5 : é‘: &
F.0.B: Closing Date & R & $0
] et g
Q ) & -8
5? g & S
Delivery Requirements: Purchase Period: | 4] Sf.’-’ 5}9 bQ- Q‘I{l
(o] & @
$ 3 & § 4
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T <) k4 9 <
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF o
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
600 KW DIESEL POWERED 3 : ; ;
< 24,000.00 21,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
aies GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! L ’ ¥
600 KW DIESEL POWERED : ; -
47,500.01 34,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
a0 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : L $ 2
700 KW DIESEL POWERED . : :
< 7 - 25,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
009l JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE I fads 3 ZSenna
700 KW DIESEL POWERED . . ;
2 .00 40,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
- GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! MO ¥ Sh0ue
800 KW DIESEL POWERED - i
.00 25,800.00 No Bid $ 16,320.00 No Bid
0093 L(}F.NERATOR-EMERGENCY USE I Wi ¥ 28500 il
800 KW DIESEL POWERED . :
f 40,900.00 No Bid $ 44,880.00 No Bid
0094 | GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE ! MO » 3180000
1000 KW DIESEL POWERED i
5 000.0 28,800.00 $ 9,640.00 $ 16,320.00 No Bid
L GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE . WK ¥ R0
1000 KW DIESEL POWERED i
57,500.00 45,600.00 $ 28,920.00 $ 44 ,880.00 No Bid
Ll IGENERATOR-EMIZRGF.NCY USE : MO $




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS

fcommodity: 98143 Date: I 101512024 &
& &
Category: A24-98130 Requisition No: | . §’ & @‘:
Generator Rental for City of BR 0{? <] T - 13 V§ .éb
" ~ sy -
Agency: Building and Grounds iBid Opening: 11/7/2024 é‘ gl i )hﬂf d i@ g NAL i,? q’?
or & _é' e @_-o &';o
F.0.B: Closing Date é\ R o 6-9
U X o
Q ) & R
c';‘e @ @ S
fDelivery Requirements: fPurchase Period: I O g‘f‘.’ 4? bQ. &
S S Q‘? & nd
4 v > h-d
p ; " 2 i < s O & Y
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T [©] . >
D T, i s
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

5 s
0097 1250 KW DIESEL POWERED | WK $  31.500.00 $  40.800.00 $ 10,755.00 $ 20,400.00 No Bid

fGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE

1250 KW DIESEL POWERED i
i 65,600.00 32,265.00 $ 56,100.00 No Bid
0098 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : S o SR ¥ ‘ ¥

1500 KW DIESEL POWERED i
K : 59,656.80 $ 11,511.00 $ 24,600.00 No Bid
e GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : W ¥ BeE00 5

1500 KW DIESEL POWERED i
75,000.00 §7,028.00 $ 34,533.00 $ 57,960.00 No Bid
o fGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 M0 e ¥

1750 KW DIESEL POWERED . . :
J 656.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
0101 GENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 WK $ 37,500.00 $ 59, o Bi

1750 KW DIESEL POWERED _ , .
2 ,950. 97,028.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
0102 § - - NERATOR-EMERGENCY USE l B0 3 Sae000 $

2000 KW DIESEL POWERED i
: ,000. 59,656.80 $12,431.00 $ 25,980.00 No Bid
e JGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE 1 W 3 400000 *

2000 KW DIESEL POWERED _
0104 79,500.00 97,028.00 $ 37,293.00 $ 59,896.00 No Bid
oA IGENERATOR-EMERGENCY USE : L TR0 3




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
Jcommodity: 98143 Joate: I 1011512024 é-v
A4 (;@\‘i é}
§Category: A24-98130 fRequisition No: I : _g" T q}‘* N
o
‘Generator Rental for City of BR 2 o } & @
= e & 3 ORIGINAL \ S
iAgency: Building and Grounds IBid Opening: 11/7/2024 N ~ i = =l ig 5
53 o & o @
Ry < &
IF.0.B: Closing Date I3 R & g
o L o &
R d & K
.;5 & @ N
jDelivery Requirements: Purchase Period:l (&) b-{') £ bQ— ‘o(}
& IS S & &
g & & g o
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T <) < ) <
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

LINES 105-128 ARE FOR STANDBY PRICING RATES TO RESERVE GENERATORS, FOR PRE-PLANNING PURPOSES IN THE EVENT OF AN EMERGENCY, FOR A FOUR (4) MONTH PERIOD THAT WILL BEGIN AUGUST 1 OF CONTRACT
CALENDAR YEAR AND WILL END NOVEMBER 30 OF CONTRACT CALENDAR YEAR. THERE IS NO GUARANTEE THAT THE LINES WILL BE USED, AS IT WILL BE THE DISCRETION OF THE USING AGENCY TO DECIDE THEIR INTENT
OF UTILIZING THE FOLLOWING LINES; IF ALLOWED WITHIN THEIR ANNUAL BUDGET

Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. § DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

20 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
105§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 1 MO $ 1,000.00 $ 134167 $ 2,100.00 $ 1,806.00 $  900.00
—NOVEMBER )

30 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
lUéTSTANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 1,000.00 $ 1,666.67 $ 2,106.00 $ 2,366.00 $ 1,190.00
| NOVEMBER )

40 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
1078STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 1,000.00 $ 2,100.00 $ 2,754.00 $ 2,530.00 $ 1,400.00
—-NOVEMBER )

50 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
108§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 1,200.00 $ 2,175.00 $ 3,336.00 $ 2,897.00 No Bid

—-NOVEMBER)

75 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
1098STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $  1,400.00 $ 3,366.67 $ 3,876.00 $ 4,111.00 No Bid
—-NOVEMBER )

100 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
I 10§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 1,750.00 $ 3,550.00 $ 4,674.00 $ 4,366.00 $ 2,700.00

—FNOVEMBER )

125 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
111§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $  2,000.00 $ 3,766.67 No Bid $ 4,927.00 $ 3,200.00

—-NOVEMBER )




Summary of Quotations

NAMES OF VENDORS

Commodity: 98143

Date:

10/15/2024

Category: A24-98130

Requisition No: l

Generator Rental for City of BR

|Agency: Building and Grounds

Bid Opening:

11/7/2024

or

jF.0.B:

Closing Date

Delivery Requirements:

jPurchase Period: I

Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities____
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150 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
112§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST
—NOVEMBER )

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

ESTIMATED
QUANTITY

UNIT OF

MEASURE Unit Price

MO $ 2,150.00

Amount

$

Unit Price

4,091.67

Amount

Unit Price

$ 5,160.00

Amount

Unit Price Amount

$ 5,161.00

Unit Price

$ 3,360.00

Amount

175 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
113]STANDBY RATE (AUGUST
—-NOVEMBER )

MO $ 2850.00

4,525.00

$ 6,216.00

$ 5,049.00

No Bid

200 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
114|STANDBY RATE (AUGUST
L NOVEMBER )

MO $  3,200.00

4,525.00

$ 6,318.00

$ 5,192.00

No Bid

250 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
115)STANDBY RATE (AUGUST
—-NOVEMBER )

MO $ 3,400.00

5,325.00

No Bid

$ 6,650.00

$ 4,200.00

300 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
1168STANDBY RATE (AUGUST
-NOVEMBER )

MO $  4,500.00

7,491.97

$ 8,454.00

$ 6,946.00

$ 5,250.00

350 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
117§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST
—NOVEMBER )

MO $  4,750.00

8.575.60

No Bid

$ 7.252.00

No Bid

400 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
118§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST
—-NOVEMBER )

MO $  6,000.00

8,575.90

No Bid

$ 10,628.00

No Bid

450 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
1 IQFTANDBY RATE (AUGUST

NOVEMBER )

MO $ 7.250.00

8,676.20

No Bid

$ 10,628.00

No Bid




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
Icommodity: 98143 IDate: | 10/15/2024 \é—:
o o
fCategory: isiti ; & R I
gory: A24-98130 §Requisition No: l & § <
Generator Rental for City of BR q? O Wl El E\\ A ?45" 62?
: - o ~ wile "_\' N
Agency: Building and Grounds [Bid Opening: 11/712024 ci‘ bv ) AL U— § qt’:\
or foo’ 5 T =) %]
S 3 &
fF.0.B: fClosing Date 5\‘ R ) @
@ > > &£
& 5 g £
N <@
fDelivery Requirements: §Purchase Period: I oo s{,’-’ ~t9 §- Q/o.
& S s £ &
N & S g v
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities__ < () T < <
==
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. | DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

500 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
STANDBY RATE (AUGUST - MO $ 8,750.00 $ 8576.50 $ 13,680.00 $ 10,863.00 $ 9,000.00
—-NOVEMBER )

120)

600 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
12ISTANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 9,750.00 $ 13,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
—-NOVEMBER )

700 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
122lSTANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 11,000.00 $ 17,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
L NOVEMBER )

800 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
1238STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 13,500.00 $ 17,300.00 No Bid $ 22,440.00 No Bid
| NOVEMBER )

1000 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
1248STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 16,500.00 $ 17,450.00 $ 28,920.00 $ 22,440.00 No Bid
—-NOVEMBER )

1250 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
1258STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 20,000.00 $ 25575.00 $ 32,265.00 $ 28,050.00 No Bid
—-NOVEMBER )

1500 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
126§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 25,000.00 $ 25575.00 $ 34,533.00 $ 28,980.00 No Bid
—-NOVEMBER )

1750 KW DIESEL GENERATOR -
127§STANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $ 27,500.00 $ 38,358.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid
—-NOVEMBER )




Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
fcommodity: 98143 IDate: | 10/15/2024 &
=
& 5)\.‘ 2

[category: A24-98130 JRequisition No: | S : q;; £
IGenerator Rental for City of BR gf’ O \ | v{? g,‘?

[Agency: Building and Grounds IBid Cpening: I 11/7/2024 e‘ 7 - /M <& €

I ] kb O:V O)Q
or < & N &
IF.0B: IciosingDate | IS -2 ) &
$ & & §
: . _ & 3 & 3§
§Delivery Requirements: jPurchase Period: I O & 49 bQ' Q/G
& & & 2 &
g & & & \
Sealed Bid ___ Price Inquiry___Definite Quantities___ T [<) T ) <>
S ST
Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
2000 KW DIESEL GENERATOR —
128JSTANDBY RATE (AUGUST 4 MO $§ 30,000.00 $ 38,358.33 $ 37,293.00 $ 29,998.00 No Bid
NOVEMBER )

In the event of a declared emergency, we reserved the right to establish reasonable rerouting and detainment rates using the lowest rerouting bidder and detainment rates of the responsive bidders as a benchmark. Additional delivery charges if
applicable: Please specify below your applicable delivery related charges as may apply to this contract. Failure to supply applicable charges below will indicate vendor is supplying the service/commodity at no additional charge ($0.00) to the City
Parish. If your delivery is unreasonable delayed in loading or unloading at delivery destination, beyond four (4) hours, specify the separate hourly delivery detainment charge assessed

Item ESTIMATED UNIT OF
No. § DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY MEASURE Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
Delivery detainment charge. per ;
2 - 1 HR 269.00 250.0
|hour. beyond a four(4) hour delay $ 0 No Bid 200/hr $ 125.00
rT I!I SCD
130|Delivery rerouting charge 1 FLAT FEE 7.00 250.00 No Bid determined $ 100.00
I ) _ - B
131fDelivery rerouting charge 1 MILE 7.00 $ 5.00 No Bid determined No charge
ﬁ i
TOTAL AMOUNT
JCASH AMOUNT
INET AMOUNT
IDELIVERY
AWARD

NOTES:




