SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS VENDORS
Commodity:
A24-0633-2 3 o
EMS MEDICAL SUPPIIES (Category 20 80) LCL//) é;“ i
Category: File No: E 5 O 5
46583 24-000633 & Z< g
Repair Kits, Hospital & Medical Equipment QD {—' 2 \E/) 7
Bid Opening or 5 .étu g Li/< .&,E
Agency: Closing Date: < & 8 z 5
EMS 11/19/24 5 S & q ~
Sealed Bid _X Price Inquiry ___ Definite Quantities §U N I §
CATEGORY “20” LINENS — ITEMS 20-01 — 20-06 ESTIMATED | UNIT OF TOTAL TOTAL UNIT | TOTAL | UNIT TOTAL
QUANTITY | MEASURE |UNITPRICEL o JUNITPRICEL opice PRICE PRICE | PRICE PRICE
Fitted, White, heavy-duty sheet, 36”°x90” SUPER-G™ Fitted Sheet for Stryker
XPS stretcher. Custom fit to unique XPS stretcher mattress design, fluid
resistant, elastic fitted design, assist in aid of transfer of patient up to 450
20-01]pounds, protects mattress and patient from cross contamination MUST BE 40,000 EACH $3.59 $2.45 $2.37
COMPATIBLE WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT, STRYKER POWER PRO XT
STRETCHER WITH HARNESS RESTRAINT BRAND: Taylor Healthcare
Rrodicic £ 00.SLIDER.C
Patient privacy flat sheet. 55gsm non-woven spun bond polypropylene.
20-02 Dimensions: 40” X 84”, dark blue. BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Products #90- 20,000 EACH $1.16 $0.87 $1.15
Pillow, small, 30gsm non-woven shell: 100% polyester fiberfill; non-
20-03 allergenic. 14” X 16”, white material, white fiberfill. 500 EACH $2.12 $2.15 $2.12
20-04]Pillow case, 30gsm, non-woven spun bond polypropylene. 17” X 25” white 350 EACH $17.37 $0.22 $0.44
Blanket, Yellow, Disposable 60” X 90, impervious to fluids, 1.5 mil poly
20-05](yellow side) with 40gsm PPE (polypropylene non-woven (white side). 5,000 EACH $5.09 $3.40 $2.12
BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Product #90-YEB6090.
Blanket, Navy Blue Polar Fleece, 2 sides brushed, one sided anti-pilling with
20-06]3 stitch edges 60” X 80”, 200gsm BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Product #60- 2,000 EACH $5.09 $4.40 $5.98
NFB6080
20-07]Discount offered for pick-up at vendor’s location 1 EACH 0 PERCENT 0 PERCENT 0%
Total for Category "20"
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CATEGORY “50” EZ-IO NEEDLES & ACCESSORIES - ITEMS 50-01 — 50-06 QUANTITY | MEASURE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE priCE | PRICE PRICE
ARROW EZ-10 15mm, 15ga Intraosseous Needle, 3-39kg, w/EZ-Connect
Extension set, EZ-IO Wristband and NeedleVISE 1-Port Sharps Block, box of NO
50-01]5 REF #: 9018-VC-005 NSN #: 6515-01-537-9808 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO 200 EACH NO BID CHARGE $110.00
COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT:
ARROW®EZ-I0® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM
ARROW EZ-10 25mm, 15ga Intraosseous Needle, 3kg & over, w/EZ-Connect
Extension set, EZ-IO Wristband and NeedleVISE 1-Port Sharps Block, box of NO
50-02]5 REF #: 9001-VC-005 NSN #: 6515-01-537-9007 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO 500 EACH NO BID CHARGE $110.00
COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT:
ARROW®EZ-10® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM
ARROW EZ-10 45mm, 15ga Intraosseous Needle, 40kg & over, w/EZ-Connect
Extension set, EZ-IO Wristband and NeedleVISE 1-Port Sharps Block, box of NO
50-03|5 REF #: 9079-VC-005 NSN #: 6515-01-577-0312 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO 400 EACH $188.11 CHARGE $110.00
COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOQOUS EQUIPMENT:
ARROWREZ-10® INTRAQSSFQUS VASCUI AR ACCEFSS SYSTEM
ARROW EZ-10 Stabilizer, box of 5 REF #: 9066 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO NO
50-04]COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: 1,000 EACH NO BID CHARGE $10.00
ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM
ARROW EZ-IO Vascular Access Power Driver REF #: 9058 NSN #: 6515-01-
590-8589 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT NO
50-05 EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: ARROW®EZ-10® 10 EACH NO BID CHARGE $150.00
INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM
ARROW EZ-IO Power Driver Hard-Sided Carrying Case NO SUBSTITUTIONS NO
50-06]DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS 10 EACH NO BID CHARGE $18.95
EQUIPMENT: ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS
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CATEGORY “20” LINENS — ITEMS 20-01 - 20-06 ESTIMATED | UNIT OF
QUANTITY MEASURE UNIT PRICE -II;OR-II?IIE_ UNIT PRICE -II;OR-II?IIE_
Fitted, White, heavy-duty sheet, 36”x90” SUPER-G™ Fitted Sheet for Stryker
XPS stretcher. Custom fit to unique XPS stretcher mattress design, fluid
resistant, elastic fitted design, assist in aid of transfer of patient up to 450
20-01]pounds, protects mattress and patient from cross contamination MUST BE 40,000 EACH $0.90 $1.72
COMPATIBLE WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT, STRYKER POWER PRO XT
STRETCHER WITH HARNESS RESTRAINT BRAND: Taylor Healthcare
Rrodicic 200 CLIDEDR (G
Patient privacy flat sheet. 55gsm non-woven spun bond polypropylene.
20-02 Dimensions: 40” X 84”, dark blue. BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Products #90- 20,000 EACH $0.60 $0.86
Pillow, small, 30gsm non-woven shell: 100% polyester fiberfill; non-
20-03 allergenic. 14” X 16”, white material, white fiberfill. 500 EACH $1.37 $0.74
20-04]Pillow case, 30gsm, non-woven spun bond polypropylene. 17” X 25” white 350 EACH $0.20 $0.17
Blanket, Yellow, Disposable 60” X 90”, impervious to fluids, 1.5 mil poly
20-05](yellow side) with 40gsm PPE (polypropylene non-woven (white side). 5,000 EACH $4.70 $4.04
BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Product #90-YEB6090.
Blanket, Navy Blue Polar Fleece, 2 sides brushed, one sided anti-pilling with
20-06]3 stitch edges 60” X 80”, 200gsm BRAND: Taylor Healthcare Product #60- 2,000 EACH $2.83 $4.24
NFB6080
20-07]Discount offered for pick-up at vendor’s location 1 EACH 0 PERCENT 0 PERCENT
Total for Category "20"
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CATEGORY “50” EZ-IO NEEDLES & ACCESSORIES - ITEMS 50-01 — 50-06 QUANTITY | MEASURE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
ARROW EZ-10 15mm, 15ga Intraosseous Needle, 3-39kg, w/EZ-Connect
Extension set, EZ-IO Wristband and NeedleVISE 1-Port Sharps Block, box of
50-01]5 REF #: 9018-VC-005 NSN #: 6515-01-537-9808 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO 200 EACH $120.00
COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT:
ARROW®EZ-I0® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM
ARROW EZ-10 25mm, 15ga Intraosseous Needle, 3kg & over, w/EZ-Connect
Extension set, EZ-IO Wristband and NeedleVISE 1-Port Sharps Block, box of
50-02]5 REF #: 9001-VC-005 NSN #: 6515-01-537-9007 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO 500 EACH $120.00
COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT:
ARROW®EZ-I0® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM
ARROW EZ-10 45mm, 15ga Intraosseous Needle, 40kg & over, w/EZ-Connect
Extension set, EZ-IO Wristband and NeedleVISE 1-Port Sharps Block, box of
50-03]5 REF #: 9079-VC-005 NSN #: 6515-01-577-0312 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO 400 EACH $120.00
COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT:
ARROWREZ-1I0® INTRAQSSFQUS VASCUI AR ACCFSS SYSTEM
ITEM
INCLUDED
ARROW EZ-10 Stabilizer, box of 5 REF #: 9066 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO WITH THE
50-04]COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: 1,000 EACH OFFERED
ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM BD 10
NEEDLE
KITS
ARROW EZ-IO Vascular Access Power Driver REF #: 9058 NSN #: 6515-01-
590-8589 NO SUBSTITUTIONS DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT
50-05 EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS EQUIPMENT: ARROW®EZ-10® 10 EACH $654.89
INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS SYSTEM
ARROW EZ-IO Power Driver Hard-Sided Carrying Case NO SUBSTITUTIONS
50-06]DUE TO COMPABILITY WITH CURRENT EQUIPMENT INTRAOSSEOUS 10 EACH $60.74
EQUIPMENT: ARROW®EZ-IO® INTRAOSSEOUS VASCULAR ACCESS
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