A B C D G | H [ | J [ k] Mo N
2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 T
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks o §
. — kY R
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A 9 %)
6 : ' 3 3 s o &
Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% rzro & S
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\43) L o$$<(9
)
8 < g s & v
L O 2 A
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 9 S
o 9 NS N
10 $ & & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 < 5 ~ (gJ @)
& S & QP
12 ~ 04)27 S _\(_) AN
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ § O g QQ’
em ONIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
15 RECTANGLE #1
12” X 18”
0001 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 450 EACH | $ 5.05 $ 5.16 $ 4.67 NO BID
16
12” X 36”
0002 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 750 EACH | $ 9.49 $ 1032 $ 8.98 NO BID
17
12” X 24”
0003 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | $ 5.67 $ 6.88 $ 5.98 NO BID
18
24” X 30”
0004 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1,000 EACH |$ 1457 $ 17.20 $  14.98 NO BID
19
24” X 36”
0005 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH |$ 1811 $ 2064 $ 17.96 NO BID
20
24” X 48”
0006 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 500 EACH |$ 2280 $ 2752 $ 2396 NO BID
21
24” X 54”
0007 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 2550 $  30.96 $ 2698 NO BID
22
24” X 60”
0008 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 2825 $ 3440 $ 2094 NO BID
23
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2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 Z
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks o §
. — Y R
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A 9 %)
6 : ' 3 3 s o &
Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% rzro & S
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\zg) S o$$<(9
o
8 < g s & v
: Q O 2 A
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 9 S
Q 4 NS N
10 $ & & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 < 5 ~ (gJ @)
& S & QP
12 ~ 04)27 S _\(_) AN
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ § O g QQ’
em ONIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
30” X 36”
0009 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 2242 $ 2580 $ 2246 NO BID
24
18” X 6!1
0010 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH | $ 2.53 $ 2.58 $ 3.09 NO BID
25
12” X 6!!
0011 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH | $ 1.80 $ 1.72 $ 2.28 NO BID
26
48” X 96”
0012 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 10 EACH | $ 109.46 $ 141.44 $ 130.97 NO BID
27
24” X 66”
0013 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 5 EACH |$ 3099 $ 3784 $ 5014 NO BID
28
24” X 78”
0014 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 5 EACH |$ 3647 $ 4472 $ 59.28 NO BID
29
24” X 84”
0015 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 5 EACH | $ 39.21 $  48.16 $ 6381 NO BID
30
24” X 102”
0016 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 5 EACH |$ 4744 $ 5848 $ 7752 NO BID
31

32
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2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 T
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks o §
- — kY 3
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A 9 %)
6 : ' 3 3 s o &
Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% rzro & S
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\zg) S o$$<(9
o
8 < g s & v
Q O o A
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 9 S
QO 9 NS N
10 $ & & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 < 5 ~ (gJ @)
& N § G &
12 N & £ O
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ § o(o g QQ’
em ONIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
24” X 18”
0017 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID $ 1032 $ 8.98 NO BID
33 500 EACH | s 8.50
48” X 24”
0018 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID $ 2752 $  23.96 NO BID
34 200 EACH |$ 2280
48” X 30”
0019 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID $ 3440 $ 3744 NO BID
35 100 EACH |$ 3480
60” X 30”
0020 | STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID $  43.00 $  46.79 NO BID
36 200 EACH |$ 4431
37 RECTANGLE #3, FLAT
24” X 9”
0021 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | $ 6.01 $ 6.63 $ 5.63 NO BID
38
30” X 9!!
0022 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | s 7.66 $ 8.29 $ 7.02 NO BID
39
36!! X 9!!
0023 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 300 EACH | $ 9.10 $ 9.95 $ 8.42 NO BID
40
42” X 9”
0024 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 1168 $ 1158 $ 9.84 NO BID
41




A B C D G H [ | J [ k] L Mo N
2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 T
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks o §
- — kY 3
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A 9 %)
: < 9] 9 o
6 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% rzro @ \%
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\zg) S o$$<(9
o
8 < g s & v
Q O o A
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 9 S
QO 9 NS N
10 $ & & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 < 5 ~ (gJ @)
& S & QP
12 ~ 04)27 S _\(_) AN
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ § O g QQ’
em ONIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
48” X 9”
0025 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 1252 $ 1326 $ 1123 NO BID
42
54” X 9”
0026 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 1462 $  14.90 $  13.09 NO BID
43
60” X 9”
0027 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 16.09 $ 16.58 $ 1457 NO BID
44
24” X 12”
0028 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH | $ 7.02 $ 8.84 $ 7.76 NO BID
45
30” X12”
0029 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH | $ 8.98 $  11.05 $ 9.70 NO BID
46
42” X 12”
0030 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH |$ 1325 $ 1547 $ 1359 NO BID
47
487X 12”
0031 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 1444 $ 17.68 $  14.98 NO BID
48
60” X 12”
0032 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 1834 $ 2210 $ 2010 NO BID
49
66” X 12”
0033 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 2003 $ 2431 $ 2365 NO BID
50
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2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 Z
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks o §
- — kY 3
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A 9 %)
6 : ' 3 3 s o &
Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% rzro & S
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\43) L o$$<(9
@]
8 < g s & v
Q O o A
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 9 S
Q 4 NS N
10 $ & & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 < 5 ~ (gJ @)
& N § G &
12 N & £ O
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ § o(o g QQ’
em ONIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
72” X 12”
0034 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 2173 $ 2652 $ 2330 NO BID
51
78” X 12”
0035 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 2343 $ 2873 $ 26.15 NO BID
52
84” X 12”
0036 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 2512 $ 3094 $ 2817 NO BID
53
36" X 12”
0037 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 1065 $ 13.26 $ 1207 NO BID
54
42” X 18”
0038 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 18.86 $ 2321 $ 2074 NO BID
55
48” X 18”
0039 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 21.23 $ 2652 $ 22.46 NO BID
56
54” X 18”
0040 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH | $ 24.01 $ 29.84 $ 26.69 NO BID
57
60” X 18”
0041 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | $ 26.58 $ 33.15 $ 28.09 NO BID
58
66” X 18”
0042 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | $ 29.16 $ 36.47 $ 30.87 NO BID
59
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2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 Z
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks o §
. — kY R
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A 9 %)
6 : ' 3 3 s o &
Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% rzro & S
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\zg) S o$$<(9
(@)
8 < g s & v
: ) o P A
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 9 S
Q 4 NS N
10 $ & & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 < = ~ 9 O
12 N S 8 O3
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ § o(o g QQ’
em ONIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
72”7 X 18”
0043 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 31.73 $ 30.78 $ 33.60 NO BID
60
84”7 X 18”
0044 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | $ 36.89 $ 46.41 $ 39.32 NO BID
61
96” X 18”
0045 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 42.04 $ 53.04 $ 44.92 NO BID
62
102” X 18”
0046 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | $ 4461 $ 56.36 $ 47.73 NO BID
63
108” X 18”
0047 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | $ 47.19 $ 59.67 $ 50.54 NO BID
64
114” X 18”
0048 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | $ 49.76 $ 62.99 $ 53.33 NO BID
65
120” X 18”
0049 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | $ 52.34 $ 66.30 $ 56.15 NO BID
66
67 STREET NAME BLANKS, FLAT .100
24” X 6”
0050 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH | $ 4.01 $ 4.42 $ 4211 NO BID
68




A B C D G H [ J [ K L Mo N
2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 Z
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks o §
- — kY 3
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A 9 %)
6 : ' 3 3 s o &
Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% rzro & S
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\zg) S o$$<(9
@]
8 < g s & v
Q O o A
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 9 S
Q 4 NS N
10 $ & & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 < 5 ~ (gJ @)
& N § G &
12 N & £ O
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ § o(o g QQ’
em ONIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
30” X 6”
0051 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH | 3 5.11 $ 5.53 $  43.89 NO BID
69
36!! X 6!!
0052 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH | $ 6.07 $ 6.63 $ 5267 NO BID
70
42” X 6”
0053 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH | $ 8.16 $ 7.74 $ 7340 NO BID
71
48” X 6”
0054 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH | $ 8.64 $ 8.84 $  69.97 NO BID
72
54” X 6”
0055 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH |$ 1010 $ 9.95 $ 9445 NO BID
73
60” X 6!!
0056 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH |$ 1107 $  11.05 $ 104.98 NO BID
74
75
18” X 18”
0057 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 300 EACH | $ 6.68 $ 7.74 $ 6.73 NO BID
76
24” X 24”
0058 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 300 EACH |$ 11.33 $ 1376 $ 11.98 NO BID
77
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2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 T
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks o §
. — Y R
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A 9 %)
6 : i S ¢ $ o &
Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% rzro & S
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\zg) S o$$<(9
)
8 < g s & v
Q O o A
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 9 S
QO 9 NS N
10 $ & & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 < 5 ~ (gJ @)
& S & QP
12 ~ 04)27 S _\(_) AN
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ § O g QQ’
em ONIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
30” X 30”
0059 STATE BRAND AND MODEL EID 300 EACH |$ 1821 $ 2150 $ 1871 NO BID
78
36” X 36”
0060 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 2673 $ 3096 $  26.96 NO BID
79
48” X 48”
0061 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 10 EACH |$ 55.16 $ 7072 $ 6437 NO BID
80
81
18” X 18”
0062 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH | $ 6.68 $ 7.74 $ 6.83 NO BID
82
24” X 24”
0063 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 11.33 $ 1376 $ 1216 NO BID
83
30” X 30”
0064 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH |$ 1821 $ 2150 $ 1871 NO BID
84
36” X 36”
0065 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH |$ 3177 $ 3078 $ 3771 NO BID
85
48” X 48”
0066 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH |$ 5516 $ 7072 $ 67.05 NO BID
86
87 OCTAGON
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2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 Z
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks | & &
) — 9 NS
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A %(’-’ o %) O
6 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% (Ub(o @ \%
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\(Z) S \)Y%QO
8 \g 3 \%o o> %f
Q O 2 9Q
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 2]
Q & NS N Q/%
10 < < & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 $ 5 o (gJ @)
12 O & 3 &
- - - — — S’ 2) $ X &
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ AN O N Q
em ONIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
30” X 30”
0067 STATE BRAND AND MODEL EID 1,000 EACH |$ 1784 $ 2064 $ 1781 NO BID
88
24” X 24”
0068 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 1110 $  12.90 $ 1140 NO BID
89
36” X 36”
0069 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 300 EACH |$ 3077 $ 3801 $ 3205 NO BID
90
91 TRIANGLE
30”7 X 30” X 30”
0070 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 200 EACH | s 9.53 $ 1075 $  10.65 NO BID
92
36” X 36” X 36”
0071 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH |s 1574 $ 19.89 $ 1883 NO BID
93
94 27.9
36” DIAMETER
0072 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 50 EACH |$ 26.05 $ 3096 $  27.95 NO BID
95
96
36” X 36”
31.49 39.78 32.36 NO BID
0073 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 100 EACH |9 $ $
97
98 INTERSTATE SHIELD
24” X 24”
11.51 13.76 NO BID NO BID
99 0074 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 10 EACH |9 $
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2 Summary of Quotations NAMES OF VENDORS
3 . . Date: 3/24/2025 Z
" A25 — 0617 Aluminum Sign Blanks |~ & §
_ — Y R
5 Commodity: 80109 Requisition No: N/A 9 %)
: < 9] 9 o
6 Category: Blanks, Sign Metal OV' \% rzro @ s
7 Agency: Traffic Engineering Bid Opening: 4/14/2025 S)\’ /\zgj S o$$<o
@]
8 Q7V' OV' N O)O’ 7%
. 9 A
9 F.0.B: Q O ~ 9 S
o ? NS Yo
10 $ & & S
11 Delivery Requirements: YES Purchase Period: 5 < = ~ 9 O
¥ N & G &
12 ~ 04)27 S _\(_) AN
13 Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry___ Definite Quantities____ § O §' QQ’
em UNIT OF
14 ] No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY JMEASURJUnIt Pric Amount JUnit Price} Amount JUnit Pricej Amount JUnit Pricej Amount
30” X 24”
14. 17.2 NO BID NO BID
100 0075 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 10 EACH |8 1463 $ 0 © ©
101 U-CHANNEL SIGN POST
POST, SEVEN (7) FOOT
NUCOR 7’- 2# GALVANIZED
0083 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 400 EACH | $ 18.20 $ 19.95 NO BID $ 19.99
102
POST, TEN (10) FOOT NUCOR 10’-2#
GALVANIZED
0084 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1,500 EACH | $ 26.00 $ 25.98 NO BID $ 26.79
103
POST TWELVE (12) FOOT
NUCOR12’ — 2# GALVENIZED
0085 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 300 EACH | $ 31.20 $ 35.01 NO BID $ 32.90
104
POST FOURTEEN (14) FOOT
NUCOR 14-2# GALVENIZED
0086 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 1 EACH $ 36.40 $ 39.85 NO BID $ 39.15
105
STREET NAME POST, 2 3/8”X 10’ TRINITY
10’ -2 3/8 16 GAUGE
0087 STATE BRAND AND MODEL BID 600 EACH |$ 3221 $ 52.95 NO BID $ 19.93
106
107|Vendors TOTAL AMOUNT $ - $ - $ - $
108|Advertise ( ) Bid Bond () Ins () lcASH DISCOUNT
109|Special Conditions NET AMOUNT $ - $ - $ - $
110 Buyer\ Date DELIVERY




