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Remoa Tri
ABAMECTIN/FENPROPATHRIN/C8910
0001 {INSECTICIDE MIX 200 Gallon NO BID NO BID $315.00 NO BID
Valent BioSciences ReMoa Tri triple-action
insecticide
0002 [Methoprene Granules ALTOSID P35 or 320 Pound $20.25 $20.25 $31.06 $20.25
approved equal per bid specifications
BTI Liquid Larvicide AQUABAC XT or
0003 [VECTOBAC 12AS or approved equal per bid 300 Gallon $36.58 $38.50 $39.24 NO BID
specifications
0004 |BT! Granules AQUABAC 200G or VECTOBACG | 44, Pound $1.78 $1.60 $1.82 NO BID
or approved equal per bid specifications
Larvicidal Oil, Reduced Petroleum Distillate
0005 JClarke COCOBEAR or approved equal per bid 165 Gallon NO BID NO BID NO BID $49.28
specifications
Spinosad Tablet Larvicide
0006 |C1arke NATULAR XRT or approved equal per 1,100 Tablet NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.97
bid specifications
Sumithrin/Prallethrin/PBO Insecticide Mix
0007 |Clarke DUET DUAL ACTION ADULTICIDE or 550 Gallon NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.12
approved equal per bid specifications
DUAL ACTION AERIAL
SUMITHRIN/PRALLETHRIN/PBO INSECTICIDE
0008 [MIX Liquid DUET HD MOSQUITO Adulticiding 1,100 Gallon NO BID NO BID NO BID $224.76
Insecticide or approved equal per bid
specifications
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Methoprene Pellets
0009 |ALTOSID PELLETS or approved equal. per bid 500 Pound $29.25 $800.00 NO BID $29.25
specifications
Permethrin/PBO Insecticide Mix PERMANONE
0010 |31-66, BIOMIST 31+66, KONTROL 31-67 or 300 Gallon $149.84 $144.00 $148.75 $170.10
approved equal per bid specifications
Deltamethrin Aerial Adulticide IMPERIUM
0011 [MOSQUITO ADULTICIDING INSECTICIDE or 300 Gallon NO BID $279.00 NO BID NO BID
approved equal per bid specifications
S)-methoprene, Bacillus thuringiensis subsp.
0012 |israelensis granules 400 Pound NO BID $16.40 $4.40 $16.40
VectoPrime FG- larvicide
Malathion insecticide mix
0013 [Fyfanon EW 200 Gallon NO BID $73.00 $77.28 NO BID
TOTAL AMOUNT
CASH DISCOUNT
TOTAL AWARD

NOTES:




