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0001
SITE GROUP 1 TOTAL (13 SITES)

1
SITE GROUP 

TOTAL
$990.00 $520.00 $390.00 $975.00 $386.75

0002
SITE GROUP 2 TOTAL (16 SITES)

1
SITE GROUP 

TOTAL $770.00 $670.00 $1,157.95 $2,165.00 NO BID

0003
SITE GROUP 3 TOTAL (2416 

SITES)
1

SITE GROUP 

TOTAL $1,135.00 $1,055.00 $1,881.25 $2,570.00 NO BID

0004 SITE GROUP 4 TOTAL (16 SITES) 1
SITE GROUP 

TOTAL $765.00 $715.00 $1,013.00 $1,460.00 $420.00

0005 SITE GROUP 5 TOTAL (14 SITES) 1
SITE GROUP 

TOTAL $720.00 $600.00 $1,010.25 $1,240.00 $637.00

0006
SITE GROUP 6 TOTAL (16 SITES)

1
SITE GROUP 

TOTAL $520.00 $475.00 $553.75 $1,225.00 $519.20

0007
SITE GROUP 7 TOTAL (14 SITES)

1
SITE GROUP 

TOTAL $1,080.00 $605.00 $1,151.25 $2,145.00 NO BID

0008
SITE GROUP 8 TOTAL (18 SITES)

1
SITE GROUP 

TOTAL $635.00 $725.00 $1,027.50 $1,385.00 $403.20

0009
SITE GROUP 9 TOTAL (15 SITES)

1
SITE GROUP 

TOTAL $925.00 $650.00 $1,096.75 $1,950.00 $881.25

0010
SITE GROUP 19 TOTAL (19 

SITES)
1

SITE GROUP 

TOTAL $1,280.00 $835.00 $1,727.75 $2,630.00 NO BID

TOTAL      

  

VENDORS

2 Men and 

a Mower
K3B, LLC

File: 25-091873

BOD: 09/11/25

AWARD

E-C Lawn 

Care
VAST, LLC

Agency:

DPW-Central Garage

Scag 

Scapes

Summary of Quotations
A25-91873

A25-91873 Landscape Maintenance of  City Parish Owned Lots 

and  FEMA Properties (Groups 1-10)  

Category

91873

Landscaping Maintenance


