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ESTIMATED 

HOURS PER 

YEAR

See NOTE 1

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

HOURLY WAGE 
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RATE BILLED TO 

CITY

See NOTE 3
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ITEM TOTAL BILL 

RATE

0001 Unskilled Worker 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $23.59 NO BID

0002 Carpenter 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $32.56 NO BID

0003 Carpenter's Helper 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $24.62 NO BID

0004 Electrician 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $125.00 $37.37 NO BID

0005 Electrician's Helper 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $80.00 $26.79 NO BID

0006 Plumber 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $130.00 $37.37 NO BID

0007 Plumber's Helper 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $75.00 $26.69 NO BID

0008 Concrete Form Carpenter 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $32.03 NO BID

0009 Painter 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $31.36 NO BID

0010 Mechanic 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $36.70 NO BID

0011 Mechanic's Helper 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $27.76 NO BID

0012 Maintenance/Custodial 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $25.36 NO BID

0013 Grounds Worker 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $25.36 NO BID

0014 Welder 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $41.37 NO BID

0015 Welder's Helper 400 Per Hour NONRESPONSIVE NONRESPONSIVE $29.09 NO BID

 

SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS

Sealed Bid   X   Price Inquiry__  Definite Quantities___ 

12/1/2025

ND GLOBAL CONSULTING 

SERVICES, INC

Bid Opening:

TOTAL BID

Agency:

VENDORS

DPW - Buildings & Grounds

ENFRA MCC, LLC PENICO CORPORATION
Category:

91705

Contract Labor

A25-90900

TEMPORARY LABOR SERVICE FOR BUILDING MAINTENANCE AND 

CONSTRUCTION

Commodity:

File No:

22-90900

NET AMOUNT

DELIVERY

TOTAL AMOUNT

CASH DISCOUNT

MVP PRICING SOLUTIONS

NONRESPONSIVE

DID NOT SUBMIT ON CITY 

DOCUMENTS

CORPORATE SOLUTIONS

NONRESPONSIVE

DID NOT SUBMIT ON CITY 

DOCUMENT

TOTAL AWARD


