
VENDORS
A26-0526 Airport Police Uniforms

Summary of Quotations

File No.

26-000526
Bid Opening

02/04/26

Item No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

ESTIMATED

ANNUAL

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

0001

RAINWEAR

(#78240 Reversible Rain Pant – Unisex Regular: S, M, 

L, XL or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

15.00 EACH  $29.95 $74.89

0002

RAINWEAR

(#78240 Reversible Rain Pant – Unisex Regular: 2XL, 

3XL, 4XL or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

5.00 EACH  $29.95 $82.89

0003

RAINWEAR

(#76120 Reversible Rain Coat– Unisex Regular: S, M, L, 

XL or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

30.00 EACH  $66.50 $174.89

0004

RAINWEAR

(#76120 Reversible Rain Coat – Unisex Regular: 2XL, 

3XL, 4XL or Approved Equal)  Per Specifications

15.00 EACH  $66.50 $192.00

0005

RAINWEAR 

(#76120– Reversible Rain Coat 

Unisex Long: M, L, XL or Approved Equal)  Per 

Specifications

15.00 EACH  $66.50 $174.89

0006

RAINWEAR

(#76120 Reversible Rain Coat  Unisex Long: 2XL, 3XL, 

4XL or Approved Equal)  Per Specifications

10.00 EACH  $66.50 $192.00

0007

TACTICAL SAFETY VEST

(#71500 Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Approved 

Equal) Per Specifications

30.00 EACH  No Bid $73.89

0008

MEN’S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT

(#411R7851Z Dept. Class A Size: 14.5” – 18.5”, Color: 

Dark Navy or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

30.00 EACH  No Bid $64.89

0009

MEN’S LONG SLEEVE SHIRT

(#411R7851Z  Dept. Class A Size: 19.0” – 22.0” Dark 

Navy or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

10.00 EACH  No Bid $84.00
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0010

MEN’S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT

(#761R7851Z Dept. Class A Size: 14.5” – 18.5”, Color: 

Dark Navy or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

30.00 EACH  No Bid $56.89

0011

MEN’S SHORT SLEEVE SHIRT

(#761R7851Z Dept. Class A Size: 19.0” – 22.0”, Color: 

Dark Navy or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

10.00 EACH  No Bid $73.00

0012

MEN’S TROUSERS

(TR070 – Baton Rouge MAPD Dept. Class A (Size: 28-

44, Color: Dark Navy or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

90.00 EACH  No Bid $66.49

0013

MEN’S TROUSERS

(TR070 – Baton Rouge MAPD  Dept. Class A Size 46-60, 

Color: Dark Navy or Approved Equal) Per 

Specifications

15.00 EACH  No Bid $86.00

0014

SOFTSHELL JACKET

(#54100 Regular - Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications

30.00 EACH  No Bid $139.00

0015

SOFTSHELL JACKET

(#54100 Long Size – M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or 

Approved Equal) Per Specifications

30.00 EACH  No Bid $139.00

0016

SWEATER

(#74086 Size: S, M, L, XL, 2XL, 3XL, 4XL or Approved 

Equal) Per Specifications

30.00 EACH  No Bid $138.00

0017

JACKET (Super Shell Jacket With Fleece Liner – Blauer 

9970-60 – Size Regular/Tall: S, M, L – 

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

25.00 EACH  No Bid $564.00

0018

JACKET (Super Shell Jacket With Fleece Liner – Blauer 

9970-60 – Size Regular/Tall: XL, 2XL, 3XL – 

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

10.00 EACH  No Bid $564.00
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0019

ALL WEATHER PANTS (Blauer Tac Shell Duty Over 

Pants – Blauer 9825Z - Color: Dark Navy 04 – Size 

Regular/Tall: S, M, L - 

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications 

10.00 EACH  No Bid $74.89

0020

ALL WEATHER PANTS (Blauer Tac Shell Duty Over 

Pants – Blauer 9825Z - Color: Dark Navy 0) – Size 

Regular/Tall: XL, 2XL, 3XL  – 

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

5.00 EACH  No Bid $74.89

0021

ZIP-OFF BIKE PANTS (BLAUER ZIP-OFF BIKE PANTS - 

Blauer 8822Z – Color: Dark Navy 04) – Size 

Regular/Long: 28 - 42 -  

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

30.00 EACH  No Bid $73.89

0022

ZIP-OFF BIKE PANTS (BLAUER ZIP-OFF BIKE PANTS - 

Blauer 8822Z  – Color: Dark Navy 04) – Size 

Regular/Long: 44 - 50 -  

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

30.00 EACH  No Bid $73.89
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0023

PANTS

8666 BLAUER FLEX RS 

COVERT TACTICAL PANTS WITH TUNNEL WAISTAND, 

COLOR: DARK NAVY [04]

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

Quantity:

      Women’s (Sizes: 00 - 30)

      Men’s (Sizes: 28 - 46)

To determine exact sizing quantities, vendor to 

measure Baton Rouge Metro Airport Police 

Department personnel onsite in Baton Rouge, after 

award

105.00 EACH  No Bid $98.00
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0024

SHIRT

8362 BLAUER FLEX RS ARMORSKIN  

SHORT SLEEVE BASE SHIRT

COLOR: DARK NAVY [04]

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

CUSTOMIZATION:

Vendor to be responsible for sewing 3 patches on 

each shirt.  Baton Rouge Metro Airport Police 

Department emblems to be sewn on each sleeve and 

Baton Rouge Metro Airport Police Department badge 

patch to be sewn on left chest Baton Rouge Metro 

Airport Police Department to supply patches.

To determine exact sizing quantities, vendor is 

required to measure Baton Rouge Metro Airport Police 

Department personnel onsite in Baton Rouge, after 

award

90.00 EACH  No Bid $71.89

0025

SHORT SLEEVE POLO SHIRT 

(Ufx Ultra-Light Color Block Short Sleeve Polo Shirt - 

Elbeco Style K5213/K5214 – Size: XS, S, M, L, XL – 

or Approved Equal) Per Specifications

42.00 EACH  No Bid $73.89

0026

SHORT SLEEVE POLO SHIRT 

(Ufx Ultra-Light Color Block Short Sleeve Polo Shirt - 

Elbeco Style K5213/K5214 – Size: 2XL, 3XL, 4XL –

or Approved Equal) Per Specifications 

20.00 EACH  No Bid $81.89
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0027

SHIRT – Size: Small 

(8361 Blauer FlexRS 

Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

10.00 EACH  No Bid $79.89

0028

SHIRT – Size: Medium

(8361 Blauer FlexRS 

Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

20.00 EACH  No Bid $79.89

0029

SHIRT – Size: Large

(8361 Blauer FlexRS 

Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

20.00 EACH  No Bid $79.89

0030

SHIRT – Size: XL 

(8361 Blauer FlexRS 

Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

20.00 EACH  No Bid $79.89

0031

SHIRT – XXL

(8361 Blauer FlexRS 

Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

20.00 EACH  No Bid $79.89

0032

SHIRT – Size: XXXl

(8361 Blauer FlexRS 

Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

9.00 EACH  No Bid $79.89
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0033

SHIRT – Size: XXXXL 

(8361 Blauer FlexRS 

Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt

or Approved Equal)

Per Specifications

3.00 EACH  No Bid $99.89

0034

BREECHES (Motormen/Mounted Breeches Based on 

Custom Measurements or Approved Equal)  Per 

Specifications

30.00 EACH  No Bid $150.00

TOTAL AMOUNT

AWARD

NOTES:


