
SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS V  E  N  D  O  R  S

Date:

Agency:

Bid Opening or

Closing Date:

Sealed Bid    X         Price Inquiry           Definite Quantities      

Item 

No. DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY QUANTITY

UNIT 

OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE TOTAL

UNIT 

PRICE TOTAL

UNIT 

PRICE TOTAL

UNIT 

PRICE TOTAL

0001

Fire Fighting Helmets  - Glossy White (Bullard UG6LB 

with Leather Fron  or approved equal per the 

attached specifications)

150 EACH $475.00 $485.00 $445.00 NO BID

0002

Fire Fighting Helmets – Black Matte (Bullard UL6LB with 

Leather Front or approved equal  per the attached 

specifications)

150 EACH $420.00 $460.00 $445.00 NO BID

0003
Replacement 6: Leather Front (Bullard Stamped or 

approved equal )per the attached specifications)
150 EACH $65.00 $55.00 $60.00 NO BID

0004
Replacement Leather Brow Pad (Bullard R635L or 

approved equal  per the attached specifications)
150 EACH $97.00 $43.00 $45.00 NO BID

0005
Replacement Face Shield (Bullard R334 or approved equal 

per attached specifications)
150 EACH $98.00 $99.00 $96.00 NO BID

0006
Replacement Hardware (Bullard R156  with Leather Front 

or approved equal  per the attached specifications)
150 EACH $65.00 $23.00 $24.00 NO BID

0007
Replacement Retroreflective Trim (Bullard Trim or 

approved equal ) per the attached specifications)
150 EACH $120.00 $33.00 $36.00 NO BID

0008
Fire Fighting Boots (HAIX Fire Eagle Air – All Men Sizes or 

approved equal  per the attached specifications)
150 EACH $526.00 $475.00 $445.00 NO BID

0009
Fire Fighting Boots (HAIX Fire Eagle Air - All Women Sizes 

or approved equal  per the attached specifications)
150 EACH $526.00 $475.00 $445.00 NO BID
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Total Amount

Cash Discount

34034

Fire Protection Clothing

Fire Department

Category:

A26-0606
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NOTES: 

Total Amount

AWARD

Delivery


