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Item MONTHLY SITE MONTHLY SITE|] ANNUAL SITE |MONTHLY SITE] ANNUAL SITE |[MONTHLY SITE
No. |DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY GROUP TOTAL GROUP TOTAL | GROUP TOTAL | GROUP TOTAL | GROUP TOTAL | GROUP TOTAL
0001 |Site Group One Annual Total $386.75 $390.00 $507.00 $360.00
0002 |Site Group Two Annual Total NO BID $835.00 $644.00 $650.00
0003 |Site Group Three Annual Total NO BID $845.00 $1,031.00 $850.00
0004 |Site Group Four Annual Total $600.00 $630.00 $695.00 $400.00
0005 |Site Group Five Annual Total $637.00 $545.00 $582.00 $625.00
0006 |Site Group Six Annual Total $470.00 $500.00 $456.00 $500.00
0007 |Site Group Seven Annual Total NO BID $765.00 $581.00 $900.00
0008 _|Site Group Eight Annual Total $600.00 $500.00 $607.00 $390.00
0009 |Site Group Nine Annual Total NO BID $740.00 $632.00 $850.00
0010 |Site Group Ten Annual Total $1,000.00 $1,050.00 $802.00 $1,200.00
TOTAL AMOUNT
CASH DISCOUNT
NET AMOUNT
DELIVERY
QUOTE TOTAL
AWARD

NOTES:




