
Item 

No.

MONTHLY SITE 

GROUP TOTAL

MONTHLY SITE 

GROUP TOTAL

ANNUAL SITE 

GROUP TOTAL

MONTHLY SITE 

GROUP TOTAL

ANNUAL SITE 

GROUP TOTAL

MONTHLY SITE 

GROUP TOTAL

0001 $386.75 $390.00 $507.00 $360.00

0002 NO BID $835.00 $644.00 $650.00

0003 NO BID $845.00 $1,031.00 $850.00

0004 $600.00 $630.00 $695.00 $400.00

0005 $637.00 $545.00 $582.00 $625.00

0006 $470.00 $500.00 $456.00 $500.00

0007 NO BID $765.00 $581.00 $900.00

0008 $600.00 $500.00 $607.00 $390.00

0009 NO BID $740.00 $632.00 $850.00

0010 $1,000.00 $1,050.00 $802.00 $1,200.00
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04.30.26

Agency:

DEPARTMENT OF MAINTENANCE

Sealed Bid   X   Price Inquiry__  Definite Quantities___ V
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Site Group Six Annual Total

Site Group Two Annual Total

Site Group Three Annual Total

File No.

DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY

SUMMARY OF QUOTATIONS VENDORS

A26-91873: Landscape Maintenance of City-

Parish Owned Lots and FEMA Properties

Category:

Site Group Nine Annual Total

Site Group Five Annual Total

Site  Group One Annual Total

Site Group Four Annual Total

Site Group Eight Annual Total

98836  Grounds Maintenance: Mowing, 

Edging, Plant (Not Tree) Trimming, etc.

26-091873

NOTES:

DELIVERY

QUOTE TOTAL

AWARD

Site Group Seven Annual Total

TOTAL AMOUNT

CASH DISCOUNT

NET AMOUNT

Site Group Ten Annual Total


