

Summary of Quotations

Commodity:

A20-20072-SUPP

POLICE UNIFORMS & DUTY GEAR

Category:

20072

Agency:

POLICE - SUPPLY

Sealed Bid X Price Inquiry    Definite Quantities   

Requisition No:

A20-20072

Bid Opening

04/30/21

VENDORS

*First Responder Equipment and  
Uniform Distributors, LLC T/A A.  
P. E., Inc. and American Police  
Equipment, Inc.*

*Galls, LLC*

*Tom Meagher, Inc. dba  
Guidry's Uniforms*

*TEECO Safety, Inc.*

*TEECO Safety, Inc.*

**ORIGINAL**

Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF COMMODITY	QUANTITY	UNIT OF MEASURE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
0049	SECTION 6 - MEN'S JACKET – Size: Small (First Tactical Men's Tactix System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	13	Each	\$215.99		\$250.00		\$272.48		\$268.17		\$268.17	
0050	SECTION 6 - MEN'S JACKET – Size: Medium (First Tactical Men's Tactix System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	57	Each	\$215.99		\$250.00		\$272.48		\$268.17		\$268.17	
0051	SECTION 6 - MEN'S JACKET – Size: Large (First Tactical Men's Tactix System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	78	Each	\$215.99		\$250.00		\$272.48		\$268.17		\$268.17	
0052	SECTION 6 - MEN'S JACKET – Size: XL (First Tactical Men's Tactix System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	64	Each	\$215.99		\$250.00		\$272.48		\$268.17		\$268.17	
0053	SECTION 6 - MEN'S JACKET – Size: 2XL (First Tactical Men's Tactix System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	28	Each	\$215.99		\$250.00		\$272.48		\$268.17		\$268.17	
0054	SECTION 6 - MEN'S JACKET – Size: 3XL (First Tactical Men's Tactix System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	7	Each	\$215.99		\$260.00		\$272.48		\$268.17		\$268.17	
0055	SECTION 6 - MEN'S JACKET – Size: 4XL (First Tactical Men's Tactix System Jacket – 118502 or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	3	Each	\$215.99		\$260.00		\$272.48		\$268.17		\$268.17	
0057	SECTION 7 - SHIRT – Size: Small (8361 Blauer FlexRS Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	90	Each	\$37.99		NO BID		\$54.88		\$50.49		\$50.49	
0058	SECTION 7 - SHIRT – Size: Medium (8361 Blauer FlexRS Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	165	Each	\$37.99		NO BID		\$54.88		\$50.49		\$50.49	
0059	SECTION 7 - SHIRT – Size: Large (8361 Blauer FlexRS Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	172	Each	\$37.99		NO BID		\$54.88		\$50.49		\$50.49	
0060	SECTION 7 - SHIRT – Size: XL (8361 Blauer FlexRS Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	145	Each	\$37.99		NO BID		\$54.88		\$50.49		\$50.49	
0061	SECTION 7 - SHIRT – Size: XXL (8361 Blauer FlexRS Armorskin Long Sleeve Base Shirt or Approved Equal) Per Specifications	20	Each	\$39.99		NO BID		\$54.88		\$50.49		\$50.49	

